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B/22/2018
» Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Detalls

Wehicle Mo

Viehicle 19 be Exparted:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehiche Make:

Vehicle Model

Primary Colowr:
Manutacturing Year:

Engine No.

Chassis o

Maxirmuen Power Output:
Ogpen Market Value:

QOriging| Registration Date-
First Registration Date:
Tramsfer Count;
Actual ARF Paid

Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Eligibiliey:

PARF Eligitility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebare Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Dater

COE Category:

COE Period[Vear):

QP Paidh:

COE Rebate Amount;

Total Rehate Amount

The infarmation contaired herein is correct as at 22 Aug 2019

PARF/COE Rebats Enqguiry

Company
B13C

SMNZ151G

e

22 Aug 2019
MAZDA

MAZDAT 1.60L SDN
Grey

2010

5871484
JMABLIDZ 1ADL58TOR
TT.0kW (103 bhpl
$20,27400

24 Nov 2010

24 Now 2010

2

$2027400

Yes
23 New 2020
$11.15000

23 Nov 2020

A - Car [1600ce & below)
1a

§37.000.00

§4 BE5.00

$14,035.00

OK

PRSI INE. gov. Sg/ta/vrifacnon/engui e bale By FulicHelorsUereginpul frUNG | ILIN_IU=FUsiauuy | |

m



. o N,
& # A %
WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS

BLOCK @ SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE #01-32,
SINGAPORE 575644,
TEL: 6456 0830 * FAX: 6458 0128 « EMAIL: weilsemotorworks@gmail.com
Businass Regn No: 269436/00J

Ay /Z/w;ﬂ,y
19,aug 2019 2 ’ﬁ)’ @ >
e At 1.,
india international Insurance pl .
64 Cecil street #04/#05/406-02 ""oﬁ@
|OB Building S 049711 v 4

Attn:Motor claim dept-3" party claim

Claiming against your insured vehicle no: SHC1001E

Accident involving vehicle no: SMN2151G/SHC1001E/SLNBI9BC/SKN28498/J5S6906
DOA: 15/08/2019 AT SLE(after Thomson)twds BKE

Dear officer incharge
Re: Estimate cost of repair for vehicle no: SMN2151G

To supply--
Description Qty Amount B |

Lid 1 /2y 122000 &—
Iid lock 1 s 18700 —
Lid-Mazda logo 1 Alg 7500 —
Lid-Mazda emb;em 1 A, 3900 —
Lid-3 emblem 1 U 2600 —
Lid reflector 1 Fa 33800 X
Rear bumper 1 Hn, 1,103.00 —
Rear bumper reflector @63 2 Crmy 12600 —
End panel 1 43000 <7
End panel top garnish 1 20300 7
Boot weatherstrip 1 14800 7T
Rear bumper enforcement 1 Ss7.00 7
Front bumper B Pdeq 107800 —T
Front bumper enforcement 1 464.00 7
Front bumper sponge 1 10200 7
Front support panel 1 51500 7
Front grille,center 1 Por 23900 —
Front bumper tow cover 1 Pev 29.00 —r
Front bumper foglamp cover @72 2 14800 7
Headlamp @1175 2 ol Mgy 235000 L4
Parts B 9,373.00
Parts less less 20% 1.874.60
—i 7.498.40

oy ey, Ry | Y 4




Vehicle No: SMN2151G

To remove damaged parts and attachments, front n rear
Cut n weld damaged panel

Straighten chassis where necessary

Repair/reshape damaged/dented areas

Rep;ace/align all parts into position

To spray paint-front n rear

s 130000 7

S 125000 /oo

S 10,048.40



Nivitha (LKK Auto

From: Mator Claim - Ill <motarclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 August 2019 9:41 AM

To: karen Seah; sur@Ikkauto.com; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: TP survey for vehicle no: SMN2151G & SHC1001E(IN) on 15/08/2019

Attach ts: doc03158020190819131453 pdf

men oc p o\ an® .a-u'lth"\
eren

Dear Sir / Mdm, = .1

Vthicle n

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SMN2151G and let us have your report urgently. Se® en
This claim will be handled by Aida.

*Kindly upload this survey request email lo merimen.

Thank You.

Daniel Pooi
Motor Claims Department

India International Insurance Pte Lid
64 Ceeil Swreet #04-02 108 Building

Singapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6100 Ext 202 Fax: 6224 4174

S&P 'A-" rated Company

lN"I-"IIlNHI"I.BHM
IH!I..II.A.NC!
iy e e e 190F

From: karen Seah [mailto:weileemotorworks@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, 19 August, 2019 2:34 PM

To: Motor Claim - [Il emotorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: Re: TP survey for vehicle no: SMN2151G & SHC1001E(lll) on 15/08/2019

Vehicle No: SMN2151G

Dear officer incharge

We would like to have LKK Auto Consultants to survey the vehicle.
Thank you.

On Mon, Aug 19, 2019 at 2:17 PM Motor Claim - 1l <motorclaim@iii.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sir / Mdm,

We acknowledge receipt of your email,

We proprose using one of the following mator surveyors:



= LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
» Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Daniel Pooi

Motor Claims Department

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Ceeil Street #04-02 10B Bullding
Singapore 043711

Tel: 6347 6100 Ext 202 Fax: 6224 4174

S&P ‘A-* rated Company
o PRTITS
°® & InrenNATIONAL
( Insunance
N O A F O RS
g pR g e | T

From: karen Seah [mailto:weileemotorworks@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, 19 August, 2019 1:15 PM

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iil.com.sg>
Subject: TP survey for vehicle no: SMN2151G

Your insured vehicle no: SHC1001E
Accident involving vehicle no: SMN2151G/SHC1001E/SLN8998C/SKN2849B/1SS6906

DOA: 15/08/2019 AT SLE(after Upp Thomson twds BKE)



Dear officer incharge

[ refer to the above case,attached with the accident report/police report.
Kindly arrange to survey the vehicle. ASAP.

thank vou.

Best Repards,

Karen Seah

Wei Lee Motor Works

Block 9 Sin Ming Industrial Estate
#01-32 Singapore 575644

Tel: 6456 9830

Fax: 6458 0128

Company registration: 269436/001]

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers
(located both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry,
including the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing,
handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with
applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



Best Regards,

Karen Seah

Wei Lee Motor Works

Block 9 Sin Ming Industrial Estate

#01-32 Singapore 575644

Tel: 6456 9830

Fax: 6458 0128

Company registration: 269436/00)

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed 1o have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K
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WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS

BLOCK 8 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE #01-32,
SINGAPORE 575844,
TEL: 5456 9830 = FAX: 5458 0128 » EMAIL: welleemotorworks@gmail.com
Business Regn No: 288438/00J

06,Sep 2019
India International Insurance PL
Attn: Motor claim dept-3" party claim

Claiming against your insured vehicle no: SHC1001E

Accident involving vehicle no:SMN2151G/SHC1001E/SLNB99BC/SKN2B49B/1S56506

ON 15/08/2019 AT SLE -after Thomson twds BKE

Dear officer incharge
We are the workshop for the owner of vehicle no: SMN2151G

Regarding the claim for the case abave, this is a liability clear case considering that your client’s
vehicle collided into the rear portion of our client’s vehicle,the impact caused my client’s vehicle
move forward and hit to the front vehicle.

The claim for vehicle No: SMN2151G as follow:-

Cost of repair to SMN2151G S 4,800,00 finalised with your surveyor
GST 7% S 336.00
Loss of use S 4B80.00 580x06d
LTA search fee 5 7.45
5 5,623.45

Enclosed with all the necessary document for your reference.

Kindly let us have your reply soonest possible.

Thank you. P



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

: INC M g 'LTC_\
l, K” (_auunj - { | (the third party claimant”)
of 2Lt & 'JP'? Mowson  WeeC (address),

owner  of SMN 351 § (vehicle no.)  hereby authorize
Wel Lee ,-L\ujf‘m" W Lb}(LS ‘

(“the workshop”) to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or
Al
rental and/or loss of use (‘claim”) for my vehicle no. SIMA a‘ﬁ'lh ~__thatwas

damaged pursuant to the accident which n-:_:_currad on O lﬁ“c\ (date) along
2k 'G{'\Qr Wawison Ands BhlT (Iucatiun)

B ol € f‘thl .gtﬁ& < (“the accident”).

involving vehicle no/s

| further authorize the workshop to settle the above mentioned claim in a
manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive
payment furtherto settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in

favour of the workshop.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my
behalf is on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar

as the driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

i 'S
Date this D day of PN*[ (month) 20 L—‘ (year)

~ Leg"

5 =4

o -

Y T
o »-
™

& J

#

/
\

*

\, | #

Y,

’

1259 N

Signed by “the third party claimant’ Signed by “the workshop”

(L L 8 1T EN
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INDIA I ERNALIONAL INsuANCE PHE LTD

- " T
. T-;l- v g e T i | LR e Wep MR X
® Inranmamonas ok | LAl STt | 810 [ 05 [ @0 | JOK Mudaling | Singapore 044711
( INHJM-‘NC! e (] AT Rl ol A
' A0 m WD E PO (LT YELTR R Wihmats wrvmtnc [l avien g
P g i g bl |
RISCHARGE VOUCHER
lll-Direct Settlomant (PODS)
India Ref: MCT10080381
Claimant Ref :SMN21515
W, WEI LEE AOTDR WORKS {“the warkshop”) hareby confirm (hal wall have reached an agreemant
with the appointad Surveyor of Indin Intemational Insurance Ple Lid LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lio (nama
of Surveyor) with respect o the amount cimed for 5§ _ 513800 (repalr cosl), S§_360.00 (loss of
usomm), 55 TAS  (search fes), vehicie no, Sunzisis  that was damaged pursuant to the sccident which ocoumred
on 15082019 (dale) ot ___SLE WFTER UPPER THOWSON) TOWARDSBE____ (jocation) invoiving vehicle no. SHC1001E _ (insured

wehicla). This Is pursuant 1o the inspettion sonducted on 20082019 (dale) al “the workshop”

Wel confim thal wel amslam muthorzed by the ownet KH LEASING FTE LTD (“the wird pary
clgbmant”) of vehicle no. syeosg bo moke the claim as set out in tha sbove paragraph and we/l have full authonty to setie
iha matiar on hisfher behall in a manner that wall deem fit. Well encloss hersin the latter of authorty given by “the third

party clisimant”®,

Wail further conlirm thatl wal will indemnity India International irsurance Pie Lid for all camages. loss andior expenss that
thery will of have alresdy incumed in the eveni thal “the third party claiman™ after ihe sbove said agresment lodgss @
further claim ageinst the frmer for any loss and expenses suffersd penaining 1o cosl of repairs andfor rental sndior loss
of use pursuani lo the domage fo _Swatig  (vahicle no.) as @ resull of the sccident.

Well confirm that the agresman! mached above is in ull and fnal seiliement of ail clalms of “tha third pary clsimant™
pursuanl 1o 1ha acoident and that further this setibiemeant (8 reached on a8 withoul prejudice and withoul sdmission of Sability
binsis,

This agreamant Is subject to the application of Singaparm low and the Singspore Courts have exclusive jurisdiction over amy
dispute srining oul of tha same

Wael puthorize you to paythe total amountot 5§ _ 550345 5 weiLEE woTOR woRNKS

CLAIMANT: WITNESS:
Signature® Signature k&c
by appointed Surveyor

Tenme Harme: LKK Auto Consultants Plelld
NRIC: NRIC:! 195E07188R
Addross: Adudress 51 Ubi Aveoue 1

#01-25 Paya Ubl Ind. Park S{408833}
Natlonality: S Mallonality




" 4{] /? ﬂ; BLOCK 8 SIN MING INSDUSTRIAL ESTATE #0126,
SINGAPORE 575644,

TEL: 0459 0830 FAX: 6458 0128

WE] LEE MOTOR WORKS O T e

TAX INVOICE
NO WL03827
MIS : India International Insurance PL Vehicle No : SMN2151G
Date : 08-SEP-2018
Quantity Particulars Unit Price  Amount Incl.
GST
SMN2151G
1.00 Your insured vehicle no: SHC1001E
Accident involving vehicle no:
SMN2151G/SHC1001E/SLNB99BC/SKN2849B/JS
SB906
DOA: 15/08/2019
1.00 Caost of repair for vehicle no: SMN21516G 34,800.00 $4 800,00
Lump sum repaired as recommended by your
appointed surveyor LKK Auto Consultants
1.00 GST 7% $336.00 $336.00
‘Fntﬁl_Amcunt Incl. GST - I“E.ﬁﬁ.nﬂ
Standard Rate GST Amount (7.00%) §336.00
Total Amount Bafore GST $4,800.00

Uinae, Sagrinrriber . 2019, G 46 pm 1of1



I . l Gmall karen Seah <weileemotorworks@gmall.com>

Notification of Successful Vehicle Insurance Search for Receipt No.: ITNET-
00000-190819-001352

1 message

LTA <LTA-VTL@Ita.gov.sg> Mon, Aug 19, 2019 at 12:42 PM
To: weileemotorworks@gmail com

Land Transport Authority

Notification of Successful Vehicle Insurance Search for Receipt
No.: ITNET-00000-190819-001352

Dear SirlMadam

We wish to Inform you that your transaction on "Enquire Vehicle Insurance Particulars”
performed on 19 Aug 2019 was successful and the Receipt No. is ITNET-00000-190819-
001352

2. The datalls of the search results are as follow:
Vehicle No. Search Date Search Time Search Result

SHC1001E 15Aug 2018 21:30.00 INDIAINTL INS PTE LTD

3. Please contact our customer service officers at tel - 1800-CALL LTA (1800-2255 582) should you
require further assistance.

4. Visit www.onemotoring com.sg for more information, or go to www Ita gov sg/feedback if you
have any feedback. This email is auto-generated, please do not reply to this email

5. Thank you,

If you are not the Intended recipient of this communication, please delete it

As it may contain confidential or official information, do not retain it or disclose the contents to any
person as it may be an offence under the Official Secrets Act



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

IIUCLAIH SUBFULDER.“[FIHdII‘Iﬂ for 5l.|l‘\‘|¥ H.Epﬂrt]

Direct Settlement

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case | Matified Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned Ad) Byt Ag| Submitted  |Ins Auth'ed | Status
gy |19 Aua 2019 iy 2019 $54,800.00 | $$4,800.00 ::;:,;" for Survay
Lan Reg o ac o | £t Extimutes | | View it | Cancel Caes |

Hain

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

Irsured; COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co REeg Moo -
'?'-."Em.-, KM LEASING PTE LTD, Co. Heg. Mo.: 2016118130
Vehidle Reg. 15/08/2019 21:00 - :59
Mo.: MMIISIE Date of LoSS: |1y 04 Manths and 22 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]
Claim Type: | TP / MCT19080361 cwCae | mcomgo1s
Vehicle Reg. .
Mo SHC1001E :gll::n::ﬂ: 5111585410
Enge4n

Repaktes: Wel Les Motor Works (HQ) BLOCK 9 S5IN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE #01-32, 575644 Sin Ming - Tel:
India International Insurance Pre Lbtd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 ,,. [Handled by Zuhaidah Be Samsur - 6347 6070]

NTUC Income Insurance Co-oparative Lid (HQ) - Tel
Adjuster; LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-1561 .. [Handled by KENNETH KONG] . [Final Rpt due 29/08/2019]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al |  Compose Case Mai |

» [1_SG (23/10/2015) Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (S$5503.45) - SMNZ151G - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bt...
» III_SG (23/08/2019): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5$0.00) - SMNZ151G - Clalm Handler: Zuhaidah Bte §...

[ ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS® view All | Sewcch Tusks | Create ew Task | compinte |

Due Date  Priority Type  Taskh Group  Subjest  Hendler  Assigned By Completed On Craated On  Daone?
Ko results.

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 8/11/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 2

Claim Documents

*SMN2151G (MCT19080361)
[SHC1001E]
TP
KH LEASING PTE LTD
Aug 15 2019 9:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Wei Lee Motor Works

Upioad Documents | Upioad Protos | Comooss wew Letsr | View [View m Srowar| v |
Photos/Imeges {3porpage  [~]| B
Mo | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |2210/19 15101 | General View 0| wmews | A
2 |zzn0019 1301 General View 0| oadic | M
3 |3210019 19:01 | Ganaral View @ | loesirc | A
4 |22/10/19 19:01 | General View 0O leiwc | A
5 |22/10/19 19:01 | General View 0 s | M
6 |2210/19 19:01 | General View 0| toearc | A
7 |310/19 19:01 General View Losd e | B4
8 |22r10/19 19:01 General View _g st s | A
9 |22/10/19 19:01 | General View @ | edre |
10 |Z2/10/19 19:01 | General View 0 cedws |
11 |22/10419 19:01 Ganeral View 0| adies | M
12 [2210/19 19:01 | General View O | Ladivc |
13 |22/10/19 19:01 | Genaral View 0| wuwrs | &
14 | 23710/19 19:01 Ganeral View 0| weaws | M
15 |22/10/18 18:01 | General View 0| wears | &
16 |22/10019 19:01 | General View 0| edirc | A
17 |2210/19 12:01 | General View 0| tedws | B
18 |22/10/19 19:01 | General View Q| waws M |
19 |Za10719 19:01 General View O | aaws B
20 |22/10/19 19:01 | General View 0| wews | &
21 |22/10/19 19:01 | General View 0| eadrc | A
22 |22/101912:01 | General View 0| teadivs | BB
73 |23/10/18 19:01 | General View 0| twtws | A
24 |21/10/19 19:01 General View ﬁ wed 76 | BA
25 |22/10/1915:01 | General View 0| wews B
26 (2210018 19:01 | General View 0| oadrc | A
77 |22710/18 19:03 | Relnspection Phota 0| Ladrwe | B
76 |23/10/19 18:03 | Reinspection Photo 0| zars | @A
29 |z2/10/19 19:03 | Reinspection Phato 0| casws |
30 |22/10/19 19:03 | Reinspection Phato | toocrc | &A1
3 |2210/19 19:03 | Reinspection Photo 0| tsedira | A
32 |22/10/1919:03 | Reinspection Photo 0| cure | #
33 |22/10/19 1903 | Reinspection Phota 0| edws | &
34 |22/10/19 19:03 | Reinspection Phato 0| s |
i5 |22/10/18 18:03 | Reinspection Phato Q| ooows | B
% 2210019 19:03 feinspection Phaota 0| edwc | A
Documantation | .ng [~
No |Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thnumbnail | Print
1 |70/08/19 15:24 | EMAIL FROM III DD 20082019 O | Loacror
2 |20/08/19 15:24 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF
1 [72/08/1517:23 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load POF
4 [21/10/18 16:34 | LTA SEARCH Lood POF
5 |[DB/11/19 10:30 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF
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o | Rolabel/Aocorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ]) Thumbnall | Print
& |0B/11/19 10:30  |AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM B € | Losd FOF

7 |08/11/19 10:30 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER 0 | LosdPOF

§ |08/11/1910:30 | LOD = @ | Load POF

No | Firalieed On Irufla International Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |21/08/19 10144 | Singspore Accldent Statement IV SHC1001E Load POF
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd iconeg Mo 1essarisar)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/l18014527/KGB3Q2

Date: oBM 12018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Pte Lid  Policy No MCOMOO015
Claimant "
Vehicle No SMMN2151G Insured Vehicle No : SHC1001E
Date of Loss: 15/08/2019 Nature of Claim: LI Claim No: MCT 198080361
RIPTI | I
Reg No SMN2151G
Make & Model: MAZDA 3, 1.6 (A) Engine No: ZBB71484
Reg. Date: 24/11/2010 (Man, Year. 2010) Chassis No: JMBBL10Z1AD158708
Calour; Metallic Grey Odometer: 124285 km
Engine Capacity 1598 cc
Market Value/New Car NIA
Price
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceabla): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable) Yes Engine Modificalion: Mo Pre-accidenl Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/55 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/55 R16
Front Left Side Piralli 6 mm Rear Left Side: Pirelli 5 mm
Front Right Side Piralli 6 mm Rear Right Side: Pirelli 5 mm
The abave values represeni the remaiming fyre reads depih
COST OF CLAIMS ~ Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %)
Parts 7,559.20 5,196.80 2,362.40 3125
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2,550.00 1,800.00 750.00 29.41
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (55) 10,109.20 6,996.80 3.112.40 30.79
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 4,600.00
(S5) 10,109.20 4 BO0.0O 5,309.20 5252
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5%) 707 64 336.00 37164 5252
MNett Amount (5%) 10,816.84 5,136.00 5,680.84 52.52
+ Loss of Use (6.0 x $560.00/day) (5§) 360.00
+ Doc/Search Fes (S§) 745
Nett Liability (S8) 5,503.45
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 20/08/2019
Date Inspectad: 20/08/2019 Inspected Al Wei Lee Motor Works (HQ)
BLOCK 8 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL
ESTATE #01-32
Singapore 575844
Estimated Period of Repair: 6.0 days
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Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Chong Pui Lin

NOTE: This report regresents our findings Bl the lime and place of ingpecton stated heren, Such inspection has bean cirmed out fo ihe best of aur
knowiedge and abilty but any other liabilty under any ather circumstances (s hemby expressly axciuded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 8/11/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4
REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

'Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Las! Synchronised: 21 Oct 2019)

Parts: 144 MAZDA 3 1.6 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0}

Labour: Repairer's (Prica-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SMN2151G)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages. running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the |ast estimale page

Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *. |

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 ‘LiD Bent 1,22000FL *1.220.00FL
2 1 ‘LID LOCK Dented 187.00FL  *187.00FL
3 1 *LID -MAZDA LOGO MNecassary 75.00FL *75.00FL
4 1 *LID -MAZDA EMBLEM Mecassary 38.00FL *39.00FL
5 1 *LID-3 EMBLEM Mecassary 26.00FL *26.00FL
6 1 *LID REFLECTOR Saerviceable 338.00FL *-FL
7 1 *REAR BUMPER Buckled 1,103.00FL *1.,103.00FL
B 2 ‘REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR Cracked 126.00FL *126.00 FL
g 1 ‘END PANEL Repair 430,00 FL *FL
0 1 *END PANEL TOP GARNISH Serviceable 203.00FL *-FL
11 1 *BOOT WEATHERSTRIP Serviceable 14B.00 FL *FL
122 1 *REAR BUMPER ENFORCEMENT Benl 557.00FL *557.00FL
13 1 *FRONT BUMPER Mtg Cracked 1.078.00FL *1.078.00FL
14 1 *FRONT BUMPER ENFORCEMENT Banl 464 DOFL *464.00 FL
15 1 ‘FRONT BUMPER SPONGE Cracked 102.00FL *102.00FL
18 1 *FRONT SUPPORT PANEL Semnviceabls 515.00FL *-FL
17 1 *‘FRONT GRILLE ,CENTER Dented 230,00 FL *239.00FL
18 1 *FRONT BUMPER TOW COVER Dented 29 00FL *29.00FL
1@ 2 ‘FRONT BUMPER FOGLAMP COVER Serviceable 144 00 FL *FL
20 1 ‘HEADLAMP OIS Mig Cracked 2,350.00FL *1175.00FL
211 *FOGLAMP COVER ,RH Distorted T6.00FL *76.00FL

F=Franchise part. L=LimitbemDisc

Sub Total (S§) 9,449.00 6,496.00

- List Item Discount on L ltems 20.00/20.00% (S§)  1,880.80 1,299.20

Total Parts (S$) 7,559.20 5,196.80

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out |
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Recommended Miscellaneous [tems
There are no now miscellaneous Homs selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO REMOVE DAMAGED PARTS AND Naw 1,300.00 800.00
ATTACHMENTS ,FRONT REAR CUT N WELD DAMAGED
PANEL STRAIGHTEN CHASSIS WHERE NECESSARY
REPAIR IRESHAPE DAMAGED /DENTED AREAS
REPLACE /ALIGN ALL PARTS INTO POSITION
2 TO SPRAY PAINT- FRONT N REAR Mew 1,250.00 1,000.00
Gross Labour Cost {S§) 2,550.00 1,800.00

Report was unsubmitted duning this print-out

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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