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PARE/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

L]

Page | of |

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
236A

SFW7767H
No

20 Aug 2019
NISSAN

SYLPHY 1.6 CVT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD
4DR

Grey

2016

HR169895358B
MNTBBAB17Z0027243
85.0 kW (113 bhp)
$16,807.00

20 Jun 2016

20 Jun 2016

0

$16,807.00

Yes
19 Jun 2026
$12,605.00

19 Jun 2026

A-Carupto 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$47,889.00

$32,719.00

$45,324.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 19 Aug 2019

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By Public Before Dereglnput ?ZFUNCTION _ID=F030... 19-Aug-19
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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: lanet Tan <janet tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 21 August 2019 851 AM

To: Shu Pel [LEXAULD)

Ce: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJN5936A (Ol - EQI -DM19H002292/1T) AND
SFWTT67H (TP : LKK REF - CCR/EQIN9014434/Upb3) on 17.08.2019

Attachments: TP GIA REPORT pdf; 5A52654341.PDF

Dear Shu Pel

Attach Ol report,
Please procead to D5
Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

I[

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4180

WWW. Bdinsurance com.sg

yob T el

-

D\ & Messshet o Caystate B

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the ser

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, August 20, 2019 6:44 PM

To: EQI PRS <EQIPRS@eqinsurance.com.sg>; Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>, Joel Goh
<joel goh@eqinsurance com.sg>

Cec: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tang (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com:>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIN5936A (O : EQI - TBA) AND SFWT767TH (TP : LKK REF -
CCh/EQI19014434/Upb3) on 17.08.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.



We have inspected TP vehicle SFW 7767H at M/s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for
a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GlA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: ghupei@itkksuto com | fac 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Uikl industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, 802-25 | 5(408933)



Hsiao Tnng !LKKAutnz ——

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 28 August 2019 11:26 AM

To: Jason Fastech Auto (jason@fastechauto.com.sg)

Subject: Your Ref SFWTT67H *Our Ref: CC6/EQI19014434/Upb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SJN S936A(EQ) AND SFW 7767H ON 17/08/2019]

Your Ref: SFW7767H Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC6/EQI19014434/Upb3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT IN G SIN 59 EQ) AND S 7H ON 17, 019

We refer to the above matter.

Our driver reported that it is a chain collision. However your client reported that it is a head-to-rear collision.

As per EQ instruction, we would like to request for a copy of video footage as stated in your client GIA for our
necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply,

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, elther party is nat bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51. Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Hsiao Tnng (LKKAuto) —

From: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.comsg>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 August 2019 11:32 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SFW7767H *Our Ref: CC6/EQI19014434/Upb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SJN 5936A(EQ) AND SFW 7767H ON 17/08/2019]

Without Prejudice
Dear Hsiao Tong,
As requested.

https://www.dropbox.com/sh/mSp7tyuxfvdigco/AABccceBHezdnyo2p0BtBZiZa ?dl=

Thank you,

Best Regards

Jason Tang

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave &
#01-46/48/50 AutoBay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 67465405

Hp: 98218445
jason@fastechauto.com.sg

Please nate that it is a condition of any settiement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any] of the owner/
claimant

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, August 28, 2019 11:26 AM

To: lason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>

Subject: Your Ref: SFW7767H *Our Ref: CC6/EQI19014434/Upb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJN 5936A(EQ) AND SFW
7767H ON 17/08/2019]

Your Ref: SFW7767H Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC6/EQI19014434/Upb3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIN 5936A(EQ) AND SFW 7767H ON 17/08/2019

We refer to the above matter.

Our driver reported that it is a chain collision. However your client reported that it is a head-to-rear collision.



" As pér EQ Instruction, we would like to request for a copy of video footage as stated in your client GIA for our
necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties an this matter ks purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / Inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially atfect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhi@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)



CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

NISSAN AUTO PROTECTOR PRIVATE VEHICLE

Name of Pollecyholder  : Teo Kea Boon Vahicle No SFWTTGTH
Period of Insurance 20 Jun 2019 To 18 Jun 2020 Folicy No 2100470519-02
Engine No. HR169895358 Endorsement No.

Chassis No MNTBBAB1TZO027243 Issued Date ¢ 23 May 2019

ABOUT THE COVER

[ z
Make/Modal NISSAN SYLPHY 1.6 PREMILIM
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Cwner 10
WVehicle Details
Vehicle No.:
Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Dereglstration Date:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:
Maniifacturing Year:
Engine Ma.:
Chassis Mo
Maximum Power Output:
Dipen Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Drate:
Transter Count:
Actuasl ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Diate:
COE Category:
COE Perind(Years).
QP Paid:
COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:
The Information contained herein is correct as at 17 Aug 20157

PARFINOFE Rehals Frnnine

Singapore NRIC
2344

SFWTTETH

Yes

17 Aug 2019

MISSAN

SYLPHY 1.4 CVT ABS DVAIRBAG JWD 4DR
Grey

2018

HR16%895358
MNTEBAB17Z0027243
B5.0 kW (113 bhp)
$16,807.00

20 Jun 2016

20 Jun 2014

]

$16,B07.00

Yes
19 Jun 2026
$12.40500

1% Jun 2024

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (1306hp)
10

$47.889.00

$32.750.00

$45,355.00

OK

VLR (V1L I8, GOV.SETE VI BCIOMenquIre M eDas oy UDICOaTOre Lareginpul UG | N _ILSTUSUEuUL |
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Hsiao Tﬂﬂa “-KK.AMU} —— ———————————————————

From: Jason <Jasoni@fastechauto.comsg>

Sent: Monday, 30 September 2019 11:13 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SPW7767H *Our Ref: CC6/EQI19014434/Upb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SIN 5936A(EQ) AND SFW 7767H ON 17/08/2019]

Without Pre|udice
Dear Hsiao Tong,
We are pleased to accept your offer of global sum $4,580.00 for my client’s vehicle property claim.

Thank you.

.est Regards

Jason Tang

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave &
#01-46/48/50 AutoBay
Singapore 417BE3

Tel: 67465405

Hp: 98218445

lason@fastechauto.com.sg

Please nate that it 1s @ condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice ta any personal Injury claim (if any) of the owner/
claimant

rom: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]
!em: Saturday, September 28, 2019 B:56 AM
To: Jason <Jason(@fastechauto,.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SFW7767H *Our Ref: CC6/EQI19014434/Upb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIN 5936A(EQ) AND
SFW 7767H ON 17/08/2019]

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of 54,580.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on
our part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in
respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be
made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters,



Settiement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher [for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintitf/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made

payment on the settlement sum.”

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-4107 | emall: ghewhti@ kkauto.com | fax: 5741-4108
Blk 51. Payn Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: lason <Jason{@fastechauto.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 28 August 2019 11:32 AM

‘n: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
ubject: RE: Your Ref: SFW7767H *Our Ref: CC6/EQI19014434/Upb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIN 5936A(EQ) AND
SFW 7767H ON 17/08/2019]

without Prejudice

Dear Hslao Tong,

As requested.

hrrps://www.dropbox.com/sh/mSp7tyuxfvdigen/AABccceHe ZiZatdl=0

Thank you.

Best Regards

son Tang

astech Auto Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-46/48/50 AutoBay
Singapore 417883
Tel: 87465405
Hp: 98218445
|ason@fastechauto.com.sg

Please note that it is & condition of any settiement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any persanal ingury claim (if any) of the owner/
claimant

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com)
Sent: Wednesday, August 28, 2019 11:26 AM
To: Jason <lason@fastechauto.com.sg>




Subject: Your Ref: SFW7767H *Our Ref: CC6/EQI19014434/Upb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIN 5936A(EQ) AND SFW
7767H ON 17/08/2019)

Your Ref: SFW7767H Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC6/EQI19014434/Upb3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
CIDENT INVOLV SIN 5936A[E 7767H ON 17 2019

We refer to the above matter.
Our driver reported that it is a chain collision. However your client reported that it Is a head-to-rear collision

As per EQ instruction, we would like to request for a copy of video footage as stated in your client GIA for our
necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.

indly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
matter amicably without parties resarting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlemant.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence an the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-3108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)



FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
| Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay
Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67465405 / 67465376  Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Date: 05092019
EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road

#17-00 Tower Block MND Complex
Singapore 069110

Attn: Motor Claim Department

Dear SirMadam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES : SFW 7767H / SIN 5936A ON 17.08.2019

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no:  SFW 7767H which was involved
in the captioned accident with your insured vehicleno:  SIN 5936A The vehicle owner has requested and
authorized us to assist him in presenting his/her claim against the party responsible for the dumuage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims fowe
your consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

17 Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) § 4.280.00
2) Lossof Rental 5 300,00
3) GIA Search Fee s 2.00

$ 4.582.00
We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:
a) Final Repair Invoice b) Car Rental Invoice / Agreement
c) GIA Search Result d) Letter of Authorisation, etc...
¢) GIA Report fi VC & Driving Licence
g) Insurance Certificate h) Vehicle Registration Log Card

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our customer’s clnims
@s s00n as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank you.
Yours faithfully.

Jason Tang (jasond fastechdghd com.sg)
For Fastech Auto Pte Ltd
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1 LRI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Our Ref: CC6/EQI19014434/Upb3
30 August 2019

NORYANTI BINTE ALI ZAINAL ABIDIN
BLK 1 HAIG ROAD

#03-557

SINGAPORE 430001

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SN 5936A AND SFW 7767H ON 17/08/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY
LIMITED to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant 1o the above said accident wherein you andfor your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred. we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with third party claimant

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD — if applicable) will be with held for
the time being. Pending for final allocation of liability in settlement by our principal EQ
INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

cn(ﬁw HSIAO TONG
Case Handler

DID: 6742 3197
FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: chewht@]kkauto.com

c.c. EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
{Mator Claims Dept)



DATE : @1 0% 1019
TO B Isionce (ompany 11

RE  : ACCIDENT INVOLVING vEHICLENO,  SPH TIEIH [ 33N 5%

acong  fom I Funes Enfe Inte NIE .
on 1100 29

I/We. Too Yoz Baon

O, nricrorOCNey 3 N2
of I\ Dbk Bwivoir Yiew #031-02 Swapone 1IR3
owner of vehicle no. SPN REH in musiilciraliuu ol M/s FASTECH ALITO
PTE LTD repairing my/our vehicle o TEH at my/our instruction and hereby
authorise AMVs FASTECH ALTTO PTE LTD to demand clam settlement whatever
amount setiled/payable by the Insurance Company and/or third party or to commence legal
proceedings, il necessary, under my name, tor the cost of repairs, car rental and/or loss of use,
ete. and to their appointing solicitor 1o act for meus in respect of the said accident/claim and

all claimed and/or seftled shall belong 1o them absolwiely.

I/'We farther agree and undertake to indemnity them agmnst the above-mentioned claim cosr
@ ich may arisen therewith.

[ Bss—

Signature of Chwner

MName of Owner




TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158  Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Tax Invoice - 21316
EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road Date 05.09.2019
#17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Vehicle No  -SFW 776TH
Singapore 069110 MaokeModel NISSAN SYLPHY 1.6
Chassis/Eng¥
Atn : Motor Claim Departmem Accident Date  ©17.08.2019
Cluiim No
Relerence 0819 -21316
Palicy Mo
Amounl
To proceed on lump sum repair §8 4000,00
E. & O.E, Total : S§ 4000.00
GST @ 7% : 5§ 280,00
Amount Due - SS 4280.00

for FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

All Invoices are subjected to GST




DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-46 Autobay

Singapore 417883
Tel No: 6741 7244 / 6746 5405 Fax No: 6745 8520 / 6746 5786

Co. Reg No: 52928467k

To: TEO KEE BOON Invoice : DCR-2019-08-24
Date : 20.08.2019

Agreement No @ 20921

Payment Term : LOD

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Rental charges for vehicle : SKZ B2B6Y ( 0819-21316 ) 5 300.00
Rental Period from  17.08.2019 to 20.08.2019

E. & O.E. Total $ 300.00

LINA PANG
for Dynamic Car Rental




Dynamic Car Rental

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6, #01<464850 AUTOBAY. SINGAPORE 417883,
TEL: (+65) 6741 7244, 6746 5405 FAX: (+65) 6745 8520, 6746 5786

Co. Reg, No. 52828467K

Ne. 20921
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17/08:2018

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Irvnice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

£ Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm

GST Registration No: MA00017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

The images provided 1o you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association of

Our Ref No: GR-18-133137

Date of Request: 17/08/2019 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Kim Chwea Auto Pte Lid

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBayEKaki Bukil
Singapare 417883

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Date 17/08/2019

uiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan
hicle No. SJINSB36A

Accident Date 17/08/2019

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle Mo, Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SJINGE3EA EQ Insurance Company Lid 18/02/2019-18/02/2020 6223 8433
Thank You.

Singapore and we lake no responsiblity for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoevar for any loss or damage arising out of
or in connechon with tha reports or thair iImages.

. is @ computer generaled document and requires no signature.

htips:/isingapare. manman comiclaima/index. cfm fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninvip&rafid=22481208CFID=576449628CF TOKEN=580.

112



171082019 Invoice

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE -icie 556224 0010 Fax. +65 5224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday (o Friday 9am 1o 5pm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE O oaistration No: MA000T7755

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No: GR-18-133137
Daie of Request: 17/08/2019 Your Ref No; Online Purchase
Kim Chwee Auto Pte Litd
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue & #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukil
Singapore 417883
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Date 17/08/2019
aqmr_v By Tang Kok Wee, Allan
Vahicle No. SJINS93BA
Accident Dale 17/08/2019
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S§)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0,13
Total Amourt Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This Is a computer generaled document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use;
Data:
[X] GIRD [ | Cash [ | Cheque

hitps:/singapore. menmen. com/clums/index. cim Tfusebox=MTRsasAfuseaction=dsp_goninvip&rafid=22481208CFID=5T64459628CFTOKEN=580..

Fird



' , / Conpuillants
i W = Prelid Company Registration Ne. 199607198R

U AVE | #0225 PAVA U INDUSTHRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (45} 62563561 FAN [ (045) 6254315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 30/10/2019

THIRD P EME
_ SJN 5936A {Insd Veh) |Your Ref No. DM18HO02292/JT
Vehicle No.
SFW 7767TH (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No. : GC&’EDI1BG1£434MD|=3=I2
Date of Accident 17/8/20189
Liabllity 100% -
Final Repair Cost % 4.280.00
Loss of Use . r _dgﬁ._ B
Rental (If any) |: 8 300.00 |. 3 days B B
Others: 'S 2.00 | - B
4,582.00
Final Setllement Sum |: § 4,580.00 |GLOBAL SUM
Remarks R — =
ment ‘P 's Breakdown

1) |FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

4,580.00

JOANNE LEE

LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industnal Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315
Aeg. No: 198607158R GST Reg. No 18-0607198-R

Affiliated to Federatlen Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref CCHB/EQIT19014434/Upb3g2
oW B AT
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 30-10-2019
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code : EQI
- Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJN 5936A Veh. Inspected SFW TT67H
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DM19HO02292/JT Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 18/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN SYLPHY (A) c.c 1588
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. MNTBBAB17Z0027243 Colour GREY
Odometer 35876 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOCD
¥ Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/B0R16 BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/860 R16 BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/80 R16 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/60 R16 BRIDGESTONE B mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  17/08/2015 Inspection Date 18/08/2018
Survey held at FASTECHAUTO FTELTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 4 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6258 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No 19-0807198-R Page No 1af 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SFW 7767H
Qty  Description of Parts Condition m.l )
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BCOTLID TO REPAIR SEE BO5.00 -
LABOUR
1|BOOTLID REAR LOGO NECESSARY 45,80 45 80
1|BOOTLID 'PURE DRIVE' EMBLEM MNECESSARY 60.00 60.00
1|BOOTLID 'SYLPHY' EMBLEM NECESSARY 62.00 62.00
1|BOOTLID LOWER CHROME MOULDING SCRATCHED / 315.00 315.00
CRACKED
1|BOOTLID INNER LOCK SERVICEABLE 105.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER DENTED 605.00 B05.00
1|REAR BUMPER BRACKET O/S DENTED 85.00 85.00
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER O/ BENT 32.00 32.00
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE TORN 165.00 131,70
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 35.00 35.00
2|TAILLAMPS @$450.00 O/S CRACKED a00.00 365.00
2| TAILLAMP HOUSING PANELS @%$255.00 QIS BENT 510.00 255.00
1|REAR END PANEL BADLY DENTED 465,00 455.10
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH TWISTED 365.00 188.20
1|REAR END PANEL LOCK SENSOR CRACKED 2B8.00 155.90
1|BOOTLID WEATHERSTRIP HNECESSARY 162.00 162.00
1|REAR FENDER QJS TO REPAIR SEE G981.00
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM Q/S NOT NECESSARY 350.00
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH NOQ SUCH PARTS 215.00
1|REAR END PANEL SEALANT NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -304 .27
8,761.80 2,738.43
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SHORTED 250.00 200.00
250.00 200.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING. 80.00 30.00

Report Ref No. CCG/EQI18014434/Upb3qg2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL' 6258 15561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 129807198R GST Reg No 19-8807158-R Page No.2of 2
Qaty Description of Parts Condition | Estimate By | Our Adjusted
ty pt i Wvﬂhhﬂ]lz““ | ($)
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING REVERSE SENSOR BO.OO 50.00
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX SEAT ,CUSHION UPHOLSTERY. 120.00 80.00
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING 100.00 50.00
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING 1.080.00 800.00
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR FENDER
/S AND BOOTLID
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. 1.500.00 1,080.00
2.960.00 2,080.00
GRAND TOTAL 9,971 Iln 502843 -
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,000.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) i
Report Ref No. CCB/EQI19014434/Upb3g2
CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Rapan s made solsly for ine use and banefi of the Cllent named s the lront page of this Repon




Joanne Lee (LKK Auto)

e e —

From: Joanne Lee (LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 31 October 2019 4:10 PM

To: ‘eqiprs@eqinsurance.com.sg’

Cc '‘chewht@lkkauto.com'

Subject: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJN 5936A (Ol) and SFW 7767H (TF) on
17/08/2019

Attachments: LKK REPORT & PHOTO,pdf: TP DS SUPPORTING DOCUMENT pdf

Dear SirMadam,

Please be informed that the above-mentioned case had been settled.
Enclose herewith final report & relevant documents for your necessary action please

Thank you.

Best Regards,

JOANNE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 emall: report@Ikkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933



