Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Jaime Tay <jaime.tay@egqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 January 2020 3:48 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIJN 5936A (Ol) and SFW 7767H (TP)

on 17/08/2019. EQI REF: DM19HO02292/JT.

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We have processed payment but there’s an outstanding premium which is not collected from our insured.
Our colleague from finance is following up on this issue.

Thank you.
Regards,

Jaime Tay
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: 15 January 2020 14:55

To: EQI PRS <EQIPRS@eginsurance.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIN 5936A (Ol) and SFW 7767H (TP) on 17/08/2019
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to our email dated 30/10/2019.

Kindly advise payment status.

‘Wishing you a Hapyy and Prosperous New Year”

=



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Reports (LKKAuto) <report@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 31 October 2019 4:11 PM

To: egiprs@eginsurance.com.sg

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIN 5936A (Ol) and SFW 7767H (TP) on 17/08/2019

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that the above-mentioned case had been settled.
Enclose herewith final report & relevant documents for your necessary action please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

JOANNE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@Ilkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933
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