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08/082019

Owner:

oo RO R ATA
HUI YANG MOTOR PTE. LTD. . oo

Contact Add . SIN MING AUTOCARE Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive #04-02 Singapore 575721 )
Tel: 64515752 (2 Lines) . Fax: 64514658 L
GST & Reg No. 201629438M

SKYWAY MOTOR PTE LTD

ESTIMATE TO REPAIR HONDA VEZEL HYBRID - SLQS8195L

Ipe

rear RH fender protector

less 20%

spray painting
labour charges
Total

et/ o 195.50

L]

$ 19550
s 10
§ 15840

"




TP Claim for SLQB195L against GBB7101L / DOA: 0B/DB/2019

oM’ Chin, Lee-Ying

; ’;: assignments, admin-a@@Ikkauto.com
Cc Fong, Andy-SY

Sent:  BMB/2019 B:41:31 AM

Attachments:  T8) sk C28719081315080 ndf

HI LKK, 4202 l4yle]ln
Kindly assist to survey, VMl

A0 &
Thanks,
Best Regards
Lee Ying, Chin
AlG

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd.
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +{65) 6419 1947

Lee-Ying.Chin@aig,com | www.aig.sg

From: Hul Yang Motor [mailto:hui_yang_motor@hotmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, August 15, 2019 12:53 PM

To: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: TP Claim for SLQB8195L against GBB7101L / DOA: 08/08/2019
Importance: High

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments,
Hi,

We would like to arrange 19/08/2019 after 11 AM to survey the vehicle SLQ8195L.

Thank you & Regards,
Sandra

From: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey <AIGSGP_ClaimsSurvey@aig.com>

Sunt: Tuesday, August 13, 2019 3:31 PM

To: Hul Yang Motor <hui_yang_motor@hotmail.com>

Subject: RE: TP Claim for 5LQ8195L against GBB7101L / DOA: 08/08/2019
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Bel,

P'zaze inform us when vehicle available for survey.




";har"nis.

AIG Claims Survey

From: Hul Yang Motor [mailto:hul_yang_motor@hotmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, August 13, 2019 3:18 PM

To: /.IG SGP, Claims-Survey

Subject: [EXTERNAL] TP Claim for SLQ8195L against GBB7101L / DOA: 08/08/2019
Importance: High

This message is from an cxternal sender: be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Sir'Mdm,
Please refer to attached Estimate and GIA report.

Kindly let us know when can we arrange our client's vehicle in for survey.

*Vehicle not in yet.

Tha " you & Regards,
Bel
Tel: 7151 5752

IMPORTANT NOTICE:
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential, If you are nol the intended recipient. you must not use ar
dissarinata the information. If you have received this emall in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply* command and

pui -ully deleta the original and any copies or printouts thereal. Although this emall and any attachments are believed to be free
of any vinus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which It is received and opened, It s the responsibility of the
recin -t o ensure that It is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or lts subsidiaries or

alijl+ 5 vither jaintly or severally, for any loss or damage arizing in any way from its usa.




_Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LEK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 17 March 2020 10:25 AM

To: Hul Yang Motor

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Your Ref: CC4/AIG19014421/KKb3 Qur Ref: SLQB195L / DOA: 0B.0B.2019
Attachments: AlG DV pdf

Without Prejudice

(save as to costs)

Dear Sandra,

Thank you for the acceptance.

We attach herewith a copy of the DV for your further action.

Thank you.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matier amicably without parties resorting to legal proccedings. No admission of liability. whatsoever. should be deemed | inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
linbility/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Hest Regards.

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchnao Ikkawo.com!Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hui Yang Motor <hui_vang motor@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 13 March 2020 3:07 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@ lkkauto.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: CCH/AIG19014421/KKb3 Our Ref: SLQS8195L / DOA: 08.08.2019
Importance: High

Hi khancha,

We accept the settlement at $443.00.
Kindly forwards us the DV.




Thank you & Regards,

Sandra

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna’ [kkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, March 13, 2020 2:00 PM

To: Hui Yang Motor <hui_vang motor@hotmail.com=
Ce: Admin A <admin-ala lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: CC4/AIG19014421/KKb3 Our Ref: SLQBI95L / DOA: 08.08.2019

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm.

We refer to the above matter,

We propose setllement on a global sum for $443.00(all in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negatiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially aftect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settiement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hui Yang Motor <hui_yang moator@hotmail.com>

Sent: Manday, 10 February 2020 5:47 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Fw: Your Ref: CC4/AIG19014421/KKb3 Our Ref: SLO8195L / DOA: 08.08.2019
Importance: High

Hiy Khuanchna,

May 1 have the settlement for SLQB195L7
LOD emailed to LKK on 23/08220149.

I'hank you & Regards,

Sandra




Tel: 64515752

From: Hul Yang Motor <hui_yang motor@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, January 10, 2020 11:02 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Fw: Your Ref: CC4/AIG19014421/KKb3 Our Ref: SLO8195L / DOA: 08.08.2019

Hi Khanchna,

May | have the settlement for SLO8195L.?

Thank you & Regards,
Sandra

Tel: 64515752

From: Hui Yang Motor <hui yang motor@hotmail.com>
Sent: Friday, November 29, 2019 11:08 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@ lkkauto.com>
Subject: Your Ref: CC4/AIG19014421/KKb3 Our Ref: SLQ8195L / DOA: 08.08.2019

Hi Khanchna,

May | have the settlement for SLOBI95LY

Thank vou & Regards,
Bel

Tel: 64515752




From: Hui Yang Motor <hui_yang motor@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, November 12, 2019 9:38 AM

To: Khanchna [LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Fw: LOD for Vehicle SLO8195L. DOA- 08/08/2019
Hi Khanchna,

May | know the status for settlement for SLOB195L7

Thank you & Regards,
Sandra

Tel: 64515752

From: Hul Yang Motor <hul_vang motor@hotmail.coms
Sent: Thursday, October 31, 2019 2:50 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@|kkauto.com>
Subject: Fw: LOD for Vehicle 5LO8195L. DOA- 08/08/201%9

Hi Khanchna,

May | have the settlement for SLQ81951L.7

Thank you & Regards,

Bel




Tel: 64515752

From: 5hu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, August 26, 2019 10:03 AM

To: Hui Yang Motor <hul vang motor@hotmail.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: LOD for Vehicle SLQ8195L. DOA- 08/08/2019

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -
LKK ref Officer in charge
CC4/AIG19014421 /Kkb3 Khanchna

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupeil kdasuta com | fax: 6741-4108

Bik 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Hul Yang Motor <hul_yang motor@hotmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 23 August 2019 12:09 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: LOD for Vehicle SLQO8195L. DOA- 0B/08/2019
Importance: High

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Attached LOD for your perusal,

Thank vou & Regards,




Marcus Loh




12182019 Adjustar Immedials Advics

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregnarssoriess
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Emall: sur@lkkauto.com;assignmenis@ikkauio.com

To . AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Lid,

Attn :

Your Ref ; B4265989215G

Our Ref ; CCA/AIG19014421/KKB3

Date 18 Dec 2018 "WITHOUT PREJUDICE"

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB7101L & SLQB195L ON 08/08/2019
Refer 1o the above accident.

The accident occurred when Insured vehicle changed lanes (BOLA 15) liability down against Insured. We have clarified
with the Ol on the nature of the accident and ha/she is awars thal histher NCD would be affected.

On behalt of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid., we have successfully / not successfully carried out TP Express
Settlement between your insured (vehicle no. GBBT101L) and third party claimant (vehicle no. SLQB195L).

Summary of offer made to workshop Hul Yang Motar Pta Lid is as follows |

Claimed Revised
Cost of Repairs (w/GST) § 102335 § 381.35
Loss of Use (1 day x 565) s 65.00 % 60.00 (1 days x 360)
LTA Search fee - 200 % 200
Total £ 100035 § 443,35
Amount of claim at Liability 100% 5 443,35

Enclose herewith the relevant supporting documents for your perusal.
** 1 days recommendation for repair

For your approval please.

Regards,

Khanchna Pothura)
LKK Auto Consultants Pta Lid

hitips:isingapore. merimen. comiclaims/index. cfm Musebox=SV Cdoc&fuseaction=dsp_viewsrsmart&naimgviewsr=1&ftype=2Adocid=502842014pc, . 111




INA2020 Marimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail | szsociated with |

‘SLQB195L (8426509892156)
[GBB71O01L]
"

SKYWAY MOTOR #TE LTD
Aug 8 2029 B:DOAM
[JASRICH TRADING FTE LTD]
Hul Yang Motor Pte Ltd

Aeply | Reply All | Mark as Unread | Print Message | Delste Message | Forward |

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sant on 04,/03/2020 14:45 PM,
To LKK_HG
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$443.35) - SLQ8195L - Claim Handler: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha

{Approved 44335l proceed with settiement @ $443.35 [COR-$381,35 LOU-$60 LTA-52] *subject to final repair bill & ATA

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.

hitps /isingapore. meriman_comiclaims/index.cim lusebox=5VCmail&fuseaction=dsp_viewSmode=1&iinbonid=16424858iDomainld=11810kjld=8.. 112




LEASE AGREEMENT NO.
DATE: 1TA62019

SMAZDTHM-00001 1

Schedule

This is o Retal Agreement made briween ws, SKYWAY MOTOR PTE LTD (heremalicr referred 1o as “the
Company™ which shall include its successors-m-title and assigns), identified as the Lessor and hoving ouwr
registened address 400 Orchard Road #1506 Singspore 238875 AND YOU. the personis) identifind as the Hirer
below include (which shall include your wocessars- in-tile and ssmgnsj:-

NAME OF HIRER{S] {IN FULL) : HOE KAR LIM
NRIC/PASSPORTROME NO. : S6B70716A
ADDRESS :BLR IO HOUGANG AVENUE ) wid-J 145 S¢230101)
TELEFHONE 1 92993760
FPERSON IN CHARGE i
NAME OF DRIVER ) {IN FULL) 1 LEE MAY MEI
NRIC/PASSFORT NO., : S1806682C
DATE OF BIRTH L BLK 101 HOUGANG AVENUE | #05-1145 ${530101)
DRIVING LICENCE NO : S1B06682C
ISSUE / EXFIRY DATE | 039572003 AQR2926¢ 3
COUNTRY OF 1SSUE : SINGAPUORE
NAME OF DRIVER 1 (IN FULL)
NRIC/PASSPORT NO,
DATE OF BIRTH
DRIVING LICENCE ND
ISSUE /EXPIRY DATE
COUNTRY OF ISSUE
NAME OF DHIVER 3 (IN FULL)
NRIC/PASSPORT NO.
DATE OF BIRTH
DRIVING LICENCE 5O
ISSUE / EXPIRY DATE
COUNTRY OF ISSUE
1. DESCRIFTION O al L
REGISTRATION NO. SLOBI9SL
MAKE / MODEL (HONDA VEZEL HYBRID 15X AUTD
COLOUR .BLACK
ENGINE NO | LEBSS52269
CHASSIS NO. RU31252250
COE & PARF
TYPE FASSENGER COMMERCIAL"
{“delere where mappheable)
Date. Time and Mileage for Collection (dste) {time] {mileage)
Dute. Time and Mileage fior Return (dme) (time) {mileage)
Pewrol Ohar Empty / ' tank / %5 tank | % ok /Full”

iVehicle musi be retumned with same level of petrol)

Chpawen 2




10D

Dl y'WeoeklyMonthly Y early* Basis
From L2B62019 (“Commencemen Daic™) 1o 14122019 (End Date”)

Thereatier, this lease will be sutomatically renewed on the same wrms and condrions as set oul m this
Agreement for further successive periods of one (1 ) day/week/imonth® each, on & duily'weekly'monthly*
basis, unless terminaicd arber in sccordance with the termis of this Agrocment

* delee whiere notapplicable

LEASE CHARGES
Amount SHSS00 per dey weekomonthyesr® inclusine of Goods and Services Ta I"GST")

{collectively, “Lense Charges™) payable in advance on the Frdav of gach dey'week month 'vesr®
("Paymem Dhute™).

In the event the Payment Date falls on & non Business Day, the Hirer shall effect payment of the Lease
Charges on the Business Day falling immedizely prior 10 the Puyment Date. GST is chargeable
sepamtely and the Hirer shall pay the prevailing GST wyother with the Leuse Charges. Tune of paymem
shall be of the essence

* delete where not applicable

DEPOSIT
Amount: SES00D0 (exclusive of GST)

The Company will be responaible for the road tax, maintenance and servicing of the Vehicle

You agree 10 pay the sum of SS_NIL on Commencement Date for the Company 1o arange ithe
lollowing insurance coverage for the Vehicle. The full details of the msurance policy will be provided 10
you and you undertake t0 strictly comply with the serms and conditions of the msurance policy

Escess for Own Damage 581 300 00 (exclumrve of GST)

Excess for Thisd Panty Injury, Death and Damage - $§1,500.00 (exclusive of GST)
Windsereen Excess : $5200 00 (exclusive of GST)

Damage or mmpering of Vehicle decal - $5100.00 (exchsive of GET)

¢ | .
Excen for Own Damage 553000 .00 (exclusive af G5T)
Excess for Third Panty Injury, Death and Damage - $33.000 00 (exclusive of GST)

OF drivel 0 g0 ol saluly gy of the enitern der paragraph
Additional Exces for Own Damage © 553,500 00 (exclusive aof GST)
Additional Excess for Third Party Injury, Dieath and Damage - $$3,500,04 (exclusive of G&T)

i

Personal swcial domestic use © Private hire e Uber or Grab Taxi - Others®
Ilothers. please specify

* delete where not applicable

L¥ )

fipion 2




You shall be linble 10 the Company for esily termunation 2s provided under the Terms and Conditions
annexed hereto,

PAVMENT

For cheque payments, plesse issuc the chegue o ihe Company end indicate the vebicle number an (he
back of the cheque. The cheques must be delivered 10 the Company’s regisicred sddrews as smted ubave
and any payment sent 10 the Company by post will be a1 your own risk.

The Agreement herem compnises the Schedule sbove and the Terms and Conditions snnesed herein, The Hifer
eatifirms that he has read, undermood and sgreed 1o the terms of this Agreement.

IN WITNESS whereof the Parties hereto have st thest hands ihe day and the year first above wnfien

Signed by the Hirer Signed for and on behall of

SKYWAY MOTOR PTE LTD
\7

Name: HOE KAR LIM
NRIC: S6870716A
Company Stamp:

Signed by the Additional Driver

Name
NRIC:

Company Samp:
Signed by the Additiona] Drives




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiane

CLAIM SUBFOLOER TRACKING . ——
| o Notified |Est Submitted | Adj Assagned Adj Rpt Az Submitted Ins Auth'ed Statui
08 Aug 2019 | N i $$356.40 $3156.40 Pamding for Survay
Main E Report
‘ et ] | wnaijn | | Smemmens || vovns | Cance Case |

Main
CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjuster] '
Insurnd. JASRICH TRADING PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No. 2007055200

Maimn
Claimant:  |SEYWAY MOTOR PTELTD, Co. Reg. No.: 1999904104

. . [ 08/08/3019 08:00 - ;59
”uf;”' " |sLqs19sL Date of Loss: | 54 uonths and 15 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥rj]
Claim Type: (TP / B4265989215G rolcy/Caver | 210017796 (Comprehensive)
Vaticie Reg '
Palicy Ne,
Mo GEBTI0IL | AZBTESIDAMEX
(Lnsured) (Claimant):
Expess:

Raphirer: Hui Yang Motor Ftl"!._'l_:!n{l"!g} 176 Sin Ming Drive #04-02, Sin Ming AutoCare, 575721 Sin Ming - Tel: B4515752
Fandling ALG Asls Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65-6415-3000 . |Mandied by Syed-Yusoff, Sallha] Saliha Syed-
Insurer: Yusoff Gang. com

g""‘"'_‘“ | MS1G Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: +&5 6827 7888

Adjuster: |LEK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel. 256-3581 __ [Handied by KENNETH KONG] . [Final Rpt due 28/08/2019]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compase Case muil |
« AIG_SG_EAPAESS [04/01/2020): Alert = Ad) Mandate Approved (S55443.35) - SLQ8195L - Clalm Handler: Syed-Yusoff,...

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= view Al | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Complets |

Due Date  Priarty Type  Task Group Subject  Handier Assigned By Complated On Created On~ Done?
No resulls.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 20/3/2020




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 2
Claim Documents
*SLQB195L (84265989215G)
[GBB71D1L)]
"
SKYWAY MOTOR PTE LTD
Aug 8 2019 8:00AM
[JASRICH TRADING PTE LTD]
Hul Yang Motor Pte Ltd
Uplosd Documents |  Uptad Phesns | Compeas New Lotee | Uplosd visss | Uptosa suse | View [Vies =1 Browser| v ]

Letters/ Correspondences L]__gg__gg m- &A
No |Finafized On LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbeall| Print
1 |(oratt) Third Party Express Settiement - Payment Breakdown Q| e
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: GBB7101L (Insd veh) Model: HONDA VEZEL 1.5 HYBRID
SLQB195L (TP veh) (A)
| Date of Accident: |08/08/2019

Global Sum Settlement [ : | [X] Yes | [ | No
Repair Estimale - 1,023.35
Final Repair Cost 5 443,00
Loss of Use - 1,00 days at $80.00 per day
Rental (if any) . 5 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee -
Others: o

H
Final Settlemant Sum (Global Sum) 4 - 443.00
Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [ X] NO (Kindlyindicate
balow)
A) For Non GlA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:
B) For GIA Registered Workshop:
BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability () (%a)
* Assessed Liabillty lo be filled anly for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks
Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1) |Hul Yang Motor Pte Ltd ' § 44300
2] -1
3 5
r
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN zgu’gg
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Fimal Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;
Meadical Report/ BIll {if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno 1ssso7158s)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Emall sur@lkkauto com,assignmentsi@ikkaulo.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/AIG18014421/KKS3Q2

Date: 20/03/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No: 2100178796
Claimant :
Vehicle No : SLa8185L Insured Vehicle No : GBEBT101L
Date of Loss: 08082018 Nature of Claim! TP Claim No: 842658882156
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SLOB195L
Make & Model! HONDA VEZEL. 1.5 HYBRID X (A) Engine No: LEB5852269
Reg. Date: 24/07/2017 (Man. Year: 2016) Chassis No: RLU31252250
Colour: Matallic Black Odometer; 182230 km
Engine Capacity: 1498 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (SS$). Market Valua/New Car Price
1 H AT THE TIME OF SUR
General Condition: Steering (Serviceabls): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Servicaabla). Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
COMDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size 215/60 R16 Rear Tyre Size 215/60 R16
Front Left Side: Davanti 8 mm Rear Lefi Side: Davanti 8 mm
Front Right Side: Davanti 8 mm Rear Right Side: Davanti 8 mm
The above values represen! the remaning lyre lreads depth
!EG’ST OF CLAIMS Repairar's _ Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 156.40 156.40 0.00 0.00
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 800.00 200.00 600.00 7500
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 956.40 356.40 600.00 62.74
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) B6.85 2485 42.00 B82.73
Nett Amount (5§) 1,023.35 361.35 642.00 62.74
+ Loss of Use (1.0 x S$360.00/day) (S$) 60.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 2.00
Nett Liabllity (S$) 443.35
Global Sum Sattlament (S5) 443.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 18/08/2019
Date Inspected: 18/08/2018 Inspected At Hui Yang Motor Pte Ltd (HQ)
176 Sin Ming Drive #04-02, Sin Ming
AutoCare
Singapore 575721
Estimated Period of Repair: 1.0 days
Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Khanchna Pothuraj
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NOTE: This report represents our findings at the ime and pisce of inspection stafed hersin, Such inapechon nas boen camed ouf fo the best of our
knovwledge and abilly but any offer llability under any offwr circumatances (s haraby expresaly excluded.
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 ‘REAR RH FENDER PROTECTOR Dented / Cut 19550 FL *195.80FL
F=Franchiza part. L=ListhemDisc
Sub Total (55) 195.50 195.50
- List ltem Discount on L Items 20.00/20.00% (S%) 3810 39.10
Total Parts (S8) 156.40 156.40

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellanecus tems selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 SPRAY PAINTING New 400.00 120.00

2 LABOUR CHARGES New 400.00 B0.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 800.00 200.00

I Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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