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Mr Lim

Celine FomL(LKKAuto)

A Eeme——
From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, 22 January 2019 6:19 PM
To: ‘Elaine Cheong'
Cc: SUR
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR MARKET VALUE & LTA REBATE - SKN2475X - CLAIM REF: 20180002289
Dear Elaine,

The market value for SKN 2475X is $69K - 70K (est) as at December 2018.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Elaine Cheong [maiito:elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 22 January 2019 3:08 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; admin@|bs-auto.com; fchong@stengg.com

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR MARKET VALUE & LTA REBATE - SKN2475X - CLAIM REF: 20180002289

Dear All,

Please assist to let us have the market value urgently.

Thank you.

Regards,

Elaine Cheong
Executive (Motor Claims)
Claims Departrment

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079809

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6530

Fax: 6224 747816224 7175

Email: elaine.cheong@sa.cntaiping.com
Website; www.sg.cntaiping.com




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 21 Jan 2019

Dep 200 yr
934{!/\%\/

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/ action/ enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTION_ID=FO30...

Singapore NRIC
0743H

SKN2475X

Yes

22 Jan 2019
VOLVO

S60D2

Black

2013
D4162T2719708
YV1FS84ABE2302813
84.0kW (112 bhp)
$32,298.00

27 May 2014

27 May 2014

1

$22,218.00

Yes
26 May 2024
$16,663.00

26 May 2024

A-Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$65,689.00

$35,104.00

$51,767.00
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Shirle! Hiew (LKK Auto) \

From: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 21 January 2019 10:21 AM

To: SUR; admin@Ibs-auto.com; fchong@stengg.com

Subject: REQUEST FOR MARKET VALUE & LTA REBATE - SKN2475X - CLAIM REF:
20180002289

Attachments: PARF & COE - SKN2475X.pdf

Dear All,

Please assist to check the market value of the abovementioned vehicle as at 20.12.2018 (DOA).

Thank you.

Regards,

Elaine Cheong
Executive (Motor Claims)
Claims Departrment

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6530

Fax: 6224 7478 /6224 7175

Email: elaine.cheocng@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

\NATUFRSAR)
In Singapere ince 1938
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Used Volvo S60 Car for Sale in Singapore, Prime Motor & Leasing - sgCarMart

* sGCARMART.COM

New Cars

FREE VALUATION
Let us tell you how much your car can sell for!

Volvo

Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance

| [ Price ha_ng-e“ v] Eibie;preciétion Wil 2014 )

Home » Used Cars » Prime Motor & Leasing » Volve S60 Diesel D2

Volvo S60 Diesel D2

Financial Insurance Accessories Similar

Resources
Car Buying
Car Selling

Car Ownership

Car Aftermarket

On The Move

Lifestyle

Vehicle Number Plates
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Add to Shortlist

Price

Depreciation

Reg Date

Manufactured
Mileage
Transmission
Engine Cap
Road Tax

Power

Curb Weight
Fuel type

Features

Accessories

Description

COE

OMV

ARF

Dereg Value
No. of Owners
Type of Veh
Category

Availability

Add to Shortlist

% PRIME MOTOR & LEASING

How much is my car worth

Login  Sign up

Articles

e R DY

vehicdeType 7| N

Forum

Research Photos Map

HENTLY MCTETRTED Y

SAE

[CHENG YONG CREDIT ENTERPRISES PTE LTD GROUP OF COMPANIES)

Add to Compare Add a Note Report Error
$72,000
$11,210 fyr (2]

View models with similar depreciatior

27-Jun-2014
(Syrs Smths Sdays COE left)

2013

Auto
1,560 cc
$1,244 [yr

84,0 kW (112 bhp)
View specs of the Valvo 560 Diesel (2013-2017)

1,549 kg
Diesel (Euro 5 Engine and Above)

Powerful And Fuel Efficient 1.6L 4 Cylinder
Turbocharged Diesel Engine, 6 Speed Gear Tronic,
Electric Park Brake, Multi Function Steering Wheel,
ABS,

Cruise Control, Keyless Entry And Stop/Start Ignition
Button, Electric Front Seats, Auto Head Lights,
Bluetooth, Parking Sensors, AUX/USB, Airbags.

All Times Service And Maintain By Agent. Viewing
Strictly By Appointment Only As Vehicle Is Not At The
Office Premises. Please Call To Schedule For Viewing,

$61,899

$32,318

§22,246

$50,313 as of today (change)
2

Luxury Sedan

PARF Car, Premium Ad Car

Available ‘REMILIN

Add to Compare Add a Note

Posted on: 03-Dec-2018 | Last Updated on: 21-Jan-2019

Tags: Volvo 560, volvo s60, 2014 Volvo 560, 2014 volvo s60, Volvo, 560, s60, Used

Volvo

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/info.php?ID=788067&DL=1292
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More Actions

Location h.pﬁap

Company

Address

Location
Office No

Contact Person(s)

!i%l

Price Analysis

Resources

Prime Motor & Leasing

» dealer’s pricelist

» 99 vehs sold | 157 vehs available

31 West Coast Highway #01-19/20
Search cars nearby this location

West Coast Car Mart
67782233

Bobby

86863300

« PRIME CAR RENTAL & TAX! SERVICES PTE LTD = SECTION CREDIT & MOTOR LEASING PTE LTD « BEST PETROL AND DIESEL SUPPLY PTE LTD + BEST ELECTRICITY SUPPLY PTE LTD

12



