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ar2020 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mall is associated with :

*SIM1008K (51209806605G)
aop
May 31 2019 11:20PM
[TRAN CQUAN]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Reply | Reply Al | Mark as Unread | Print Massage | Delete Message i Forward ]

From AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 05/03/2020 13:41 PM,
To LKK_HDQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$4041,20) - 5JM1008K - Claim Handler: Azlan, Syazairdina

Approved:4041,20:To cormence OO repairs, To confirm all check iterms and re-seek mandate after dismantling, Clear phatns to be provided for all
paid out parts and labour,

|
|

There are no documents.

hitps:#isingapore merimen.comiclaims/index.cim?fusebox=8VCmail&fuseaction=dsp_viewAmode=1&iinboxid=1643213&iDomainld=11&i0bjld=1... 112
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Rich Text Editor, SVYCDOCHrcontent

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (Co.Reg.No: 199607 1588
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

To: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
AlG Building
78 Shenton Way #08-16
Singapore 079120

Attn:  Azlan, Syazairdina

From:

Date:

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933

04 Mar 2020

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No : SJM1008K
Make CAUDI A4

Assignment Date  : 19/08/2019
Date of Inspection | 19/08/2019

Accident Date s 31/058/2018
Policy No. 1 1700083569-02
Excess 1 550.00

Est. Duration of Repair  : 3.00

Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMORBILES PTE LTD (UBI)

55 UBI ROAD 1
SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact /| General Description of Damages

The vehicle sustained impact / damages front o/s portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross)
Revised Amount

Check ltems (Estimated)
Tatal

Lump Sum Repair

Total Loss Consideration

MNew for Old Value
Pre-Accident Value
COE / PARF Rebate
Salvage Value

Margin for Repair

Remarks

(X))

5%
5%
5%
5%

5%

55
5%
ot
55
5%

15,836.00
4,041.20
0.00
4,041.20

115,000.00
68,389.00

46,631.00

The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage.

Kindly let us have your authorisation,

The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck,

Other commeants |

https:/isingapore. merimen. comiclaims/index. cfmMusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_rpts&rptmode=2&casaid=B29561&extid=313813&ad|cu. ..

M



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August 2019 2:40 PM

To: Claims Dept; SUR

Cc: {nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg)

Subject: RE: SJM 1008 K - OD CLAIM-DOA: 31/5/2019
Dear Tony,

Vehicle excess $0.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August 2019 8:50 AM

To: Claims Dept <claims@premiumauto.com.sg=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com:=>
Cc: (nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg) <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SJM 1008 K - OD CLAIM-DOA: 31/5/2019

Dear Tony,
As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle STM 1008K (Excess TBA-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408333)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
sent: Thursday, 22 August 2015 3:58 PM



To: Claims Dept <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: /M 1008 K- OD CLAIM-DOA: 31/5/2019

Dear Tony,

Pending approval from AIG.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Claims Dept <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2015 3:42 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims Dept' =claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SJM 1008 K - OD CLAIM-DOA: 31/5/2019

Dear Veron,
Any update on repair approval?
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Tony Foong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)
55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408699
p. +65 6366 2323, d. +65 67689911

e.mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Rad_ Singapore _159938 p. +65 6836 2223

€11

The all-new Audi Q88

welcome to the 8th Dimension.

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, i confidential and may also be privi eged
If you hive received it in errer, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system
Please do not copy itor wse it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment Lo any othar person. Thank you

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 20 August 2019 3:00 PM



To: Claims Dept; SUR
Subject: RE: SIM 1008 K - 0D CLAIM-DOA: 31/5/2019

Dear Tony,

Pending approval from AIG.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims Dept <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 20 August 2019 2:34 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Claims Dept' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg=
Subject: SIM 1008 K - OD CLAIM

Dear all,

Kindly assist follow up on OD claim-AlG.
survey had carry out on yesterday.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Tony Foong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automaobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199302271wW)

55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408699

p. +65 6366 2323, d. +65 67689911
e.mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg W. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159338 p. +65 6836

< W

2223

The all-new Audi. QS

welcome to the 8th Dimension.

Emakl Disclaimar

This ermail, inchsding any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged
i you have received it In error, please notify us immadiately by reply email and then delete this message from youwr sysie
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpese, or disclese its contents or any attachment to any ather person. Thank you

3



812772018 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail Is associated with :
“SIJM1008K (51209806605G)
oD
May 31 2019 11:20PM

[TRAN QUAN]
Premium Automobiles Pre Ltd

_R;all. Reply AII] Mark asmfgaﬁ] Print Mf:ssagﬂ Delete Hes_sagﬂ. Forward I ) _ [

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 27/08/2019 10:47 AM.
Te LKK_HQ
cc Victor_KohCK

Subject Re: POLICY EXCESS

_IDEEF Veron,

Please be |nformed that full excess waiver |s applicable for this case and the final excess amount Is $0.

Thanks and regards,

Syara Irdina Azlan

«<-= Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: syazairdina.azlan@aig.com; AlG_5G; Victor_KohCK
Sent On: 27/08/2019 08:45 AM

Subject: POLICY EXCESS

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please provides policy excess.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen

'DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
| There are no documents,

htlps:.n'fsingapom.mafriman.mrﬁclaimaﬁndax.v:fm'?fusah-n:=Svaail&msaanliumdsp_vlew&muan1&iinboxlrd-1 539089&iDomainld=11&i0bjld=12... 12



Br27/2018 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :
=5IM1008K (51209806605G)
oD
May 31 2019 11:20PM

[TRAN QUAN]
Premium Automobiles Pre Ltd

[ Reply | Reply All || Mark as Unread | Print Message | _Delete Message | Forward |

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 26/08/2019 17:45 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SIM1008K - Claim Handler: Azlan, Syazairdina

Maintained: To commence OD repairs, To confirm all check items and re-seek mandate after dismantling. Clear photos to be provided for all paid out
parts and labour,

|DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
| There are no documents,

https:ffsingapmﬂ.rneriman.mmfclaimsﬁndax.v:.fm?fusaboFSVCmaiI&fusnlinn=dsp_uiaw&muda=1&l1nboxiu=1 538598&i00malnld=11&0bjid=12... 1/2



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Fong, Andy-SY <Andy-SY.Fong@aig.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 27 August 2019 8:43 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: Koh, Victor-CK; Chan, Yoke Shi

Subject: Re: RE: PENDING MANDATE APPROVAL

Yes maintain as i reckon $8,000 will suffice. Please proceed with repair commencement

On 27 Aug 2019, at 8:39 AM, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.
Dear Andy,

Mandate still under maintain.

<imageQ01.jpg>

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Fong, Andy-SY <Andy-5Y.Fong@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, 26 August 2019 5:55 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Koh, Victor-CK <Victor-CK.Koh@aig.com>; Chan, Yoke Shi <yokeshi.chan@aig.com>
Subject: RE: PENDING MANDATE APPROVAL

Mandate for SIM1008K set.
Please hold for SGN8618) as we are pending further policy coverage review.

Thanks
Andy

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:ver @lkkauto,com]
Sent: Monday, August 26, 2019 5:37 PM

To: Koh, Victor-CK

Cc: Fong, Andy-SY

Subject: [EXTERNAL] PENDING MANDATE APPROVAL

Dear Victor,
Kindly assist for mandate approval

1. SIM 1008K



2. SGN 8618J

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error,
please immediately notify me by "Reply"” command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any
virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it
is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by
American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any
loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Fong, Andy-SY <Andy-SY.Fong@aig.com>
Sent: Monday, 26 August 2019 5:55 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc Koh, Victor-CK; Chan, Yoke Shi

Subject: RE: PENDING MANDATE APPROVAL
Mandate for SIM1008K set.

Please hold for SGNE618) as we are pending further policy coverage review.

Thanks
Andy

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, August 26, 2019 5:37 PM

To: Koh, Victor-CK

Cc: Fong, Andy-5Y

Subject: [EXTERNAL] PENDING MANDATE APPROVAL

Dear Victor,
Kindly assist for mandate approval

1. SIM 1008K
2. SGN 8618J

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408599
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183
Email: Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg [ claims@premiumauto.com.sq

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Waorkshop :  UbiRoad1

Contact No : G366 2323

Fax No * BB41 1183
Reference r PAJODIOT3G/20190KK
Date : 11-Jun-18

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.
Your insured veh no. i SIM1008 K

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name . Mr. Tran Quan
Address T 38 Wilby Road

#10-24

Singapore 276308
Telephone : [HP) +65 95626926
Type of Claim :  Own Damage Claims
Policy No. :  1700083569-02
Vehicle No : SIM 1008 K
Model Code F Audi A4 SEDAN 1.4 TFSI
Model | Year o MNowv-22
Engine No + CVN 045345
Chassis No L WAUZZZF45JA023388
Mileage .
Date In :
Liability ¢ W
Excess Cost . -
Estimated By :  Johnny Boo/ Allan Wu

Accident Date
Place of Accident

31-May-18
The Tessarina Condo Carpark

s ms



Premium Automobiles
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408599
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle. SJM 1008 K

Estimated Surveyor's
SIN Nature of Jobs Charges tecommendation
To remove and transfer front wire haeness for headlight,
1 horns , cutside temperature sensor and headlight washer S/IN 8 360.00 3 360.00

assy.
To dismantle and renaw front bumper and rhs headlight.

2 Re-grganise crash management components. Reinstall all 3 1,400.00 § 500.00
parts removed.

3 To respray front bumper, 5 900.00 $ 550.00

4 To carry out diagnostic check SN § 182.00 L1 192.00

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES I | 2,852.00 3 1,602.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408599
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax
Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SJM 1008 K
Damage Parts & Prices
S/N Parts Description SINett Remarks
1 FRONT BUMPER $ 104600 $ 1,556.80
2 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS 5 258.00
3 FRONT BUMPER GRILLE - CENTER ] 178.00
4 FROMNT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT - LOWER CENTER 5 191.00
5  FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE - RH s 56.00
6 RADIATOR GRILLE $ 1,053.00 $ 842.40
T FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE - RH b 123.00
a FRONT BUMFER CARRIER 3 733.00
2] FOAM FILLER PIECE 5 113.00
10 FRONT BUMPER COVER $ 116.00
11 FRONT BUMPER GUIDE SECTION - RH 5 34.00
12 SIGN "COUTION" ] 13.00
13 AIR CONDITIONER STICKER $ 7.00
14 FRONT BUMPER BERACKET LOCK CARRIER 3 125.00
15 FRONT BUMPFER BRACKET - LH 3 26.00
16 FRONT BUMPER BRACKET - RH $ 26.00
17 FRONT LOW TONE HORN FANFARE - RH $ 262.00
18 FRONT HOREN MOUNT BREACKET - EH 3 26.00
19 LED HEADLIGHT - RH $ 7,087.00
20 LIFT CYLINDER - RH - 182.00
SUB-TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 12,565.00 $§ 2,399.20

All charges are not inclusive of GST
Legend
Spare parts are Special Netl.

Remarks {OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No SJM 1008 K

Damage Parts & Prices

S/IN Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
cff $ 2,399.20
21 RADIATOR AIR GUIDE OUTER - RH s 33.00
22 RADIATOR AIR GUIDE INNER - RH 5 45.00
23 FRONT NO PLATE 5 4000 % 40.00
24 SUNDRIES 8 300.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 12,984.00 § 2,439.20
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 2,852.00 § 1,602.00
GRAND TOTAL 5 15,836.00 § 4,041.20

All charges are not Inclusive of GST
Legend ; Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks () = Mot approved

Spare parts are Special Nett.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note ! This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, piease refer to Ms Morah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 5 March 2020 2:30 PM

To: 'Boo seng yak'; Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR; Carrine Leong; Chang Chee Sing;
Jiayeeyap@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SIM1008K - OD AIG - SURVEYED 19 AUG 20

Dear Mr Boo,

Confirm repair cost of $4041.20 before GST @ 3 days of repairs.

Kindly send us invoice and discharge voucher for us to close file.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 3 March 2020 4:22 PM
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com=>; SUR

<sur@lkkauto.com>; Carrine Leong <carrine leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; Chang Chee Sing
<claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SIM1008K - OD AIG - SURVEYED 19 AUG 20

Hi Taufikh and all,

Revised estimate and photographs is attached.

Please confirm repair cost of 54041.20 @ 3 days of repairs.

Your early closure is appreciated.

Best regards - jb



