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ALG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
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Daar Sirs,

ACCIDENT ON 14-Aug-2019 INVOLVING GW2288U & SGI7870Z AT ENG NEO AVENUE SLIP ROAD TO VANDA ROAD

We are authorised repair workshap for the owner of vehicle, GW2288U, which was involved 10 the capbioned accident with your
insured's vehicle. The vehicle owner has requested and authorised us to assist him/her in presenting his claim against the party
responsible far the damage to the vehice,

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured, SG17870Z, we are submitting these claims for your considerstion on
behalf of the owner/driver/clalmant.

—

. Cost of Repair £1,605.00
. 4 days Car Rental x $200.00 $800.00
. Loss Of Lsa -
. Survey Fees -
. LTA Fees $2.00
. TP/GIA Fees -
. Medica| Fees =
Others

W pg

- e -

(EROE)  $2,407.00

We enclosed the following documents to support the claims:-

Repair/Excess Bil GlA/Police Report(s) [ _| Power of Attaney [] Medtical aun
V|

D:‘mmmpm GIA/TP Search [/] car Renta 81l Dwmmssmxmm
[:]t:uhumdmntngmphs ltmmmece!ﬂﬂcate mhers: LoA

mnd!vlmklntntherrmwhtmhmrhmwunnumgﬁumamﬁmrdlanrs:himasmupmﬂe.

Please note that it is & condition of any settiement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of
the owner/driver/dalmant.

Youirs faithfully,




Jia Le !Llll( Autn!

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 5 September 2019 5:55 PM

To: leo_ey@yahoo.com

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGJ 7870Z & GW 2288U ALONG/AT ENG NEO ROAD SLIP

ROAD TOWARDS VANDA ROAD ON 14/08/2019

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19014396/Uda3

LEONG YEE WAI

APT BLK 78 LORONG LIMALU
#12-71

SINGAPORE 320078

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGJ 7870Z & GW 2288U ALONG/AT ENG NEO ROAD SLIP ROAD TOWARDS VANDA ROAD ON
14/08/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from GW 2288U against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour as it is head
to rear collision. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lklkauto com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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Date : 15-Aug-2019
From : IBUILDERS PTE LTD {Name of Policyholder)
My Vehicle No. : GW2288U Other Vehicles : SGI7B707
Accident Date © 14-Aug-2019 Location : ENG NEO AVENUE SLIP ROAD TO
VANDA ROAD
LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

To : AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD, (Third Party and/er Third Party Insurer)

| have authorised ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD to proceed with the repairs to my accident damaged vehicle and to proceed
with 3rd Party Insurance Claims against Third Party and / or its Insurer on my behalf for property damages, costs, and
expenses, including loss of use, loss of rental, medical fees and legal costs.

To have absolete discretion to agree to any settlement of compensation amount in respect of my/our claim against third
party (except personal injuries and medical claims).

As ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD will be handling the entire 3rd Party Claims, which includes signing / submission of all
relevant documents and negotiation of my claims on my behalf, kindly forward and make payable all proceeds to my
claims to ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD.

I confirm that the payment of any negotiated settlement with and accepted by ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD will serve as
an effectual discharge of my claims against the Third Party and / or its Insurer for the damage caused.

. - -4 .Lﬂ
Policyholder's Signature / Company's Stamp (if applicable) Withness's Signature

Name : IBUILDERS PFTE LTD MName : ABBY LIM
NRIC Na. / ROC Na. : NRIC No. :

Designation :



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“The contents of this document o vehicls damages
”mﬂ%ﬂﬂﬁmm“m

“Well. ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD (“the workshop") hereby continy trar weA Re0elhed an
agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE_LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
§§2.200.00 (Global Sum) for vehicle no, GW 2288U that was damaged pursuant to the accident
which occurred on 14/08/2019 (date) along ENG NEO AVENUE SLIP ROAD TO VANDA
ROAD involving vehicle no/s SGJ 7870Z.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 19/08/2019 (date) at “the workshop™

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner IBUILDERS PTE LTD (“the third party
claimant”) of vehicle no. GW 2288U make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in @ manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant” after the above said sgreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to GW 2288U (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settiement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis,

This agreement is subject to the spplication of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over uny dispute arising out of the syme.

meualm apply o vehicie =
b aﬁagmm“"'“m -
Dated this _2 o (day) of _N evaa e (month) 20! of this documen™ excludeag

A

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)
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PROFORMA INVOICE: HQPI00024

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
78 SHENTON WAY #0%-16 SINGAPORE

079120079120
CONTALCT : 54183000

VEHICLE NO

MAKE
MODEL

MILEAGE

: TOYOTA
¢ DYNA 150 M

: OKM

DATE : 2B-AUG-2019
108 SHEET NO HISD0920
SERVICE ADVISOR ABBY LIM
108 START 2015-08-20 09:16:38
108 COMPLETED 2019-08-21 17:57:01
PAGE : 10F1

NO STOCK CODE DESCRIPTION

QTY UNIT PRICE SUM (5GD)

1 CLAIM COST OF REPAIR FOE VEHICLE GW22B8U 1 1,500.00 1,500.00
SERVICE RECOMMENDED BY MARCLUS LKK AUTD
CONSULTANTS DOA 14/08/2018
SGD : ONE THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED AND FIVE ONLY SUB-TOTAL : 1,500.00
G5T-7%: 105.00

1,605.00




| BAANDAN LINK #D3-28
a U re nt0| MANDAI CONMECTION (5] 778851 !N_M_E
i o N0, 1503
£ AURENTALS :
driving businesses o ses wo s QUOTATION NO.
OATE ° 30/08/2014
4 DAY
BILLING DETAILS VEH FIEETE"AIR: 1
NAME/COMEANY | 1 BUILDERS PTE LTD - NO. = GBFGI00H
NRIC, REG NO. | GE354944R
CONTACT PERSON | SABUR MD ABDUL
CONTACT NO.
EMAIL
ATTENTION TO | ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD
ADDRESS | 45 KALLANG PUDDING ROAD #10-11
BUILDING (S) 349317

S/NO DESCRIPTION
1 TOYOTA DYNA 160 5MT RENTAL 400

RENTAL PERIOD FROM 19AUG2019 TO 23AUGZ013

TYPE QTY  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
200.00 RO0.0D

TEUMS AND CONDITIONS AS PES AENTAL AGHEEMENT
INTEREST HATE OF 1.5% FER MONTH WILL RE IMPOSED 0N OVERGUE ACCOUNT(S) SUB TOTAL 800,00

WAKT CHEQUE PAYARLE TO IF ANY
AURENTAL PTE LTD,

FOM BANK THANSFER, KINDLY TRANSFER TCh TOTAL AMOUNT 5% 800.00
DBS CURRENT ACCOUNT: 072-006002-4

Thi iy 4 gorgrlssised decumant Mo pEtELueE 18 mauiied
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapore 048560
INSURANCE Phone: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCLATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Gam 1o 5pm
GST Registration No: MA00017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Third Party Insurer Enquiry
Our Ref No: GR-19-131894
Date of Request: 15/08/2014 Your Raf Nao: Online Purchasa
Abwin Service Pte Lid

Mo. B Kaki Bukil Avenue 4
#07-48 Promieri@Kaki Bukit Gato 2

Singapore 415875
Diaar SirMadam,
Enquiry Data 15/08/2019
"-quiry By Lim Hui LI, Abby
Vehicla No SGJTATOZ
Accidant Dato 14/0872019
Enquiry Resul
TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Inssurer Tel, No.
SGJTETOZ AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Lid. Z007TIZ018-18/072020 fif-6415-3000
Thank You.

The Images provided 1o you are taken from the eriginal reports forwarded 1o tha centre by the members of the Gonaral Insurmnce Association of
Singapors mnd we lako no responsibility for their accuracy of contents and shall be under no labilily whatscaver far any loss or damage arsing oul ol

ar in cormection with the reports ae thais irmages,

i 15 A compuler genarated documeant and requires no signature.



GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
GENERA'L & Rafflas Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

lNSURANCE Phona: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 D030
ASSOCIATION

Operating Hours: Monday ta Friday Sam to Spm
GST Registration No: MA0O01TT36

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No: GR-18-131884
Date of Reguest 15/0812019 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Ahwin Service Pie Lid
No. B Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
#07-48 Premiar@Kak! Bukil Gate 2

Singapare 415875
Disar Sir'Madam,
Enguiry Date 15/0872018
= ‘=uiry By Lirn Hui LI, Abbry
Yahicls No SGJTETOZ
Acodent Date 14/08/2019
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S5)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This Is a computar generated documant and requires no signature

For GIARMC Official usa
Date
[¥] GIRQ | | Cash | ] Chegue




