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Celine Fong (LKKAuto) Mt Lim

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 25 January 2019 6:28 PM

To: 'Winnie Chua'

Cc: assignments; Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: MV for SKW8113D DOA: 18/01 /2019

Dear Winnie,

The market value for SKW 8113D is $121K - 122K (est) as at January 2019.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From; Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 21 January 2019 10:43 AM

To: 'Winnie Chua' <pingping_chua@sg.msig-asia.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Subject: FW: MV for SKW8113D DOA: 18/01/2019

Dear Winnie,
Thank you for the email.
Dear Shirley,

Kindly assist

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Winnie Chua [mailto:pingping_chua@sg.msig-asia.com]
Sent: Monday, 21 January 2019 10:39 AM

To: Undisclosed recipients:

Subject: MV for SKW8113D DOA: 18/01/2019

Dear Sir,

Please let us have the mv for the above car. Tks.



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner D Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 21 Jan 2019

Dep %L}é@/ey

Singapore NRIC
4682)

SKw8113D

No

22 Jan 2019

TOYOTA

LEXUS ES250 LUXURY A/T S/R
White

2015

2ARF123981
JTHBJ1GG702088644
135.0kW (181 bhp)
$40,884.00

18 Nov 2015

18 Nov 2015

0

$49,238.00

Yes
17 Nov 2025
$36,928.00

17 Nov 2025

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

$57,501.00

$39,223.00

$76,151.00

OK

My Bk o~ (22



Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 21 January 2019 10:43 AM

To: 'Winnie Chua'’; SUR

Cc assignments

Subject: FW: MV for SKW8113D DOA: 18/01/2019
Attachments: 6.pdf

Dear Winnie,
Thank you for the email.
Dear Shirley,

Kindly assist

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Winnie Chua [maiIto:pingping_chua@sg.msig-asia.com]
Sent: Monday, 21 January 2019 10:39 AM

To: Undisclosed recipients:

Subject: MV for SKW8113D DOA: 18/01/2019

Dear Sir,

Please let us have the mv for the above car. Tks.

Best Regards

Winnie Chua
Admin Officer, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2556 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | pingping_chua@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220

OO0

9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg

A Member of BT U0 INSURANCE GROUP
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1/21/2019 Used Lexus Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

Lexus ES250 - N.A 26-Jun-2015 2,494 cc - Luxury SOLD

$2000 Republic Auto Warranty Warkshop Credit, Agent Unit. Serviced And Maintained By Lexus. High COE Value At $71,509. 1 Owner, Well
Maintained, Enjoy Exclusive Interest Rates At 2,.28%, 60% Loan, Plea...

Republic Auto
Posted: 29-Dec-2018 Tags: 2015 Lexus ES250, 2015 lexus es250, Lexus ES250, lexus e5250, Lexus, ES250, 5250, Used Lexus

Lexus ES250 Luxury $123,800 $14,460 [yr 30-Nov-2015 2,494 cc 52,587 km Luxury Available

Agent Unit, Luxury Model, Prestine Condition Very Well Maintained, By Careful Owner, View To Believe. Please Call/SMS Now For A Non Obligated
Enquiry, Trade In Welcome.

Posted: 28-Dec-2018 Tags: 2015 Lexus ES250, 2015 lexus es250, Lexus ESZ50, lexus es250, Lexus, ES250, 5250, Used Lexus

Lexus ES250 Luxury - N.A 17-Apr-2015 2,494 cc - Luxury SOLD

Full Agent Serviced And 5 Years Warranty By Borneo Motors Only, One Of The Top Notch Classy And Most Reliable Unit! Lexus ES250 Ensuring A
Performance Oriented Yet Fuel Efficient Drive. Spacious And C...

Posted: 21-Dec-2018 Tags: 2015 Lexus ES250, 2015 lexus es250, Lexus ES250, lexus es250, Lexus, E5250, €s250, Used Lexus

The best car deals without the hassle!

We have over a thousand consignment cars available for sale at highly attractive prices. All without the need to do paperwork. Pick out your favourite
car today.

Find out more!

Lexus ES250 = N.A 15-May-2015 2,494 cc - Luxury SOLD

Graded B by ST&

Low Down Payment. Low Interest Rate. 1 Year Warranty. Maintained By Borneo Motors. Balloon Scheme, In-house Financing Options Available, Buy P REMIUM 40 )
With A Peace Of Mind. 1 Owner, 100% Genuine Mileage. Well M... L FREWUM 10 J

GOwheeler Pte Ltd
Posted: 15-Dec-2018  Tags: 2015 Lexus ES250, 2015 lexus es250, Lexus £5250, lexus es250, Lexus, ES250, es250, Used Lexus

Lexus ES250 Luxury - N.A 13-Aug-2015 2,494 cc - Luxury SOLD

1 Owner, 100% Accident Free, 5 Years Warranty By Borneo Motors(Lexus), Elegant Silver In Colour With Clean Interior, Please Call For Viewing And
Enquiry.

Hin Lung Auto Pte Ltd
Posted: 07-Dec-2018  Tags: 2015 Lexus ES250, 2015 lexus es250, Lexus ES250, lexus es250, Lexus, ES250, es250, Used Lexus

Lexus ES250 Luxury - N.A 19-Mar-2015 2,494 cc - Luxury SOoLD

High Loan Available. $3000 Servicing Credit. One Owner Only. Low Mileage Done. Fully Lexus Maintained. 160 Points Quality Assurance Inspection
Done, Exclusive Interest Rates At 1.99% Only For 60% Loan...

Inchcape Pre-Owned
Posted: 29-Nov-2018  Tags: 2015 Lexus ES250, 2015 lexus es250, Lexus ES250, lexus es250, Lexus, ES250, 5250, Used Lexus

Lexus ES250 Luxury = N.A 04-Mar-2015 2,494 cc - Luxury S0LD

$2000 Republic Auto Warranty Workshop Credit, Agent Unit, Luxury Model, 1 Owner, Well Maintained, Enjoy Exclusive Interest Rates At 2,28%, 60%
Loan, Please Call/SMS Now For Enquiry And Viewing.

Republic Auto
Posted: 16-Nov-2018  Tags: 2015 Lexus ES250, 2015 lexus es250, Lexus ES250, lexus es250, Lexus, ES250, es250, Used Lexus

Lexus ES250 Luxury = N.A 13-Aug-2015 2,494 cc - Luxury SOLD

$2000 Republic Auto Warranty Werkshop Credit, Agent Unit, Warranty Till Aug 2020, Maintained At Lexus, Luxury Model, 1 Owner, Well Maintained,
Enjoy Exclusive Interest Rates At 2,28%, 60% Loan, Please...

Republic Auto
Posted: 14-Nov-2018  Tags: 2015 Lexus ES250, 2015 lexus es250, Lexus ES250, lexus es250, Lexus, ES250, es250, Used Lexus

Lexus ES250 Luxury - N.A 26-Jun-2015 2,494 cc - Luxury SOLD
Interest Rate From 1.98%. Comes With Panoramic Roof, 1 Owner, Full Serviced Histories With Agent, 5 Years Warranty, Call Us Now!

Motor Universe Credit Pte Ltd
Posted: 02-Nov-2018  Tags: 2015 Lexus ES250, 2015 lexus es250, Lexus ES250, lexus es250, Lexus, ES250, 5250, Used Lexus

Lexus ES250 Luxury % N.A 20-Aug-2015 2,494 cc - Luxury SOLD
Enjoy Low Interest At 1,98% Only. Luxury ES250 With Panoramic Roof! Fully Maintained And Serviced By Borneo Motor Regularly, Road Tax Just
Renewed Till Feb 2019! Agent Warranty Till 2020! 1 Owner, Pri... [ rresim D |

Euro Performance Asia Pte Ltd

Posted: 01-Nov-2018  Tags: 2015 Lexus ES250, 2015 lexus es250, Lexus ES250, lexus es250, Lexus, ES250, es250, Used Lexus

Save this search criteria, to get email alerts whenever a match is found.

Compare [ 1]

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?MMO=ES250&RPG=100&VEH=0&RGD=2015&MOD=Lexus 2/3



