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PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST - FBE3642C vs SMJ2236S (Ol) on D.O.A.: 09/06/2019

From: Hor, Yinrul

To: ‘assignments@lkkauto.com', Admin A (admin-a@lkkauto.com)

Cc: Fong, Andy-SY, Chin, Lee-Ying, Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa, Azlan, Syazairdina, Chan, Yoke Shi, Lim, Sheng Yang, Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur, Parthiban, Theerthan, Subramaniam, Divy:
Sent:  Friday, 16 August, 2019 1:33:37 PM

Attachments: [ ] WhatsApp Video 2019-08-02 at 12.31.57.mp4 %] 11375 Claim File-1.pdf

Hi,
Please refer to the enclosed request fromBan Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd.

Claim no : 8084555646SG007
Case Owner : Loh Chee Heng

If you have any queries/concerns, please let us know.
Thanks & Regards,

Hor Yin Rul (Viviane)

AIG

FNOL Adjuster |

Singapore FNOL | Claims Operations — Auto

Yinrul.Hor@aig.com | www.aig.sq

From: raymond@bhh.com.sg [mailto:raymond@bhh.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, August 16, 2019 11:24 AM

To: Hor, Yinrul

Cc: Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Azlan, Syazairdina; Chan, Yoke Shi; Lim, Sheng Yang; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur; Subramaniam, Divyashni; Parthiban, Theerthan; Tong,
Wahxin; raymond@bhh.com.sg

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - Accident Involving FBE3642C), FBN9445T, GBC9511T), SMJ2236S & SHC242H along CTE twds AYE before Balestier

Dear Viviane,

We are claiming against SMJ22368S.

Thanks & Regards,

Raymond Tan

Ban Hock Hin Co. Pte Ltd

From: Hor, Yinrul

Sent: Fri, 16 Aug 2019 03:16:49 +0000

To: raymond@bhh.com.sg

Cc: Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa, Azlan, Syazairdina, Chan, Yoke Shi, Lim, Sheng Yang, Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur, Subramaniam, Divyashni, Parthiban,
Theerthan, Tong, Wahxin

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - Accident Involving FBE3642C), FBN9445T, GBC9511T), SMJ2236S & SHC242H along CTE twds AYE before
Balestier

Hi Raymond,

Thank you for the notice of the accident. Noticed that this is a chain-collision accident.
Kindly advise which vehicle you’re claiming against to.

Thanks & Regards,
Hor Yin Rul (Viviane)
AIG

FNOL Adjuster |
Singapore FNOL | Claims Operations — Auto

Yinrul.Hor@aig.com | www.aig.sq

From: Raymond [mailto:raymond@bhh.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, August 16, 2019 10:33 AM

To: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Accident Involving FBE3642C), FBN9445T, GBC9511T), SMJ2236S & SHC242H along CTE twds AYE before Balestier

https://securemail2.aig.com/securercader/read.jsf 16/8/2019
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This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Sir / Madam,

We attached the third party claim documents and video footage from the taxi (SHC242H) for your perusal.
Appreciate for you to arrange LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for the pre-repair survey.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Raymond

Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd
Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 220 | Fax: (65) 6284 2969

Visit us athttp://www.bhh.com.sg
Facebook: http://www.facebook.com/bhhsg
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IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have
received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this
email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the
responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates
either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
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