Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: venessa.chan@fwd.com

Sent: Thursday, 15 August 2019 3:10 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com; clara.li@fwd.com

Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SKJ8411L &
SLB6249H ON 14/08/2019

Attachments: SLB6249H Ol GIA.pdf; img-815120540.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please refer to the email below and liaise with TP repairer for PRS.
Please create the case in Merimen.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Venessa Chan

Administrative Assistant, Claims

FW)

insurance

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.

6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986
E venessa.chan@fwd.com

W  www.fwd.com.sg

From: Venessa Chan - SGUser

Sent: Thursday, August 15, 2019 3:07 PM

To: AMA Automotive

Cc: Motor Claims SG - SG Common; Clara Li Zirong - SGUser

Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SKJ8411L & SLB6249H ON 14/08/2019

Hi Alvin,

Thank you for your selection of LKK Auto Consultants.
We will proceed to assign survey.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Venessa Chan
Administrative Assistant, Claims

FW)

insurance

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.

6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986
E venessa.chan@fwd.com

W www.fwd.com.sg

From: AMA Automotive [mailto:ama.claim@gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, August 15, 2019 3:00 PM

To: Venessa Chan - SGUser

Subject: Re: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SKJ8411L & SLB6249H ON
14/08/2019

Dear Venessa,

Thank you for your respond.

We choose LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD for pre-repair inspection of our client’s vehicle.

Thank you.

On Thu, 15 Aug 2019 at 14:53, <venessa.chan @fwd.com> wrote:
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Steven,
We refer to your email dated on 15.08.2019 of the PRI Notice of your client’s vehicle SKJ8411L.

Please find our panel surveyors as follows: -

1 LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

2 INFINITI APPRAISAL SERVICE

3. AJAX INSPECTION SERVICES PTE LTD
4 RT Appraisal Pte Ltd

If you are not agreeable to any of the above, we reserve our rights to request for pre-repair inspection of your client's
vehicle.



We look forward to receiving your reply.
Thank you.
*Please note that contents of this email should not be construed as any admission of liability on the part of our insured

and/ or insurers. We hereby maintain full reservation of rights and all defences available to us.

*Please note that we do not accept fax. Hence, please send in any correspondences related to Motor Claims via e-mail to
motorclaims.sg@fwd.com.

Thank you.
Best Regards,

Venessa Chan

Administrative Assistant, Claims

FWD)

insurance

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.

6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986

E venessa.chan@fwd.com

W  www.fwd.com.sg

= ‘Enjoy cashless medical outpatient claim at our

travel S i-".'_z Favat i
insurance




From: AMA Automotive [mailto:ama.claim@gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, August 15, 2019 1:37 PM

To: Motor Claims SG - SG Common; Clara Li Zirong - SGUser

Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SKJ8411L & SLB6249H ON
14/08/2019

Dear Sirs/Madam

Please find the attached PRS Letter and GIA report for your perusal. Kindly let us have the Pre-Repair Surveyor Lists.

Take note that the Repair Estimate will be ready upon the Pre-Repair Survey.

Workshop : AMA Autocare Pte Lid

Address : 36 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST #01-36
ENTERPRISE HUB SINGAPORE 608580

Contact Person : Alvin Wee
HP: 8778 3636 / 9017 3393 /
Office: 6200 0600

Regards

Alvin Wee
AMA Automotive Pte Ltd

36 Toh Guan Road East (Enterprise Hub) #01-36

Singapore 608580




Hp : +65 8778 3636

Tel :4+65 6200 0600

www.amaauto.sg

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain information
that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete the mail.

Data Privacy Policy Notice: AMA Automotive Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated in our Privacy Policy.

This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is
permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf).

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the use
of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please notify
the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not use,
disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any attachments.

Thanks and regards,
Melvin Wee

(65) 87783636

AMA Automotive Pte Ltd
Enterprise Hub

36 Toh Guan Road East
#01-36 S(608580)

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender
immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not use, disclose, copy or store
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this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any attachments
at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT been scanned for viruses
by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any attachments.



