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View Received Message

This mail is associated with |

*PATLB9Z (744356849315G)
[SMC2243H]
T
WOODLANDS TRANSPORT SERVICE FTE LTD
Aug 7 2019 3:00PM
[GOLDBELL CAR RENTAL FTE LTD]
Wis Engincering Pte Lid

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. [Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 07/10/1019 16:06 PM.

101152018
meply | Reply All | Mark as Unread | Print Message | Delete Message | _Forward
From
To
Subject

Approved:1965,95:Cost of Rapairs (w/GST) 1,658.50 Loss of Use 300 (2days x $150) LTA Search Fee 7,45 Total 1,965.95

LKK_HG
Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$1965.95) - PAT189Z - Claim Handler: Ler, Bernard-1Q

There are no documents.

tittps:isingapore. menmen.com/claimalindex cfm Flusebox=5VC mall&fuseaclion=dsp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=1561450&iDomainld=114i0bjId=9. ..

112



(IJ-\ WTS Engineering

WTS Engineering Pte Lid

B Gul Circle, Singapore 629564 Tel. 65558084 Fax: 68622163
Company Registration Number 200505706E

Quotation
DATE: 0a/08/19 LOCATION: Gul Workshop
VEHICLE NO: PAT1B0Z Q REF No: 019/08/1052
DRIVER: PANG PIOW QIE DEPARTMENT: WTS Bus Department
ATTENTION TO: ACCIDENT DATE: 07/08/19
PREPARED BY: Mustapa Bin Awang REF No: JW-0819-453
SIN_| Description [ aty [ costper unit| Amount S§
Spare Parts Pl
1 |REAR BUMPER 1350] A~ 1,350.00
Labour Costs 157 - 01199

._ 1 |TO REMOVE AND REPLACE REAR BUMPER.

2 |TO REPLACE REAR BUMPER STICKER.

iso| <V 350.00
450 P00 45u.uu|

Spray Paint

1 |Spray Painting

TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING REAR BUMPER.

aso| 792  3s000|

Remarks:

]
7 12/

Signature of W hop Dpt
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Signature of Department Head
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TOTAL: 2,500.00
Total Amount SGD 2,500.00
19625
8§ 15572
ﬁl @k\ \
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PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST — PAT1B0Z va SMCZI4IH (O1) on D.O.A OTIDEZDTE
Ferr  Har Yiend

Ta 'luwml.mm' iy & jaErneaf ik ks comg
ce Fong, Andy-5Y, Chin_ Lee-Yng, &b sassim, kinos Unriesa, Arion. Syassesdine. Chin Yoke Shi, Lim. Sheng Yang, Mimoosingh. Asthweetisalkecr, Parihisan, Thearban, Submmanion, Divy

" Senit WSROV 1004 AN
At 7B arosT peeneT) ouaisnon e

Hi,

Please refior to the enclosed reguest from Weadlands Tramspart Service Pe Lid

Kindly carry out Palicy coverage verification (lrat before conducting the pre-repait bepection within 48 hinrs Iﬁ"ﬁi""@ =S ] 3{ L)

17 you hove any queries/'concerns, please bet us loow.

Kinafly aorist 1o assign Mahawad Tuuftkh ar Single Jotnr Expert ar requeted WQ “Tw
Thanks & Regards, i wal hot h'"i
Hor ¥in Rul {Viviena)

A

FHOL Suicmine |

Beigapoes FACL | Cliris Cipammany - i

Zeyripndbye o | s il g

From: kenjie@woodiandstramiport.com.sg [mallo: kenfesdwoodiandstransport. com.ag

Sent: Thursday, August 15, 2019 10:19 AM

Tot Hor, Yierul

Ce: goofiwoodlandstransport.comsg; sichanBweodlandstransport.com.sg; Fong, Andy-5Y; Chin, Lee-Ying; Aby Kassim, Noor Maresa; Azian, Syarairding; Chan, Yoke Shi; Lim,
Shang Yang; Mithoosingh, Asshweenjeetiaur; Perthiban, Theerthan; Subramaniam, Divyashni; Tong, Wiknin

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEMICLE SMCIJ43H AND PATLEOT ON 07/08/2019

This niessage Is from an external senider; be cautious with links and attschments,
Duear All,

Wo rafer ta tha PRI above.

Piease b informed that we choose Mr Mohamad Taufikh as the single joint expert for this PRI

Thank you.

Thanks and Raegards,
Remil Loe
Claima Department

Woodlands Transport Service Ple Lid

§, Gul Circle, Singapore 629564

Maln Line -+658559 B0ES  Fam £S5 GHOA 2304
Direct Line | +65 6555 8954
sivrw.prodlandsiram ol oo g

Ve & [ ampieiviasd

From: Hor, Yinrul <Yinrul Hor @ aig.coms

Sant: Thursday, 15 August 2019 £:47 Asd

To: ken|llee@woodiandstransport.com g goo@iwood|sndsiraniport com g

Cc: Fong, Andy-5Y cAndy-57 Fang@aig coma; Chin, Lee-Ying <Les-Ying Chinfaig.com»; Abu Kassim, Moor Manesa <NoorMariesa Abuassim®alg coms; Azian, Syatairding
Syarairding Arlan@alg com>; Chan, Yoke Shi cyokewhl chaniaig coms, Lim, Sheng Yang <Sheng¥ang Lim@alg.coms>; Mithooungh, Aathween|eetiaur

<Azshweenjectiaur Mithoosingh8aig.com>] Parthiban, Theerthan <Theerthen Parthibanialg come. Subramaniam, Divyashnl <Divyashnl Subramaniam@algcom>; Tong, Wihsm
<Wahain.

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OLIR INSURED VEHICLE SMC2243H AND PATIBRSZ ON O7/08/2015

This s 3 secure, encrypted message. To read it, open the
attnchment.

CERESNEAN - IREELAe  RFEMS -

ftaninrrrdsastodonwilaimilady tfad et
R Ty



OIHE HHED BENE HAXYUC IUE HasR E

B IYE 2o

ini adalsh pesan, aman terankripsi. Untuk mambacanys, membuka

" attachment.

Chick hore by 2015-08-73 08:47 «08 to read your message.

Afmr that, open the sttachment.

Mem ola
Omaimirmey: Thes ormu BnE 01 EEEENT 2PV SENMEHATRIA] LT S EEOED ity (08 11l maE o ThE
addrwiars Fews iuflife e s if v hese ool (B ek eeres e smpey desin

Sevipwd by Prowslpain Rseeypeins. Cogy=ghl © JO0% JO0 F Prosipoae, v &) sghria
FastFwi

INFORTANT NOTICE:
The infarmusian in his amail (and sny anschements ) s confdential. If you are nol ihe ikenced recpient. you muest nel uss oF desaminaie e mormetion. I o W mosiisd this small in erme_ plasss
immudizady nalify me by Fepl” command and permarently delels tha eiginal snd any copes ¢ printouts thereol. Alhough ihis emaill and any stachmants are baleved 1o bo fres of By vine &

ether dedect Pt might afiect amy computsr sywiem ints which i In iecefved ani opened. 1t & e responalbity of e reciplen o enaus that @ i vise fee and no respansiility i sccepied by Amarican
Infamancnal Group. Ing. or e subsidianes or sflates sither joenly of sevenilly, for any ss or dareape arising i any wey from s wes.

M:MTM“M

Ce: Anoy-5Y Fongieg com Les-Ying com Moorkdanesa AtuKassmJag com Syalardma AslenE e youmsni chaniiag Snengvang Limilug,
Asstwesnsetsaur Mihoosinghieig com  Thesrhan Parthican@aig.com Diyastin Subramanismg)sg.cam m::.“mmm o - o
Bubject: RE: aigencrypl PRE-REPAR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING DUR INSURED VEHICLE SMCZIIMH AND PAT1B0Z ON 0TOMZI18

Date: Thie 15 Aug 2015 DOWET-10 +0D000

Dear SirMadam;

Reminder for pre-repair survey,
Kindly response to the emall below whether agree to the appointment of any of these motor surveyors below as a single joini expent.

Thanks & Begards,

Hewr Y Al (Viwlars )

AIG

FRCH. Ampsmar |
Emgaprre FROL | Claess Opesatines §0 Subs

Trwyl S T | e 8.0

From: Hor, Yinrl
Sent: Wednesday, August 14, 2019 B:47 AM
Tot kenjl i poolwoodlandstrensport.com.sg

les@woodlandstransport com.sg;
Cc Fong, Andy-5Y; Chin, Lee-¥ing; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Azisn, Syazairding; Chan, Yoke Shi; Lim, Sheng Yang: Mithoasingh, Axshwesnjestiaur; Parthiban, Thesrthan;
Subwemaniarm, Divyashni; Tang, Wahain
Subject: sigencrypt PAE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SMC2243H AND PATISSZ ON 07/08/ 2019

Wiithout Prejudics

:fm Heference < PATIENZ
Our Reference : SMC2243H
Dear SiMadam,

We refer to yout Notice of Accident ol even date.

We intend o condict & pre-repoir survey of the damage to your cliest's'your custames"s vehiele jointly with your elient/yous mstor workshep We proposs 1o use ane ol ihe motor
wurveyors named in the stmched lin 10 conduct (ve joint pre-repair survey s s single joint expert:

Name of Surveyar Company Nume

"AIG In House Surveyor AIG Asia Paciic Insursnce Pe Lid
Lawrencs Mg Chan e Pronity Services

Jelfrey Ong Leng Kimt Pricnry Serices

Jimmy Lee Prionty Services

EC Loai Automobile Inspection Services Pie Lud
Fang Kish Keen (Frankie] Formieam Adjusters Pie Lid

g Yau Hun Formteam Adpusters Pre Lid

Soon HanXin (Gury) Formtenm Adpasters Pre Lid

[ Chow Ho Xiang Formizam Adjusters Pre Lid
Clua Soo Teck (Benjamin) Formizam Adjusters e Lid
Kalvin Ang LEK Auto Conmultunts Pie Lid
Ximy Guo Qiang LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lij
Marcas Cheoa LER Auto Conswltants Pir Lig
Mutmrad Tanfikh LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid
Adiian Ling LEK Auts Consultants Pie Lid
Mahamrmed Hasul LKK Auto Consuliants Pie Lid
Kenneth Kouy LKK Auta Consultants Ple Lul




Picmse et ua knew within two (1) working days whether you agree o the sppantment of my of these motor surveyors 15 & single it expert. You ruay select one or more of the
Histed mator surveyors. We will bear the cost of the pre-repakr survey cumied oul by the single joint expert.

- mr-:uni'ms.

Haor ¥in Bul (Wivusna)

G

FHCL Adjnier |

Baingatgmes TROL | Clawns Opwesiions el b

T e cam | e e85

From: kenjilee@woodiandstransport.com g [maita: kerlee@woodiandstransport.com.sg]
Sentt Tuesday, August 13, 2019 5:43 PM

To: Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Chan, Yoke Shi

Ce goo@woodlandstransport.com.sqQ

Subject: [EXTERNAL] PRI PATIBSZ V5 SMCII93H DOA 07/08/19

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments

Atterdion Motor Claima Department WITHOUT PREJLINCE
Daar Sir

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMCI243H WITH OUR VEHICLE NO PATIRSZ ON 07/08/2019

We refer to the above accident and wunderstand that you are the insurer of SMC2243H

Dur vehicle sustasined damages in the above accident

Plasse send your surveyor B out premises at No. § Gul Circle, Singapore 629564,

Plaase contact Mr Chon of Tel: 5559 B84 / 9299 4122 for an appointment te view the vehicle
Antached s the repalr estimate for your perussl

For your Immaediate sttantion snd sction, plasse.

Thank you

Thanks and Regards,

Rt Lee

Claims Departiment
Woodlands Tranaport Service Pie Ltd

8, Gul Circle, Singapore 628564

Main Line - +E55559 8988  Fax - +B5 6A9A 2104

Direct Line : +85 65539 B354
wkweediandsitmnspetoomg

Eemg if omghieri



@ WTS Engineering Pte Ltd

YOUR REF 1 SMC2243H
OUR REF :JW/0819/453
19 September 2019

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd C/O
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25
Singapore (408933)

Attention : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir

’
7 #

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMC2243H WITH OUR VEHICLE PA7189Z ON 07/08/2019

We refer to the above accident and understand that you are the insurer appointed surveyor of
SMC2243H.

From our investigation, we are of opinion that the accident arose as a result of your insured's negligent
driving.

Our loss in this connection comprises the following:
1. Cost Of Repair 1658.50

5
2. 2 Days Loss Of Use S 700.00
3. Search Fees s 7.45

Total 5 2,365.95

Please let us know whether you are prepared to admit liability and reimburse our lass in full within the next two weeks
on receipt of this letter otherwise we will proceed the matters legally which we will recourse the costs Incurred to you.

Please acknowledge receipt of this Letter of Demand
Thank you.
Yours faithfully,

Kenji Lee

Claims Department

Direct Line : (65) 6559 8354
Facsimile : (65) 6898 2394

Email : kenjilee @woodlandstransport.com.sg

WTS Enginesring Pte Ltd e ——
8. Gul Circle, Singapore 628564 Tel: 5 550 BBBE Fax: 6 BOS 2394 l;" ’
) i, e
URL www woodiandstranspon com sg =
Company Registmtion Number | 200505 T06E

N



T L 00
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S1UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408913 TEL @ (065) 62563561 FAX : (651 62564315

Our Ref: CCA/AIG19014250/T1db3

05 SEPTEMBER 2019

GOLDBELL CAR RENTAL PTE LTD
10 RAEBURN PARK

#02-01

SINGAPORE 088702

Dear SirfMadam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMC 2243H & PA 7I189Z ALONG/AT CHANGI AIRPORT T2
TOWARDS SIMEI STREET 3 ON 07/08/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid to deal with the third party
claim against your policy,

We have received a claim from PA 7189Z against yvour motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and aceident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your
favour as your vehicle collided onto Third Party parked vehicle. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter,

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30%
(20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your
policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will
be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully.

.

CHAN JIA LE
Case Handler
DID: 6749 5792
FAX: 6741 4108

Emal; Jialef@lkkauto.com

C.C. AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



@ Woodlands Transport

Your ref raMmCaatasH
Our ref : Fewf0B IR DS

Date: | 5] 10123217

N ],f!.,'ll"j,ll’?"pl'_-" 'L.Ilj'i! Ay .'.[:Lh'_ Ly
prx hutte Consattona Ple i4a

3 4 Brrge, Ui TovdusToiol Packs, Uit Bee |

goxah  ALNOEG33 )

WITHOUT PREJIUDICE
Dear Sirs,

3 L

ACCIDENT INVOLVING Si40 1345 1] AND OUR VEHICLE NO PA 715 |2 ON _Tilofil

We, Woodlands Transport Service Pte Ltd, owner of Motor Vehicle Registration No.

PA 7183 do hereby authorize WTS Engineering Pte Ltd as my agent and

representative to correspond in, negotiate and settle on my behalf, my claim against the parties

invalved in the above-mentioned accident.

Yours faithfully, — .

S ez
Lim Eng Kwong —
Group Managing Director

Woodlands Transport Service Pte Lrd

B, Gud Cirgle, '5|ﬂ3,ap|:|r: 19564 ENIERIEE
T & 559 B9AR F & A9E 2394 SINGAPORE '1‘;' 6. i
Wawiwsdeni o sl QUALTTY CLASS Fo pl m4 —_——
UEMN: 198102721




RELEASE VOUCHER
AlG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim

“We/l, WTS_ENGINEERING PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have
reached an agreement with the appointed survevor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
S51.658.50 (Repair Cost), SS300.00 (Loss of Use/Rental), S$7.45 (Disbursement) for vehicle no.
PA 71892 that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 07/08/2019 (date) along
T2 ARRIVAL HALL (location) involving vehicle no/s SMC 2243H This is pursuant to the
inspection conducted on 20/08/2019 (date) at “the workshop”

We/l confirm that we/l are/asm authorized by the owner WOODLANDS TRANSPORT
SERVICE PTE LTD (“the third party claimant™) of vehicle no. PA T189Z make the claim as set
out in the above paragraph and we/l have full suthority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a
manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party
claimant™

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the evemt that “the third party
claimant™ after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered penaining 1o costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage 10 PA 7T189Z (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement 1s subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Couns have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

-~

Dated this ___"™™  (day) of OB imonth) 20_19 (year),
[ LKK
< TH |
o | \_.r

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop™ (with c%]



@y

From :Workshop Department

WTS Engineering Pte Ltd

M/S: Woodlands Transport Service Pte Ltd Date : 18-5ep-19
No 8 Gul Circle No: 0919/1048
Singapore 629564

S/n Description Unit Amount
Repair cost of PA71852
Accident Date: 07/08/2019
Repair works took 2 days
Lumpsum repair inclusive of labour charges 5 1,550.00
and spray painting
Add 7% GST $ 108.50
S5GD: One Thousand Six Hundred Fifty Eight
& Cents Fifty Only
Total 5 1,658.50

WTE Engimeering Pis Lid

& Gul Crom. Singapore E25564 Te € 555 8962 Fax € BOE 7064 UURL wiry woO0ISNdEr STEpon cor 3

Compary Ragsirsion Mumbe | J008057THE

Authorised Signature

5 histr, ==




Recejpt Page 1 of |
» Back to OneMotoring

Land Transpon Authoriny

Larnd Transport Autharity
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapare 575701

GST Registration No - M4-0006529-2
Print Date/Time : 13 Aug 2018 / 16:08:07
Receipt Date/Time = 13 Aug 2019/ 16:08:07
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No ' ITNET-00000-180813-002183

Pravious Recept No
S/N Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (S§) (S5%) (S5)

Result of Insurance Enqguiry - SMC2243H
As at 0T Aug 2019/15:10:00
Insurance Co: AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.

. 1 Insurance Enguiry - SMC2243H
Enquiry Fee 7.00 D49 749
201808131607 14252927
Sub-Total 7.00 D49 748
Total Before Rounding T.00 049 748
Rounding Difference 0Da
Total Amount Payable 745
Paid By
Direct eNETS Dabn
20180813160723656 [rmrn:':nmnm 745
Total 745
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 745
Excess Refunoabie Amount 0.00
. THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settied by the payment service
provider | financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee
may apply.

Print Receipt OK Save as PDF

hitps://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/complete Payment?FUNCTION _ID=FI1301001TT 13/8/2019
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiane

| l.'-l.allﬂ SUBFOLDER TRACKING

| Case hitafie Est Sulsrmitted Ad| Assigned Ad| Rt Ad| Submitied Ins Auth'ed Stotus
| 18 A8 2019 2%y Jm1a 5$1,550.00 | 5$1,550.00 m‘" Survey |
it Beg Eait Ad) gt | Ede fyvmatmn | | view noe | N MIMl |

Claim Dotails

Miin

| [Creatnd by adjuster]

= CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS
| Insurnd: wmmuﬂnﬂ.mtﬂ Co. Reg. No.: 2007105510

mm. .  WOODLANDS TRANSPORT SERVICE PTELTD, (o Reg. No.: 1981027210
Vehicle ' _ | 07/DB/2015 15:00 - 159
yeicie Res- paz1mez o Date of LOSS: | |5 39 Manths and 12 Days From LTA Rag Date (Man ¥r}] |
Clnim Type: | TP / 74435684935G rohcy/Cove! | 0999994314 (Comprahensive)
um:u Reg

SMC2243H [;?m":ﬂ, 5018V07061
{lnluﬂn] )

Extngg:

Regalrar: Wtis Engineering Pte Ltd (HQ) 8 Gul Circle, 629564 Tuas - Tel:
Handling AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Ltd, [Express) - Tei: 65-6419-3000 . [Handled by Ler, Bernard-1Q|
Ingurer: BernardiQinn. Ler@alg.com
f:;:"__’f“ Liberty Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: (65] 6221 8611
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 , [Handied by MOHD TAUFIKH EIN HAMID] . [Final Rpt due
| : 26/08/2019]

| ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view a8 |  compose Case Mas |
+ AIG_SG_EXPRESS (07/10/2015): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5$1965.95) - PA7189Z - Claim Handier: Ler, Bernard...

]mmmruni:- View Al | Search Tasks | Create wew Tose | Compiee |
Due Dute  Priority Type Task Group  Subject  Handier  Assigned By Completed On  Created On  Done?

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 4/11/2019



Menmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

Page | of 2

*pA7189Z (74435684935G)
[SHMC2243H]
™
WOODLANDS TRANSPORT SERVICE PTE LTD
Aug 7 2019 3:00PM
[GOLDBELL CAR RENTAL PTE LTD]
Wis Engineering Pte Ltd
i L l1perpage [~] B |
[Na_[Finaleed On | LKK Auto Consultants Pta Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print |
(3 |19/09/19 14:26 | Video - Accident [TP) 0 | Losd e
Letters/Correspondences [loepage  1v] W&
Mo | Finalized On LXK Autn Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 [Draft) Third Party Express Settlement - Paymant Breakdown Edn
Assessment Reports 1 ~] @
{ho_ | Finalized Gm LK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HG) | | Thumbnall | Print
1 18/09/18 16:13 | Adjuster Immaediate Advice I : BT
P/ e Dperpeee D1 &2
o | Reisbel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ] Thumbinall Print
1 1%T/1% 1447 | Odometer Reading | @ | Lone PG =1
2 | 1900919 1447 Chassis Number 8 wows |
1 |1909/10 14:47 | General View )| oaaws |
4 |19/09/19 14:47 General View B | oadirs | B
5 |19/09/19 14147 | General View 0| s | B
B [19/09/19 14:47 | Genersl View Q| aarws | B
7 |19/09/19 14:47 | Genersl View 0| wedws | A
B |19/09/19 14:47 | General View 0O | waows | &
B |10/09/19 14:47 | General View 0 | toadies | &
10 |19/09/15 1447 | Genersl View 0| wadws | B
11 |19/05/19 14:47 | Genersl View 0| taars | A
12 |19/09/15 1448 | Reinspection Photo 0| caaws |
11 | 19/06/19 14:48 Reinspection Photo 0| wawrs | A
|14 |1909/19 1448 | Relnspection Photo 0| waawc | A
|
Documaentation 1 per page ~]| &
Mo | Relabal/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd [(HQ)  Thumbnail | Print
1 |15/08/19 17:28 | EMAIL FROM ATG DD 15082019, 0 | LoadroF
12 |15/08/1917:38 | TP ESTIMATE Load POF
31 [1508/18 1728 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF
4 |15/08/19 17:38 WHKSP NOTICE s Load POF
5 |22/0B/19 09:00 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load FOF
& |19/09/19 14:50  |LDD Load POF
7| 19/09719 1524 SEARCH FEE Load PDF
B |04/11/19 10:58 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load PDF
5 |04/11/19 10:58 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF
10 |04/31/13 10:59 | Release Voucher Load POE
11 |04/11/1910:59 | LETTER TO &1 ) | Load FOF
Mg | Finalized On AlG Asla Paciic Insursnce Pte, Ltd, (SG) Thumbnall | Print
1 |16/08/19 10:01 | OI GIA REPORT Loag POF

Documents Checklist

|n-umnm: CHECKLIST

Reset | Save | pr |

|Th¢r| are no document checkdists configured.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 4/11/2019
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Qur Checklist Remarks - LKK Auts Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)
Fal
L

Shaw Remarks To: O Handling Insurer
MptE . REwarks iow privabe oiiesi giie i I [ DIMEF AECTEL.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 4/11/2019
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SMC2243H (Insd veh) Model: 'TOYOTA COASTER 4.2 D
PAT189Z (TP veh) HR (M)

| Date of Accident: | 07/08/2019

Global Sum Settiement | | [ ] Yes | [x1 Ne

Repar Estimate 1§ 2,675.00

Final Repair Cost $ 1,658.50

Loss of Use - 300,00 2.00 days at $150.00 per day

Rental (if any) $ 0.00 days

LTA / GIA Search Fee ' § 7.45

Others. 5 0.00

3

Final Settlemeant Sum 4 1,865.85

Is Third Party Werkshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate
lbelow)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Ligbility 100 (%)

[8) For 6a Regiss Appl ‘Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: BOLA Applicable o

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liahility (*): (%)
* Assassed Liability to be flled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply,
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) | WTS Engineering Pte Ltd 1.965.95
2) 5
3) -
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN o
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documants (o the form.
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Involce; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report)
Madical Report/ Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc&fuseaction=dsp_d... 4/11/2019
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreq no teseor1sary
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/AIG19014250/T1DB302

Date: 04/11/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Palicy MNo: 0999094314
Claimant .
Vehicle No : PAT189Z insured Vehicle No : SMC2243H
Date of Loss: O7/08/2019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 744356840356
DESCRIPTION & IDENT IFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No PAT189Z
Make & Model, TOYOTA COASTER, 4.2 D HR (M) Engine No: ND4CTQ11444
Reqg. Date: 26M12/2007 (Man, Year: 2007) Chassis No: JTGFC538X03000138
Colour White Odometer: 130938 km
Engine Capacity. 4009 ec
Market Value/Mew Car NIA
Price
Sum Insured (SS); Market Value/New Car Price
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable)! Yes Fooibrake (Serviceable)! Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 21575 R17.5 Rear Tyre Size: 21575 R17.5(D)
Front Lef Side: Yokohama 6 mm Rear Left Side Yokohama 6/8 mm
Front Right Side; Yokohama 6 mm Rear Right Side Yokohama 8/6 mm
The above valuas reprosant bhe remarng e neds deprh
(COST OF CLAIMS -  Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %
Parts 1,350.00 1,012.50 337.50 25.00
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,150.00 a50.00 200.00 17.39
Paimwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (55) 2,500.00 1,962.50 537.50 21.50
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 1,550.00
(5%) 2,500.00 1,550.00 850.00 38.00
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5%) 175.00 108.50 66.50 38.00
Nett Amount (S5) 2,675.00 1,658.50 1,016.50 38.00
+ Loss of Use (2.0 x 55150.00/day) (S5) 300,00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) T45
Mett Liability (S§) 1,965.95
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 15/08/2019
Date Inspected: 20/08/2019  Inspected Al Wis Engineering Ple Lid (HQ)
B Gul Circle
Singapore 629564
Estimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 4/11/2019
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Adjuster: MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID Manager: CHAN JIA LE

NOTE: This reper represanta our findings st the time snd placoe of nspoction stated hermn, Such inspechon hiss bean camed ouf fa thv bt of Dur
kmowiedge and ability but any oifer labilily under any cther sircumatances (s horshy exprasaly ascluded.

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 4/11/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4
REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
11 "REAR BUMPER Dented 1,350.00 F *1,350.00 FL
F=Franchiss part. L=ListiamDisc
Sub Tetal (S§) 1,350.00 1,350.00
- List Item Discount on L Items 0.00/25.00% (S§) 0.00 337.50
Total Parts (S§) 1,350.00 1,012.50

[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 4/11/2019
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

Thare are no new miscellaneous lems selected.

Recommended Labour

Mo Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour tems

1 TO REMOVE AND REPLACE REAR BUMPER Mew 350.00 300.00

2 TO REPLACE REAR BUMPER STICKER New 450.00 400.00

K] TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING REAR BUMPER Mew 350.00 250,00

Gross Labour Cost [S5) 1,150.00 950.00

Report was unsubmitied duning this print-out. _]

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 4/11/2019



