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" Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Hi Team,

TP PRS for SKN7239D please.

lvy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Thursday, 15 August 2019 4:08 PM
Admin-D (LKKAuto)

sur@lkkauto.com; Julie Mangubat

FW: TPPD Survey: Claim ref:C10003752/JM

Est:0.00 || Ryder Auto
SJK2941U PRS NOTICE.pdf

Workshop has chosen Mr. Kenneth or Marcus to survey the vehicle.

Please confirm.
Regards,

Ivy Ratilla

Executive, Claims Admin

T +65 6540 2185
F +65 6725 0853

E ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sq

Trusted

Budget s
Direct Ao

insurance |-

Customer Care +65 6221 2111

Claims +65 6221 2199

Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01

Singapore Shopping Centre

Singapore
239924
budgetdirect.com.s

auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (

Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA)
General) and is for the intended addressee.
reflect the views of the stated author but m
confidential and subject to copyright. It ma
confidentiality and privilege have not been

email is unauthorised.

|| OI- SKN7239D (Silver) TP- SKN7239D I

Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget

Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
ay not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is

y be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this



"This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is
* for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the
stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may
be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use,
interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.

From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 15 August 2019 11:11 AM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Urgent: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION: Your Vehicle SKN7239D; Our Vehicle SJK2941U Accident involving
SJK2941U & SKN7239D On 14 August 2019

Dear Sir,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly find attached PRS for your necessary action.
For Direct Settlement cases, we only use your in-house surveyor. Kindly arrange your in-house surveyor.
Thank you.

Best regards
June

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19, 02-22 AutoHub @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417921
Tel : 67418277 Fax: 67468277

5 Tuas Ave 3 BS Logistics Hub Singapore 639405
Fax: 64815390

|

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential
and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and
privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.



Ryder......

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19/22, AutoHub @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417921
Email: ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com
Tel: 67418277 Fax: 67468277

Our Ref: SJK2941U Date : 15 August 2019

Auto & General Insurance (S) Pte Ltd
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre

Singapore 239924
Dear Sir,

PROPERTY DAMAGE CLAIM
CLAIMANT : WEE YING KONG

ACCIDENT INVOLVING : SJK2941U & SKN7239D ALONG JURONG WEST AVE 4
SLIP ROAD TWDS JALAN BAHAR ON 14 AUGUST 2019

We act for WEE YING KONG, the owner of vehicle no. SJK2941U, which was involved in the
aforesaid accident.

Kindly be notified that we are claiming against your insured motor vehicle no. SKN7239D

for damages, costs and disbursements as a result of your insured driver’s negligence. Kindly
let us know if you wish to conduct a pre-repair inspection on our client's motor vehicle at our
workshop, 2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19, Autohub @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417921.

Please arrange with the undersigned via mobile 97924673 Mr Chan. Kindly reply within the
next two (2) working days or we shall proceed with our own necessary procedures and repairs.

This PRS is on a “Direct Settlement” basis, hence we shall be furnishing an estimate for your
surveyor to finalise as soon as possible.

Kindly reply either via email, fax or mobile.
Thank you.
Yours faithfully,

Ryder Auto Pte Ltd

ﬁ.LLgu

Chan San Choon

Director
DipEng, AAE MIMI, MSAE(Aust)

WD) = oo 448778 1999 Mlobjl I 4isATE,

LS Authorised Reporting Centre 24 hr accident call




‘,15/08 2019 FRI 10:44 FAX [dloo1/005

1

MSME18107028 / SME Motor Pte Lic - Kaki Bukit
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 15/08/2018 16:29
SUBMITTED BY: Chia Pei Ying

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correclly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.

2. This Form must be completed by the Palicyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies to
repudiate policy liability.

4, The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an agmission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This reporl will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by lhe General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties.

7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent ta the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made available

aforesaid.

Date Of Report 15/08/2018 16:29

Date Of Accident 14/08/2019 14:00

Exact Location Of Accident JURONG WEST AVE 4 SLIP RD TWDS JALAN BAHAR
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

Vehicle Registration Number SJK2941U

InsuredPolicyhe

Name Of Registered Owner
NRIC No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phone Na

Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

far repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken

Vehicle Category

WEE YING KONG
525034434

NOEMAIL

(LOCAL) +65-83556026
OFFICE-97329511

TOYOTA
WISH

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

Type Of Coverage
Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Name of Driver
NRIC No

Date Of Birth
Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Mobile Number
Fax Number
Contact Number
EMail Address

LIBERTY INSURANCE PTE LTD
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

S118V12236/VPE/RO3

WEE YING KONG
S$2503443J

17/09/1953

INDOCR

230711975

44 YEARS AND 0 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-83556026

OFFICE-97329511
NOEMAIL

Page 1 of 14



16/08 2019 FRI 10:44 FAX [@ooz2/005

Address BLK 732 JURONG WEST ST 73 #12-36
Postcode 640732

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OWNER

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle =

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)

involved in the accident 2

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| he-w_e. been approacr]ed by ugknuwn lperson(s) NO

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 2

Passenger 1 NAME:  : WONG SIEW GEOK

GENDER: : FEMALE

T

Was the accndent reported to the police? NO
If Yes,Please state which Police Station
Was natice of intended Prosecution given? NO

If Yes agamsl whom'P

I WAS TRAVELL]NG ALONG JURONG WEST AVE 4 SLIP ROAD TOWARDS JALAN BAHAR VEH!CLE AHEAD SLOWED

DOWN AND STOPPED I FOLLOWED SUIT MOMENTS LATER VEHICLE B REAR ENDED MY VEHICLE

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

Was there any audio recorded? NO

Vehicle Registration Number SKN7239D
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour

Details Of Properties VEHICLE B
Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Name of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage

Page 2 of 14
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Sketch Plan #2 Pg. 1
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

| WAS TRAVELLING ALONG JURONG WEST AVE 4 SLIP ROAD TOWARDS JALAN
BAHAR. VERICLE AHEAD SLOWED DOWN AND STUPPED. | FOLLOWED SUIT.

—MOMENTSLATERVERICLE B-REAR-ENDED-MY-MEHICLE.

DECLARATION
I/ We declare the faregoing particulars are true in every respect.

11a

[d@oos/005

Policyholder's Signature Driver’s Signature Reporting Centre Personnel’s Signature
Date & Time: (if driver is not the policyhalder) Name:
Date & Time: NRIC / FIN No.:

Page 5 of 14



> Back to OneMotoring

iEnquire Transfer Fee

R e e S R e e e e, Ty

Vehicle No.: SJK2941U

Vehicle Type: P11 - Passenger Station Wagon/Jeep/Land Rover
Vehicle Attachment 1: No Attachment

Vehicle Scheme: Normal

Vehicle Make : TOYOTA

Vehicle Model : WISH 1.8 AUTO

Chassis No.: JTDER12W103000526

Propellant : Petrol

Engine No.: 1273124322

Engine Capacity: 1794 cc

Maximum Power Output ;

97.0 kW (130 bhp)

Maximum Laden Weight : 1885 kg
Unladen Weight 1310 kg
Year Of Manufacture : 2008
Original Registration Date : 15 Oct 2008
Lifespan Expiry Date ; -

COE Category: B -Car (1601cc & above)
PQP Paid : $32,279.00
COE Expiry Date: 14 Oct 2028
Road Tax Expiry Date : 14 Oct 2019
Inspection Due Date : 14 Oct 2019
Intended Transfer Date : 19 Aug 2019
CO2 Emission: -

CO Emission: -

HC Emission ; -

NOx Emission : -

PM Emission : -

The current road tax expiry is 14 Oct 2019. You may renew the road tax from 15 Jul 2019 with all pre-requisite(s) fulfilled. If the road tax is renewed after 14 Oct
2019, late renewal fee(s) will be imposed. Please use Enquire Road Tax Payable tocheck on the late fee(s) payable.

Road tax, including Over Payment (if any), of a vehicle will follow the vehicle to the new registered owner when its ownership is being transferred.

Amount Before GST GST Amount Amount After GST

(S$) (%) (S$)

Transfer Fee: 25.00 - 25.00

Sub Total: 25.00

Nett Road Tax Amount (After 584.00 - 584.00
Offsetting Over Payment) :

Total Amount Payable : 609.00

Amount Before GST GST Amount Amount After GST

(%) (S9) (S%)

Transfer Fee: 25.00 - 25.00

Sub Total : 25.00

Nett Road Tax Amount (After 1,167.00 - 1,167.00
Offsetting Over Payment) :

Total Amount Payable : 1,192.00

You may print this page for reference.

OK

Print



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 443)
R e ey S )
Vehicle No.: SJK2941U
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 19 Aug 2019
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: WISH 1.8 AUTO
Primary Colour: Grey
Manufacturing Year: 2008
Engine No.: 1273124322
Chassis No.: JTDER12W103000526
Maximum Power Qutput: 97.0 kW (130 bhp)
Open Market Value: $18,803.00
Original Registration Date: 15 Oct 2008
First Registration Date: 15 Oct 2008
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $18,803.00
RT3 T VT s o2 S A b msaul MR P B R o ) 2 S S oA Sy e |
PARF Eligibility: Forfeited
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Elnfen e SO e D R e s L sy SRy
COE Expiry Date: 14 Oct 2028
COE Category: B - Car (1601cc & above)
COE Period(Years): 10
PQP Paid: $32,279.00
COE Rebate Amount: $29,540.00
Total Rebate Amount: $29,540.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 19 Aug 2019
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Mileage =

Veh Type [ ISPITE ~ [

Any Available

B

i
Search Selection Toyota Wish

[ Toyota Wish 1.8A (COE $11.588  $7,650 /yr  23-Feb-2006 1,794cc 350,000 km MPV Available
till 02/2021)

HiFi, Car Camera.

!;kO\YAJ 1 Owner. Paper ‘\Tﬂluc $8.5k.

DIRECT OWHER

[Tl Toyota Wish 1.8A X (COE  $41,800  $8,510/yr  17-Jul-2009 1,797 cc 102,000 km MPV Available
till 07/2024)

Keyless Entry, Best Selling MPV Of All Time. Powerful And Yet Fuel Economical. Serviced Regularly
And Well Maintained. Good For Big Families Or With Kids. No Compromise On Spacious And
Comfort. 100% Loan Available. Do Call Our Dedicated Sales Consultant For Mor...

MS Carz

7 Pasied: 1D-Ayg-2019 Ta PiHF) Tervoin Wisle 2009 igyots wisdi. Tovots Wik, toyotn wish, Tovom, ¥ aialy, Ul Togot

[0 Toyota Wish 1.8A X (COE  $59,800  $6,110/yr  09-Jun-2009 1,797 cc 110,000 km MPV Available
till 05/2029)

I Owner, Low Mileage, Accident Free. Bank/In House Loan Available. Cheapest In The Market.

| Tayota Wish 1.8A X $67,800  $6,930 /yr  26-Jun-2009 1,797 cc - MPV Available
Sunroof (COE till 05/2029)

1 Year In House Warranty, Full Loan Available, 2 x Free Servicing, Warranty Not By 3rd Party
Workshop, Price Stated Above Is Actual Selling Price, Our Company Renew COE Car Based On
Condition Not On Ownership, New Paintwork, Fully Refurbished, Accident Free, ST...

Carway

¢ Pusted 19-A0Z010 Tages. 2000 Toyotn Wish, 2000 tyerts wish, Tovats Wishi ownta wish, Toynts, Wishi, wisly, Used Tovnts

GETYOUR Is your COE expiring? Let us help you renew it!

d Getting your COE renewed is easy, fast and affordable. We'll help you renew your COE and get a loan for it. Get
EgﬁﬁWAL the cheapest loan in town and an approval in 2 days without effort! Enquire today.

[ Toyota Wish 1.8A (COE $11,800  $7,700 /yr  21-Mar-2006 1,794 cc - MPV Available
till 02/2021)

Lowest In Market. Vehicle In Decent Condition. Please Call For Viewing Appointment First Before
Coming.

[C] Toyota Wish 1.8A X (COE  $65,800  $6,680 /yr  26-Jun-2009 1,797 cc 98,488 km MPV Available
till 06/2029)

Smooth Engine, Easy To Maintain Unit, Immaculate Condition, Depreciation Is Even Cheaper, Do Not
Miss, Bank And In House Loan Available! Trade In Welcome. Call For Appointment For A Test Drive
Now Before The Car Is Gone.

i!-g [l Toyota Wish 1.8A X (New  S$60,800  $6,080 /yr  26-Jun-2009 1,797 cc - MPV Available
. 10-yr COE)
g, 5 Years COE Renewal For $42,800. Selling Cheap! Hurry! View Now. Up To 100% Flexible Loan. We

" Provide Lowest Interest Rate. Flexible Loan And High Trade In Are Available. Package With Unrivaled
Warranty Complete With Certificate And Test Report. Check Out Our New...

Classic Credit Pte Ltd
"5 Posted 19-Aug-201" T 20090 Tuveie Wish, 2009 1avota wish. Toyota Wish, wyou wish, Ty o, Wish wgh Used Tovota
0 Toyota Wish 1.8A (COE 514,800 $8,290 /yr  02-Jun-2006 1,794 cc - MPV Available

till 06/2021) R
Full Loan Available At $1k Plus, We Can Help To Conver To Z10 Usage If Needed. In House Loan Or a—



Bank Loan Available! Fast, Easy And Flexible Loan Approval! We Are sgCarMart Premium Dealer!
Buy With Confidence! Viewing And Test Drive Available Daily Including Wee...

88 Motor Trading

i [ Toyota Wish 1.8A X (OPC) ' $40.500  $8,090 Ayt 19-Aug-2009 1,797 cc - MPV Available
(New 5-yr COE)

OPC CONVERT! LOW MILLEAGE! $0 Down Payment Scheme Available. Interest From 3.18%. Bank
Loan And In House Loan Available. Lowest Monthly Installment $701, Trade In Welcome.

Pusted: [S-ARZ2019  Tags. 2000 Tayae Wich, 2004

3 Witk toyois wigh, Toyala, Wi i, Uséd Tovota

[T Toyota Wish 1.84 X §29.800  §8,440 /yr  29-Feb-2008 1,794 cc 108,000 km MPV Available
Limited (COE rill 02/2023)

6 Months Warranty, Excellent Condition, Accident Free, Bank Loan/In House Loan Available, Trade In
Welcome.

BlackVue DR750S Car Camera

Equipped with Sony Starvis CMOS Sensor, this blackvue full HD cloud camera gives you best image quality
under any light condition. Find the list of the best cameras available, each with product information and user
reviews,

Find out more!

[ Toyota Wish 1.8A X (New  $61,800  $6,170 /yr  30-Jul-2009 1,797 cc ; MPV  Available
10-yr COE) ]

Graded B by ST®

3.18% Per Annum. $688 Monthly. $0 Admin Fees For All GV Purchase. STA Grade B. 2 Years

Warranty For Engine And Gearbox. Inhouse Finance,inhouse Workshop And Paintshop All Under One

Roof. Buy With Assurance. Warranty Booklet And STA Report Will Be Given.

GV Credit Pte Ltd

i Toyota Wish 1.8A X (COE  $40.800  $8,290 /yr  20-Jul-2009 1,797 cc - MPV Available

il 07/2024)

3.18% Per Annum. $688 Monthly. $0 Admin Fees For All GV Purchase. STA Grade B. 2 Years
Warranty For Engine And Gearbox. Inhouse Finance,inhouse Workshop And Paintshop All Under One .
Roof. Buy With Assurance. Warranty Booklet And STA Report Will Be Given. M

GV Credit Pte Ltd

Ty ¥ Vigh, 20604 tvor 3 2 | oy i . W satl T

| [ Toyota Wish 1.8A (COE $16,800  $9,860 /yr 03-May-2006 1,794 cc 165,000 km MPV Available
| till 05/2021)

Ist Owner, 1 Year In House Warranty, Free 2 x Servicing, Full Loan Available, Warranty Not By 3rd
Party Workshop, Price Stated Above Is Actual Selling Price, No Gimmicks, Purchase Comes With
Official Warranty Certificate For A Peace Of Mind, Accident Free, STA Or VICOM. ..

Carway

A

\LJ Fasted: 18-Aug-2019 Tags. 2006 Toyota Wish, 2006 tayobswish, Tovots Wish, jovots widh. Toyota, W w ks o Tovors

[ Toyota Wish 1.8A X (COE  $31.800  $7,830 /yr 11-Sep-2008 1,794 cc - MPV Available
till 09/2023)

12 Months Warranty, Drive By A Retiree.Brand New Tyre, Most Sought After Mid Size MPV,
Silver On Black Leather! Very Low Mileage! As Good As New Interior And Engine! Silky Smooth
Gear Box! No Repair Needed! 100% Loan Available! Act Fast! Call Me Now Before It Is...




Ryder......

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19/22 AutoHub @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417921

Email: ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com
Tel: 67418277 Fax: 67468277

ESTIMATE OF REPAIR
Veh# : SJK2941U Model: TOYOTA WISH
Accident Date : 14/08/2019 (15/10/2008)
i SKN7239D
Location : JURONG WEST AVE 4 SLIP RD TOWARDS JALAN BAHAR 3pP: (AUTO & GENERAL INS)
S/Nos. | Qty Description List § S/NettS | Nett$
1 1pc |Rear bumper /{ RY._ 481.25 - -
2 8 pcs |Rear bumper clips ~ NEC 24.00 - 2
3 2 pcs  |Rear bumper o/s & n/s stay ) / 151 141.70 = -
4 2 pcs  |Rear bumper o/s & n/s reflector X_SU (& 167.40 - -
5 2 pcs  |Rear bumper o/s & n/s retainer _: )( J\J ( 144.70 - -
6 2 pcs  |Rear bumper o/s & n/s corner clips ? Y SV 242.20 - -
7 1pc |Rear tail-gate / Hp 981.40 - -
8 1pc |Rear tail-gate weatherstrip 4 he lq O 28990 -
9 1pc |Rear tail-gate emblem 7N f 61.70 - -
10 1pc |Rear tail-gate Borneo Motor emblem A R-C 61.35 -
11 1pc |Rear tail-gate moulding (chrome) -~ C_QK 20% 28777 - -
12 2 pcs  |Rear tail-gate moulding clips 7 NE-( 25.80 - -
13 | 1pc [Reartail-gate inner trim X SV 591.75 i d
14 8 pcs  |Rear tail-gate inner trim clips X NN 24.00 - -
15 1pc |Rear tail-gate lock (upper) X (J\ 322.70 - -
16 1pc |Rear tail-gate lock (lower) X il 124.80 - -
17 1pc |Rear tail-gate lower panel (outer) e j)D 589.72 - -
18 1pc |Rear tail-gate lower panel (inner) ol DD >/\ K /_‘i 561.60 - -
19 1pc |Rear tail-gate lower panel inner trim il "> _/( R &8 289.90 - -
20 4 pcs |Rear tail-gate lower panel inner trim clips ; _:,\/ rs 12.00 - -
21 1pc |Rear boot floor panel B X f’ 1,789.00 -
2 046.82

SJK2941U ESTIMATE.xIsxPg1

2 7("\;r 1



22 1pc |Rear windscreen sealant / ~N /L-L S 30.00| - -
23 1set |Rear reverse sensor XSUL - 280.00 -
24 1pc |Rearreg. no. plate DD - 45700 27 P -
25 1pc |Rearreg. no. plate bracket - 29@ ) -
Sub-Total: 7,214.59 384.00 0.00
25% 0% 0%
After Less %: 5,410.94 384.00 0.00
Labour
1 To dismantle rear portion _180000 ATO & 04
2 To spray painting 1,800.00 9 oo
3 To remove and refit rear windscreen 120.00
4 To remove and replace rear reverse sensor 0000 S0
5 To check wiring 12000 40
6 To re-seal anti-rust 28000~ SO .
Sub-Total: 432000 | 220
Total: 10,114.94
After Less 20%: 8,091.95
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Acknowledged by Repairer
Dﬁ\j/& D.ale: .

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:
« To resurvey before/after spray painting
» To display damaged part(s) during resurvey
» Parts prices are subject to confirmation
= Third party survey is on a “Without Prajudice” basis
« No illegal modification(s) is allowed
« Supplementary item{s) must be resurveyed and
is subject to final approval from Insurance Company
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24 hr accident call
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
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Bl B B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
AUTO & GENERAL INSURANCE (S) PL Ref :  CS/AGI19014241/Ntf3e2

(BUDGET DIRECT INSURANCE)
190 CLEMENCEAU AVENUE #03-01

LI

SINGAPORE SHOPPING CENTRESINGAPORE ¢’ 10092019
239924
Code: AGI
1z Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKN 7239D Veh. Inspected SJK 2941U
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. C10003752/JM Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From IVY RATILLA Assign Date 15/08/2019
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAWISH 1.8A c.c 1794
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. JTDER12W103000526 Colour GREY
Odometer 214248 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65R15 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/65R15 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre [195/65R15 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 195/65 R15 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5 General Information
Accident Date  14/08/2019 Inspection Date 16/08/2019
Survey held at RYDER AUTO WORKSHOP LLP
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2# 02-19 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB SINGAPORE
417921
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

]EWMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJK 2941U
Qty Description of Parts Condition VE::Ln;:?pB(;.) Our“l\(:])usted
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER CRACKED 481.25 481.25
8|REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 24.00 24.00
2|REAR BUMPER O/S & N/S STAY BENT 141.70 141.70
2|REAR BUMPER O/S & N/S REFLECTOR SERVICEABLE 167.40 -
2|REAR BUMPER 0O/S & N/S RETAINER SERVICEABLE 144.70 E
2|REAR BUMPER 0O/S & N/S CORNER CLIPS SERVICEABLE 242.20 -
1|REAR TAIL-GATE DENTED 981.40 981.40
1|REAR TAIL-GATE WEATHERSTRIP DEFORMED 289.90 190.00
1|REAR TAIL-GATE EMBLEM NECESSARY 61.70 61.70
1|REAR TAIL-GATE BORNEO MOTOR EMBLEM NECESSARY 61.35 61.35
1|REAR TAIL-GATE MOULDING (CHROME) CRACKED 287.72 200.00
2|REAR TAIL-GATE MOULDING CLIPS NECESSARY 25.80 25.80
1|REAR TAIL-GATE INNER TRIM SERVICEABLE 591.75 -
8|REAR TAIL-GATE INNER TRIM CLIPS NOT NECESSARY 24.00 -
1|REAR TAIL-GATE LOCK (UPPER) SERVICEABLE 322.70 -
1|REAR TAIL-GATE LOCK (LOWER) SERVICEABLE 124.80 -
1|REAR TAIL-GATE LOWER PANEL (OUTER) DENTED 589.72 589.72
1|REAR TAIL-GATE LOWER PANEL (INNER) TO REPAIR SEE 561.60 -
LABOUR
1|REAR TAIL-GATE LOWER PANEL INNER TRIM CRACKED 289.90 289.90
4|REAR TAIL-GATE LOWER PANEL INNER TRIM CLIPS SERVICEABLE 12.00 -
1|REAR BOOT FLOOR PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 1,789.00 -
LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,803.65 -761.71
5,410.94 2,285.11
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|SET REAR REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SERVICEABLE 280.00 -
1|REAR REG. NO. PLATE (SN) } DENTED 45.00 50.00
1|REAR REG. NO. PLATE BRACKET (SN) } 29.00 -
384.00 80.00

Report Ref No. CS/AGI19014241/Ntf3e2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl B B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
aty Description of Parts Condition vﬁ:::::?pa(g) Our ‘;‘;’,“md
LABOUR
TO DISMANTLE REAR PORTION. INCLUSIVE OF THE 1,900.00 800.00
REPAIR OF REAR TAIL-GATE LOWER PANEL (INNER)
AND REAR BOOT FLOOR PANEL.
TO SPRAY PAINTING. 1,800.00 800.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN. 120.00 120.00
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE REAR REVERSE SENSOR. 100.00 30.00
TO CHECK WIRING. 120.00 30.00
TO RE-SEAL ANTI-RUST. 280.00 50.00
4,320.00 1,830.00
GRAND TOTAL 10,114.94 4,195.11
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,350.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/AGI19014241/Ntf3e2

MUHAMMAD NAZRIL BIN ABDULLAH

Automotive Assessor

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.

B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE,AMSAE-A,M.MATAI




