Vic (LKKAuto)

—_—— ——y
From: ONG LI U <llong@lonpac.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 23 October, 2019 9:.01 AM
To: Vic (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A; MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: <SEEK MAMDATE> RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SLQ7591H & SGLB0OBR DOA - 13/08/2019 Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/022212 [External
General] LKK REF CC4/LPC19014215/Ghb3

Lonpac External - General
Dear Vic

Please proceed.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all %3 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Genaral data is for internal / external use.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpehi@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 7 October 2019 2:38 PM

To: ONG LI LI

Ce: Admin A; MT _Claim_SG; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SLQ7591H & SGLROSR DOA : 13/08/2019 Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/022212 [External General] LKK REF
CC4/LPC19014215/Ghb3

Your Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/022212
Our Ref: CC4/LPC19014215/Ghb3

Dear Li Li,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SGL 808R (Ol) AND SLQ 7591H (TP) ON 13/08/2019

We refer to the subject matter and to the assignment dated 14" August 2019 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct
settlement with our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd

It was reported that Insured vehicle had rear-ended the TP vehicle.



As such, under MCF and BOLA scenario 27, for rear-ended collision, we have to settle the claim from the front
vehicle.

We propose to offer to TP repairer E SINGAPORE" as below:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 10,473.40 $ 5,489.84
Loss of Rental (5120 x 3 days) 5 360.00 5 360.00
GIA Search Fee 5 2.00 5 2.00
TOTAL | 5 10,835.40 $ 5,851.84
Breakdown of days is as follows:
Our surveyor's recommended days to repair 5 days

TOTAL CLAIMED DAYS 3 days

The above is for your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Dest Regards,
Vie Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | emaoil: vicalpeh@lkknuto.com | fax: 6741-3108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ SRS D
Sefma R = Save bhe Earth: Frivt only when necessary

This e-mail contam confidential and prvileged matenal, and are for the sole use of the ntended reciplent. Use or distnbution by an
unintended rectplent ks probibited, and may be a viclation of law. If you belleve that you received this e-mall In arror, plaase do not
read this e-mall or any allached llems. Please delsle the e-mall and all attachments, including any coples thareol, and inform tha
spnder thal you have deleled the e-mall, all attachmaents and any copins Ihaeol. Thank you

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:Hong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August, 2019 9:32 AM

To: Shu Per (LKKAuto)

Ce: Admin A; MT_Claim_SG: Vie (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ7591H & SGLSOSR

DOA - 13/08/2019 Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/022212 | External General |

Lonpac External - General
Dear Shu Pei/Vic

Attached is our Insured GIA report.

Please reply to workshop.

Regards,
Ong LI Li



Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

| - -

The all §8%3 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 16 August, 2019 3:56 PM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: Admin A; MT_Claim_5SG; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ7591H & SGLBOSR DOA : 13/08/2019 Our
Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/022212 [External General]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SLQ 7591H at M/s Volkswagen Centre Singapore on a WF basis and TP
repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident
report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.
Thank you.

Hest Repurds

Shu Pell Admin

LKEK Auio Consultunts Pie Lid

Phone: B360-005%5 | email: shiupeiskkaute com | fax: 67412108

Bik 51, Paya LThi Industrial Parke. LTbi Avenue 1. #0215 | S{40893 3]

From: Admm-D (LKKAuto) <admin-dia lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 August 2019 2:22 PM

To: 'ONG L1 LI' <llong(@lonpac com>; assignments <assignments{a lkkauto.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim(@/lonpac.com=>

Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ7591H & SGL8OSR
DOA : 13/08/2019 Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/022212 [External General |

Dear Sir'Mdm,
Thank vou for the assignment

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop. repairer will arrange.
3



Hest Regards

G.NIVITHA
LEK Autlo Consultants Pte Lid
Micing: 6841-1072 | email: gesignments@ [kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408933)

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:Hong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 14 August 2019 9:40 AM

To: Chee Steven (VGS - SG/Singapore) <steven.cheel vw.comsg> MT_Claim_SG

<mt_¢luimia lonpac.com=>; assignmentsi@lkkauto.com; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-di@ lkkauto.com=
Ce: Tang Shu Shi (VGS - SG/Singapore) <shushi.tang@vw com.sg>

Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ7591H & SGLSOSR
DOA : 13/08/2019 Our Ref: 18/19/19/VPD5/022212 [External General |

Lonpac External - General
Without Prejudice

Dear Steven

Our Insured has not reported the accident.

Do you want us to arrange survey first? If so, please liaise with LKK Auto
Consultants Pte Ltd.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

| V-

oy The all €% lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Chee Steven (VGS - 5G/Singapore) [mailto:steven, chee@vw.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 13 August, 2019 5:46 PM

Ta: MT_Claim_SG

Cc: Tang Shu Shi (VGS - SG/Singapore)

Subject: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ7591H & SGLAOBR DOA : 13/08/2019

Dear Clhams,

Please revert on liability & arrange survey for this claims,



Thanks You.
Best Regards,

Steven Chee,
Insurance Service Advisar
Aftersales

Volkswagen Centre Singapore (Macpherson)
1 Kampong Ampal
Singapore 368314

DID: +65 6922-3511

Mobile: +65 8511-2203

Main Line : +65 63056-7298

Main Fax: +65 6285-B620
sieven cheaifivw.com.sg
https/iwww . volkswagen.com sa/

More than
meets

From: Chee Steven (VGS - SG/Singapore) <steven.chee@vw . com sg>
Sent; Tuesday, 13 August 2019 5:42 PM

To: Chee Steven (VGS - SG/Smngapore) <steven.cheefavw.com.se>
Subject: Scan Image

Intarma

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software




1 Kampong Ampat 5(368314)

LETTER OF DEMAND
Your Ref: by,
Our Ref: cra TAH
To: FNTAL
Dear Sirs,
accioentiwvoving <8 TF1H g sel were gy 13 %19

We are clsiming on behalf of ourclient " CAe  gap

owner of vehicle number _ SLR 75911 involved In accidenton /3 % 17

withvehicle 81 B0E  pnpsm b 1 Femuny paes -

Description of claims:

Cost of Repairs s_ S4td-8H (incl 7% GST)

Loss of Use/Rental . |3 x_%  Days=$3%" (incl 7% GST)
Search Fee g = (incl 7% GST)
Miscellaneous Fee s (incl 7% GST)

TOTAL g SLE-eY (incl 7% GST)

Yy
We are claiming in full and final settlement of $ Fes1- M

payable to Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd.

Kindly send us a written acknowledgement within 14 days from receipt of this document
Please note that finalization/settlement offer of this claim should be within 8 weeks from the

date of this document. Please emall all settlement offers to shushi tang@vww.com. sg /
steven chee@®vw.com.sg,
i1-9 11

Dated this




Volkswagen Centre Singapore

iz Reg. Mo 531000692
05T Mo M2009A505-2

LETTER OF AUTHORITY
ACCIDENT INvoLvinG _ SLQFS\H and SOt “SE an 13 919
iy wdacin § ushEr Oiffver vahichs's namber Chade of scoapd
along e 1 EBRLTY  Papk -
Accoen! DoEbion

BY THE LETTER OF AUTHORITY, we, ___ PN CAWe se&
Mams of Policy Holder & IC / Passport number
of owner of Vehicle Registration

MNumbear cie 1591M hereby irrevocable appoint Volkswagen Centre Singapore

Dy vahicie 5 oMo
(hereinafter refer to VGS), a company Incorporated in Singapore and having its registered office at 247
Alexandra Road, Singapore 159934, its agents of any person suthorized by VGS to be *my / our Attorney and
in * my / our name(s) on *my / our behalf to do all or any of the following:

To submil, resolve and make any claim(s) (including the commencament of legal proceedings) which *liwe may
huvungﬂnuihauhr'paﬂﬂwﬁnhhhmmmmdmlmmrﬂm* e taken up by such
“party/parties or alternatively under Insurance Policy number 1V taken up by *me/us and
pay the compulsory excess in respect of ihe cost repairs suffered by *me/us arising from the Accident (loss and
damage)/,

_ To coliect payment(s) due in respect of any such claim(s) for the loss and damage, such payment lo be made by
way of Cheque In favour of Volkswagen Centre Singapore and give a valid receipt and discharge therafore.

For any of the purpose aforesaid, to execute, sign and deliver all documents whatsoaver in relation thereto.

Generally do all such acts as it shall deem necessary for the purpose of settling such claim.

*I/We hereby declare that all acts, mwmmmmurmdmhmmnumwnm *myfour
behall by the Allomey, its agents or any person authorized by VGS in that behalf shall be as good valid and
aﬁu-:tulllnauintanuanl:lmemiihmnhﬂbmdmawamﬂﬂW'nﬁwh'mﬁw
awn proper parson(s) and “l/we hereby ratify and confirm. all acts, instruments and documents done or execuled
by virtue of the authority and powers hereby confarrad.

*|I\We hereby further declare that the letter of authority hereby conferred shall remain Irrevocable.

*I/\We further confirm that the acceptance by VGS of the settlement amount in respect of such constitute the full
discharge of *myfour claim(s) in respect of such loss and damage.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, “/wa have hereunto to sel *my/our hand and sign this | ¢ of the month
EI‘ Year \ 91
Signed & Deliyered By:
fﬂ rY
=7 Policy Hofder

Witness By:




LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO : |18/1919/VP05/022212
DATE : 23 OCTOBER 2019

I/'We, PNG CHING SER confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or the owner of SGL 808R the sum of Singapore Dollars Five Thousand
Ei undred Fifty One and Cents Ei ur Only ($5.851.84) in full and final
satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of property claim competent to me/us upon the
said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim sustained by
mefus whether now or hercafler to become manifest, arising either directly or
indirectly from an accident to my vehicle, SO 7591H on 13 AUGUST 2019 along
LOR 1 REALTY PARK.

| /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (SIAU SUN KING / LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made by any
person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum dircctly to M/S
VOLKSWAGEN GROUP SINGAPORE PTE LTD.

I/'We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
linbility basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured's recovery action.

20/

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

Clonart,Prg Chig o, 2410119

Name of vehicle owner/Date



Singapore 633176
Biz. Aeg. No.: 1981014342 Volkswagen

G587 No: M200885052

VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE @ @ @
17 Tuas Avenus
SKODA v

lax invoice
Copy
Fage e
Company Custormner Details: Documant no 12333807 152
Lonpac Insurance BHD Mr Document gale Q7-08-2019
101 Thomson Aoad PNG Cusiomar no 5211043801
#18-01 United Sguare CHING SER Customer GSTID
Singapore 307581 119A RIVERVALE DRIVE Dealer 35969
#10-300 Job omoer number 2018001828/ 1
Singapore 541118 Job order date 27-08-2018
Service Advisor GERMAINE MEI TING
ONG
Licensa plave | Moadel codo First registraton ViN Moge:d | Miteage
SLOTSaH AM13HZ 21072007 WVWIZTAUZGWS43962 | Sportsvan 1 ACLBMT 52 TS1 O7TF 48,082
Position no Description Cuantity Unit Unit price Taxcoose  Totml amount  Tolal amouni
Check Shart Crourl | Harmess Repair 1 pCE 280.00 £ 28000 299 60
Diagnostic and Programming 1 pcs 480.00 #1 4B0.00 513,60
510807417M GRU  Cower For Bumper Primea 1 pes 1,080.69 " 1,080.69 1,167 0«
AEAR BUMPER
LABOURS g pes 840,00 wi 1,680.00 1,787 80
SPRAY PAINTING 2 pcs 800.00 & 1,600 00 1200
LONPAC DIRECT SETTLEMENT
DOA : 13082019
TP VEH . SGLA0BR
SURVEY BY | GLIO QIANG [LKK)
Tax Labour Material GST™ GST Total amount Total amoun!
Code excl GST incl. GST
o T80.00 4 37069 ™ 358 15 5,130.69 5,489 B4

Customer

Piaase supec] your vehade phor 1o avng our DETTEES. We BEEK POur Understanding trat wa ame ol atle 1o hoenour claims on soratches. dents eic. after your car Fas
Imf| our preriaEe

~—WVISIT QUA WEBEITE: sfinrsalns. vw com sy [lor onine serviom appostnants) and volkswagen com g and wew skoda com g (e addihonal servoes, prooucts
ang promobong).—-

Afl bund tranaler paymeety should be rmace payabs 1o Volawagen Group Singapcrs P L Bank Narme  Deutache Bark AG (Sngapore Branch), Bank Account
TH28214002 . Swnlt Code: DEUTSGSG. Pipase indicate Customar Number (8g. 521 XK0000K), Custormer Name and Invoion Numbes in the payments

Lirtl payrmert of al goods [parts, acosssones &l | Nas oeen maoe in full 1o and moened Dy Volkewagen Group Sngapons (VGS), the gooon eman n legal
possetaion ol VOGS, irespeciive || ihey have airsady been instalied o your vehicle, However, ihe warsanty of the goods (where appicabie) staris wilh the issuance ol
iha irwpicm o Ihe collection pf pour CaF, whichewer 5 sailie

For warranly anms and condibons please visil guw webnte wis volkssagen com sg



VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE @ @
17 Tuas Avenue
Wanatlen

Singapore 838178
Blz Aeg No. 1991014942 Yolkywagen SKOOS
GST Mo ; M2008B5052 _ .
Tax invoice
Copy
Page 22
Company Cusiomer Details: Document no. 123338071152
Lonpac insurance BHD Mr Documenl date 07-09-2018
101 Thomson Road PNG Customer no 5211043801
#£16-01 United Sguare CHING SER Customer GST-ID
Singapcre 307591 1194 RIVEAVALE DRIVE Dol 35999
#10-300 Job order number 2018001828/ 1
Singapone 541119 Job order date 27-08-2019
Service Advisor GERAMAINE ME| TING
ONG
Licensa plate | Moogel code Firsi regisiration | VIN Model Mileage
SLOTS@IH | AMI3HZ 21-07-2017 | WVWZZZAUZGWS43882 | Sportsvan 1 4CLBMT 82 TSI O7F 48,032

This is an authoriaed document. No signature & regquirned



@MOVA

Automahive Ple

Main OMice:
Mova Sulkding
'1@5‘22 Jalas KSI::I“B
Fm &5) & r?sam
Tax Invoice wx: [65) €271 53
Veh# - SLL3623C RK147752 S
101 DA
PNG PEW TEE RA# - B143160/0 Sngapore 159722
:::”E““LE DRIVE From - 02/09/2019 T a8) 2723002
SINAGAPORE 541119 To = QBOG2010 R g iy oimer
Terms = C.OD
Altention - PNG PEW TEE H,!I'I'Im = HICHELLE""JW
Description Qy UPrice Amounts 5%
RENTAL CHARGES i DAY 112.15 335.45
FROM 02/09/2019 TO 05/08/2018
VYW JETTA ;: SLLAG23C
RENTAL AGREEMENT : B14316
DRIVEN BY : PNG PEW TEE
YOUR REF : VW/KA-SLQT7591H
] \JEP ;,
3Y. __C_ﬂ_fah___ __‘6?:‘_&&,'?#
Singapore Dollars :
Three Hundred Sixty Only AMGUNT &8 T
GST@7% 23,55
Thank you for your conlinuous support. AMOUNT DUE S§ 360.00

7T
.g-.

MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD
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8132019

Involce

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 RafMes Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 D030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Third Party Insurer Enquiry
Our Ref No: GR-18-130291
Date of Request: 13/0872019 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Vaolkswagen Cantre Singapora
247 Alexandra Road
Singapora 1559834
Dear SirMadam,
Engquiry Date 13/08/2018
Enquiry By Chee Tiow Chuan
TP Vehicle No. SGLB0AR
Accident Dale 13/08/2019
Enguiry Result
TP Vehicla No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tal. No.
SGLBOER Lonpac Insurance Bhd 22/M1M2018-27M12/2019 +«55 82507388
Thank You.

The images provided io you are taken from the ongmal repors forwarded fo the centre by the members of ihe General Insurance Associabon of

Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accurscy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of
or in connection with tha reports or their images

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

hitps. /{singapars. marmen com/claimalindes. cim Mussboar=MTRsasAluseacton=dsp_geninviprefid=2242808ACFID=5T412630ACFTOKEN=b8d.

12



8132018 Irvvaios

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

8 Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
WE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE CST Regisiration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Qur Ref No: GR-19-130291
Date of Reguest: 13/08/2019 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Volkswagen Centre Singapora
247 Alaxandra Road
Singapore 150932
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Date 13/08/2018
Enquiry By Chee Tiow Chuan
TP Vehicle No, S5GLA0AR
Accident Date 13/08/2019
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (5%)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 200
Thank You

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official usa:
Date:
[X] GIRO [ | Cash [ ] Cheque

hitps /fsingapore. menmen. com/claimadinoex. cim Tusebox=MTRsasA fussaction=dso_geninviphrefid=2242808ACFID=5T4126308CFTOKEN=b84, . 22



