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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 19 December 2019 10:08 AM

To: 'Khar Kian Toh'

Subject: RE: SLG 7520R / TP / DOA: 2/8/2019

Dear Khar Kian, 

 

Finalize for vehicle SLG7520R lump sum $1800.00 with 4 repair days confirm. 

 

Please submit all relevant  documents direct to First Capital insurance  

 
 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email:  sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Khar Kian Toh <tohkk_90@hotmail.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 18 December 2019 11:28 AM 

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SLG 7520R / TP / DOA: 2/8/2019 

 

Hi Denise, 

 

Above attachment is the after paint photo and  finalize estimate. 

 

Kindly Assist to Finalize for vehicle SLG7520R lump sum $1800.00 with 4 repair days. 

 

Please check and revert.  

 

Thanks 

 

 
Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 

 
Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

 

 

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) [mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, 9 December, 2019 11:46 AM 

To: tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

Subject: SLG 7520R / TP / DOA: 2/8/2019 

 


