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- - Congulfarnts

31 UBLAYE 1, #01-15 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408333 TEL : (D65) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62504315

Your Ref: D19005089MFSH Date: 21/8/2019
Our Ref: CSIFCI19014209/T11f3

The Motor Claims Department

First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO__SLG 7520R

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
19/8/2019 at the premises of M/s_Li Sheng have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8% 4.961.36
Revised Estimate Amount '8 282.80
“Check™ Items Amount -5 1.961.84
Market Value 1 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 8%
Nett Value - 5%

Description of Damage: raar
The vehicle sustained damages at the front o/s portion

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Taufikh
Automotive Assessor



MS ‘ Firstcapital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited CoReg Wo 1550001060 GST R Mo, M2 -D001GT6-9

6 Raffles Quay 421-00 Singapore D4B580
Tel: (656222 2311 Fax (5516222 3547

Clidens & Mober Undwrwriling Bept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 Clry House Singapore DGBETT
Tel: (B5) 6507 3848 Fax [65) 6507 3843
wiwer msfirstcapital. com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

05-08-2019 Our Ref No. D1S005089MFSH
02-08-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHA1416C Third Party Vehicle. SLG7520R

BLK K #01-18 PANDAMN LOOP
TOH KHAR KIAN
0/ 83987469 Fax No. 67744885

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

LI SHENG AUTOMOBILE
TRADING
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Attention. NIL

KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

g nof :l_-' FANCT GF




Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 August 2019 10:54 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments
Cc: ‘Karen Tan'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005089MF5H/1
Attachments: PREL| ADVISED OF 5LG 7520R.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLG 7520R

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
8lk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 15 August 2019 3:22 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005089MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshep, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assipgnments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 14 August 2019 3:40 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @ LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005085MFSH/1




Estimate

Li Sheng Automobile Trading

Please arrange o survey at
Bik K, Pandan Loop #01-16 /18 5(128236)

MS FIRST CAPITAL Date: 13/8/2019
Vehicle No: SLG7520R
Model: HOMNDA VEZEL
Date of loss: 2/8/2019
Your Ref Vehicle No: Owr ref: LSA209T]S
SHA1416C (TP claim) Year: 2016
Oty  Description List Price Remarks
100  FRONT BUMPER 2 801.70 A
200  FRONT BUMPER RETAINER S 20% 4180 A=) 4 KH -rag -~
1.00 FRONT BUMPER LOWER LIP % 279.60 4L
1.00  FRONT RHS FENDER $ sgo.00 FE
100 FRONT FENDER INNER SHEILD $ 26030 X
100  FRONT RHS FENDER ARC GARNISH $ 158,00 &
100 FRONT BUMPER TOWING CAP $ 18.30 4t~
100 FRONT RHS FOG LAMP 5 327.00 X7
1.00  FRONT FOG LAMP COVER $ 45,00 AL~ _
1.00  FRONT HEADLAMP $ 1,820.00 K ﬁ‘{;
100  FRONT HEADLAMP BRACKET S 45.00 £
TOTAL: $ 4,376.70 3
LESS 20 %: $ 875.34 14955
$ 350136 (5 121-§o
LABOUR AND PAINT
Oty  Description Unit Price Resuiks
1.00 LABOUR FOR REPAIR ON AFFECTED AREA < F00.00 %‘ o8
1.00 SPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREA $ 600,004 0
1.0 CHECK WIRING 5 80.00 =
1.06 APPLY RUST PROOF ON AFFECTED PANEL 4 S0.00 ’?) %]
TOTAL: § 1,460.00 67
SUBTOTAL: $ 4,961.36

Estimate prepared by: TOH KHAR KIAN
Telephone : 83987463

tohkk S0@Ehoimail com

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:

» To resurvey beforifafier spray painting

« To display damaged part(s} during resunvey

» Parts prices ara subjact 10 confirmation
» Third party survey ion a Withou! Prajudsca’ bass
« Mo ilegal modification(s) & allowed

» Supplamentary itemis) must be resurveyed and
is subject 1o final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowiedged by Repairer
gnature:
Date:

T;.-.JGLL AMu
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Estimate

MS FIRST CAPITAL

Your Ref Vehicle No:

SHA1416C (TP claim)

Oy Descriplion

1.00 FRONT BUMPER

2.00 FRONT BUMPER RETAINER

1.00 FRONT BUMPER LOWER LIP
1.00 FRONT RHS FENDER

1.00 FRONT FENDER TMNMNER SHEILD
1.00 FRONT RHS FENDER ARC CARNISH
1.00 FROMT BUMPER TOWING CAP
1.00 FRONT RHS FOC LAMP

L.oo FRONT FOG LAMP COVER

1.00 FRONT HEADLAMP

.00 FRONT HEADLAMP BRACKET

LABOUR AND PAINT

Qty
1.00
100
1.00
1.00

TOTAL:
LESS 20 %:

LABOUK FOR REPAIR ON AFFECTED AREA

SPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREA

CHECK WIRING

APPLY EUST FROOF ON AFFECTED PANEL

SUBTOTAL: §

Estimate prepared by: TOH KHAR KIAN

Telephone ; BI9RTI69

tohkk 90& hotmail.com

S

Li Sheng Automobile Trading

Please arrange to survey at
Blk K, Pandan Loop #01-16 /18 5(123236)

Date: 13/8/2019
Vehicle No: SLGTE20R
Model; HONDA VEZEL
Date of loss: 2/8/2019
Our ref: LSA299T]S
Year: 2016
List Price Remarks
$ 801.70 Ai—"
3 0 418044 3¢ , Rl ~rag
3 279.60 A€ —
$ 580.00 HE—
$ 26030
$ 158,00 oA~
% 18.30 ~
$ 327.00 .
§ 45,00 AL~
$ 1,520.00 7
s 45.00 7
$ 437670 4190559
s §7534 & aBv3n
$ 350136 S 1530 .80
TUnit Price Remarks
$ 700.00 Zfﬂ@
$ 600.00
$ 80.00
$ 80.00 279 .
5 146000 S3L0

4,961.36 SSRITO
>\

N
w@m U < gpnbay

‘Hi\mk
4] {H@ Lq“«-—
1 S [diasdso
[er e
Ptgry e
?LH@&




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607138R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R

' Vd V4

di M B B

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref :  CS/FCI9014209/T1H3n2
316,01 CITy HOUSESINGAPORE 068677 tl [ 2lasi n”m"mmm"m
Code; FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 1416C Veh. Inspected 5LG 7520R
Policy No. Coverage () 0.00
Claim No. D19005085MFSH Excess (%) 0.00
Assign From KARENT Assign Date 15/08/2019
o Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA VEZEL c.c 1498
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. RU11201062 Colour GOLD
Odometer 75328 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R1 f DUNLOP & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAIMED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT /S PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date  02/08/2018 Inspection Date 19/08/2019
Survey held at LI SHENG AUTOMOBILE TRADING
BLK 1, PANDAN LOCP,
#01-186
SINGAPORE 128215.
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




Ll

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6236 4315

Reg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. Mo. 13-9607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLG 7520R

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapora 408933

Page No.:1 of 1

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Qty Description of Parts Condition ‘E::L?E;?gn Our ﬁgj:lustad
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 801.70 B01.70
2|FRONT BUMPER RETAINER OfS NECESSARY / 41.80 20.90
NS NOT
NECESSARY
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER LIP DEFORMED 279.60 278.60
1|FRONT RHS FENDER BENT 580.00 580.00
1|FRONT FENDER INMER SHIELD NOT NECESSARY 260.30 =
1|FRONT RHS FENDER ARC GARMISH cuTt 158.00 158.00
1|FRONT BUMPER TOWING CAP cuTt 18.30 18.30
1|FRONT RHS FOG LAMP NOT NECESSARY J27.00 £
1|FRONT FOG LAMP COVER DEFORMED 45.00 45.00
1|FRONT HEAD LAMP MOT NECESSARY 1.820.00
1|FRONT HEAD LAMP BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 45.00 -
LESS 209% DISCOUNT -875.34 -380.70
3,501.36 1,522.80
LABOUR
LABOUR FOR REPAIR OM AFFECTED AREA 700.00 300.00
SPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREA. 600.00 400.00
CHECK WIRING. B80.00 30.00
APPLY RUST PROOF ON AFFECTED PANEL. 80.00 30.00
1.460.00 760.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,961.36 2,282.80
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,800.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI119014209/T1tf3n2

M .

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

KL

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report s made sclaly for the use and benefit of tha Cliant namad on tha front page of this Rapern,




