Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Attachments:

Dear All,

We quantify our claim as follows:-

Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>
18 September 2019 9:40 AM

CS ATeam; Admin A

LOD Re: Accident on 9/8/2019 involving SHB 706S & GBJ 5951X (China Taiping's
insured) Our Ref: TAX/08/19/2022/Ig

img-918091504-0001.pdf; SHB706S laid-up report.pdf

Cost of Repair $4129.69
Loss of Rental $696.60 | 6 daysx S$116.10 )
Loss of Income $360.00 ( 6 dayx $60.00 )
LTA Search Fee $7.00
Total $5193.29

We enclose the following documents:

1) Repairinvoice

2) Proof of rental rate
3) Police/GIA reports
4) Accident vehicle laid-up report

5) LTA search

6) Hirer’s letter of authorisation

Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)

Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

%SMRT
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Customer Code: 3000063
SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD
Block Unit

60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4
SINGAPORE 757705

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
251 North Bridge Road Singapore 179102
Tel: 65 63311000 Fax: 65 63340247

Tax Invoice

GST Reg No. : MR-8500001-7
CRN :°1990042802
Invoice No. Iv190900153
Date 09.09.2019
Vehicle No. SHB706S

Your Ref No. TAX/08/19/2022
Our Ref No. 24102783

Terms 30 Days

Description oty Unit Add / (Discount) Amount
Cost % Amount
Parts
COVER, FR BUMPER 1000549550 (25.00 ) $ 123.87 S 371 .63
SUPPORT, FR BUMPER LH 000 8 182530 0.00 $ 0.00 S 0.00
COVER, FR BUMPER LH 0.00 s  28.10 0.00 3 0.00 S 0.00
CLIPS PIECE, FRT & RR BUMPER 10008 1.50 (25.00 } S 3475 5 185225
UNIT, HEADLAMP , LH 1.00 52558:90 (10.00 ) 5725589 5 2303.01
REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT 0.00 5 318.80 0.00 $ 0.00 5 0.00
SEAL, RR BUMPER , LH G.00 S 85.20 0.00 $ 0.00 5] 0.00
ABSORBER, FR BUMPER LOWER 0.00 S 117.00 0.00 3 0.00 s 0.00
ABSORBER, FR BUMPER G007 S 70630 0.00 $ 0.00 S 0.00
SUPPORT, RADIATOR UPPER LH 000§ 670 0.00 $ 0.00 S 0.00
HOOD SUB-ASSY 1.00 $ 938.40 (255005 $ 234.690 S 703.80
Sub-Total $ 3389.69
Labour
TO REPAIR FRONT PORTION 1.00 $ 300.00 0.00 $ 0.00 5 300.00
Others
TO CHECK WIRING AND SYSTEM FUNCTION 1.00 8 20.00 0.00 5 0.00 =) 20.00
TO REPLACE SUNDRY PARTS 1.00 5 20.00 0.00 S 0.00 S 20.00
TO WASH AND VACUUM 0.00 $ 60.00 0.00 S 0.00 $ 0.00
TO REPSRAY FRONT BUMPER 1.00 $ 200.00 0.00 S 0.00 5 200.00
TO RESPRAY FRONT SUPPORT PANEL 0.00 s 180.00 0.00 $ 0.00 5 0.00
TO REPSRAY FRONT HOOD 1.00 8 200.00 0.00 $ 0.00 S 200.00
GRAND TOTAL 5 4,129.69

Remark
Make/Model PRIUS4
Accident Date 09.08.2019

N.B. Payment by cheque should be crossed and

made payable to 'SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd'.

No receipt will be issued unless requested.
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Ruthorised Signature
for SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
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SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd MEMORANDUM
To: Claims Dept Our Ref: TAX/08/19/2022
From: SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd Date: 19/08/2019

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB706S AND GBJ5951X ON 9/8/2019
3:55 PM ALONG LORONG 24 GEYLANG.

This is to confirm that the daily rental rate for SHB706S is $116.10
per day.

Please proceed to recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of the
above accident.

Thank you.

Yours sincerely
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Date: !0/&7/7

Our Ref. No.:

etter of Authorisation

! F//e; Chian SW%’ (NRIC No.: G//?%”?f‘f/f ) the
registered hirer l;é{;f iver / taxi share driver of SMRT taxi reglstratlon number
SHE 7468 hereby authorise SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

“AutoSvs”) to deal with all matters arising out of the acc1de between m
( g /
Dz

50 5+ & H /KZ?AVK
and GSJ S’C} 3 /)< happened on ?atlf/uﬂ =
along Place M’ﬁ e (—3’4’3!5]'/5]4’1@} ﬁﬁcf LOf’aﬂ? ﬁfﬁ/ﬁk .
1] v V)

(the “Accident”) on my behalf, including but not limited to instituting and any claims or

proceedings against such party or parties (as AutoSvs deems fit in its absolute
discretion) in respect of any claim, demand, loss, cost, expense, liability, damages or

action made against us or incurred or suffered by us.

Without prejudice to the foregoing, | further authorise AutoSvs to negotiate, resolve
and settle any proceeding or claim arising out of the accidents, including but not limited
to doing any act or executing any document or signing the Discharge Voucher on my

behalf as may be required.

Name - P /_‘.“. _____ (’/];a,ﬁ ........ ﬁ ....... Signature: t’ﬁg//'f’
NRIC No.
Tel No.

Address
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£nquire Transaction History

1 og Date/Time: 13Aug 20197100129
Asset Tyner Vehicle Transaction Amaunt: §7.49
ES

Asset 1D GRIS951X
Yransaction Type: 18.37 Insurance Enquiry (GIRO Payment} Channel: External Agency .
tser It FSASEARD - BALQISH BINTE ABDUL HALIL Business Transaction Reference No. 70190813101 1??277833
Search Date / Time: 09 Aug 2019 15:55:00

~— -
1nsurance Company; CHINA TAIRING INSURANCE {SINGAPORF] PTL Lo

Information displayed is correct as at the log date and time,

tnguire Related Logs Back to List

ﬂt{j{)b‘?iNrI.I[a.gn\.'.ngIIafVﬁfEC[IOF\InUDf-\QOI'\CV irnLoguetan ¢t UING HTUN B BUTUUALLL [ERS



Laid Up Report

Accident Start Date :  01/08/2019 Date Generated :  18/06/2019
Accident End Date :  18/09/2019 User Name : LeeGek

TAXI08/19/2022 SHB7068 SMRT Taxis Pie Ltd TOYOTA PRIUS4 24102783 08/08/2019 5:16 PM 16/08/2019 8:24 AM
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Traffic Police
SINGAPORE 10 Ubi Avenue 3
Singapore 408865
POLICE FORCE Tel +65 6547 0000

Fax +65 6547 6259
www.police.gov.sg

Our Ref : TP/1P/49541/2019
Date : 22 August, 2019

PHNG CHIAN SENG

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB706S & GBJ5951X ALONG LORONG 24 GEYLANG
BY JALAN MOLEK ON 9 AUGUST 2019 AT 1555 HRS

I refer to the above accident.

2 Please be informed that we have completed our investigations which shows
that the driver of GBJ5951X had committed an offence of Careless Driving under Rule 29
of the Road Traffic Rules. Action has been initiated against the driver for the said offence.

3. If you have any queries, please contact the Investigation Officer, Jeff Tan Jun
Yan at 65476311 or email at TAN Jun Yan@spf.gov.sg.

Yours faithfully

P4

Jemeema Farween

for Head Traffic Investigation
Traffic Police

Singapore Police Force

A FORCE FOR THE NATION




