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Bl ma ™ Plel Company Registration No. 199607 198R

S1UBIAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563861 FAN 1 (45) 4256431 5

Your ref: TBA

Our ref: CC6/EQIN19014156/T 1 ga3 Date: 16/08/2019
The Motor Claims Department

M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SLD 90627

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the mspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 15/08/2019
at the premises of M/s Li Sheng Automobile Trading and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : §% 4,668.64
Revised Estimate Amount 1 S% 3.537.76
"Check” Items Amount 1 5% 12.96
Total (Including Check Items) : 5% 3,550.72
Market Value : S% -
LTA Reimbursement Value - 55 -
Nett Value 1 55 -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the ra
/S Front portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 4.0 days

Yours faithfully,

MOHD. TAUFIKH
Licensed Appraiser



Estimate

EQ

Your Ref Vehicle No;

SKK7404](TP claim)

1.00 FRONT BUMPER

10,00 FRONT BUMPER CLIP

2.00 FRONT BUMPER RETAINER

1.00 FRONT RHS FENDER

L00  FRONT RHS HEADLAMP

Lo0 FRONT BUMPER LOWER LIP

1.00 FRONT FENDER ARC GARNISH

100 FRONT RHS DOOR

LABOUR AND PAINT

Qty  Description

100 LABOUR FOR REPAIR ON AFFECTED AREA
100 SPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREA

100 CHECK WIRING

1.00 APPLY RUST PROOF ON AFFECTED PANEL

LESS 20 %:

SUBTOTAL: §

Estimate prepared by: TOH KHAR KIAN
Telephone : 31957469
Ighice 90Shotmailcom

Li Sheng Automobile Trading
Please arrange to survey at
Bk K, Pandan Loop #05-16 /18 5{128136)
Date: 14/8/2019
Vehicle No: SLD9062Z
Model: HONDA CRV
Date of loss: 7/8/2019
Ohr ref: SLSA300T)S
Year: 2016
List Price Remarks
$ 598.20 dit o~
5 30,00/~
$ 324044 Kby AN
$ 63120 K ¥
$ 1,548.20 oA —
3 48220 puk -~
$ 188.60 gt
REPAIR
- 3,510.80 a0
$ 702.16 e, ay
5 280864 n3aR o
Unit Price Remarks
s 900.00 b6 0
3 s00.0000°
$ 80.00 J<»
$ 80.00 3o
s 1,860.00 12kD.o0
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Estimate

EQ
Your Ref Vehicle No:
SKK7404](TP claim)
Oty Description
1.00 FRONT BUMPER
10,00 FRONT BUMPER CLIP
2.00 FRONT BUMPER RETAINER
1.00 FRONT RHS FENDER
1.00 FRONT RHS HEADLAMP
1.00 FRONT BUMPER LOWER LIP
1.00 FRONT FENDER ARC GARNISH
1.00 FRONT RHS DOOR
TOTAL:
LESS 20 %
LABOLUR AND PAINT
Qty Description
1.00 LABOUR FOR REFAIR ON AFFECTED AREA
1.00 SPEAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREA
1.00 CHECK WIRING
1.00 APPLY RUST PROOFE ON AFFECTED I"ANEL
TOTAL:
SUBRTOTAL:

Estimate prepared by: TOH KHAR KIAN
Telephone : BI9ET46%

EOHkE BOEDHotmail com

KK Auto Consultants hence notify

mMe Repairer of the following:

» To remurvey tefore'afer spray paeTing

» To display damagea part(s) dunng resurvey

» Paris proes we subiect 1o confirmation

# Thind party survey i o0 & “WINOW Freguaice” base
& No ilegal modifanahii] & alowed

« Suppiementary 1em(s| maust be resurveyed §nd
i sttyect 10 hnal acprowsl rom |eurance Company

Acknowsedged Dy Repasmr
Sqraturn.
lam

—

Li Sheng Automobile Trading

IMease arrange (o survey al
ik K, Pandan Loop #i1-16/18 5{125234)

Date: 14/8/2019
Vehicle Nao: SLD90&2E
Model: HONDA CRY
Date of loss: 7872019
CQr ref: SLSA300T)S
Year: 2016
List Price ~ Remarks

§ 508,20 Ad

$ 30,0048~

3 30.402#% £l -7

$ 631.20 K

5 1,548.20 oA

5 482.20 k.

$ 188.60 ¢k

REPAIR

$ 3,510.80

$ 702.16

s 2,808.64
Unit Price Remarks
$ 900,00 b0V

5 800,004 0 ©

5 000 Sur

$ 80.00 Fo

s 1,860.00

$ 4,668.64
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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

e ———————— e ———

From: Janet Tan <janettan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 August, 2019 9:.03 FM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Ce: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); C5 A Team; Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKK7404J (O : EQI - DM13HO02234/JT)
and SLD9062Z (TP : LKK REF - CC6/EQI19014156/T1ga3) on 07/08/2019

Attachments: SASZ658779.PDF

Categories; HMEK

Dear Mei Kwan
Attach oi report.

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

egnsurance

AV S .f?.ql W ool

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190
www.eqinsurance.com.sg

<
ﬁhw'u‘f[ﬂﬁhﬁl* @.__--'

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [muilto:Meikwan @ lkkauto.com|

Sent: Thursday, August 22, 2019 9:53 AM

To: Janet Tan <janet.lan @eginsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@ Ikkauto.com>; Admin
A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subjeet: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKK7404]) (O] : EQI - DMI19HO02234/JT) and
SLD9062Z (TP : LKK REF - CC&/EQI19014156/T 1ga3) on 07/08/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Janet,

Enclosed accident scene photos.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Mel Kwan | Admin



We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
* TP estimated cost of repair
* Preliminary advice

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured'’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Cecilia and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 4274,

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 oos5 | emall: MeiKwan@lkkauto com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{q08933)

From: Janet Tan <janet.tan @ eginsurance.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 15 August, 2019 9:20 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan @ lkkauto.com>

Ce: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @ lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@ lkkauto com>; Admin A <admin-
a@ lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKK7404]1 (01 : EQI - DM19HO02234/IT) and
SLD9062Z (TP : LKK REF - CC6/EQI119014156/ha3) on 07/08/2019

Dear Mei Kwan

Accident not reported.

We are following up on non reporting.
Regards,

lanet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

eqnsurance

I""it-'rvl- {?*F . .;-;atfil'r

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190

Www.eqinsurance.Com.sg Q:
‘h. A Mpemiser af iy gt 'lﬂ--—-—*'"

Privileged,/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the .



Cecilia Chuﬂ (LKK Auto!

From: Khar Kian Toh <tohkk_90@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 January 2020 11:29 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auta)

Subject: RE: Accident involved with vehicle SLDI0E2Z (OUR INSURED) and SKK7404) (TP) on

07/08/2019 1345HRS ALONG PENJURU FLYOVER TURNING TO PENJURU RD *** LKK
REF: CC6/EQI19014756/T1ga3

Dear Cecilia,
Confirm offer as 53130.00 (all-in).
Please send us DV,

Thanks,

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com)

Sent: Friday, 3 January, 2020 10:46 AM

To: Khar Kian Toh <tohkk_90@hotmail.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involved with vehicle SLD9062Z (OUR INSURED) and SKK7404) (TP) on 07/08/2019 1345HRS
ALONG PENJURU FLYOVER TURNING TO PENJURU RD *** LKK REF: CC6/EQI19014156/T1ga3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Toh,

We are pleased to offer G/S 53130.00 (all-in),
Kindly confirm acceptance,

Thanks

“Please note that our above settiement is made on a without prejudice basis, and shauld not be canstrued as an admission of liability on our
part ar on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the
accident. Dur offer made In respect of this present matter Is made solely to resolve this matter only. Mo reference shall be made ta this offer
ar any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of ariginal documents on demand at any time and execition of Discharge Voucher [for
settlernent sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment
on the settlement sum.”

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Huppy New Year 20207

Best Regards,

Cecilin Chong | Case Handler

LKR Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeclliaChong e lkkiutocom | fax: 6741-4108

1
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L3744
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Consuitants

Company Reglstration Mo, 129607198R

S1 LB AVE |, #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL 1 (065) 62563561 FAX : (045) 62564315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Date:

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

10/01/2020

Vehicle N SKK 7404, (Insd Veh) |Your Ref No.: DM18HO02234/T
ehicle No. = A

I SLD 80622 (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No.: CCB/EQI18014156/T1ga3g2
Date of Accident 7/8/2019

Liability 100%

Final Repair Cost ] 280000 B

Loss of Use : 5 o _SEU.Q_D 4 days =

Rental (If any) - _$ _ R days B
U'U"IB_ISZ . 17.00

3,137.00

Final Setflement Sum |: % 3,130.00 |GLOBAL SUM
Remarks = = -~
Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |LI SHENG AUTOMOBILE TRADING '8 N 3,130.00

- %

JOANME LEE

LKK Aulo Consultants Pte Ltd




! L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

?#_. 51 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No 199607128R GST Reg No. 19-9507198-R

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref : (CCB/EQI19014156/T1ga3q2

MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 089110

Code: EQI

5 MAXWELL ROAD
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 10-01-2020

HIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKK 7404. Veh. Inspected 5LD s062Z
Policy No. DMPPHO18-0058428 Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. DM18HO02234/JT Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From

Assign Date 15/08/2019

Make & Model HONDA CRV c.c 2354
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. MRHRM3850HP000069 Colour GREY
Odometer 77073 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN CRDER Modification SPORTS RIM

Size Make Balance

R/H Front Tyre |[225/60 R18 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre [225/60 R18 MICHELIN B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225B0R18 MICHELIN 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/80R18 MICHELIN & mm

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

Accident Date 07/0872018 Inspection Date 15/08/2019

Survey held at 18 PAN DAN LOOP#01-18
Repalrer LI SHENG AUTOMOBILE TRADING

A)THE INSPECTION
B)IN ACCORDAN




' ” V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Al B 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
’#_. TEL: 5256 3561 FAX. 62568 4315
Reg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 18-6607198-R Page No.-1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLD 90622

1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 598.20 586.20
10|FRONT BUMPER CLIP NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
2|FRONT BUMPER RETAINER NOT NECESSARY 32.40 -
1|FRONT RHS FENDER TO REPAIR SEE 631.20 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT RHS HEADLAMP cuT 1,548.20 1.548.20
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER LIP cuT 432 20 482 20
1|FRONT FEMDER ARC GARNISH cuT 188.60 1B8.60
1|FRONT RHS DOOR (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE - -
LABOUR
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -702.16 -568.44
2.808.64 2277.78
LABOUR
LABOUR FOR REPAIR ON AFFECTED AREA INCLUSIVE 900.00 500.00
OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT RHS FENDER AND FRONT
RHS DOOR
SPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREA 800.00 600.00
CHECK WIRING . B80.00 30.00
APPLY RUST PROOF ON AFFECTED PANEL BO.CO 30.00
1.880.00 1.260.00
GRAND TOTAL 4, 668.84 3,537.7T6

MDITION,

Report Ref No. CC6/EQI18014156/T1ga3q2

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN
M.MATAI AMSAE-A Automotive Assessor
Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report ls made solely for the use and benafll of the Clisnt named an the frani page of this Repor.




