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] URLAVE I, #02-25 PAYA UL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX @ (65) GIS6IME

Your Ref: D19005156MFSH Date: 16 August 2019

Our Ref: CS/ECI19014152/R1sd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear SirfMadam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __GBE 976558 .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 15/08/2019 at the premises of M/s Sin Sheng Engineering Services and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount - 11,800.63
Revised Estimate Amount : 8% 7.224.43
“Check” Items Amount . 5%
Total : 8%
Market Value : 8%
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%
Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages

at the n/s body.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 7 days

Yours faithfully,
Mohammed Rasul
Automotive Assessor



Ms ‘ Firstca pital M35 First Capital Insurance Limited (e Reg o 1550001050 GST Beg o, MZ-0001E76.9

6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel (63) 6222 2311 Fax: [65) 6222 3547
Chalms & Metir Undeawaiiing Depe 36 Robinson Road #16-01 Clty Howse Singapore DGESTT

Tek (65) 6507 3048 Fax: [65) 6507 3845
v msfirsteapitaloom.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type
Appointed

Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number,

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
07-08-2019 Our Ref No. D19005156MFSH
06-08-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC2987D Third Party Vehicle. GBES7655

NO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 3)
SUSAN
6863 9595/ 0 Fax No. 6863 6477

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315
MNA,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

SIN SHENG

ENGINEERING Attention. NIL
SERVICES

MNA, TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
JOANNEY

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

PERNE] (v amancr i




9/6/2019 Mail - Shirley Hiew (LKK Aula) - Outlock

Re: Our Ref: D19005156MFSH Pre-Repairs Assessment Request for GBE9765S -
accident involving with SHC2987D

sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com>
Thu 5/9/2019 2:38 PM
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Hi Mr. Rasul,

We are agreed the offer.

** KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED AT NO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 5), SINGAPORE
638892 WITH [MMEDIATE EFFECT **

Thank You

Regards

Pei Jin

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
No 8 Tuas Ave 18

Singapore 638892

(Level 3_Office)

(Level 5_Workshop)

Tel: 6863 9595

Fax: 6863 6477

On Thu, 5 Sep 2019 at 10:59, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Susan,

Refer to attachment

Finalised amount is $ 5,750 / 7 days lump sum

Kindly confirm

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto com | fax: 6841-4315

https:ioutiook.office comimailisearchiid/ AACKADUXOWNIYmYZLTFhM2QINDISN yOSZWFILTZIMzADOTIyMZMSNWAQALZIPUETNHNChoHbgPx... 176



- Ehirlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) =ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com=>
Sent: Friday, 16 August 2019 5:50 PM

To: ‘loanne Yong'; 'CWS Motor Claims'

Ce: assignments; SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005156MFSH/
Attachments: GBE 97655 - Preli Advise -.pdf

Dear Joanne,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBE 97655.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Higw | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 14 August 2019 5:03 PM

To: 'CWS Motar Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Joanne Yong' <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005156MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that repairer agreed survey on 15/08/2019.

Best Regards

G.NTVITHA

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)
Sent: Wednesday, 14 August 2019 4:32 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Joanne Yong



=loanneyong@msfirstcapital.com. sg=

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005156MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited

Tel : 6507 3848
Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW. aVE.COMm




ARAIPN1A

> Back to OneMotoring

Enguire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo,

Wehicle to be Exported:

Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

WVehicle Model:

Primary Colour
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No_

Chassis Mo.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Crriginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paig:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 08 Aug 201%

PARFITOF Rabate Frmiire

Company
196N

GBEY7655
Yes

31 Dee 2019
FIAT

DOBLO CARGD MAX] 1.6 MT) AMT GLAZE

Grey
2016

253A50007628798
ZFAZ6300006C51224
$19.29500

17 May 2016

17 May 2016

0

$955.00

Mo

$0.00

16 May 2026

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$46,502.00

$29.651.00
$29,651.00

THLGRE A W UV S L L T B LI O U TR LT PR L D Y UL S BB TRy DR W | IS F U0 § )



- SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES

NO 8, TUAS AVE 18,
(Level 3), SINGAPORE 638892

Tel No. : 6863-9595 Fax No. : 6863-6477
E-Mall : sinsheng1281@gmail.com

Buss. Reg. No. : 312029/00D

GOLDBELL LEASING PTE LTD
59 SENOKO ROAD
SINGAPORE 758123

Attention : Motor Claim Department
Contact : 6861 0007 Fax No.: 6753 7780

Estimate

Date :
Vehicle Num.

Make/Model :
Chassis/Eng#
Accldent Date ;

Page 1/2

: ES002926

10/08/2018

GBE97655

FIAT DOBLO 1.6MJTD (E5)-2016
ZFAZ6300006C51224/263A50007628
06/08/2019

Claim No. :
Reference : SHC2987D
Policy No, : 29090793
3N  Quantity  Particular unit Price  Amount 55
LIST ITEMS :
1. 1 FRONT DOOR, LHS 67‘.--"’ 2,615.62
2. 1 DOOR HANDLE OUTER LH e~ , 215.60)¢
- . DOOR GARNISH XX vt A% 69 9L 462.20%
4. 1 SIDE MIRROR, LHS Bfe 795.40
5. 1 DOOR GLASS LH FEeflanl” I L 308.20%
B, 1 RUNCHANNEL ¥ ¥“ 30520
7. 1 SLIDING DOOR, LH &~ oY 7 2,863.50
8 1 SLIDING DOOR HANDLE, LH FegémV” S &S 245.30%
9. 1 SLIDING DOOR GARNISH %S ———  35520%
10. 1 SLIDING DOOR LOCKS. SV& 253.20‘;:
1. 1 SIDE PANEL, LHS Freftéim ) 2,152.10°
19 3 SIDE PANEL GARNISH, LH P-ef-""c«“r’f 295.40
List Totalss : 11,061.92
15.00% Discount 55 : 1,659.29
9,402.63
METT ITEMS :
1 1 COMPANY REGISTRATION STICKER A& 20.00 -
Nett Total 55 : 0 20.00
10.00% Discount S§ : S 2.00
',..,'-"’ .............
18.00
i

CONTINUE /...



Page2/2

- SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES

NO 8, TUAS AVE 18,

(Level 3), SINGAPORE 638892

Tel No. : 6863-9595 Fax No. : 6863-6477
E-Mall : sinsheng1981@gmail.com

Buss. Reg. No. : 312029/00D

GOLDBELL LEASING PTE LTD Estimate - ES002926
5O SENOKO ROAD
SINGAPORE 758123 Date : 10/08/2019
Vehicle Num. : GBE97655
- . Make/Model : FIAT DOBLO 1.6MJTD (E5)-2016
ACERRERI - MAtor Sl Deparkmedt Chassis/Eng# : ZFA26300006C51224/263A5000762¢
Contact ; 6861 0007 Fax Mo. : 6753 7780 Accident Date : 06/08/2019
Claim No. :

Reference : SHC2987D
Policy No, : 28090793

]
S/N  Quantity Particular Unit Price  Amount 55

LABOUR :
TO PAMEL BEAT/REPAIR LH BODY 6-91? }Bﬁﬁ
TO DISMANTLE/REPLACE ABOVEMENTIONED PARTS \ '
T
SPRAY PAINTING \‘\ {50 120000 {"_";i.'/
TO APPLY TUFF KOTE B’ﬂ }Eﬂ{ﬂ |
: i
TO CHECK WIRING P’f’ Qroten [y Yo 30760
LOSS OF USE : 7 DAYS @ 5 120/DAY
Labour Total 5 : 70&1‘10 2,380.00
-
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-2607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

Ref -  CS/FCI19014152/R15d3n2

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Bl STO0SI0 ”lml|||”|||”|mlm
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, SHC 2987D Veh. Inspected GBE 97655
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19005156MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From JOANNE YONG Assign Date 14/08/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model FIAT DOBLO CARGO MAXI16 |c.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. ZFA26300006C51224 Colour BLUE
Odometer 88557 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [195/60 R16C PIRELLI & mm
L/H Front Tyre 195/60 R16C PIRELLI B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/60 R16C PIRELLI & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/60 R16C PIRELLI & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  05/08/2019 |In5pection Date 15/08/2019
Survey held at NO B TUAS AVENUE 18 (LEVEL 3)
Repairer SIN SHENG ENGIMEERING SERVICES
Sa. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REFPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

T Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 408933
TEL: G256 3561 FAX: G256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607T198-R

Page Mo.:1 of 2

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBE 9765S

Qty Description of Parts Condition | Estimate By fOur Adjusted
B Workshop (§))|  (5)
BEPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT DOOR,LHS BENT 2,615.62 2,615.62
1|DOOR HANDLE OUTER LH TO REPAIR SEE 215,60 -
LABOUR
1|DOOR GARNISH SERVICEAEBLE 462.20 =
1|SIDE MIRROR LHS BROKEN 795,40 795.40
1|DOOR GLASS LH TO REPAIR SEE 398.20 -
LABOUR
1|RUNCHANMNEL SERVICEABLE 395.20 -
1|SLIDING DOOR,LH BENT 2,863.50 2,B63.50
1|SLIDING DOOR HANDLE LH T REPAIR SEE 245,30 <
LABOUR
1|SLIDING DOOR GARNISH SERVICEABLE 355.20
1(SLIDING DOOR LOCK SERVICEABLE 268.20 -
1|SIDE PANEL,LHS TO REPAIR SEE 2,152.10 -
LABDOUR
1|SIDE PANEL GARNISH,LH cuT 29540 29540
LESS 15% DISCOQUNT -1,650.20 -985,49
9.402.63 5,584.43
NETT ITEMS
1|COMPANY REGISTRATION STICKER (N} MECESSARY 20.00 20.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -2.00 -2.00
18.00 18.00
LABOUR
TO PANEL BEAT/REPAIR LH BODY.TO 850.00 600.00
DISMANTLE/REPLACE ABOVEMENTIONED
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF DOOR HANDLE
OUTER LH,DOOR GLASS LH,SLIDING DOOR HANDLE LH
AND SIDE PANEL LHS.
SPRAY PAINTING 1,200.00 BO0.00
TO APPLY TUFF KOTE, 150.00 B0.00
TO CHECK WIRING. 80.00 40.00
2,380.00 1,620.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19014152/R1sd3n2




r [ B T
ads ny »
Page No.:2 of 2
f_ GRAND TOTAL 11,800.63 ?.:2:.43]
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5,750.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19014152/R1sd3n2

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Automotive Assessor B.Eng, AMSOE,AMIRTE,AMSAE-A,MMATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repon is mads sobsly for the vse and bonalit of the Clisnt named on tha frent pags of this Ropor.

Heo Bability of respensilility whatsoeser, in contact or tort. is accepted 1o any third garty whe may reply on the Regaet wholly ar n part. Any third pany scting or relying on this
Bepart. In whede or in part, does 50 at bis or hes own risk.



