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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 19 August 2019 9:15 AM

To: kangcar@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Kang Car (yahoo); Admin A

Subject: RE: OUR CLIENT VEHICLE  -SMD1530E ; ACCT INVLG SMG5774B(AIG), DOA : 07.08.2019

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Hi Sir/Mdm,   

 

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA 

(subject to BOLA guideline settlement)  and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case. 

  

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your 

client’s vehicle.  

  

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the 

days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor. 

  

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051 

 

In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate 

settlement. 

 

Thank You. 

 

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 19 August 2019 8:59 AM 

To: kangcar@singnet.com.sg; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Kang Car (yahoo) <kangcar176@yahoo.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: OUR CLIENT VEHICLE -SMD1530E ; ACCT INVLG SMG5774B(AIG), DOA : 07.08.2019 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

 

Thank you for your email. 
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The case is handled by Ms Asher. 

 

Hi Asher, 

 

Fyna. CC6/AIG19014037/Aea3 

 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 

matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 

negotiation of terms/settlement. 

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 

liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

 

From: kangcar@singnet.com.sg <kangcar@singnet.com.sg>  

Sent: Saturday, 17 August 2019 10:20 AM 

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Kang Car (yahoo) <kangcar176@yahoo.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: OUR CLIENT VEHICLE -SMD1530E ; ACCT INVLG SMG5774B(AIG), DOA : 07.08.2019 

 

 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE / REMINDER 

 

Hi Hsiao Tong,  

 

We refer to our email below.  

 

Kindly advise if your insured reported the accident and the liability.  

 

 

 

Thank you & Regards,  

Jeffrey 

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd  

Tel: 6747 7636  

Fax: 6748 5071 

 

 

On Tue Aug 13 2019 12:59:04 GMT+0800 (Singapore Standard Time) <kangcar@singnet.com.sg> wrote: 

---------- Original Message ---------- 
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WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

 

Hi Adrian,  

 

Attached herewith the supplementary estimate for your attention.  

 

Hi CS/Admin,  

 

Our client's vehicle was surveyed by Adrian Ling on 08.08.2019. Attached herewith the GIA of our client 

for your reference.  

 

We would like to proceed for Direct Settlement and kindly advise if your insured reported the accident 

and the liability.   

 

Kindly revert.  

 

 

Thank you & Regards,  

Sharon 

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd  

Tel: 6747 7636  

Fax: 6748 5071 

 

 


