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MS @ FirstCapital

MS First Capital Insurance Limited cCoReg bo 1950000060 ST Heg. No, M2-00016769
& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapare 048560

Tek {65) 6222 2311 Fax: [65) 6222 3547

Claims & Motor Undeswiting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068277

Tek {65) 6507 3048 Fax: [B5) 6507 3849
wwew. mafirsteapitaloom.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

26-07-2019 Our Ref No. D19004878MFSH
25-07-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SH7168J Third Party Vehicle. FBN5321L

255 ALEXANDRA ROAD

ALAIN LIM

65138625/ 0 Fax No. 0

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 688416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

BOON SIEW SINGAPORE Atienti NIL
PTE LTD Gl
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
SERENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspaction.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

& Memner of [EDRRAT INSURANCE GROL




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

E

From: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 8 August 2019 6:11 PM

To: ‘assignments@Ilkkauto.com’

Cc: Lim Chee Seong; Toh Boon Wah; Serene Ler; CWS Motor Claims
Subject: MNEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT OUR REF: D19004878MFSH
Attachments: 0197_190802154418_001.pdf

Dear Sirs

New assignment for your handling urgently.

Thanks and Regards,

SK Teo
Moteor Claims Dept

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3848 | Fax Mo.: 8507 3849 |
AMember of RN INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data,

Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by
return e-mail.

From: Teo Swee Keong

Sent: Thursday, August 8, 2019 5:49 PM

To: Lim Chee Seong <cs.lim@boonsiewhonda.com .sg>

Cc: Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 'assignments@lkkauto.com' <assignments@lkkauto.coms
Subject: RE: Accident involving FBN5921L & SH7169) on 25/07/2019 along Marymount road.

Dear Sir

Thank you for informing us of your choice at 5:46 pm, LKK will be appointed within 2 working days of your email.

Thank you,

Thanks and Regards,

SK Teo
Motor Claims Dept

M3 First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3848 | Fax No. ; 6507 3849 |
AMember of BRTNNE INSURANCE GROUP



Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPAT):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement,

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If'you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by
returm e-mail.

From: Lim Chee Seong <cs.lim@boonsiewhanda.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, August 8, 2019 5:46 PM

To: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Accident involving FBN5921L & SH7169) on 25/07/2019 along Marymount road.

Dear 5K Teo,
Arrange LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Come To Survey
Thank

Best Regard

Alain Lim

Service Executive

Boon Siew Singapore Pte Lte
TEL-6513 9625

From: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong @msfirstcapital.com . sgs

Sent: Thursday, August 8, 2019 3:19:41 PM

To: Toh Boon Wah <bwtoh@boonsiewhonda.com.sg>; Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: Lim Chee Seong <cs.lim@boonsiewhonda.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Accident involving FBN5921L & SH7169) on 25/07/2019 along Marymount road.

Dear Sirs,
We refer to your survey request dated 02/08/2019.

Please find below our list of surveyors for your reference. Kindly select from our list below and inform us of
your choice within the next 2 days.

1. LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
2. Vicom Ltd

Once you inform us of your choice, the surveyor will be appointed within 2 working days of your email.
Ifyou do not agree to any of the surveyors above, you may proceed to appoint your own surveyor. In this
instance, we will also appoint a surveyor from our list above to conduct the PRI. Upon completion of repairs,

please contact our appointed surveyor to conduct a physical re-inspection of the vehicle.

Thank you.

Thanks and Regards,



5K Teo
Motor Claims Dept

M5 First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3848 | Fax No. : 6507 3849 |
AMember of IUAFARNY INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA™);

Under the POPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your persanal data.

Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sq for details of POPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential, It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by
return e-mail.

From: Toh Boon Wah <bwtoh@boonsiewhonda.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, August 8, 2019 3:06 PM

Te: Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Lim Chee Seong <cs.lim@boonsiewhonda.com.sg>

Subject: Accident involving FBN5921L & SH7169J on 25/07/2019 along Marymount road.

Dear 5K Teo,

Your Ref: D19004878MFSH
Our Ref: FBNS921L

We spoke a moment ago, thank you for your kind assistant.

Appreciate if you could assist to arrange for site survey soonest at 255 Alexandra Road 5-159937
Kindly contact PIC of the case CS Lim at his mobile 8201 626 for the arrangement.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Toh BW

Boon Siew Singapore Pte Ltd
DID: 6513 9324



Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 20 August 2019 2:23 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAute);, 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments
Cc: ‘Serene Ler'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004878MFSH/M

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be inform we will recommend total loss due to chassis bent not safe to repair.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com=>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 August 2019 12:14 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'Serene Ler' <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004878MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment,

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 13 August 2019 11:40 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LEKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004878MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



MEHH 19058852 | Alax Mars Ple Lid - Bual Merah

ENTRY CATE & TIME: 30/0772019 16:33 Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting
SUBIITTED BY. Elizaheth Lex Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 30/07/2019 17:33

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1, Please report correclly the detais of the accident 1o speed up the claims process
2. This Forrn must be complated by the Policyhalder anddor the Authonsed Driver,

3, Information provided must be as ruthful and accurale as possibde, Any wallul misrepresentation or witholding of matenal facte may allow msurance companies o
repudiate policy labikty.

4, The issue and acceplance of this Form by insurance companes s nol an admission of palicy liakdily on the parl of the insurance companies

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This repon will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Managemeant Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this repord will, for a lee, be made available upon appfication by interested partios

7. By the loagement of this répor 1o e insurers, you hereby consent 1o the archiving of 1his repor at the centre.and 1o copses of the repor being made available
aforesaid,

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 30072019 16:33

Date Of Accident 25/07/201918:10

Exact Location Of Accident ALONG MARYMOUNT ROAD TOWARDS THOMSON ROAD
Country/State of Loss SINGAFPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number FBMNS921L
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner GOH CHUN Y1

NRIC Mo

Email Address
Mobile Phone No
Alternative Phone Mo
Vehicle Particulars
hManufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

fime of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicla?

If Mo, Please state acticn o be taken

Vehicle Category
Insurance Company
MName of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage
Fleet Policy

Palicy Number

Cowver Note Number
Driver

Wame of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth
Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gendoer

Mobile Mumber

Fax Numbear

Contact Number

EMail Address

589817990

J2 CORP.RSPHI@GMAIL. COM
(LOCAL) +65-97109467
OFFICE-97100467

HONDA
CBF190WH

PRIVATE

MY

THIRD PARTY
MOTORCYCLE

LIBERTY INSURANCE PTE LTD
COMPREHENSIVE

MNO

SB19V03402

GOH CHUN ¥I
SALB17594D
25/07/1989

INDOOR

3111062018

0 YEAR AND 8 MONTH
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-97100487

OFFICE-97109467
J2.CORP.RSPHIE@GMAIL.COM

Page 11 22



Contact Number

Address

Posticode

Insurance Company Nama

Mature Of Damage

MNo. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Name GOH CHUN Y1
Approximate Age

Injuries Sustain

Injured person in which vehicle? FEMNSS921L
Were seal belts worn? MO

Was this injured conveyed to haspital by
ambulance?

Address

Postcode

Page 3 of 22



Police Report

SINGAPORE “ngﬂlm

POLICE FORCE
Siaton 1ol3

Trafie it Repon No TR0VE0TIN20AT

Traffic Pobce

10 Ubi Aveniue 3 SINGAPORE 4088585

Tel No. 65470000

REPORT OF A TRAF SR T i
Ve R T Station Dsary

“Data/Time ReporiMade | Vide Report No.
28072018 1217 Ef20190725/0118

> L NIA SINGAPORE

GOH CHUN I | 27 MILTONIA CLOSE #07-13 SKIES MILTO
Tt Py S e T T

iD Type /1D No Contact No..

NRIC NO / S89817990 HomeOffice Moble: 97100407

Nationaity: Emad

YSIAN

i Age mﬁr Birth: | Type of Informant

Male a0 25/07/1989 | Rider - Name

S mm l Irsdituton [ School 4

i : e
Occupation. Driving Licence Information:
SENIOR ENGINEER Class: 28.3 Date of Expiry.

Page 5 of 22



Police Report

Page 7 of 22



SINGAPORE
POLICE FORCE

Folice Station Of Origin:

Traffic Police

10 Ubi Avenue 3 SINGAPORE 408865
Tel Mo: 65470000

REPORT OF A TRAFFIC ACCIDENT

T RATO AR

TR0120729/2047

183
Report No. T/201907 2972047

Date/Time Report Made: |

Vide Re?or‘i_ﬁd_-: Station Diary Mo

29/07/2019 12:17 | E/20190725/01186

Informant’s Partlculars

Name of Informant: Address:

GOH CHUN ¥ 27 MILTONIA CLOSE #07-13 SKIES MILTONIA SINGAPORE
. 768061

ID Type / ID No.: Contact Mo

MRIC NO [ 385981 ?BQD__ - Home/Office: Mobile: 87109457

Mationality: Email:

MALAYSIAN -

Sex; Age: Date of Birth: | Type of Informant: -

Male | 30 25/07/1989 Rider

Race: Language: Institution / School Name:

Chinese o

Occupation: Driving Licence Information;

SENIOR ENGINEER Class: 2B,3 Date of Expiry;

General Information of the Accident == e v o=
Type-of Injury Drink Date/Time of | Type of Location:
S Attended by Police Drive: | Accident: Straight Road

Accident: !

o | 25/07/2019 18:10

Location:

Along Road 1 Traveling Toward Road 2

MARYMOUNT ROAD

THOMSON ROAD

Weather: Road Surface; Road Speed Limit:

Clear Ory

Traffic Flow: Traffic Control; | Traffic Volume:;

Two Way . Moderate

Type of Collision: Anyone conveyed by

Between Moving Vehicles - Head To Rear ambulance:

Yes i

Details of Vehicle Involved B T

Vehicle No. | Type | Make Model | Color Condition | No of Passenger
| FBNSSZ1L | Motorcycle Slightly |0

Damaged

! SH71684 TAXI Slightly 0 [
L Damaged |




SOXICE Frce M

T .

T/20190729/2047
Police Station Of Origin: Aol 3
Traffic Police Report No. T/20180729/2047
10 Ubi Avenue 3 SINGAPORE 408865
Tel No: 65470000 CONTINUATION OF REPORT

Sketch Plan
Informant is not able to provide sketeh plan

IMPORTANT: Please attach a copy of your vehicle's Insurance Certificate to this report. If you don't have
the certificate with you now, please fax a copy to 65474885 stating the report number as reference.

Signature Of Officer Recording The Repori. | [ Signature Of Informant
TR/ 5. T _ 3
Sr Staff Sgt SYED ZAY|D MUHAMMAD BN A
SYED ABDUL WAHID ALHINDUAN Y | A ) “I

Ve
Signature Of Interpreter: Date/Time: |
Not applicable 29/07/2018 1217
Officer In Charge Of Case: | Classification OF Case:
TP/ GIT !

Staff Sgt YAN MINGSHENG DANIEL
Contact No.: 65476252 -

- - B
Authentication Stamp .
NP168




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta’/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeD..

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type:
Owner 1D

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended Deregistration

Date:

Wehicle Make:
Wehicle Model:
Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:
Maximum Power
Output:

Open Market Value:

Original Registration
Date:

First Registration Date;
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:

Singapore NRIC
799D

FEN5921L
Nao
14 Aug 2019

HONDA,

CBF190WH

Red

2018

MC46E5071166
LWBMC4659)1310137

$2,269.00
0% MNov 2018

09 Nov 2018
1
$341.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry
Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Mo

$0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

08 Nov 2028
D - Motorcycle
10

$3.951.00
$3,648.00
$3,648.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 14 Aug 2019

| of |

OK

14/8/2019, 9:32 ar



Identification Card

HEPUBLIC OF SINGAPORE
IDENTITY CARD NO. SBSB1799D

s :
GOH CHUN YI
X & &
CHINESE

LEGRTITONL

Page 21 of 22



SINEAPDH E Traffic Palice

10 Uk Avenoe 3

PELIEE FDHCE Singapore 408865

lel #B5 6547 0000
www, police. Qov. 8g

Our Ref . TP/IP/46359/2019
Date 29 July 2019
NAME : GOH CHUN YI

g
L

II_.r
I

NRIC / FIN : S8981799D !
IR

Dear Sir / Madam,

CASE OF TRAFFIC INCIDENT ALONG _ MARYMOUNT ROAD ON  25/07/2019

NOTICE FOR VEHICLE {FBN5921L ) COLLECTION

Please collect the above vehicle which is registered under your name at Traffic Police
Vehicle Pound located at 517 Airport Road, Singapore 539942 within 30 working days from the
date of this notice. The Duty Officer at Traffic Police Vehicle Pound can be contacted at 6280 7841.
The collection hours are;

_ Day of week - Operational hours
__Maonday _ 2.00 pm to 4.00 pm

8.00 am to 12.00pm
2.00 pm to 4.00 pm

Tuesday to Friday

2 You have to make your own arrangements to remove your vehicle at your own cost. If you are
authorizing someone else to collect the vehicle on your behalf, please ensure that he /[ she produces
his / her NRIC / Passport for verification. Please fill up the letter of authorization at Annex ‘A’

3 Take note that the vehicle must be collected within 30 working days from the date of this
notice or slorage fee will be levied as follows:

Type of \.r_a_z__iéig':ﬁm o Storage fee per day
Motorcycle/Scooter . s20-
_ Motorcar e
~_ Others = $80/-
4 Traffic Police will proceed to dispose the vehicle if it remains unclaimed after 30 working

days from the date of this notice. Should you require further clarification, please contact the
undersigned at telephone number 6547 6394 or via email at syed_zayid_muhammad@spf.gov.sg.

Yours faithfully, *

SYED ZAYID MUHAMMAD
INVESTIGATION OFFICER
TRAFFIC POLICE

L

AFORCE FOR THE NATION



02 August 2019

HONDA

BOON SIEW SINGAPORE PTE LTD
370 Ubi Road 3 Singapore 408651

Tel: +65 6339-3002 Fax: +65 6844-1852
Website: www boonsiewhonda.com.sg
Company Registration MNo. 137701866M

— LKK Auto Consultants h '
MS FIRSTCAPITAL CLAIMS DEPARTMEN'] the Repairerof he folowiy o
36, ROBINSON ROAD, -_l ey before/a®=r spray painting
#16-01 CITY HOUSE o Todspia: Samages 1 resurvy
SINGA[PRE D68877 R 2 : 1, s
L 1 wag I
Attn @ Motor Claim Department ® Sippi t2 resurveyed and
i5 %1 i PR "-'J-rﬂrﬂ:ﬂ[:{“m
Re:  Vehicle Registion  : FBN392IL Acknow edged by Repairer
Model : HONDA CBFI90WHG Signature;
Chassic No : LWBMC469911310137 Date:.

Engine No P MC46ESDT] 166
We have conucted visual inspection on the above-mentioned motorcyele, we wish to
advise you that the motoreyele chassis frame was severely damage. it is beyond repair.

Kindly arrange your Surveyor to inspect the said motorcycle at our premises soonest.

Please contact me should vou require further clarifications.
Your Early attention is greatly appreciated

Pt ”:’“m\(ﬁilﬂm 1349957341 / b7 Y4564
k me’
3]&[|AQ H4S

Lin.C.S

Executive Service
Boon Siew Singapore
(Leng Kee Branch)
Tel : 6513 9625

Hp : 82011626

Remark: Please Note That There Will Be A Daily Storage Charge Of $$10.00 per Day.
The Charges will Commence 5 Days after This Letter.



