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LEW JIEMNNY
From: LEMW JERMNY
Sent: Thursday, 8 Augus:, 2019 3.52 PM
To: Mancy Lam'; assignments; SUR
Subject: RE REQUIEST FOR JWN DAMAGES CLAIM APPROVAI: SKT 5962E DOA01.08.2019 /
M12D11171808
Attachments: ESTzi i
g O reseed Thgnés
Dear Nancy,

J 85

VVe will appoint LKK to survey the vehicle.
Dear Shiau Chan,

Please arrange to survey the vehicle at Kim Chwee Pte Ltd.
Excess: 33750.00

Vammest Regards

Jdanry Lew

Claims Divigion

United Overseas Insurance Limited

4 Anaon Road, #2807 Springleafl Tower, Singspore 078403
Main = (B3} 5222 7733 | DID - (B5) 6480 9329 | Fax - (&5) £337 3660 | Ermail + annyiewfuci cam sg

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person recaiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as canfidential and not misuze, eopy,
disclose, distribule or refain the information in any way thal amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are nat the intended
recigient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer syslem. As the integety of this message cannot be guaranieed,
neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsitie for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinicn of UCE or any entity in the UOB Group.

From: Nancy Lam [mailto:nancy.lam @&fastechauto.com.sg)
Sent: Thursday, 8 August, 2019 3:06 PM
To: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uni.com_sg>
H‘ubjeﬂ: REQUEST FOR OWN DAMAGES CLAINM APPROVAL: SKT 5962 DOA:01.08.2019

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/MMadam,

Kindly seek tor own damages claim approval uider Kim Chwee Pte Ltd

SKT 5962E@ cur workshop.
Kim Chwes Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave €

#01-48 AutoBay

Singapore 41788

Your kind reply & co-operation is highly appreciated

Regards,




Nancz Lam :

From: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, August 8, 2019 3:52 PM

To: Nancy Lam; assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR OWN DAMAGES CLAIM APPROVAL: SKT 5962F DOA:01.08.2019 /
M12D11171908

Attachments: EST.zip

Dear Nancy,

We will appoint LKK to survey the vehicle.
Dear Shiau Chan,

Please arrange to survey the vehicle at Kim Chwee Pte Ltd
Excess: S$750.00

Warmest Regards
Jenny Lew

Claims Division

United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Anscn Road, #28-01 Springleaf Tower, Singapare 079909

Main - (65) 6222 7733 | DID » (65) 6490 9329 | Fax + (65) 6327 3868 | Email - [EnnyiewEL

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,

neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the UOB Group

From: Nancy Lam [mailto:nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 8 August, 2019 3:06 PM

To: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>

Subject: REQUEST FOR OWN DAMAGES CLAIM APPROVAL: SKT 5962EF DOA:01.08.2019

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,

Kindly seek for own damages claim approval under Kim Chwee Pte Ltd

SKT 5962E@ our workshop.
Kim Chwee Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave &

#01-48 AutoBay

Singapore 417883

Your kind reply & co-operation is highly appreciated

Regards.



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
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From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 August 2019 5:48 PM

To: nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg

Subject: REQUEST FOR OWN DAMAGES CLAIM APPROVAL: SKT 5262E DOA: 01.08.2019 /
M12D11171908

Dear Nancy,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SKT 5962E at repair cost on Lump
Sum basis (Excess $750/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8{g089373)



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 August 2019 5:41 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: RE: REQUEST FOR OWN DAMAGES CLAIM APPROVAL: SKT 5962E DOA:
01.08.2019 / M12D11171908

Attachments: 0D Templatezip

Dear Shiau Chan,

Please proceed to authorise the repair at $$11,550.00.
Excess: S$750.00

Enclose the discharge voucher for client due execution.

Warmest Regards

Jenny Lew

Claims Division

United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Anson Road, #28-01 Springleaf Tower, Singapore 075809
Main « (G5) 6222 Y733 | DID - (65) 6490 8325 | Fax = (65) 6327 3869 | Email » jpnnylewifluni com sg

UOE EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment{s} contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. if you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannat be guaranteed,
neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the U0B Group.

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 13 August, 2019 5:34 PM

To: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: RE: REQUEST FOR OWN DAMAGES CLAIM APPROVAL: SKT 5962E DOA: 01.08.2019 / M12D11171908

Dear lenny,

Please find the attached of preliminary advice.

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com=>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 August 2019 4:49 PM

To: LEW IENNY <jennylew@uoi.com_sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: RE: REQUEST FOR OWN DAMAGES CLAIM APPROVAL: SKT 5962E DOA: 01.08.2019 / M12D11171908




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
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From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 August 2019 4:36 PM

To: LEW JENNY

Cc SUR

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR OWN DAMAGES CLAIM APPROVAL: SKT 5962E DOA: 01.08.2019
fM12011171908

Attachments: CS5U0I19013978Uqf3.pdf

Dear Jenny,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SKT 5962E.
Repair cost economical.

We have not authorise repair.

Best Regards,

Shiaun Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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51 UBLAVE 1, #0125 PAYA URI INDUST RT.-'LLP-\RK SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (5] 62563561 FAX : (D65) 6254315
Your Ref: D12D11171908 Date: 13" August 2019

Our Ref: CS/UOI19013978/Uqf3

The Motor Claims Department
United Oversea Insurance

Attn: Jenny

Dear Sirs/MMdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO._SKT 5962E

We thank you for the instruction on _08/08/2019.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 13/08/2019 at the premises of M/s KIM CHWEE and have the following
to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount <83 26,633.71

Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 8.091.84

“Check™ Items Amount : 5% 6.385.23

Lump Sum Estimate Amount 1 5% 11,550.00

Market Value : 5% 105.000.00

LTA Reimbursement Value - 5% 71,983.00

Nett Value + 88 33,017.00

Description of Damage: i

The vehicle sustained damages at the e
ofs front portion, The undercarriage affected @ o
due to collision. :

Comments/ Present Status:

Damages consistent,

Repair cost economical,

The vehicle repair on Lump Sum Basis.
Days of repair: 5 days

We have not authorize repair.

Yours faithfully

CHUA KANG SENG (H/p: 9009 6608)
Licensed Appraiser




S1UBIAVE 1, #0125 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065} 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: DI12D11171908 Date: 13" August 2019

Our Ref: CS/UOI19013978/Uqf3

The Motor Claims Department
United Oversea Insurance

Attn: Jenny

Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO__ SKT 5962E

We thank you for the instruction on _08/08/2019.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 13/08/2019 at the premises of M/s KIM CHWEE and have the following
to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount et 26.633.71

Revised Estimate Amount : S8 8.001.84

“Check” Items Amount :S§ 6,385.23

Market Value : 8% 105.000.00

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 55 T1.983.00

Nett Value 1 S5% 33,017.00

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the

o/s front portion. The undercarriage affected
due to collision.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages consistent.

Repair cost economical.
Days of repair: 5 days

We have not authorize repair.

Yours faithfully

CHUA KANG SENG (H/p: 9009 6608)
Licensed Appraiser



