Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Khar Kian Toh <tohkk_90@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 December 2019 12:44 PM

To: SUR; CWS Motor Claims; Sithara

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: Accident involved with vehicle SCR48H (OUR INSURED) and SHB2343S(TP) on
29/07/2019 1230HRS ALONG BOON LAY WAY TWD JLN BOON LAY JUNCTION

Attachments: SCR48H INVOICE LOD LOA PIR LTA SEARCH MERIMEN SEARCH.pdf

Dear All,

Confirm as finalize 20K (L/S, before GST). 12 repair days.
Aside,

Kindly acknowledge above attachment is our Tax invoice, LOD, LOA, PIR and LTA Search Fee.

Breakdown:
Amount($)
1) Repair cost $20,000.00
2) Loss of Use (12days+2 Sundays+1 day waiting for survey) =$120x15 days)
(from 7/8/2019- 21/8/2019) $1800.00
3) Miscellaneous (LTA Search Fee+ Merimen Search ) $36.45
Total $21,836.45

Please check and revert

Best Regards,
Toh Khar Kian

Li Sheng Automobile Trading

18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K)
Mobile: (65) 83987469 | Fax: 67744885

Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) [mailto:SteveChen@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 1 November, 2019 4:00 PM

To: tohkk_90@hotmail.com

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: SCR48H Repair Limit

Dear Mr Toh

Kindly confirm the finalize.



Thanks

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, October 30, 2019 10:00 AM
To: tohkk 90@hotmail.com

Cc: Veron Chen

Subject: SCR48H Repair Limit

Dear Mr Toh,

Kindly confirm the finalize 20K (L/S, before GST). 12 repair days.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, September 06, 2019 8:47 AM
To: tohkk 90@hotmail.com

Cc: Veron Chen

Subject: SCR48H Repair Limit

Dear Mr Toh,

Kindly inform that, the above vehicle repair limit 20k.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: SteveChen@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




