8/12/2020 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

RE: SPAM-LOW: Re: Motor Accident Claim for SBS6448D against SLT252S //LKK
REF:CC4/ASM19013848/Gpa3

paul@soonbee-vbm.com.sg <paul@soonbee-vbm.com.sg>
Mon 10/8/2020 5:03 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Kindly send us the discharge voucher for this.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Paul Yew
+65 9003 6715

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 27 July 2020 9:34 AM

To: paul@soonbee-vbm.com.sg

Subject: RE: SPAM-LOW: Re: Motor Accident Claim for SBS6448D against SLT252S //LKK
REF:CC4/ASM19013848/Gpa3

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Hi Paul,

We refer to the above matter.

We have our principal instruction to maintain our offer at a global sum of $8,300.00(all-in).
Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /

inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
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From: paul@soonbee-vbm.com.sg <paul@soonbee-vbm.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 July 2020 11:53 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SPAM-LOW: Re: Motor Accident Claim for SBS6448D against SLT252S //LKK
REF:CC4/ASM19013848/Gpa3

Hi Hsiao Tong,
Any update on this case.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Paul Yew
+65 9003 6715

From: paul@soonbee-vbm.com.sg <paul@soonbee-vbm.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 28 May 2020 4:12 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SPAM-LOW: Re: Motor Accident Claim for SBS6448D against SLT252S //LKK
REF:CC4/ASM19013848/Gpa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Will it be a good time for you to call you regarding on this.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Paul Yew
+65 9003 6715

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 7 May 2020 10:29 PM

To: paul@soonbee-vbm.com.sg

Subject: SPAM-LOW: Re: Motor Accident Claim for SBS6448D against SLT252S //LKK REF:CC4/ASM19013848/Gpa3

Without Prejudice

(save as to costs)
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Hi Paul,

We refer to your below email.

We have our principal instruction to maintain our offer at a global sum of $8,300.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@]lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: paul@soonbee-vbm.com.sg <paul@soonbee-vbm.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 24 February 2020 12:27 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Motor Accident Claim for SBS6448D against SLT252S //LKK REF:CC4/ASM19013848/Gpa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
As this bus belong to LTA thus we will not be able repair based on lump sum.
Meanwhile we had to follow LTA to repair accident base on part by part.

Thus, we will like to counter propose of the amount as shown below.

Cost of repair: $9,854.72
Loss of Use @ 4 days (55250 per day): $1,000.00
GIA Report/LTA search: $7.45
Total: $10,862.17

Do let us know if you need any further clarification.
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Thank you.

Best Regards,
Paul Yew
+65 9003 6715

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 February 2020 3:32 PM

To: paul@soonbee-vbm.com.sg

Subject: RE: Motor Accident Claim for SBS6448D against SLT252S //LKK REF:CC4/ASM19013848/Gpa3

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Hi Paul,

We refer to the above matter.

We have our principal instruction to improve our offer at a global sum of $8,300.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice

engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other
related claims.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 9 December 2019 9:00 AM

To: paul@soonbee-vbm.com.sg

Subject: RE: Motor Accident Claim for SBS6448D against SLT252S //LKK REF:CC4/ASM19013848/Gpa3

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We have our principal instruction to offer as follows: -
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1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $7,008.51
2. Loss of Use (4days x $250.00) $1,000.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee S 7.45

Total | $8,015.96

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other
related claims.”

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas, and Happy New Year 2020”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Paul <Paul@soonbee-vbm.com.sg>

Sent: Sunday, 17 November 2019 10:08 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Motor Accident Claim for SBS6448D against SLT252S //LKK REF:CC4/ASM19013848/Gpa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Thank you for the follow up on this accident claim.

However after review, we will like to counter propose of the amount as shown below.

Cost of repair $9,854.72
Loss of Use @ 4 days (S$275 per day) $1,000.00
GIA Report/LTA search $7.45
TOTAL $10,862.17

Do let us know if you have any concern over it.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Paul
+65 9003 6715

From: "Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)" <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, 16 November 2019 12:17 PM

To: "paul@soonbee-vbm.com.sg" <paul@soonbee-vbm.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Motor Accident Claim for SBS6448D against SLT252S //LKK REF:CC4/ASM19013848/Gpa3
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Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We have our principal instruction to offer as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $6,163.20
2. Loss of Use (4days x $250.00) $1,000.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee S 7.45

Total | $7,170.65

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other
related claims.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: paul@soonbee-vbm.com.sg <paul@soonbee-vbm.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 27 August 2019 2:09 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Motor Accident Claim for SBS6448D against SLT252S

Dear Motor Claims Dept,
Attached are the documents on the motor accident claim for SBS6448D.
Do let us know if you required any other documentation.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Paul Yew
+65 9003 6715
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