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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: claims@96motorsports.com

Sent: Tuesday, 19 November, 2019 11:18 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; CS A Team; assignments

Subject: RE: PRI FOR SKJ 8360A ; YOUR INSURED XB 8376T *** LKK REF: 

CC6/CTI19013823/ka3

Categories: HMK

Dear Mei Kwan, 
 

Our Client would like to withdraw the claim and the vehicle has been repaired at the owner’s expenses. 
 

Thank you 

 

Royce Phua  

 
62/64 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 

Ark @ KB Singapore 417893  

Tel         : 6702 6996 

Fax        : 6384 6996 

Email    : Claims@96motorsports.com  

Website: www.96motorsports.com  
 

 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 19 November, 2019 10:38 AM 

To: claims@96motorsports.com 

Cc: vincent.lee@96motorsports.com; Andyson <andysonckl@yahoo.com>; Gary 96 

<gary.chang@96motorsports.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; 

assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: PRI FOR SKJ 8360A ; YOUR INSURED XB 8376T *** LKK REF: CC6/CTI19013823/ka3 

 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 
 

We refer to the above matter. 
 

Kindly advise whether your client still would like to pursue with TP claim. 
 

If so, please provide us the following and arrange for TP survey. 

• GIA report 

• Police report 

• Estimated cost of repair 

 

Our case handler in-charge is Khanchna and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360. 
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To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: claims@96motorsports.com <claims@96motorsports.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 6 August, 2019 2:58 PM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng 

(LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: vincent.lee@96motorsports.com; Andyson <andysonckl@yahoo.com>; Gary 96 

<gary.chang@96motorsports.com> 

Subject: PRI FOR SKJ 8360A ; YOUR INSURED XB 8376T 

 

 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
 

Dear LKK , 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 8360A and XB 8376T on 2019 

AT / ALONG BARTLEY RD > UPPER PAYA LEBAR RD 

  

We act for TANG WAI MENG, whose vehicle registration number SKJ 8360A was damaged in the above 

accident.  

 
Kindly Adrian Ling to conduct the survey. 

  

If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the 

vehicle without further reference to you. 

 

Thank you, 

Jade Lim 

 

 

62/64 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 
Ark @ KB Singapore 417893  
Tel         : 6702 6996 
Fax        : 6384 6996 
Email    : claims@96motorsports.com  
Website: www.96motorsports.com  
 

 

 


