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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 6 August, 2019 5:01 PM

To: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: ybsim@vfixauto.com.sg; jessicassy@vfixauto.com.sg; jeffbz@vfixauto.com.sg; 

alanclk@vfixauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: Your ref: YN 5751M_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SGX 8267K AND YN 

5751M ON 04/03/2017

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Categories: HMK

 
 
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
Thank you for the email.  
 
Dear Mei Kwan,  
 
Kindly assist to reopen the case.  
 

 

 

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be 

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

   

 

 

Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Vivian Lau| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

  

 

 

 

From: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg [mailto:wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 6 August, 2019 4:34 PM 

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: ybsim@vfixauto.com.sg; jessicassy@vfixauto.com.sg; jeffbz@vfixauto.com.sg; alanclk@vfixauto.com.sg 

Subject: RE: Your ref: YN 5751M_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SGX 8267K AND YN 5751M ON 04/03/2017 

 
 

 

 

Dear Vivian, 

 

 

We accepted your offer Cost of Repair at $880.00(all in). 
 
Thank You. 
 

Remark: W.e.f 22nd April 2019, our office has been relocated to 26, Chia Ping Road, Singapore 

619977. Please update your record with the following: Company contact number - 6455 2957 ; Company general 

email - contact@vfixauto.com.sg 

  

Thanks & Regards, 

 

Weng Sheng 

Motor Claim Operation Admin 

Vfix Auto Pte Ltd | Vfix Auto Service Pte Ltd | Vfix Leasing Pte Ltd 

26 Chia Ping Road Singapore 619977 

Contact: 6455 2957 | E: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg 

 

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 6 August 2019 4:27 PM 

To: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg 

Subject: RE: Your ref: YN 5751M_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SGX 8267K AND YN 5751M ON 04/03/2017 

 
 
 
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
We refer to our below email . 
 
Based on both accident reports and scenario, the accident happened along Ang Mo Kio Avenue 3 towards CTE, 
which is a merging lane. Please be informed that our principal had further reviewed the matter and based on the 
available information and evidence at hand, our principal is in the view that both parties should exercise caution when 
merging and bear equal liabilities on the above matter. 
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Purely for an amicable settlement on a without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we maintained our global 
sum offer at S$ 880.00 (all in) 
 
Kindly reconsider our offer. 
 
 

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be 

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

   

 

 

Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Vivian Lau| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

  

 

 

 

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)  

Sent: Saturday, 23 December 2017 11:15 AM 

To: vfix auto <vfixauto@gmail.com> 

Cc: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Your ref: YN 5751M_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SGX 8267K AND YN 5751M ON 04/03/2017 

 
Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Irene, 

 

We refer to our below email . 

 

Based on both accident reports and scenario, the accident happened along Ang Mo Kio Avenue 3 towards CTE, 

which is a merging lane. Please be informed that our principal had further reviewed the matter and based on the 

available information and evidence at hand, our principal is in the view that both parties should exercise caution 

when merging and bear equal liabilities on the above matter. 
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Purely for an amicable settlement on a without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we maintained our global 

sum offer at S$ 880.00 (all in) 

 

Kindly reconsider our offer. 
 

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 

from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: vfix auto [mailto:vfixauto@gmail.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 23 November, 2017 3:16 PM 
To: Zaini (LKK Auto) 

Cc: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: Your ref: YN 5751M_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SGX 8267K AND YN 5751M ON 04/03/2017 

 
Dear Zaini 
 
Our client unable to accept the offer at $880.00. Base on our insured's vehicle damaged, our insured's 
already ahead of your insured. 
 
Kindly review this case. 
 
Thanks 
Irene 
 
 
 
 
 
Vfix Auto Services Pte Ltd 
60 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Ark@KB Singapore 417892 | E: vfixauto@gmail.com | T: +65 64552957 | F: +65 64452368 
 
On Tue, Sep 12, 2017 at 10:54 AM, Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

 

Your Ref: VFIX-TP20170173  

Our Ref: CC6/AIG17004713/Uwa3 

 

Dear Irene, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGX 8267K & YN 5751M ON 04/03/2017  

 

We refer to the above matter  

 

For a quick and amicable settlement, we offer to settle global sum at S$ 880.00 (all in) 
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Kindly confirm acceptance. 

  

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 

from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: vfix auto [mailto:vfixauto@gmail.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 12 September, 2017 10:21 AM 
To: Zaini (LKK Auto) 

Cc: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: Your ref: YN 5751M_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SGX 8267K AND YN 5751M ON 04/03/2017 

  

Dear Zaini 

  

Please find attached Letter of Demand for your kind perusal. 

  

Thanks 

Irene 
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Vfix Auto Services Pte Ltd 
60 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Ark@KB Singapore 417892 | E: vfixauto@gmail.com | T: +65 64552957 | F: +65 64452368 

  

On Wed, Jul 12, 2017 at 12:55 PM, Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SGX 8267K AND YN 5751M ON 04/03/2017 

  

We refer to the below email. 

  

Strictly without admission of liability whatever, but with a view towards a resolutions of your client's claim 
in the above matter without resort to litigation and not jeopardizing our insured claim against the liable 
party, we are prepared to offer 50% to your client's claim. 

Our surveyor have finalise COR at $ 1,400.00 ( exclude gst) 2 days.  

  

In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents for us to proceed on negotiate 
settlement. 

  

Best Regards, 

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants 

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)  

Sent: Thursday, 6 July, 2017 4:26 PM 
To: 'vfix auto' 

Cc: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Your ref: YN 5751M_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SGX 8267K AND YN 5751M ON 04/03/2017  

  

Your ref: YN 5751M                                          “WITHOUT PREJUDICE” 

Our ref: CC6/AIG17004713/Uwg3 
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Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SGX 8267K AND YN 5751M ON 04/03/2017 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. There is no conclusive evidence yet to 
substantiate either party’s version. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's accident report 
for your perusal. 

  

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our 
OI we will revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal 
assistance until you heard further from us. 

  

Meanwhile, kindly forward to us with any evidence (if any) your client have to support your claim.  

  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants 

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

 


