Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 21 October, 2019 12:56 PM

To: 'Sharon Heng L K'

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FINAL REPORT - SLQ811U
Hi Sharon,

COR $26,167.15, 11 days.
Subject to insurance approval.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Sharon Heng L K [mailto:sharon.heng.leekun@simedarby.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 18 October 2019 1:51 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Toh Jing Xuan; Bernard Wan Chong Huat

Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FINAL REPORT - SLQ811U

Dear Taufikh

For your perusal :

Labour $12912.00
Parts $13255.15
Total $26167.15
Owner is claiming LOSS OF USE = $100 X 15 DAYS.

MEDICAL FEE - $402.43.
LTA SERCH FEE - $7.45.

Note : 11 working days.

Please reply me directly.

Best Regards

Sharon Heng
Performance Motors Ltd
Body & Paint

DID : 63190123

Fax : 64743229
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From: service.pml@simedarby.com.sg [mailto:service.pml@simedarby.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 18 October, 2019 11:48 AM

To: Sharon Heng L K

Subject: Message from KM _C458
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