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RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] New Assignment - Accident involving GBG195S and PA9813S
on 25/7/2019 along Tuas Road - Oref: 19/19/19/VC05/022133 [External General]

KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>
Thu 8/6/2020 11:07 AM
To:  Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Lonpac External - General
Dear Asher
 
Please proceed as per your recommendations.
 
Best Regards
 
Kenny Lim
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.
 
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.
 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 21 July 2020 3:15 pm 
To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] Re: New Assignment - Accident involving GBG195S and PA9813S on 25/7/2019
along Tuas Road - Oref: 19/19/19/VC05/022133 [External General]
 

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 20/08/2019 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle.

Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability.

Summary to offer to repairer SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount

https://www.lonpac.com.sg/
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1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 6,124.06 $ 3,424.00

2. Loss of Use (5days x $130) $ 650.00 $ 500.00 (5days x $100)

3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 2.00 $ 2.00

Total $ 3,926.00

**5 days recommendation for repair.

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval please.

 
Thank You.
Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed. 

 

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE  
Sent: Wednesday, August 21, 2019 9:02 AM 
To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)  
Cc: MT_Claim_SG ; Admin A ; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)  
Subject: RE: New Assignment - Accident involving GBG195S and PA9813S on 25/7/2019 along Tuas Road - Oref:
19/19/19/VC05/022133 [External General]
Lonpac External - General
Dear Shu Pei
Please proceed with direct se�lement.
Best Regards
Kenny Lim
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
https://www.lonpac.com.sg/
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Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 20 August, 2019 6:41 PM 
To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: New Assignment - Accident involving GBG195S and PA9813S on 25/7/2019 along Tuas Road - Oref:
19/19/19/VC05/022133 [External General]
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above ma�er.
We have inspected TP vehicle PA 9813S at M/s Sng Ah Tee Motor & Panel Service Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP
repairer proposed for a direct se�lement.
Enclosed for your perusal is:
- Es�mated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.
Thank you.
Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 6 August 2019 10:37 AM 
To: 'KENNY LIM CHING GHEE' <kennylim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: New Assignment - Accident involving GBG195S and PA9813S on 25/7/2019 along Tuas Road - Oref:
19/19/19/VC05/022133 [External General]
Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.
Best Regards
G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Monday, 5 August 2019 3:06 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
<shupei@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: New Assignment - Accident involving GBG195S and PA9813S on 25/7/2019 along Tuas Road - Oref:
19/19/19/VC05/022133 [External General]
Lonpac External - General
Dear Shu Pei
We refer to the above ma�er and appreciate if you can arrange for a survey on the TP vehicle PA9813S.
Kindly contact Ms Samantha/Sng Ah Tee to make arrangement and to let us have your comments on liability soon.
Copy of our Insured’s SAS report is a�ached for your reference.
Thank you.
Best Regards
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Kenny Lim
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.
From: SAMANTHA TAN [mailto:sam@sngahtee.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 1 August, 2019 12:08 PM 
To: MT_Claim_SG 
Subject: Accident involved with our client's vehicle PA9813S your insured GBG1959S on 25/07/2019
Hi,
We refer to above and wish to check liability for this case.
Hope to hear from you soon.
Thank you.
Best Regards
____________________________________________ 
Samantha Tan | sam@sngahtee.com

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457 
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at h�p://www.sngahtee.com
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