Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 August 2019 3:47 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto); SAMANTHA TAN

Subject: RE: New Assignment - Accident involving GBG195S and PA9813S on 25/7/2019 along

Tuas Road - Oref: 19/19/19/VC05/022133 [External General]

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA
(subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your
client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the
days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051

In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate
settlement.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 15 August 2019 3:35 PM

To: SAMANTHA TAN <sam@sngahtee.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: New Assignment - Accident involving GBG195S and PA9813S on 25/7/2019 along Tuas Road - Oref:
19/19/19/VC05/022133 [External General]

Dear Samantha,

Kindly refer to the below Ol statement for your easy reference.



It ¥ E5 Sgaaat whom'/
Circumstancas of Accident

| WAS TRAVELLING ALONG TUAS RD TWDS PIE ON THE EXTREME LEFT LANE SUDDEMLY INFRT OF MY
VEH(E/BEARING REG NO PASE135 JAMMED BRAKE AND | HAVE NOT ENOUGHT TIME TS STOP AND MY VEH HIT ONTD
THE REAR PORTION OF VEH B.

Attachrment(s)

Dear Asher,
Kindly assist.
Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: SAMANTHA TAN <sam@sngahtee.com>

Sent: Thursday, 15 August 2019 11:05 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: New Assignment - Accident involving GBG195S and PA9813S on 25/7/2019 along Tuas Road - Oref:
19/19/19/VC05/022133 [External General]

HI Shu Pei,

Enclose herewith the attached GIA report for your reference.
Kindly advise the liability status on the above vehicle.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Samantha Tan | sam@sngahtee.com

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHTE

MOTOR & PANEL

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 15 August 2019 9:44 AM

To: SAMANTHA TAN <sam@sngahtee.com>

Subject: RE: New Assignment - Accident involving GBG195S and PA9813S on 25/7/2019 along Tuas Road - Oref:
19/19/19/VC05/022133 [External General]

Dear Samantha,



Kindly forwards to us a copy of TP GIA report.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 6 August 2019 10:37 AM

To: 'KENNY LIM CHING GHEE' <kennylim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: New Assignment - Accident involving GBG195S and PA9813S on 25/7/2019 along Tuas Road - Oref:
19/19/19/VC05/022133 [External General]

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 5 August 2019 3:06 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
<shupei@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: New Assignment - Accident involving GBG195S and PA9813S on 25/7/2019 along Tuas Road - Oref:
19/19/19/VC05/022133 [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Shu Pei

We refer to the above matter and appreciate if you can arrange for a survey on the TP vehicle
PA9813S.



Kindly contact Ms Samantha/Sng Ah Tee to make arrangement and to let us have your
comments on liability soon.

Copy of our Insured’s SAS report is attached for your reference.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Kenny Lim

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all THeWD [onpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: SAMANTHA TAN [mailto:sam@sngahtee.com]

Sent: Thursday, 1 August, 2019 12:08 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Accident involved with our client's vehicle PA9813S your insured GBG1959S on 25/07/2019

Hi,
We refer to above and wish to check liability for this case.
Hope to hear from you soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Samantha Tan | sam@sngahtee.com

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHTE

MOTOR & PANEL
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