Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 30 April, 2020 10:09 AM

To: tommywoon@eurokars.com.sg

Cc: Admin A; insuranceclaims@eurokars.com.sg; weiling1509@yahoo.com;

jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg; jessicahs@eurokars.com.sg;
stephanie.loke@eurokars.com.sg; Vic (LKKAuto); Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: SJX9202E Our ref: SKQ2702A DOA: 24/07/2019 (MAZDA) - LKK REF
CC4/LPC19013779/Aha3
Attachments: DV.PDF

Without Prejudice

Dear Tommy,

We refer to our below email.
For your acceptance please.
Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and should
not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement should also
not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made
solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other
related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ EIES

i, -

" Save the Larth Print only whernr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 19 December, 2019 8:55 AM

To: tommywoon@eurokars.com.sg

Cc: Admin A; insuranceclaims@eurokars.com.sg; weiling1509@yahoo.com; jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg;
jessicahs@eurokars.com.sg; stephanie.loke@eurokars.com.sg; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: SIX9202E Our ref: SKQ2702A DOA: 24/07/2019 (MAZDA) - LKK REF CC4/LPC19013779/Aha3



WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Tommy,
We refer further to our below email.

On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our
Insured’s part, we have our principal’s mandate and we propose below amount to settle your client’s claim.

Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 5,507.80
Loss of Use ($60 x 7 days) S 420.00
LTA Search Fee S 2.00

TOTAL $ 5,929.80

If agreeable, kindly let the owner sign the attached DV and forward back to us (LKK) the original signed hard copy
for our Principal to process the payment.

The above amount is to be made payable to TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD.

Thank you.

""Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

FESES T
BAmRmEm e Save the Larthe Print only whenr recessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 15 November, 2019 11:11 AM

To: tommywoon@eurokars.com.sg

Cc: Admin A; insuranceclaims@eurokars.com.sg; weiling1509 @yahoo.com; jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg;
jessicahs@eurokars.com.sg; stephanie.loke@eurokars.com.sg; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: SJX9202E Our ref: SKQ2702A DOA: 24/07/2019 (MAZDA) - LKK REF CC4/LPC19013779/Aha3

Without Prejudice



Dear Tommy,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.

Please be informed that we are pending for mandate approval from our principal.
We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ EIES

SLERER W Suve the Larthe Print only whern necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: tommywoon@eurokars.com.sg [mailto:tommywoon@eurokars.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 14 November, 2019 10:12 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; insuranceclaims@eurokars.com.sg; weilingl509 @yahoo.com; jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg;
jessicahs@eurokars.com.sg; stephanie.loke@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: RE: Your ref: SIX9202E Our ref: SKQ2702A DOA: 24/07/2019 (MAZDA) - LKK REF CC4/LPC19013779/Aha3
Importance: High

Dear Vic,
As spoken yesterday, please expedite & let us have your settlement offer to resolve our client’s claim.

We appreciate your urgent attention and look forward to hear from you as soon as possible. Thank you.

Best regards,

8) ELROKARS GROUP

Tommy Woon

Assistant Manager — Insurance Claims

27A, Tanjong Penjuru

Singapore 609042

Dir: +65 6331 0693 |Fax: +65 6331 0690 | Email: tommywoon@eurokars.com.sg
Website: www.eurokarsgroup.com




***DISCLAIMER***

This email and any attachments there to be intended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is
confidential and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. Any use of the information contained herein (including, but not limited to, total or
partial reproduction, communication, or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended recipient(s) is prohibited. If you have
received this email in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete it.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: 21 October 2019 3:05 PM

To: Jen Lim <jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Tommy Woon <tommywoon@eurokars.com.sg>; Insurance Claims Common
<insuranceclaims@eurokars.com.sg>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: SIX9202E Our ref: SKQ2702A DOA: 24/07/2019 (MAZDA) - LKK REF CC4/LPC19013779/Aha3

Without Prejudice

Dear Jen,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.
We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg [mailto:jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 21 October, 2019 2:58 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; tommywoon@eurokars.com.sg; insuranceclaims@eurokars.com.sg
Subject: Your ref: SIX9202E Our ref: SKQ2702A DOA: 24/07/2019 (MAZDA)

Dear Vic,

Hope this email finds you well. The purpose of writing this email is to submit invoice and documents for Letter of
Demand.

Should you require more information, please do not hesitate to contact us.

Thanks you.



Best Regards,

Jen

Insurance Claims Dept

TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD

27A Tanjong Penjuru

Singapore 609042

T: (65) 6331 0698 F: (65) 6331 0690
E: jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg




