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s =am Pla Liid Company Aoglatration No 198607 156R

£ LB AVE 180225 PAVA LD INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE JUS933 TEL - (65 62500501 FAX : (a8 B2ERLY|E

Yourrel:  D19004984MFSH

Our ref: CS/FC119013775/Avd3 Date : 15/872019

The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. S]K 6891

We thank you for your instruction on 6/8/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

14/8/2019  at the premises of M/s PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 856,647.00

Revised Estimate Amount : §52,179.00

“"Check” Items Amount : $5403.00

Market Value ¢ 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%

Nett Value : 8%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the

rear portion - front

Commenis/Present Status;
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADAIAN LING WA PING
B.Eng AMSOE AMIFTE AMSAE-AMMATAI
Ligensed Appralsar



MS @ FirstCapital
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Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Conlact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

31-07-2019 Our Ref No. D19004584MFSH
29-07-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHCE780T Third Party Vehicle. SJKBBSL

55 UBI ROAD 1

SYAFIQ

53882323/ 0 Fax No. €7689911

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

PREMIUM
Cc : Workshop AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor WA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Officer Incharge

MAY CHUA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignmant and 7 days for re-inspaction

This 15 a computer generated latter, no signature required




Veron Chen !Ll(ltAutu!

From: Veron Chen [LKEKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 August 2019 8:45 AM

To: ‘CWS Motor Claims’

Cc: ‘May Chua’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004384MFSH/1-5JK 689L
Attachments: SJK 689L PRELI ADVISED. pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SJK 689L
Date of survey: 14/8/2019
Number of days : 3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 6 August 2019 4:08 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Ce: 'May Chua' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D15004984MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be infarmed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer arrange on 14/08/2018.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: pssignments@ kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims ilto:cwsmotarclaims@msfirs ital.com.s
Sent: Tuesday, 6 August 2019 11:55 AM
To: ASSIGNMENTSELKKAUTO.COM



Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital. com.sg>; May Chua <maychua@msfirstcapital.com sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004984MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mall. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WW.aVE.com



*Veron Chen !LKI{Auto!

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 24 October 2019 12:25 PM

To: 'jiayeeyap@premiumauto.com.sq’; SUR; Admin A; CS A Team; SUR
Ce: 'Boo seng yak'; ‘Carrine Leong’; 'Chang Chee Sing’

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SJKGB9L - TP FIRST - SURVEYED 14 AUG 19
Dear Jia Yee,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirm repair cost of $2178.50 before GST @ 3 days of repairs

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, PFaya Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: jiayee yap@premiumauto.com.sg <jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 October 2019 1:41 PM

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>;
CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Boo seng yak' <boojohnny@gmail.com>; 'Carrine Leong' <carrine,leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; 'Chang Chee
Sing' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SJK689L - TP FIRST - SURVEYED 14 AUG 19

Hi Adrian and all,
Revised estimate and photographs is attached.
Please confirm repair cost of $2178.50 @ 3 days of repairs

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Thanks & Best Regard
Jia¥ee Yap
Claims Administrator

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd jng ne sssoaanw)
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 4086599
p. +65 6388 1321 d. +65 6768 9925 1. +65 6841 1183

e jlgves vap@premiumauto com.sg  w. www.audl.com.sg
Audl Showroom, Audl Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6236 2223



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 63662323 Fax:6841 1183
Emall: Nora khaif@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto_com.sg

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Warkshop : UbiRoad1

Contact No + B366 2323

Fax No ¢ bB4al1183
Reference ! PA/TR/O949/2019/NS
Date i 7-Aug-19

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.
Your Insured Veh No: SHCB780 T

First Capital Insurance Ltd
36 Robinson Road

# 16-01 City House
Singapore 06BB77

Attn: Motor Claims Dept
Tel:6854 3909 Fax: 6507 3B49
Owner's Name 1 MR NGSWEE LEONG
Address ! BLK 806 BEDOK RESERVOIR ROAD
#05-02
Singapore 479243
Telephone : HP97333002
Type of Claim :  Third party Claims
Policy No. : 1B00109961
Vehicle No : S)JK689L
Model Code :  Audi A4 SEDAN 2.0 TFS1 BW
Model / Year :  Sep-lB
Engine No : CVK 062606
Chassis No +  WALZZZF49)4177148
Mileage :
Date In :
Liability : -
Excess Cost : -
Estimated By :  Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date i 29-Jul-19
Place of Accident : ALONG FULLERTON ROAD



- Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 63662323 Fax:6B841 1183

Telefax

im r Char

Estimated Surveyor's
5/n Mature of Jobs Charges Recommendation

To remave and transfer rear parking aid and rear lid kick

1 sensor, Check function and renew according to damage. e e oA <
2 To dismantle and renew rear bumper. Re-organise crash s 1 c:-smﬁ 1&[}
management components. Reinstall all parts removed. Lo
2
3 To respray rear bumper. 5 9091‘061 ¢
4 To carry out diagnostics checks S/N 5 192.00 «

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES : $ 2,502.00




" Premium Automobiles

55 Ubl Road 1, Singapore 40B699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Rean No.SIK 689 |

S/N  Parts Description S/Nett REMARKS
1  REAR BUMPER i'.lnrf S 2,015.00%,
2 REAR BUMPER FIXING PARTS Ao He 3 66.00
3 REAR BUMPER SECURING STRIP  Not Mec NEC $ 203.00% o
4  REAR BUMPER SPOILER (oA S 227.00 —
5  REAR LIGHT REFLECTOR - LH /RH Ml Al 2 s 76.00 &
6  REAR BUMPER CARRIER fﬁ,ﬂ- 3 819.00 +
7  REAR BUMPER CARRIER SEAL~ © 2§ 25.00 ¥
8  REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION - LH/RH ) 2 s 40.00 +
S REAR PARKING AID SENSOR - INNER / OUTER /%! 2 & 462.00 *
10  SEALRING Sl 4 s 12.004
11  SUNDRIES Nt Alc . s 200.00 75
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $  4,145.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES 5  2,502.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 6,647.00

All charges are not inclusive of G5T.

Legend: Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett.




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

LK Ayto Consultants hence notify

the Repairer of the ioliowing:

* T resurvey Defore‘afier spray painang

» T dmpley Gemaged panis) dunng resurvey

« Pars prces are submct 1o corfirmanon

* Theee party survey & o0 & “Witiout Prajedics’ bass
* Moy lihemyl modification(n | i iowss

Telefax * Sugplemerary o) st be resutveyed and
| subyect 1o final aperoval froe Insuimnos Company
Ariromiaiped by Sapses
Name : Adoan M g
Surveyed Date : l‘ilﬂa/t'i M&
Authorised Date -
Excess Cost
Liability -
Remarks r AL Q'\_-‘H»ﬁn’ac d ] 03 97) .
Please Note ¢ This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.

Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the

progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at

Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu

Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubl Road 1, Singapore 408689
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:@ 68411183
Email: Nora khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto. com.sg

Telefax

Estimate Accident Repairs
Workshop Ubi Road 1

Contact No 6358 2323

Fax No 6841 1183
Reference PAITPOS482019/NS
Date 7-Aug-18

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.
Your Insured Veh No: SHC 8780 T

First Capital Insurance Ltd

36 Robinson Road
# 16-01 City House
Singapors 068877

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Tel:6854 3909 Fax: 6507 3848

Owner's Name MR NG SWEE LEONG
Address BLK BDG BEDOK RESERVOIR ROAD
#05-02
Singapore 479243
Telaphone HP 97333002
Type of Claim Third party Claims
Policy No. 1800109961
Vehicle No SJK689L
Model Code Audi A4 SEDAN 2.0 TFSI 8W
Model [ Year Sep-18
Engine No CVK DB2806
Chassis No WAUZZZF48JA177148
Mileage
Date In
Liability -
Excess Cost -
Estimated By Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date 28-Ju-18

Place of Accident

ALONG FULLERTON ROAD



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408659
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SJK 689 L

Estimated Surveyor's
Sin MNature of Jobs Charges Recommendation
To remove and transfer rear parking aid and rear lid kick
' sensor. Check function and renew according to damage. ks 905.60 160.00
2 To dismantle and renew rear bumper. Re-organise crash s 1.050.00
management components. Reinstall all parts removed L 700.00
3 Torespray rear bumper. $ 800.00 700.00
4 To cany out diagnostics checks SIN S 182.00 192.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 2,502.00

1,852.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 403698
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No.SJK 689 L

Damaged Parts & Prices

S/IN  Parts Description S/Nett REMARKS
1 REAR BUMPER 5 2,015.00
2 REAR BUMPER FIXING PARTS 5 66.00
3 REAR BUMPER SECURING STRIP NEC $ 203.00
4 REAR BUMPER SPOILER $ 22700 s 226.50
5 REAR LIGHT REFLECTOR - LH / RH 2 35 76.00
6 REAR BUMPER CARRIER S 819.00
7 REAR BUMPER CARRIER SEAL 2 § 25.00
8 REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION - LH /RH 2 8 40.00
8 REAR PARKING AID SENSOR - INNER / OUTER 2 8 462.00
10  SEALRING 4 3 12.00
11 SUNDRIES $ 200.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 4145.00 226.50
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 2,502.00 1.952.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 6,647.00 5 2,178.50

All charges are not inclusive of GST.

Legend Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special MNett




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Name -
Surveyed Date :
Authorised Date

Excess Cost :
Liability -
Remarks :

Please Note -

Yours faithfully,

This estimate Is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel.6768 9828 for appointment.

Pramium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo
Body Repair Manager

Allan Wu
Claims Consultant



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

&1 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusitial Park. Singapone 408833

TEL: 6258 3561 FAX. 6256 4315

Reg. No. 189607188R GST Reg. No, 19-8807 188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Exparts En Automablie

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

Redl CS/FCIB8013775/Avd3n2

Date: 29-10-2018

T

Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Vah. SHC BTBOT Veh. Inspected SJK B89L
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. D18004984MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  MAY CHUA Assign Date DBMERZD19
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model AUDI A4 c.c 1984
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. WAUZZZF48JA177148 Colour GREY
Odometer g295 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GO0D
a. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |245/40 R16 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/40 R18 BRIDGESTOMNE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[245/40 R1B BRIDGESTONE B mm
L/H Rear Tyre |245M40R18 BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  29/07/2019 |Inspection Date 14/08/2019
Survey held at PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTELTD
55 UBI ROAD 1
SINGAPORE 408699
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimats Days of Repair

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
57 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubi Indusinal Park, Singapore 408933
TEL B256 3581 FAX: 8258 4315

Reg Mo 198607T168R GST Reg No. 18-0607 188-R Page Mo 1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJK 689L
aty Description of Parts Condition Wﬁ'ﬂ Adjusted o
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 2.015.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER FIXING PARTS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 66.00 .
1|REAR BUMPER SECURING STRIP (SN) MNOT NECESSARY 203.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER SPOILER (SN) cuT 227.00 228,50
2|REAR LIGHT REFLECTOR-LH/RH [SN) NOT NECESSARY 78.00
1|REAR BUMPER CARRIER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 819.00 -
2|REAR BUMPER CARRIER SEAL [SN) NOT NECESSARY 26.00 -
2|REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION-LH/RH (SN} NOT NECESSARY 40.00 -
Z|REAR PARKING AID SENSOR-INNER/OUTER [(SN) NOT NECESSARY 462.00
4|SEAL RING (SN) NOT NECESSARY 12.00 -
1|SUNDRIES (SN) NOT NECESSARY 200.00
4.145.00 226.50
LABOUR
TO REMOVE AND TRANSFER REAR PARKING AID AND 360.00 380.00
REAR LID KICK SENSOR.CHECK FUNCTION AND RENEW
ACCORDING TO DAMAGE
TO DISMANTLE AND RENEW REAR BUMPER.RE- 1,050.00 700.00
ORGANISE CRASH MANAGEMENT
COMPONENTS. REINSTALL ALL PARTS
REMOVED.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR
BUMPER
TO RESPRAY REAR BUMPER. 800.00 700,00
TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTICS CHECKS. 182.00 182,00
2,502.00 1.852.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,647.00 2,178.50
|  RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 2,178.50

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19013775/Avd3n2

# % ‘2.
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A MMATAI

Licensad Appraiser
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