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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

e e ——————————————————————— e

From: Admin-D (LKKAutD) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 8 August 2019 3:33 PM

To: ‘Derrick Quok’; Justin Wong'; assignments

Ce SUR; 'Albert Hong'

Subject: RE: TPPD Survey: Claim ref:C10003670/KY || Ol- SKUS007H (SKUS007H) TP- SKFE3G

|| Est: $14137.72 || Eurokars

Cear Derrick,

Noted with thanks..

Best Regards

G.NTVITHA
LKEK Auto Consultmnts Pre Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: pesipnmente@lkkngto.com | fax: 6256-4915
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4o89493)

From: Derrick Quok [mailto:derrick.q @budgetdirect.com.sgl

Sent: Thursday, 8 August 2019 3:31 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Justin Wong <justin.wong@budgetdirect.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Albert Hong <albert.hong @budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: TPPD Survey: Claim ref:C10003670/KY || OI- SKUSDO7H (SKUSOO7H) TP- SKF63G | | Est: $14137.72 ||
Eurokars

Thanks Nivitha and Justin.

"Il highlight this misunderstanding to Rick and ask him to communicate more accurately with Eva in future.

Best regards,
Derrick Quok
Budget Direct Insurance

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, August 8, 2019 3:25:14 PM

To: Justin Wong <justin.wong@budgetdirect.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Albert Hong <albert hong@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Derrick Quok
<derrick.q@budgetdiract.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TPPD Survey: Claim ref:.C10003670/KY | | Ol- SKUS007H (SKUS007H) TP- SKFE3G | | Est: 514137.72 ||
Eurpkars

Ciear Justin,

Noted with thanks,



We will close this file at our end without billing.

Best Regards

GNIVITHA

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: aasignmenta@ kkoutocom | foc b256-4315
Bk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080:35)

From: Justin Wong [mailtojustin.wong@budgetdirect.
Sent: Thursday, 8 August 2019 3:19 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@l|kkauto.com>; assignments <assighments@ikkauto.com>

Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Albert Hong <albert hong@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Derrick Quok
<derrick.a@budgetdir m '

Subject: RE: TPPD Survey: Claim ref:C10003670/KY | | OI- SKUSO007H (SKUSOOTH) TP- SKF63G | | Est: $14137.72 ||
Eurokars

Hi Nivitha,

Assignment is cancelled.
Thank you.

Regards,

Justin Wong
Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2184
F +65 6725 0853

E Justin.wong@budgetdirect.com.sg

Direct %*

insurance _ ' o

Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapote

239924

auto Qg‘eneral



Auto B General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg, No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,

confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interferance with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised,

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 8 August 2019 2:32 PM

To: Justin Wong <[ustin wong@budgetdirect. com sg>; assignments ignments@lkkauto.com>
Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Albert Hong <albert.hong@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Derrick Quok

<derrick.g@budgetdirect. com sg> _
Subject: RE: TPPD Survey: Claim ref:C10003670/KY | | OI- SKUSDD7H (SKUS007H) TP- SKFG63G || Est: 514137.72 | |

Eurokars

Dear Justin,

So is the assignment cancel?

Best Regards

G.INIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments® lkkauto.com | fox: 6256-4315
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{4080:11)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mallto:admin-d@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Thursday, 8 August 2019 12:31 PM

To: Justin Wong' <Justin.wong@budgetdirect.com sg>; 'assignments’ <ass kauto.com>
Ce: 'SUR' <sur@Ikkauto com>; ‘Albert Hong' <albert hong@budgetdirect. com.se>; 'Derrick Quok'
<derrick.g@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TPPD Survey: Claim ref:C10003670/KY | | OI- SKUSOO7H (SKUS007H) TP- SKF63G | | Est: $14137.72 I
Eurckars

Dear Justin,

Mo survey was conducted from our end.

Best Hegards

G.NIVITHA
LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | emall: peslonmenis@ikksito.cotm | fax: 6256-4315
Hlk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, so2z-25 | S{qo8933)



From: Justin Wong [mailt:justin.wong@budgetdirect com.sg)
Sent: Thursday, 8 August 2019 12:30 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>; assignments nments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc:SUR <§ur@1kkggm,mm} Albert Hong <a MME&;&M Derrick Quok
<derrick. t.co

Subject: RE: TPPD Suwev.: Chim ref:C10003670/KY | | Ol- SKUS007H (SKUSOO7H) TP- SKF63G | | Est: $14137.72 I
Eurokars

Hi Mivitha,
Please confirm whether any survey was conducted on your end?
Regards,

Justin Wong
Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2184
F +65 6725 0853

E Justin.wong@budgetdirect.com.sg
B ract

wi s ke
insurance i d

Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

1590 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

239924

budgetdirect.com.sg

auto @ general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte, Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget

This emall is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
emall |s unauthorised.

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, B August 2019 12:23 PM

To: Justin Wong <justin. wong@budgetdirect com, sg>; assignments <assignm uto.com=>
Cc: SUR <sur@ikkauto.com>; Albert Hong <albert ho budgetdirect.com.sg>




Subject: RE: TPPD Survey: Claim ref:tlﬂﬂalﬁ?ﬂf KY | I Ol- SKUS007H [SKUSDD?H} TP-SKF63G | | Est: 514137.72 ||
Eurokars

Dear Justin,
Thank you for the email,

Please be informed that the repairer arranged the timing from 3-4pm yesterday, and my surveyor was there at
3.45pm already but befare that the customer left,

Hest Regards

GINIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | emall: assignmentsi@kkauto.com | fix: 6256-4515
Btk 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-a5 | $(408933)

From: Justin Wong [mailto:justin.wo

Sent: Thursday, 8 August 2019 12:20 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.coms; assignments ignments@lkkauto.com>
Ce: SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>; Albert Hong <albert.h tdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TPPD Survey: Claim ref:C10003670/KY | | Ol- SKUS007H (SKUSOOTH) TP- SKFE36G || Est: $14137.72 ||
Eurpkars

Hi Nivitha,

Please cancel this survey assignment as your surveyor did not attend the survey appointment on 07/08/2019 at
pm.

3" Party owner sent in his vehicle in walit and left without survey.
Regards,

Justin Wong
Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2184
F +65 6725 0853

E Justin.weng@budgetdirect.com.sq

D’Igl‘&ct Award

msurance | L
Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: lvy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.comsg>

Sent: Tuesday, 6 August 2019 10:05 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAutD)

Ce: sur@lkkauto.com; Justin Wong

Subject: FW: TPPD Survey: Claim ref.C10003670/KY || OI- SKUSO0TH (SKUS00TH) TP-
SKFB3G || Est: $14137.72 || Burokars

Attachments: ESTIMATE- SKF63G pdf; SAS2646813.PDF

Hi Team,

TP Survey for SKFE3G please.
Kindly see below information for reference.
Regards,

Ivy Ratilla
Executive, Claims Admin

T +65 6540 2185
F +65 6725 0853

E wy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg

Direct ined’

insurance ..

Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2159
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clermenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore
239924

d

auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Dire |

This email Is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this emall and attachments (emall)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
ernail Is unauthorised.

This email is sent by Auto & Geperal [SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is
for the intended addressee. The views expressed n this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the
stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may

1



be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use,
imterfarence with, or disclosure of this emall is unauthorised.

From: eva. kok@eurckars.com.sg <eva kok@eurokars.com.sp>
Sent: Tuesday, 6 August 2019 9:23 AM
Te: Claims <claims@hydeetd|rect com.sg>

Cc: janice. syni@porsche com:sg; rickteo@eurckars. com sg; jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg
Subject: TP CLAIMS- SKF63G & SKUSO07H DOA 3/8/2019

YOUR REF: SKU5007H / OUR REF: SKF63G THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Dear SirfMdm,

Kindly arrange the survey of our client’s vehicle ASAP at 27A Tanjong Penjuru.
Altached is the ESTIMATE & ACCIDENT REPORT for your perusal,

We would appreciate it if you can kindly let us know the liability/status of this case.

Regards,
(8) ELROKARS GROUP
Dereirrg luxury experiences snee 1982
Eva Kok

Insurance Claims Officer

27A Tanjeng Pedjury

Singapore 609042

T: {65) 6331 0680 D: {65) 6331 0683 F: (65) 6331 0650

E: eva kok@eurokars.com.sg W wiww edrokarseroup com

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential
and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and
privilege have not been waived and any use. interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.



