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51 UBIAVE 1, #00-25 PAYA UBIL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065} 62564315

Your Ref: D19005065MESH Date: 18 Sep 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI19013737/Ayf3

The Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear SirfMadam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SJB8407D .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 06/08/2019 at the premises of M/s NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR. and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S%  4951.50
Revised Estimate Amount  (LumpSum) :S8$ 2.200.00
“Check” Items Amount : 8§ -

Market Value :S$ - :
LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% - P
Nett Value 1 8% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages

at the ofs portion

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, MMATAI
Licensed Appraiser



MS @ FirstCapital

M5 Firs1 Capital Insurance Limited o feg Mo [350000000
& Raffies Quay 121-00 Singapare 048580

Tel: {65) 6222 2311 Fax [B5) 6222 3547

Claims & Metor Ungervariting ept: 36 Fatinsen Road #16-01 City House Singapere 062877
Tet (65) 6507 3848 Fax (BS) 6507 3849

whws, mafirticapltal comsg

L5T Reg g, ME-COD1GTEY

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number,

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

05-08-2018 Qur Ref No. D19005065MFSH

03-08-2019 Claim Type. Third Party

SHB4810Y Third Party Vehicle. SJBE407D

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 BLK C #01-43 AUTOBAY@KAKI BUKIT
SUKYI CHONG

67479241/ 0 Fax No. 67417276

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No. 68418315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

NEW HOCK TECK
CNIL
MOTOR PTE LTD Attendan
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
HENRY KAQ
IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Yvonne Wung (LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, September 18, 2019 2:10 PM
To: 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc: "Henry Kao'; SUR

Subject: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005065MFSH/1
Attachments: SJB8407D DOA 03082019 REVERT.pdf
Dear Henry

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle 5J88407D
Date of survey : 06/08,/2019
Number of days : 4 days

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, August 16, 2019 3:12 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: 'Henry Kao' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005065MFSH/1

Dear Henry Kao
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJB8407D on 06/08/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonneweng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, August 06, 2019 12:04 PM
To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

1



Yvonne Wuna (LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, August 16, 2019 3:12 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc ‘Henry Kao'; SUR

Subject: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005065MFSH/1

Dear Henry Kao
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJB84070 on 06/08/2015.
We are pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong(@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Erom: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

sent: Tuesday, August 06, 2019 12:04 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: "Henry Kao' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005065MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards

GNIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [rna‘lIto:cwsmuturc!airn5@msfirstcapital.cnm,sg]
sent: Tuesday, 6 August 2019 11:27 AM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
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New Cars
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Post an Advertisement Iy VALUE FOR MONEY
Sell & yourselt Agvertise tatjust VRSN ISR ¥o Majo BN VALUE FOR TIME

$58 until it's SOLD! : C Lk .ﬂ-, % A PEACE OF MIND

Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources

Bidded Car Plate Number for sale

Looking for auspicious numbers?
Browse our list of hottest bidded car plate numbers for sale.

New 5 Years Coa Renewal Toyota Altis 1.6A

N aivartiser Login 8 Ways of Selling b 2 HOTLINE: 6741 999? ¥ieW our Cars

Wish Ary Ay = m;‘]:""’]‘ Ay fay fem Avnllable
[] Toyota wish 1,84 (OPC) (COE  $46,500 46,150 fyr 27-Feb-2007 1,754 oo 115,000 km Py Available

till 02/ 2027)
Can Take Loan Up To §41K. High Paper Value, Extramely Low Migage For A 13 Year Old Car, Balance 7 12 Years To Drive, It's Red Plate

Curvently, Just Meed To Pay Extra Road Tax For Immediate Black Plate. Low Maintenance And Good Mileage Experience. etELeT Gz )
D Toyota Wish 1.8A {COE till $212.998 $72,700 fyr 01 -Aug-2007 1,794 cc 138,551 km MRy Awailable
07/2022)

Drive With Assurance! 1 Year Warranty| Genuine And Trarsparent Deall Flexible Bank/In House Up To 100% Full Loan. Maonthly
Irstalment $778 Our Quality Congigniment Car [s Seling At The Most Reasonable Price With A& Peace Of Mind! STA Inspection Welcome!...

CarQuol Singagone

[T] Toyota Wish 1.8A (COE till $68,500 $8,450 fyr 12-58p-2007 1,794 cx - MeY available
09/2027)

1 Caredul Owner, High COE Value, Seliing Sightty Higher Than Paper Value, Low Maintenance, Low Mileage Experience, & Months Free
Servicing By Reputable Workshop With 40 Years Experience In The Market For & Peace Of Mind, Call For Viewing/Test Orive Now,

] Toyota Wish 1.84 {COE till $53,900 46,620 fyr 26-Sep-2007 1,79 ec - My Available
09/2017)

High Loan Availeble, Pleass Call For Viewing,

GETYOUR 1s your COE expiring? Let us help you renew it!
Getting your COE renewad is easy, fast and affordable. We'll help you renew ywour COE and get a loan for it. Get the cheapest loan in town and an

REMEWAL  aporoval in 2 days without effort! Enquire today.
LOAM

] Toyota Wish 1.8 (COE till $30,000 §8,960 fyr 11-Dec-2007 1,794 e . MRV Avaitabie
12/2022)

Look Mo Further! Direct Owner's Elegant Black Tayota Wish 1.8 With Black Leather Upholstery, Low Fuel Consumption With & Manths
Poad Tax Owned By Professional Seling Due To Upgrading, Original Nice Paintwork Condition, Regular Servica And 100% Accident Free....

[] Toyota Wish 1,84 % Limited $30,800 $8,630 fyr 29-Feb-2008 1,794 ¢ 108,000 ket MRy Available
(COE till 02/2023)

& Months Warranty, Excellant Condition, Accigant Free, Bank Loan/In House Loan Avadabla, Trade In Walkcoma,

D Toyota Wish 1.8A X {COE til 531,800 $8,270 fyr 11=Jun-2008 1,7 o # MFY Available
SECETLESTED  WESTORY 06/2023)

 Compare[4] ©

ster Auto Trading



PARF COF Rebate Enquiry
T

lefl

> Back to OneMotoring

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner 1D

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.,

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Madel:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine MNo.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Pawer Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date.
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period|Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Singapore MRIC
507G

SIBE4070

No

05 Aug 2019
TOYOTA

WISH 1L.BX A
White

2007
1222941988
ZME1003B0112
27.0kW (130 bhp)
$17.237.00

25 Jan 2008

25 Jan 2008

1

$1859461.00

Forfeited

£0.00

24 Jan 2023
B-Car(1601ce & above)
5

$26,136.00

$1B,126.00
$18.126.00

https: vl ltagovsg lavelacton enquircRebateByPublicBefore..

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the
vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable). whichever is earlier:

The information contained herein is correct as at 05 Aug 2019

OK

3820019, 10:37 am
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“ NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE. LTD.

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Blk C #01-43 Autobay@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883
Email: admin@nhtmotor.com Website: www.nhtmotor.com
Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276
UEN: 201718370K

05/08/2019
Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 < 164 Pon
be (LI P ~f1-
#01-43
Singapore 417883 29 ke

Accident date: 03/08/2019
Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: SJB8407D TOYOTA WISH 1.8X A '07

CHASSIS ZNE100380112

S/n Qty Items U/price Amount

1 Front R/H Fender Deicd. $585.10 ~

2 1 Front R/H Door Side Mirror Assy &(0! $980.20

3 1  Front R/H Door Glass A 14, $580.10

4 1 Front R/H Door Pillar Side Glass Shetfered $396.10 -

& 1 Front R/H Door Pillar Side Glass Moulding e~ $120-00° S/ A7)

6 1  Front R/H Door Pillar Inner Garnish et —a . $190.00 e
21540
112,45 Subtotal :- $2,851.50

T S"l'fr,' 5;,—:,

Labour charges

To remove & refit front R/H door pillar side glass SlM] Co
Gum W $50,00 37
_ £fh nepy ,

To remove & refit front R/H door giass Nr SlE;Oﬂﬂ ¥o
Gum i 1680 $50.00 A
To remove & refit front R/H door side mirror $1;0».1ﬁ 6J

- N i
Panel beatmg. — | e _h}ﬁ:b[ g ?ﬁf;,-"_-: 5890’06 SO
Spray painting. ... iAol R k/ ¢ L2 SW 500

; . vey 0 *_.-‘r_"/-j A
Subtotal :- $2,100.00

Total:- $4,951.50




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

&1 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI9013737/AyT3n2
sepommsonsons ooneasssrr o == |[{HIHKIN
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHB 4810% Veh. Inspected SJB 84070
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. D19005065MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  HENRY KAO Assign Date 0E/08/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA WISH c.c 1794
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. ZNE100380112 Colour WHITE
Odometer 273218 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65R15 KAPSEN & mm
L/H Front Tyre 195/65 R15 KAPSEN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/65R15 KAPSEM & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/65 R15 KAPSEN 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE YEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date  03/08/2018 Inspection Date 06/0B/2019
Survey held at NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #01-43 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAFPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BI)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5h. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




ivs s »

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 8256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 198607188R GST Reg. Mo, 19-0607198-R Page Mo.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJB 8407D
= Estimate By | Our Adjusted
dit
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (§)) )
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT R/H FENDER DENTED 585.10 585.10
1|FRONT R/H DOOR SIDE MIRROR ASSY BROKEMN 980.20 9B80.20
1|FRONT R/H DOOR GLASS NOT NECESSARY 580.10 -
1|FRONT R/H DOOR PILLAR SIDE GLASS SHATTERED 38610 396.10
1|FRONT R/H DOCR PILLAR INMER GARNISH DEFORMED 190.00 180,00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -537.85
2,731.50 1,613.55
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT R/H DOOR PILLAR SIDE GLASS MOULDING (SN} |NECESSARY 120.00 50.00
1|GUM (SN) MECESSARY 100.00 30.00
220.00 80.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REFIT FROMT R/H DOOR PILLAR SIDE 100.00 60.00
GLASS.
TO REMOVE & REFIT FRONT R/H DOOR FITTINGS., 150.00 B0.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT FRONT R/H DOCR. SIDE MIRROR. 150.00 60.00
PAMNEL BEATING. 800,00 350.00
SPRAY PAINTING. 800.00 500.00
2,000.00 1,050.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,951.50 2,743.55
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,200.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref Mo, CS/FCI19013737/Ayfan2
MARKET VALUE: $28,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $18,126.00=NETT VALUE: $9,874.00

KL

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

MECLAINMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Reper is mada sololy for the use and beneli of the Cléant namad on the front page of this Raport.

n conkact or forl. 6 acceniod to any Chird Dty wio
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