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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Efficient Motor <ppemclaims@gmail.com>
Sent: 17 September 2020 1:59 PM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Cc: ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg; Admin A; 'Jessie Ong '
Subject: RE:  ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ2546C & SLM9558M ON 13/07/2019 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/AIG19013668/K1ka3

Dear Khanchna, 
 
Kindly note we will drop this 3rd party claim. 
 
Please close case on your end. 
 
Thanks 
 
 
Regards, 
Jessie Ong 
Accident Claim Supervisor 
Tel: +65 8723 3003 
Email: jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg 
EFFICIENT MOTOR & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD (Workshop) 
56 Loyang Way,#06-07,Loyang Enterprise Building,Singapore 508775 

** As of 1 May 2020, For all Accident Claims related matters, Please email to ppemclaims@gmail.com 
 

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, September 16, 2020 8:57 AM 
To: ppemclaims@gmail.com 
Cc: jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg; 'rizan' <rizan@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg; 
Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ2546C & SLM9558M ON 13/07/2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG19013668/K1ka3 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Kindly let us know the status of this claim. 
 
Thank you. 
  

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
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In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement." 

 


