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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type;

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year;

Engine Na:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Pald:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Tatal Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 05 Aug 2019

PARFINOF Rahata Fomiine

Company
£59M

SLT2634E

No

05 Aug 2019

HYUNDAI

130 (FD) 1.6 DOHC AUTO
Silver

2009

GAFC9U747733
KMHDCS51DMAU218526
B9.7 kW (120 bhp)
$13.39300

29 Oct 2009

29 Oct 2009

1

$13,393.00

Yes
28 Oct 2019
$6,696.00

30 Apr 2029

A-Car (1600cc & below)
10

$26,17500

$25.484.00

$32.180.00

OK
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_Sﬁlu Chan (LKKAuto)

— e e
From: Pauline Tham <pauline_tham@sg.msig-asia.com>
Sent: Friday, 6 December 2019 5:50 PM
To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: Yref : G5/19/4448/JCM/JP/YM - SLT2636E, OREF : 601778
Dear Byran

Thanks for the prompt reply
Kindly expedite on the survey report.

Thanks.

Pauline Tham

Senior Executive, Claims Services, Motor

D: +65 6594 2545 | F: +65 6225 7402 | pauline_tham@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg o © G)

AMember of BIERENMY INSURANCE GROUP

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 6 December 2019 5:19 PM

To: Pauline Tham <pauline_tham@sg.msig-asia.com>; SUR <sur@l|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Yref : GS/19/4448/ICM/JP/YM - SLT2636E, OREF : 601778

EXTERNAL EMAIL: Be careful when you click any links or open any attachment(s).

Dear Pauline

Have reviewed the video recording, the contact between insured vehicle and the TP vehicle started from
the left front of TP vehicle stretching towards the left rear of TP vehicle.

Dear Shiau Chan

Please get surveyor to review the adjustment in our survey report and re-adjust accordingly if necessary.
If our surveyor is of the view that no adjustment is required, than please update Pauline.

Our ref: CS3/MSG19013632/R1qd3e2

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

1



From: Pauline Tham <pauline tham@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Friday, 6 December 2019 4:25 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Yref : G5/19/4448/ICM/JP/YM - SLT2636E, OREF : 601778

Importance: High

Dear Bryan
Third party submitted that video footage for our view (in merimen).

Please let us know if there is a need for survey report amendment.

Thanks.

Pauline Tham

Senior Executive, Claims Services, Motor

D: +65 6594 2545 | F: +65 6225 7402 | pauline_tham@®sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg o @ o

AMember of QURSEEASE INSURANCE GROUP

From: Pauline Tham

Sent: Monday, 21 October 2019 9:08 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Yref : GS/19/4448/ICM/JP/YM - SLT2636E, OREF : 601778

Dear Sir

Please upload paper survey report asap.

Thanks.

Pauline Tham

Senior Executive, Claims Services, Motor

D: +65 6594 2545 | F: +65 6225 7402 | pauline_tham@®sg.msig-asia.com




Precise Appraiser Pte Ltd

VEHICLE DAMAGE ASSESSMENT REPORT fleg 0. F01MOHZ

To: MOW Rentsl Pis Lad

€01 TOW Pye (2d
1 Burk it Batok Creoent #0427
WCLGA Mass
Frgapore $38064

Lm;#:": -:";'Vf%-.."Lh:'.-,u‘i.i'.‘“ = :l-".t‘ a... b‘-b-.—-—\:—* _\)“JP :."_‘h-r;"*.‘ﬂ‘-;:i‘?'—‘;l 1:- _:g}‘g'-’iix'

Rl he | 2008/000d Oate of Repoit : 2019
Callen Type : Thied Party D of Request H

Thicd party velice 1 SUTZENNL Dite of ALDIOIL 1 B0
ineistod Vhicle 1 Date of Inspection 1 Wwjaoe
Your Reférence No 1 -

WM%?'-E B e o ST, il e Tl g S et
Ragatration Mate Ko | ARt Engne WMo ificathon ' LY
ool [/ Mata 5 Hyundal 130 Pre-sccdent Samage 1 HL
Colowt ] Tiver Ganerdl Condition 3 Goed
wanutacturing Year i 2008 Ganeral Painl Work Good
Cngine ba ] eMrCMITIS Lisating 1 Servicasble
Lrigne Capacity ;6006 Handbrabd Serviraabie
Chiaashs N (] KMIOCS 1 DAMALIISEI6 Fouthrake 1 Setviceabie
Daometes NS : INEaeA
Tratrumission 1 Auo

YN CONDMON L, - . e RS TEES RS c B LAY o A AT AR

Froat Right naaf Left

“are + Comtinental Mara 1 Bridgedions

Sus © 1afe0 R1E ] Soe : 206/eORIG [ 4
Front Len Rsar Raghl

Maka 1 Conticentsl Aake | Brsdgestons

Sew 1 308/%8 ik $ $ie ¢ dA/e0 K1d 13

W&WM@MW&W PR T, g S e
Descriptrons Ragober (53] Differency (551 agjurter (55)
Pass 570768 3,70134

LA80.80 3.980.50

Colculutad Cost (351 5 — LI (T Seme
Aecemmended Lump Sum Rapeir Cest (85 T EARD
tstimate Papal Dursticn t H
Survery irapection At | TCRP P Lad
Survery Inspection Addreit 1 3 Baly Batok Creaent FOLAT

WIIGA Plaza

Sngapore §58084

Addiess: 53 Hume Avenue, #05-08, Singapom BT,
Emait Precissappraser@omal.com. u-m.asomsmo Page 1ol 2



Precise Appraiser Pte Ltd

Reg no. 2019240412

i (8} G

Aumm”rwmhm&mmummwm.rmamwmwu

-

SPECIAL REMARKS
w«mmmw.ummwwsmmaummwmwmmm
Wunpwumwmmm“muouwm.-ﬂwmhmlmmmd

-

WWWWNNBWIMMWHMmdmeM
mmnwwmwmhmmmwmmwmmmem
mnmmmmmmwmmmmmumummum

mwwmmmmmmmumwmmwn.

Address: 53 Huma Avenue, r05-08, Singapore 588751,
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* Out Raference | 2009/0006

$/N | Qly |Description Candition Repairer Our
l _Estimate (55) | Assessment |S9)
1lips Holder tom 48 A8
2jipa Torh 153 59 -

' 3o Base crack 6052 6062 -
al2pe Dented 555 559 -
5|1pes Daformed 565 565
6)1pes Servicanble 8369 .

Yipes bont 2463 2463 X
8|tpes pent 300 309 &
9|1pes Nacessary 1159 1359~
10[1pes Warp 1679 1678 -~
11|2pes Serviceatie a72.9 .
12(1pes Serviceable 1520 .
13{1pes gent 30L6 3016 Y
( 14| 1pes warp 924 924 ¥
18|1pcs Servicesbie 664 5.4
Total 6634.6 30048
Lats 20% 1126.92 500,96
Parts Sub Total $307.68 2403.84
Special Nett
[ Tolioes  [feont ( sport Aim ST S— 22
Total 400 300
To chack wring sytsem 8 e
To R&A front LH undercarriage 600 }u’ joV
I
sl Toconduct wheel alignement 200 o g b0
I
8 To panel beat on front LH fehder inher panel, front LH dote 2500 900' bou
( and rear LH door.To REA fraat snd rear bumper and
others attachmants.
- o
9 To respray on front b ur, front LM door, Rear LH door, 2000 1 200
Reat LH fander, Rear nd sccidant atfectad area ‘
] hust proaling 100 /nn" 60
Labaur Tousl 5480 3685
Sub Total (labour and parts) 1116768 668184
1422 Yo
260 100
(g¥)
% Address: 53 Hume Avenus, $05-08, Singapare 588751,
‘YU Emalt. PresiseappraiserQgimaill.cam, Moblla: +85 8103 5000
2777

Precisa Appralser Pto Lic
Rog no: 2010240412
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Adjuster Report Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregNo-199807198R)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ilkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CS3/MSG19013632/R1QD3E2

Date: 12/12/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Policy No: 29126726AVW
Clatmant SLT2636E Insured Vehicle No: SML6890R
Vehicle No :
Date of Loss: 31/07/2019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 601778
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SLT2636E
Make & Model: HYUNDAI 130 (FD), 1.6 DOHC (A) Engine No: G4FCOU747733
Reg. Date: 29/10/2009 (Man. Year: 2009) Chassis No: KMHDC51DMAU218626
Colour: Grey Odometer: 155885 km
Engine Capacity: 1591 cc
Mz_arkg Value/New Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/65 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 185/65 R15
Front Left Side: West Lake 5 mm Rear Left Side: West Lake 5 mm
Front Right Side: West Lake 5 mm Rear Right Side: West Lake 5 mm
The above values represent the remaining tyre treads depth
\COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %|
Parts 5,707.68 1,722.40 3,985.28 69.82
Miscellaneous Iltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 5,480.00 2,050.00 3,430.00 62.59
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S$) 11,187.68 3,772.40 7,415.28 66.28
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 3,000.00
Nett Amount (S$) 11,187.68 3,000.00 8,187.68 73.18
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 05/08/2019
Date Inspected: 05/08/2019 Inspected At: JCM Rental Pte Ltd (HQ)
1 Bukit Batok Crescent, #04-47
Wecega Plaza
Singapore 658064
Estimated Period of Repair: 7.0 days
Adjuster: MOHD RASUL Manager: SHIAU CHAN

NOTE: This report represents our findings at the time and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has been carried out to the best of our
knowledge and ability but any other liability under any other circumstances is hereby expressly excluded.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 12/12/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

NOTE: OUR SURVEYOR AFTER VIEWING THE VIDEO & RE-ADJUSTED THE REPAIR COST.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 12/12/2019



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Page 3 of 4

Reference

Validity:

Part Source: MRM-SG

Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 12 Dec 2019)

HYUNDAI 130 (FD) 1.6 DOHC (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

|Parts: 144
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)
Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLT2636E)

These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Repair 435.00FL *FL
2 1 *FRONT BUMPER LH RETAINER Serviceable 25.90FL *FL
3 1 *LH HEADLAMP Scratched 606.20FL  *606.20FL
4 2 *FRONT LH FENDER Bent 559.00FL  *559.00FL
5 1 *FRONT LH FENDER INNER SHIELD Serviceable 56.50 FL *FL
6 1 *SUPPORT PANEL Not Necessary 836.90FL *FL
7 1 *FRONT LH SHOCK ABSORBER Serviceable 246.30FL *FL
8 1 *FRONT LH KNUCKLE ARM Bent 309.00FL  *309.00FL
9 1 *FRONT LH KNUCKLE BEARING Bent 135.90FL  *135.90FL
10 1 *FRONT LH WHEEL HUB Bent 167.90FL  *167.90FL
11 1 *STEERING RACK Serviceable 872.90FL *FL
12 1 *CROSS MEMBER Serviceable 1,920.00FL *-FL
13 1 *FRONT LOWER ARM Serviceable 301.60FL *FL
14 1 *FRONT LOWER ARM BALL JOINT Serviceable 92.40FL *-FL
15 1 *FRONT LH ANTI ROLL BAR LINK Serviceable 69.10FL *FL
16 1 *FRONT LH SPORT RIM Scratched 400.00FS  *300.00FS
F=Franchise part. S=SpcNett. L=ListltemDisc.
Sub Total (S$) 7,034.60 2,078.00
- List Item Discount on L Items 20.00/20.00% (S$) 1,326.92 355.60
Total Parts (S$) 5,707.68 1,722.40
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 12/12/2019



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour Items
1 TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM New 80.00 30.00
2 TO CONDUCT WHEEL ALIGNMENT New 200.00 60.00
3 TO PANEL BEAT ON FRONT LH FENDER INNER PANEL, New 2,500.00 600.00
FRONT LH DOOR AND REAR LH DOOR. TO R&R FRONT
AND REAR BUMPER AND OTHERS ATTACHMENTS
4 TO RESPRAY ON FRONT BUMPER, FRONT LH DOOR, New 2,000.00 1,200.00
REAR LH DOOR, REAR LH FENDER, REAR BUMPER AND
ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA
5 RUST PROOFING New 100.00 60.00
6 TO R&R FRONT LH UNDERCARRIAGE New 600.00 100.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 5,480.00 2,050.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
< END OF ESTIMATES >
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 12/12/2019



