












Our Ref: CC6/CTI19013584/Aha3               

 

 

01 OCTOBER 2019        

 

 

MCT RENTALS PTE LTD                    BY POST & BY EMAIL 

210 TURF CLUB ROAD 

#01-B71 THE GRANSTAND 

SINGAPORE 287995 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 3528R AND SLL 722U ON 31/07/2019  

 

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance 

(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under 

the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 

 

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner 

of SLL 722U against your motor insurance policy. 

  

Based on the accident report, accident scenario and evidence at hand, liability is down 

against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the 

Third Party. 

 

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and 

settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 

 

Please call us if you have further queries. 

 

 

Yours faithfully, 

 

 

 

Vic Alpeh  

DID: 6841 2096 

FAX: 6741 4108 

Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com 

 

c.c. China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd  

            (Motor Claims Dept) 

 mcityrentals@gmail.com                

 (Email) 
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 7 July 2020 3:48 PM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto); Admin A
Cc: Jenny Lew; Claims Dept of CTI; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D203629C02/8(cbs/chewml/lewlc) (FLEET POLICY-

DMCVSN19152719000) & YOUR REF: SLL722U  - TO CONDUCT SLL 722U - LKK REF 
CC6/CTI19013584/Aba3q2 

LKK     REF -  CC6/CTI19013584/Aha3 
CTPIS  REF -  SNM19D203629C02/8(cbs/chewml/lewlc) 
Section II Excess: $1,500.00 
 
Dear Sirs 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Please proceed to offer as follow: 
 
Cost of repairs                                                            $16,906.00                        
Loss of Rental (2356cc x $150.00 x 25 days)        $  3,750.00  
LTA Search fees                                                          $          7.45 
Total                                                                             $20,663.45  
                                                                                      ==========  
 
We await your further advice to enable our Jenny Lew to act accordingly. 
 

NOTICE : 
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as 
delay is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents.  All correspondence should be made via email 
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175.  . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Alfred Toh 
Senior Executive 
Claims Department 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 
DID: 65 6389 6183 
Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com 
              alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com 
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 TaipingSG  
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may 
contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in 
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please 
delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 7, 2020 10:32 AM 
To: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Elizabeth Chew <elizabeth.chew@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CTI 
<claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com> 
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Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D203629 -GBB3528R-CBS(FLEET POLICY-DMCVSN19152719000) & 
YOUR REF: SLL722U - TO CONDUCT SLL 722U - LKK REF CC6/CTI19013584/Aba3q2  
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the subject matter. 
 
It was reported that Insured driver accidentally stepped on accelerator and hit third party. 
 
A letter was sent out to the Insured to notify TP claim and NCD issues and no feedback received till date.   
 
Summary to offer to repairer 96 MOTORSPORTS PTE LTD is as follows: 
 

TP CLAIMED  REVISED -TO OFFER  
Cost of Repair (w/gst) $                     47,395.74   $                 16,906.00  

Loss of Rental  ($250.00 x 25 days)  
$                       6,250.00  

 $                   4,500.00   (25 
days X $180.00)  

LTA Search Fee  $                             7.45   $                          7.49  
  NIL   NIL  
Proposed Total  $                      53,653.19  $                 21,413.49  

 
Breakdown of days is as follows: 
 

Recommended days      16 Days 
Weekends / Downtime        9 Days 
TOTAL DAYS       25 Days 

 
For your approval and/or further instruction please. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 23 April 2020 5:57 PM 
To: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK 
Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Elizabeth Chew <elizabeth.chew@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CTI 
<claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow 
<sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D203629 -GBB3528R-CBS(FLEET POLICY-DMCVSN19152719000) & 
YOUR REF: SLL722U - TO CONDUCT SLL 722U - LKK REF CC6/CTI19013584/Aha3 - 
SNM19D203629C02/8(cbs/chewml) 
 
LKK     REF -  CC6/CTI19013584/Aha3 

CTPIS REF -  SNM19D203629C02/8(cbs/chewml) replacing SNM19D203603 
 
Dear Vic 
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