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52019 PARF/ICOE Rabate Enquiry

The information cantained herein |s correct a5 at 05 Aug 2019

>Back to OneMotoring
- - Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

‘Vehicle Owner Particulars
Cwner 1D Type: Singapore NRIC
Crwener [D: aa1l
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No: FBLADST
Vehicle to be Exported: Mo
Intended Deregistration Date 05 Aug 2019
Vehicle Make: YaAMAHA
Wehicle Modsl: FZMN150
Primary Colaur: Red
Manufacturing Year: 2018
Engine Mo, G3E3EDD34024
Chassis No. MEIRG161BG2001%07
Maximum Power Output: =
Open Markat Value: £2362.00
Original Registration Date: 20 May 2014
First Reglstration Date: 20 May 2016
Transfer Count: 1
Actual ARF Paid: £355.00
Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Eligibllity: No
PARF Eligihility Explry Date -
PARF Rebate Amaunt: £0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date; 19 May 2026
COE Category: D= Motorcycie
COE Period(Yearsh 10
QP Paid: £4.303.00
COE Rebate Amourt $4.278.00
Total Rebate Amount: §4.278.00
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© Cecilia Chona (LKK Auto)

From: Sundari Nagarajan - lll <sundari@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 October 2019 2:09 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: CS A Team; Hsiao Tang (LKKAuto); Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: MCT19070647/01/sn; Accdt invg SHC2423P(I11) & FBL409T on 24.7.19
Urgent

Dear Cecila

We refer to the above accident. We understand that you are the handler for this case. We have already written to LKK
on 19.9.19 to submit the survey report but till now SR has not been uploaded in merimen,.

Please note that we have alreay received LOD from TP solicitors on 2.9.19 and they are chasing us for settlement.

Regards,

Sundari Nagarajan

Motor Claims Department

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64, Cecil Street, #04/4#05 108 Building
Singapore 049711

DID: 63476071

FAX: 62244174

sundari@iii.com.sg

www lil.com.

Regn No.: 198703792K

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed. It may contain confidential and/or
legally privileged information. If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has
reached you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby notified that
any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination of this information in any way or in any
manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. Internet communications may not be entirely secure or
accurate as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses. Therefore, we do not
accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this message or any delay in delivery which may
arise as a result of Internet transmission or any modification.
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - lll <motordaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 1 August 2019 5:28 PM

To: Sally; 'sur@|kkauto.com’; Admin-D [LKKAuto)

Cc: Sundari Nagarajan - |l

Subject: RE: [Spam-pop3] RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR VEHICLE NO. FBLA0ST (Accident
involving FBL409T and SHC2423P on 24.07.2019)

Attachments: shc2423p_20190731144307 pdf; shc2423p_20190731144307.pdf

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle FBL409T and let us have your report urgently.
This claim will be handled by Ms Sundari,

*Kindly upload this survey request amail to menmen,

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee
bl NG AL4PFrOE.I)

b4 Cecil Street; #05 - 108 Building
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext- 248

InpIA
]NT'E!NM‘I ONAL
InsurANCE

From: Sally [mailto:info@catherinelimlic.com)

Sent: 01 August, 2019 3:00 PM

To: Motor Claim - Ill <motorclaim @iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: [Spam-pop3] RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR VEHICLE NO. FBLA0ST (Accident involving FBL409T and
SHC2423P on 24.07.2019)

Dear Sir (Without Prejudice)
We confirm our client’s motorcycle is currently in Bike Dynamic.

Regards

aully Goh

Cittherine Lim L

20 Havelook Road 203-01
Contral Sguire
Singapore 0b9T765

Email: info@catherinelimlle. com




From: Motor Claim - III [mailto:motorclaim@iil.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, August 01, 2019 12:19 PM

To: Sally

Subject: [Spam-pop3] RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR VEHICLE NO. FBL409T (Accident invalving FBL409T and
SHC2423P on 24.07.2019)

Dear Sally,

We have already received a Survey request from Teamwork Garage. Kindly confirm that your client has decided to
change his workshop bike dynamic.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee
Fi NG AFORI

64 Cecil Street; #05 - 0B Bullding
Singapare 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

[npia
[NTE RMATIONAL
INsurANCE

From: 5ally [mailto:info@catherinelimlic.com]

Sent: 01 August, 2019 11:26 AM

To: Motor Claim - Ill <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR VEHICLE NO. FBL409T (Accident involving FBLA0ST and SHC2423P on
24.07.2019)

Dear Sir (Without Prejudice)
We refer to your email,
Qur client is agreeable to LKK, Please arrange.

Kegards

Sally Goh

Cathorime Lim LLE

20 Havelock Rond #03-01

Central Squape

slngapore 059765

Email: infollcatherinelimllc. com

From: Motor Claim - I [mailto:motorclaim@iii.com.sa]

Sent: Wednesday, July 31, 2019 2:51 PM

To: Sally

?::j:g:l;‘?.E-REPMR INSPECTION FOR VEHICLE NO. FBL409T (Accident involving FBL409T and SHC2423P on

Dear 5ir / Mdm,

We acknowledge receipt of your email.



We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

= LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
 \icom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

o InDIA
® ] INTERNATIONAL
( InsuraNCE
F I NG arDEI]
[ ep——

64 Cecll Strest; 805 - 108 Bullding
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data. sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be herehy
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses,

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting. using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing vour personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.
It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

l



If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us 1o ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately,

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful,
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delaved or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Prte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K
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CATHERINE LIM LLC
# ADVOCATES & SOLICTTORS 20 Hawalock Rosd #0301
T NOTARY PUBLIC -SHET Central Squere Sinpapore (55765
B OMMISSIONER FOR OATHS- RISy UEN Na. 201310933%
-
Wl CATHERINE C.LLIM Tel: (65) 6438 5300
M omecTor Fax: (B5) 6418 0111
LLB (MONS) SinGAPORE-EEFR AR wiww.catherinelimiic.com
MLBA [DUSINESS LAWY 2 4E8 4 Emall: info@eatherlnelimlid cam

CATHERINE UM (LT & l?w argeration

with lienbted liabliny
Your Rel: SHC 2423P v ETay
Our Ref: CL/1907100/T/BD.sg 8! P st K
31 July 2019 "-é'H"

L ] L)

To: India International Insurnnee Pre Ltd W T 1=
64 Cecll Street #04-05 via fax: 6224 4174 & By Hand - AR i
108 Building _ Pl deisf
Singapore 04971 - P
Ann: Motor Claims Dept : -
Comfon Transponation Pre Lid CERTIFICATE OF POSTING '
383 Sin Ming Drive (Plesse be informed thit ull supporting documents
GAS Building have been forwarded 1o your insurer.,)
Singapore 375717
Dear Sir

RE: NOTICE TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS P UANT TO
PRE-ACTION PROTOCOL FOR NON-INJURY MOTOR ACCIDENT CLAIMS (NTMA)

ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBL 409T / SHC 2423P ON 24072019 ALONC SIMET AVE

“‘enmwwuﬂ}ﬁﬂwunﬁﬁ-ywar;mﬂnrﬁ:m&miﬂvaﬁn‘w:lh{svﬂ: le No, FBL
Mﬂmmmm?mw;muummam-dmrm ide Sextemners
anc 'or Police Report s enclosed.

An:nnhafth:uriﬁm;,wclim'lmnﬂxi:lclmbumdmged.ﬂ:htmdh:pru:mih the
amaged mosor vehicle leﬂmm“ﬁﬁnmdpﬁm&p of this potice T VoL vour
iﬂﬂ“ﬂlhhﬂﬂiﬂﬂm&wnfhm\tﬁhhlf“ﬁ:nﬂmmyﬂb'&mpﬂﬂﬁw
Em%hsﬁpﬂndﬁm:lhnwdiuuﬂnﬂpmdm:ﬁhﬂhhwﬁmhﬂufmmm;m
Plaxse lat us know your appointed survevor.

Vemue: Bike Dyvnamic
BIk 6 Defi: Lane 10
=0]-554
Stzrpoce 539187

Tel: 6749 6637 for Eileen Fax: 6749 6120
Youss faithdully

Enc
- cliems
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8/5/2010 Used MolorCycles/Bikas For Sale in Singapore by Cwners & Dealers - SGBikemart

Hike mooel
Yamaha FZn150

Type

ﬂﬂ"l' #
Price From

N'I.'f w
Price Ta

4‘.11"? w
Class

Any "

WEET VEARDH OFTIONE w
QL SEARCH B VIEW ALL (LISTING/USEDRIKES/LISTINGS)

Q SEARCH w

Yamaha FZN150i (flisung/usedbike/yamaha-yamaha-fzn 15013665/

(fistingrusedbikefyamaha-yamaha-fin1504/1 36655

56056999

Reg : 25/08/2017
Type Street Bikes
14%¢cc

Downpayment 5659 Before Insurance. Viewing At Bike Production Pte Ltd. Please Kindly Call Ta Confirm Avallability Before Viewing Address: 610,
Serangoon Road S{218216) Tel 63922555 Trade In/..

Posied on - 02/08/2018

- Pl Al w OERLTR Al

W COMPARE DETAILS ¥ (FLISTINGSUSED@IKETAMAHA-TAMAHA-FIMN 150111 36657

Yamaha FZN150I (/listing/usedbike/yamaha-yamaha-fzn 5001 24971)

(istingfusedblkeyamaha-yamaha-frn 1 3001 24571
$6057778

Heg : 17/022016
Type: Street Blkes
Tadce

Showroom condition. Low fuel consumption
™ Manthly 1505230
Posted an - JR0TI019

W PRID AD W CHALTE AD

hitps./'www sgbikeman com.sglisting/usedbikesiistingTbike_model=Yamaha+FIn1504bika lype=Rprice from=&prica_lo=8llcense_class=&reg.,.. 1/6



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)
we

| CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case  [Motied  |Eat Subnutted | Ad) Assignes Ad) Ret Adj Submitted | Ins Auth'ed | Stanus |
|33 907009 DILAWGI0IS 54160000  |S$1,600.00 | haport
- Eait Reg mmml Eﬂtﬂmﬂn[ Wimw Rt [ Cancsi Casn I |

Hain Referance

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjuster] |
Insured: |COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTELTD, Co Reg No.: - |

|
Yol WILSOM TAY, ID: SE3EI68LI |

| Clalmand:
Vehicle Reg _[24/07/2019 17:00 - :59
Mo FBLA0T [One of Loss: |F8T T aad & Duys From LTA Reg Date (Man Y1)
Cinim Type: | TP/ MCT19070647 heV/CavET | MeOMOO1S (TP, Fire & Thefl)
Vehicle Reg policy No
Moo  sHC2eZIP ety | D1amTCo1003116
[Tnsured):
Encess

Rapairer: Blke Dynamic Centre (HQ) BLK & DEFU LANE 10 #01-554, 515187 Defu Lane - Tel! 67496637
Handing ndla tnternational Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel £3476100 ... [Handied by Sundari Nagarajan - 347 6071]

Chkrrts 1mmmmm:m-m:m1ms
Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel; 6256-3561 . [Handled by PARASURAM SHANMUGAM] . [Final Rpt dus

LKK Auto
|- |1ﬂumnm

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose Case Mai |

s [I_SG (30/09/20159): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$0.00) - FBLADST - Clalm Handler: Sundari Nagaraj...
+ 111 SG (27/08/2010); Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$0,00) - FBLA0ST - Claim Handler: Sundarl Nagara)...
s II_5G [19/08/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Malntained - FELADST - Claim Handler: Sundari Nagarajan

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view Al | Search Tasks | Create tew Task | compiete |

Oue Date Priority Type Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Complated On Created On Done?
Mo results

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 10/10/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*FEL409T (MCT19070647)
[SHC2423P])
™
WILSON TAY
Jul 24 2019 5:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Bike Dynamic Centre

Page | of 2

|

Photos/Images

|

Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

05/08/19 10:48 General View

05/08/19 10:48 General View

O5/08/19 10:48 Ganeral View

D5/08/19 10:48 General Yiew

05/08/1% 10:48 Goneral View

O5/08/19 10:48 General View

O5/08/19 10:48 General View

05/08/19 10:48 Ganeral View

05/08/19 10:48 Genaral View

W e B A | e | e | R |
= S

05/08/19 10:48 Ganeral View

11 |O5/08/19 10:48 Ganaral View

12 |05/08/19 10:48 Genaral View

Lond JPG

11 |O5/08/19 1048 General View

l14 |os/oer19 1048 | Ganeral View

Loag PG

15 |05/0B/19 1048 General View

Load JPG

16 |05/0B/19 10:48 General View

Load JPG

17 |05/0BS19 10:48 General View

Load JPG

(18 |08/08/19 1048 | General View

Load IRG

1% |05/08/19 10048 Ganaral Wiew

Loag IPC

0508719 10:48 Ganeral View

Load PG

05/08/19 10:48 Ganaral View

Load PG

Load IPG

DS/0B/19 10:48 General View

Losd JPG

0
i
22 |D5/0B/19 10:48 General View
]
4

05708719 10:48 General Wiew

Load IPG

25 |D5/08/19 10:48 General View

Load PG

16 |D5/0B/19 10:48 General View

Load PG

ceocoooeecceeepoecooocceoeceecncene

e | o e

27 |05/08/19 10:48 Genaral View Load PG

20 |05/08/19 10:48 | Ganaral View Load 106

29 |05/08/19 10:48 | General View Load PG

30 |0S/0B/19 10:48 | Ganaral View Load PG

31 |D5/08/1% 10:48 General View Load PG

32 |0%/0a19 10:48 | General View Load PG

11 |os/ne1e 10:48 | Genaral View Load 190G

34 |05/08/18 10:48 | Geners| View ) | Load G

35 |05/08/19 10:48 | General View 0 | loadirc

3 |05/08/19 10:48 | Genersl View g Load PG

37 |06/08/19 10:48 | chassls number | toad e
Oocumentation 1 per -

Ne |Relabel/Recrder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall

1 |06/08/1% 16:15 | EMAIL FROM 111 00 01082019 0 | Load PoF

2 O7/08/19 09:38 TP GIA REPORT n Load POF

Mo | Finnlaed On India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
| |05/08/19 10.0] | Singapore Accident Statement TV SHC2423P © | Losaror

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 10/10/2019
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Page 2 of 2
Photos/Images 1 per “] &
ho | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Primt
1 [19/05/19 15:4E | Latter of Demand from Third Party O | oad Por |
— T O O e L =

Documents Checklist

rnnu.lmmculmm Reset | save | fom |

|r'Thlfl are no documant checklists configured

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ)

e

SEhow Remarks Tat ﬁ Handling Insurer

Rute Esmprey gmw priveis onissl yun wow § b USher partes
https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 10/1072019



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coregno 1sseoriser

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto. com;assignments@ kkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/11118013548/FGB302

Date: 10/10/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Ple Lid  Policy No: MCOMOD15
Claimant .
Vehicle No : FEL40aT Insured Vehicle No : SHC2423F
Date of Loss. 24/072019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT19070847
E [ F
Reg No: FBL409T
Make & Model: YAMAHA FZ150, 150cc Engine No: G3IE3EDD34024
Reg, Date: 20/05/2018 (Man. Year. 2018) Chassis No ME1RG1618G2001807
Colour Red Odomeler Dkm
Engine Capacily: 149 cc
Market Value/New Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (S5): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition Steering (Serviceable). Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Conditlon;
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 100/80 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 180/70 R17
Front Left Side: Michelin 4 mm Rear Left Side Michelin 5 mm
Front Right Side: 0 mm Rear Right Side: 0 mm
The above values represent the ramaining e treads depth
(COST OF CLAIMS - Repairer’s  Adjuster's  Difference  DIff %)
Parts 3,189.00 1,449.30 174970  54.70
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.250.00 585.00 665.00 53.20
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 4,449.00 2.034.30 241470 54.28
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 1,600.00
(S%) 4,448 00 1,600.00 2,649.00 B4 04
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S§) 311.43 112.00 190.43 64 .04
Nett Amount {S§) 4,760.43 1,712.00 3,048.43 64.04
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 01/08/2018
Date Inspected: 02/068/2018 Inspected At Bike Dynamic Centre (HQ)
BLK 6 DEFU LANE 10 #01-554
Singapore 539187
Estimated Period of Repair. 5.0 days
Adjuster: PARASURAM SHANMUGAM Manager: Chong Pui Lin

NOTE: This report repressnts our findings af the ima and place of ingpection staled herein, Such inspection has bean carmed aul fo the bosf of our
krowiedge and abilly bit any other lnbiily under any cther circumatances i hereby aaprassly axciided

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=... 10/10/2019
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Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: {Last Synchronised: 10 Oct 2018)

Parts: /A YAMAHA FZ150 150cc (Model not available in database)

Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted. no print-code for FEL408T)

Validity: These eslimates are valid only i they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last esiimate page

|Further Info: Itemsivalues not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an antaﬂn.k Ly

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1T 2 *MIRROR L&R Mot Necessary 88.00F *-FL
2 1 ‘“HANDLE BAR Bent 180,00 F *05.00FL
3 1 *‘BRAKE LEVER Broken 95.00F *20.00FL
4 2 *BALANCER Cracked 85.00F *20.00 FL
5 1 ‘FUEL TANK LEFT HAND COWLING Cracked 151.00F *80.00FL
6 1 *FRONT MUDGUARD Cut BO.OOF *BO.00FL
T 1 *REAR MUDGUARD Not Necassary BO.OOF *.FL
8 1 *SET BOX RACK Scralched a50.00F *150.00 FL
g 1 *SWINGARM Not Necessary 338.00F *FL
0 1 *SET FORK Bent 450.00F *450.00 FL
11 1 *SET EXHAUST COVER Scratched 158.00F *60.00 FL
12 1 *FRONT FUEL TANK COVER LEFT SIDE Cracked 98.00F *78.00 FL
13 1 *LEFT SIDE MIDDLE COVER Cut 108.00F *88.00FL
14 2 *FRONT FOOTREST Not Necessary 158.00F *-FL
15 2 *REAR FOOTREST Scratched 158.00F *68.00 FL
16 1 *SPLASH GUARD Broken S8.00F *B8.00FL
17 1 *FORK OIL SHIELD Necessary 48 00FS *40 00 FS
18 1 *FORK DUST COVER Necessary 4B.00FS *40.00FS
19 2 *NUMBER PLATE Bent 2B.00FS *2B.00FS
2 1 *BOX Scratched 35000FS "BOOOFS
21 2 *BOTTLE FORK OIL MNecessary 40,00FS *30.00 FS
F=Franchise parl. S=Spchell. L=ListhemDisc
Sub Total (S§)  3,199.00  1,575.00
- List ltem Discount on L Items 0.00/10.00% (55) 0.00 125.70
Total Parts (58) 3,199.00 1,449.30
Report was unsubmitied during this print-out. |
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 10/10/2019
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

Thaere are no new miscellaneous ilems selected,

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 STEERING CONE MNew 55.00 55.00

2 TOWING TO ALIGMENT BODY FRAME (2 WAY) New 80.00 0.00

3 ALIGNMENT BODY FRAME New 380.00 180,00

4 TOWING FEES MNew 4500 0.00

5 FRONT RIM REALIGN MNew 80.00 B80.00

6 WORKMANSHIP New B00.00 300.00
Gross Labour Cost (S5) 1,250.00 S85.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-oul.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=...
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