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PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST — GBDG3BBY vs SLR1553C {Q1) on D.OVAL: 29/07T12013

From:. " #Har, Yinmul
s, ‘ansignments@ikkautacom’, Admin A (admin-af@ikkauoocom)
(8 Farg, fndy-5Y, Chin, Les-Ying, Abu Kagsim, Moar Manesa, Axlan, Syazrasrding Chan, Yole Sh, Lim, Sheng Yang, Milhoesngh, Aashweenjeelaur, Subramaniam Dwya:hﬁl_ Tnng_ Wahin

Senl TNV E 4:35.20 PM

Hi,
Please refer 1o the enclosed request from BONNIE KWOK LLC,

Claim no 1 454304 23355G003
Case Owner - Norsiah Ble Md Noor

If wou have any queries’concemns, please let us know,
Thanks & Regards,

Har Yim Rul [Viviane)
AIG
FlOL Adjusier |

Singapore FROL | Clams Qporatons — Aulg

“Finnd e s cnm | wh 3ig 55

From: bonnie kwok [mailto:litigation@&bonniekwok.com]

Sent: Wednesday, July 31, 2019 2:44 PM

To: Hor, Yinrul

Ce! Fong, Andy-5Y; Chin, Lea-Ying; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Azlan, Syazairding; Chan, Yoke Shi; Lim, Sheng Yang; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeatkaur; Subramaniam, Divyashni;
Tong, Wahxin, yeeauto pteltd

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SLR1553C AND GEDGE3BEY ON 29/07/2019

This message is from an external sender; be caontious with links and attachments,

Dear Sirs,

Our client aprees 1o LKK Aure Consulianie ag the Bingle Joim Expent (SIE)L

Please let us have thewr report tn due course,

Kandly request for the SIE o contact the repairers, Mis Yea Auto Fle Lid o 6457 5768 10 make the necessary amangemenls.

Reganls,
T

BONNIE KWOK LLC
Advocates & Solicitors

101 A Upper Cross Street

#08-12 People’s Park Centre
Singapore 058358

TEL: 6536 6026

FaX: 6536 22793

email : |itigation@bonniskwok.com
GST Reg, No.: 20012035472

We do not accepl service of documents by facsimile or email. Our business hours are from Mondays o Fridays from 9 am to 6 pm and we are closed on Saturday,
Sundays and Public Holidays.

- Email Disclaimer -

This message contains information that may be privileged and confidential. I you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination,
distribution or copying of this message is strictly prohibited. I vou have received this message in error, please delete it from your system and notify the sender. You

are advised 1o carry out your own checks on this messapge for computer viruses and other defecrs. Please note that we disclaim liability for any loss or damage caused
by compater viruses andior other defects.

O Tue, 30 Jul 2019 at 16:31, Hor, Yinrul <Yinrul Hor@aig.com™ wroie:

This 15 a secure, encrypiled message. To read it, open the
attachment.

Lo e . B R . W ITRIRM.

fEamnmanulaasfotosrudniiady (o ulu
i a e duuuu



0|22 Qe BB E HAIZIYLICH 2HE 2oy
HER IS BUCH

Ini adalah pesan, aman terenkripsi. Untuk membacanya,
membuka attachment.

Click here by 2019-08-06 16:31 +08 1o read your message.
Adter that, open the attachment.

Mare Info
LKisclaineer | ¥ his omsal aml it comtent are comtidemal swl miersle] ddely for e uwe of the
tldresoa. Pl imly the sender il you kave recoveed s cmail inoeeror o sis iphs debee 0
Accared by Proedposa Encrypies, Cosvophit £ 20000201 T Proabaing, [ae &l rghile
IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The infarmation in this emad {and any attachments) is confidential, If you are nal the intended racipiant, you must not use or deserminale the infarmation. If you have received this omall in orror, plaasa
Immadiataly nedify me by “Reply” command and parmanantly delate the ariginal and any coples o griniguls thersof. Althaugh this emall and any altachments are bebeved Io ba fras of any virs o
oifar dafact that might affect any computer systam inta which It is received and opened, # is the respansbility of the fecipent o ensure that it i5 virus free and o respansibilily s scoented by Amarican
Intamaticnal Group, Inc. of it2 subsidiades ar affilixtes aithar jointly or saverally, for any loss or damage adsing in any way fam its use,

From; Yineul Honffaig.com

To; Btigation@bonnmhwok.com

Ce: Andy-S¥.Fangiiaig.com Lee-Ying Chin@aig.com Moordarissa AbiassimEaig com Syazairdina Azlanf@aig.com yokeshl chan@aig.com Sheng¥ang Lim@alg.com
Aashweenjeetkaur Mithcasingh@alg_com Divyashni Subramaniami@aig.com Wahuin, Tong@aig.com

Subject: aigencrypl PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SLR1553C AND GEDEISEY ON 2072013

Diate: Tiee, 30 Jul 2019 08:31:04 +0000

Without Prejudice
"l"mu Reference CGRDSIREY
Our Reference rSLRI353C

Dear Sir/Madam,
Wa refer to your Notice of Aceident of even date.

Wi intend to conduet o pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's/vour customer’s vehicle jointly with your client'your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor
surveyors named in the attached list fo conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joim expert:

Mume of Surveyor Company Nume

AlG In House Surveyor AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
Lawrence N Chun Kez Priority Services

Jeffrey Ong Leng Kin Prority Services

Jimmy Lee Priority Services

EC Lom Awtomebile Inspection Services Pe Lid
Pang Kiah Keen (Frankic) Formteam Adjusters Pre Lid

N You Han Formteam Adjusters Pre Ltd

Soon HanXin (Gary) Formicam Adjusters Pre Lid

Chow Bo Xiong Formteam Adjusters Pre Lid

Chua Soo Teck {Benjamin) Formteam Adjusters Pre Lid
Kalvin Ang LEK Auto Consuliants Pre Lid
Xing Guo Qiang LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid
Marcus Chua LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid
Mohamad Taufikh LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid
Adrtan Ling LEK Auto Consuliants Pre Lid
Mohammed Rasul LEK Auto Consuliants Pre Lid
Kenneth Kong LKK Auto Consuliants Pre Lid

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointiment of any of these motor surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select one or more of the
listed motor surveyors, We will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expen.

Thanks & Regards,

Haof Yin Ful \YViviang|

Al

FMOL Adjuster |

Singaprma FHNOL | Glaims Operaians - Ao

Yyl Horfiah com | mwwaig 5y

From;: bonnie kwok [mailto: itigationd@bonniekwak,com)

Sent; Tuesday, July 30, 2019 3:03 PM

To: AIG 5GP, Claims-Survey

Subject: [EXTERNAL] PRI - Acc Inv: GBD 6368 ¥ & SLR 1553 C ON 29 JULY 2019

This message is from an external sender: be cautious with links sad attachments.



Drcar Sir,
We refer to the above matter.

We hereby give you 2 days’ notice to conduct a pre-repair inspection of vehicle GBD 6388 Y at M/s Yee Auto Pe Ltd, 160 Sin Ming Drive #02-17 Sin Ming
Autocity Singapore 575722, Contact number 6437 5768,

Regards,

June

BONNIE KWOK LLC
Advocates & Solicitors
101 A Upper Cross Street
#08-12 People's Park Centre
Singapore 058358

TEL: 6536 6026

FAX: 6536 2279

email : [ifigationm i
GST Reg, No.: 2012035472

We do ot aceept service of documents by facsimile or email. Our business hours are from Mondays to Fridays from 9 am 1o 6 pm and we are closed on Sanerday,
Sundays and Public Holidays.

- Email Dusclaimer --

This message contains information that may be privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination,
distribution or copying of this message is strictly prohibited. If vou have received this message in eror, pleasc delete it from your system and notify the sender. You
are advised 1o camry out your own checks on this message for computer viruses and other defects. Please note that we disclaim liability for any loss or damage caused
by computer viruses and'or other defects.

l Virus-free, ww avp com



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuUtD)

Sent: Friday, 6 September 2019 2:25 PM

To: yeeauto pteltd; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuta); SUR
Subject: RE: GDB638BY (Nissan NV350) After Repair Photo
Dear Ms Phang,

Noted with thanks.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to AIG

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd@gmail.com>

Sent; Friday, 6 September 2019 2:05 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: Re: GDB6388Y (Nissan NV350) After Repair Photo

Hi Kenneth,
We accept amount 5885/- (before G5T) & 03 working days.

Thanks & Regards

Ms Phang

Yee Auto Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive

#02-17 Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

ROC & GST Mo.: 201719251W

email: yeeauto mail.com

On Wed, 4 Sep 2019 at 08:25, Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <kennethKong@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Attach finalised for GBED 6388Y.

From: yeeauto pteltd [mailto:yeeautopteltd@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 3 September, 2019 4:13 PM

To: SUR; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: GDB6388Y (Nissan NV350) After Repair Photo
1



Reminder

Yee Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive
#02-17 Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722
ROC & GST No.: 201719251W

emall: yeeautopteltd ail.co

On Wed, 28 Aug 2019 at 10:46, yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd@gmail.com> wrote:

Good day Sir

As per attached for your reference and action.

Thanks & Regards

Ms Phang
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Yee Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive
#02-17 Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722



ROC & GST No.: 201719251W

email: yeeautopteltd@gmail.com

Virus-free. www.avg.com




YEE AUTOPTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive  #02-17/#07-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Tel G457 5768 Fax; 6252 8459 Mobiie: 9887 4031
Email yeeautopteltd@gmail com
Registration No.- 201719251W GST No: 201719251\

M/S:  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way Estimate No:  ES1900044

#07-16 Date: 01 Aug 2019

Singapore 079120 Policy No:

oz Asphen,r VehRegNo:  GBD63SSY
ATTN: Motor Claim Department Make/Model:  NISSAN NV350 PANEL
VAN 2.5 5MT 5DR EURO
ﬂfw’lﬁ? /)(125,, /4""“.{7 v

Your Ref No: - z ﬁ/ﬂ? Chassis No: INIMC2E26Z0002208
Claim Type: Third Party ¥ Engine No: YD25350365A

Accident Date:  29/07/2019 g H—f" v Reg. Date: 26/06/2014
TP Veh Reg No:  SLRI1553C

Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :GBD6388Y

Description U/Price  Quantity List Price Amount
Spare Parts

I FRONT BUMPER 572.80 e foq 57280

2 FRONT BUMPER CLIPS 50.00 1SET A~ 3000

3 FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER - LH 137.20 tec Yo 13720

4 FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP GARNISH - LH 85.00 e 85.00

5 FRONT DOOR - LH 1.668.50 IPC T 166850

6 FRONT DOOR WEATHERSTRIP - LH 125.60 IPC N 12560

7 FRONT DOOR HINGE BOTTOM - LH 82.50 1PC A 8250 X

& FRONT DOOR HINGE TOP - LH 82.50 1 BPC 7 8230

9 FRONT DOOR INNER TRIM - LH 420.00 1 PC e, 420.00

I FRONT DOOR LOCK - LH 320.00 1PC AT 32000

11 FRONT DOOR MOTOR 350.00 1 PC fo, 35000

12 FRONT DOOR REGULATOR - LH 280.00 1 PC ST 28000

13 FRONT HEADLAMP - LH 858.40 IPC Ji, 85840

14 FRONT STEP GARNISH - LH 185.30 IPC A 18530

15 FRONT DOOR STICKER - LH W, 4000 IPC YA 4660 $ 25/~

16 SLIDING DOOR - LH 1.890.00 1 PC T 1.890.00 X

17 SLIDING DOOR STICKER - LH Ae. 35000 1PC P 35000 | /Seua_

749780 7.497.80

Labour

18 TO DISMANTLE & REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS, PANEL BEAT  1.200.00 110B 1,200.00 _;’ﬁr
WHERE NECESSARY.

19 TOPUTTY. APPLY PRIMER & SPRAY-PAINT ON THE 1.200.00 110B 1,200.00 @,—;.?;
AFFECTED PORTION.

20 TO APPLY RUST- PROOFING ON REPAIRED. REPLACED 120.00 1o Y 00 X
PANEL.

21 TO REMOVE/TRANSFER FRONT DOOR AND SLIDING DOOR 200.00 1JOB v~ 20000 X
COMPONENTS.

22 TO CHECK WIRING FUNCTIONS. 60.00 1J0R 60.00 2f

2,780.00 2,780.00



YEE AUTO PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive  #02-17/#07-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 576722
Tel: G457 5768 Fax; 6252 8459 Mobile: 9687 4031
Email: yeeautopteltd@gmail.com
Registration No.: 201719251W GST No: 201719251W

M/S:  ALG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way Estimate No:  ES1900044
#07-16 Date: 01 Aug 2019
Singapore (079120 Policy No:
Veh Reg Na: GBD63ISSY
ATTN: Motor Claim Department Make/Model:  NISSAN NV350 PANEL
VAN 2.5 5MT 5DR EURO
V
Your Ref No: - Chassis No; JNIMC2E26Z20002208
Claim Type: Third Party Engine No: YD25350365A
Accident Date: 29/07/2019 Reg. Date: 26/06/2014

TP Veh Reg No:  SLRI1533C
Estimate Repair Cost to Vghicle No :GBD6388Y

List Price Amount

Description U/Price  Quantity
S8 Ss
Total 55 10,277.80
Add GST @ 7% 719.45
Total Amount Payable 5% 10,997.25

TOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR TEM THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED NINETY SEVEN AND CENTS TWENTY FIVE ONLY

For Yee Auto Pte Ltd



Adjuster Report Page | of 3

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno:1ss0r198R)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto. com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CS/AIG19013497/KVD3N2

Date: 11/09/2019
REFERENCE
S AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.  Policy No:
nNsurer;
Claimant .
Vihicls N s GBDG3ssY Insured Vehicle No : SLR1553C
Date of Loss:  29/07/2019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 45450423355G
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: GBDG3BBY
Make & Model: NISSAN NV350, 2.5 5MT 5DR EURD W (A) Engine No: Y¥D25350365A
Reg. Date: 26/06/2014 (Man. Year: 2014) Chassis No: JN1MCZE2620002208
Colour: Metallic Grey Odometer: 155633 km
Engine Capacity: 2488 cc
Market Value/New Car NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (S8%): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Medification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195R15X8 Rear Tyre Size: 195R15X8
Front Left Side: Michelin 9@ mm Rear Left Side: Michelin 4 mm
Front Right Side: Michelin 9 mm Rear Right Side: Michelin 4 mm
The above values represant the remaining lyre ireads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 7.497.80 175.00 7.,322.80 97.67
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2,780.00 710.00 2,070.00 74 48
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S%) 10,277.80 885.00 9,392.80 91.39
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 719.45 61.95 657.50 91.39
Nett Amount (S$) 10,997.25 946.95 10,050.30 91.39
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 31/07/2018
Date Inspected: 01/08/2019 Inspected At: Yee Auto Pte Ltd (HQ)
160 SIN MING DRIVE, #02-17 SIN
MING AUTOCITY
Singapore 575722
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days
Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: VERON CHEN

NGTE: This report represents our finoings at the fime and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has been carried out to the best of our
knowledge and ability but any other liability under any other clrcumstances is hereby exprassly excluded,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 11/9/2019



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars

*FRONT BUMPER

*SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS
*FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER-LH
*FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP GARNISH-LH
*FRONT DOOR-LH

*FRONT DOOR WEATHERSTRIP-LH
*FRONT DOOR HINGE BOTTOM-LH
*FRONT DOOR HINGE TOP-LH
*FRONT DOOR INNER TRIM-LH
*FRONT DOOR LOCK-LH

*FRONT DOOR MOTOR

*FRONT DOOR REGULATOR-LH
*FRONT HEADLAMP-LH

*FRONT STEP GARNISH-LH

15 “FRONT DOOR STICKER-LH
16 *SLIDING DOOR-LH

17 1 *SLIDING DOOR STICKER-LH
F=Franchise par. S=Spchett,

00~ o f W R =

10
11
12
13
14

o
B I e T T T T R e S

Page 2 of 3
Condition Repairer's Amount
Serviceable 572.BOFS “-FS
Mot Mecessary 50.00FS “F5
Serviceable 137.20F5 *-F3
Serviceahle B5.00FS3 “FS
Repair 1,668.50FS “-FS
Serviceable 12560 F% *-FS
Repair B2.50FS *-Fs
Repair B2.50F5 *-F3
Serviceable 420.00F5 *-F5
Repair 320.00F5 *-FS
Serviceable 350.00F3 *F3
Repair 280.00F5 “FS
Serviceable B58.40FS *-Fs
Serviceable 185.30FS *-FS
MNecessary 40.00F3 "25.00F3
Repair 1,890.00F5 *-FS
Mecessary 350.00FS *150.00FS
Total Parts (53) T,497.80 175.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 11/9/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 3

Recommended Miscellaneous Iltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Noe Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO DISMANTLE & REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS,PANEL New 1,200.00 300.00
BEAT WHERE NECESSARY

2 TO PUTTY,APPLY PRIMER & SPRAY-PAINT ON THE MNew 1.200.00 400.00
AFFECTED PORTION

3 TO APPLY RUST-PROOFING ON REPAIRED,REPLACED Mew 120.00 0.00
PANEL

4 TO REMOVE/TRANSFER FRONT DOOR AND SLIDING Mew 200.00 0.00
DOOR COMPOMNENTS

b TO CHECK WIRING FUNCTIONS Mew 60.00 10,00

Gross Labour Cost (55) 2,780.00 710.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out,

= END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 11/9/2019



