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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 August, 2019 9:19 AM

To: Claims

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Adrian Ling (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SFQ 9212 K AND YOUR INSURED SDJ 8886 H LKK REF 

CC3/AIG19013392/Aha3

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Troy, 

 

We refer to our telephone conversation earlier. 

 

As spoken, our surveyor recommended max repair limit @ $15,700.00. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, 8 August, 2019 8:32 AM 

To: Claims 

Cc: Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SFQ 9212 K AND YOUR INSURED SDJ 8886 H 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Troy, 

 

Please refer to the attached email. 

 

Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 7 August, 2019 6:38 PM 

To: Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: 'Claims Dept' 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SFQ 9212 K AND YOUR INSURED SDJ 8886 H 

 

Dear all, 

 

The accident happens on 26/7/2019 and follows by BOLA it’s a straight-forward chain collision and our client is fully 

not a fault for this accident. 

Due to this accident our client had suffered a lot of losses and inconvenient. Therefore, our client will be claiming 

loss of usage from day one until the repairs complete. 

 

Please revert us shall we proceed with direct settlement. 

 

TRoy Goh  
Claims Advisor 

 
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd  (Reg No 199902271W) 
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699 

p. +65 6388 2323  d. +65 6768 9828  f. +65 6841 1183  

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg   w. www.audi.com.sg 

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre  281 Alexandra Road   Singapore 159938  p. +65 6836 2223 

 
 
Email Disclaimer 
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged. 
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system. 

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you. 
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From: Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 30 July 2019 5:58 PM 

To: 'Admin A'; 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)' 
Cc: 'Claims Dept' 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SFQ 9212 K AND YOUR INSURED SDJ 8886 H 

 

Dear All,  

 

Kindly advise who is the case handler for this mentioned case, and comment on the liability clearance and direct 

settlement  

for this case.  

 

Hereby attached with the estimated with marking for your reference.  

 

Thanks  

 

Best Regards, 

TRoy Goh  
Claims Advisor 

 
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd  (Reg No 199902271W) 

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699 

p. +65 6388 2323  d. +65 6768 9828  f. +65 6841 1183  

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg   w. www.audi.com.sg 

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre  281 Alexandra Road   Singapore 159938  p. +65 6836 2223 

 
 
Email Disclaimer 
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged. 
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system. 

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you. 

 

 

From: Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 26 July 2019 4:26 PM 
To: 'Admin A'; 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)' 

Cc: 'Claims' 
Subject: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SFQ 9212 K AND YOUR INSURED SDJ 8886 H 

 

Dear all,  

 

Kindly assist in the liability clearance for the above mentioned case. We propose for 100% direct settlement in our 

client’s favour. 

 

We herein attached the GIA report for your reference. 

 

We will forward you the estimate once it is available. 

 

Please arrange survey on 30/07/2019. Owner waiting. 
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Best Regards, 

Syafiq 

Claims Admin Assistant 
 

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd  (Reg No 199902271W) 

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699 

p. +65 6388 2323  d. +65 6768 9911  f. +65 6841 1183  

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg   w. www.audi.com.sg 

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre  281 Alexandra Road   Singapore 159938  p. +65 6836 2223 

 
Email Disclaimer 
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged. 
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system. 
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you 
 


