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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 August, 2019 12:02 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: FW: Urgent Advice / TP against AIG / TP Veh: SJU242P / DOA 26th July 2019 

Dear Vic, 

 

FYNA. CC6/AIG19013375/Aha3 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 7 August 2019 12:01 PM 

To: Fong, Andy-SY <Andy-SY.Fong@aig.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; Bucha, Manik 

<Manik.Bucha@aig.com> 

Subject: RE: Urgent Advice / TP against AIG / TP Veh: SJU242P / DOA 26th July 2019  

 

Hi Andy, 

 

The nett value offer of $3k has already been agreed by Lee Sheng Auto. However this amount does not take into 

consideration as loss of use or rental charges. 

 

According to Lee Sheng Auto, their client is not making any injury claims 

 

Regards, 

 

Adrian Ling  

 

 

From: Fong, Andy-SY [mailto:Andy-SY.Fong@aig.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 6 August, 2019 6:14 PM 
To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) 

Cc: SUR; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); Bucha, Manik 

Subject: Urgent Advice / TP against AIG / TP Veh: SJU242P / DOA 26th July 2019  

 

Hi Adrian 

 

We understand that you surveyed SJU242P at Lee Sheng Auto on 1st Aug 2019. We need to verify a few questions 

with you 

 

1) You recommended repair limit $3,000 and spoke to workshop. What is workshop’s take? Will workshop 

repair within limit? 

2) Is there Bodily injury involved? GIA report states no, please confirm with workshop 
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For your urgent confirmation please. 

 

Thanks 

Andy  

 

 

IMPORTANT NOTICE:  

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, 

you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please 

immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or 

printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other 

defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of 

the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International 

Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any 

way from its use. 


