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Yourref:  To Be Advised Date: 30.07.2019
Qur ref: CCYHQBEI90133TI/K leb3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s QBE INSURANCE (INTERNATIONAL) LTD

Dear SirMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. HCRTYSB
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 29.07.2019

at the premises of M/s 1Gro Engineerin Ltd and have the following to report:-
Waorkshop Estimate Amoun| 1 5§ 3,059.24

Revised Estimate Amount : 8§ 1,287.20

"Check” Items Amount : 5§ -

Market Value : 5% -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -

Nett Value : 5% =

Description of Damage: - -I -

The vehicle sustuined damages at the | ;! _ !

Front portion ——

Commenta/Present Status;
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 2 days

Yours Faithfully.

KALVIN ANG
Licensed Appraiser



COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PIE LTD
REPAIR ESTIMATE*
VEMJCLE NO : SHC RT95B

Y= ‘-L{K) r l:f_.:

DATE 29/7/2019

MAKE
MODEL : HYUNDAI id0 ¥ “alvin
I Parts Deseription/ Labour Type Unit Price Amount
Radiator Grille  »~~ ¢m S L1010
Radiator Grille H Emblem— *# § 2950
Front Bumper Cover X /%" $ 1.05220
Fromt Bumper Sponge - 3T $ 99.20
Front Bumper Reinforcement X 4 $ 40210
Front Bumper Grille (LH/RH]) * S 5 4160 | & 8320
Front Bumper Bracket Top (LH/RH) X $ 40| 8 44.80
Front Bumper Bracket (LH/RH) > S 2460 | S 4920
SUB TOTAL 5 2.880.30
LESS 2 ’Zaf § 57606
MSCOUNTED TOTAL 5 2,304.24
Fromt Number Plate ~ ™ 5 25.00 |Nett
Front No Plate Trim Cover K 5 30.00 |Nett
5 55.00

Labour Charge
Panel Beating
Spray Painting Charge

TOTAL L
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_700.00
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COMFORIDELGRO

QOur Job Ref No : 305320640 ENGINEERING

Data : 00718 = ﬁ, Shmml Pﬁ;!!I-I“I
Fax: s

FINALIZATION FORM

Te ¢ LKK Fax:

Atn : KALVIN

Vahicle Reg No. : SHCB785B 2710712019

The survey snd estimates of the repairs of the sbove-mantioned vehicie are 8s follows:-

Z  The repair job shall bill to: QBE SKT4234E

2, The finalized amourd shall ba:
{a) Spare Parts after Lisl discoum

(b} Lebour Charges

Total for Part-By-Part Repalr Cost

(] Lumpsum Regair (if applicable)
Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less:

Final Lumpsum Repalr cost $1,000.00
3 Eslimated normal period for rapairs 2 working days
4 Wao shall treat tha above amount as Correct and Confirmad If there Is no reply from you within 7
working days
5 Thank you for your assis Wa canfirm the estimates and
finalized amount
Signature : y Signalure
4 -
Nome : CHIANG Name for
Tel 62148314 Date 7/
Fax ., 65468156
For Official Use Only
Documenl
ftem Amounl Attached | Sonfirm By Remarks
(Signalure)
Yes or No
1, Rental Rate P/Day YES
2 Loss of Income Pald N
3. Survey Fees
4, LTA Search Fes 7.49
5. Madical Fees (on bahall
of driver, if applicabla)
E Owvarrun

Remarks:
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REPAIR ESTIMATE*

COM¥ORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD ( )(ll{___ Ll [ (\) l _{f

VEHICLE NO : SHC 8795B DATE 29/7/2019
MAKE : 3 :
MODEL  : HYUNDAI id0 L¥F “kalvin

Oty ] Parts Description’ Labour Tyvpe L'nit Price Amount
Radiator Grille  ~ S L1100

Radiator Grille H Emblem= 5 39.50
Front Bumper Cover X /1" $ 1,0582.20
Front Bumper Sponge . S 99.20
Front Bumper Remforcement ol 5 402,10
Front Bumper Grille (LH/RH) » 5 4160158 83.20
Front Bumper Bracket Top (LH/RH) x S 2240 |8 44 80
Front Bumper Bracket (LIVRH) > 5 24060 |5 4920
SUR TOTAL 5  21.8B0.30
LESS }ux’kf § 57606
DISCOUNTED TOTAL § 230424
Front Number Plate - s 2500 |Nert
Front No Plate Trim Cover & $ 30.00 |Netr
s 55.00
Labour Charge 2e®
Panel Beating 5 )Odﬁ;l'
Spray Painting Charge S 300460
o
TOTAL LABOUR % T00.00
Al

ESTIMATE TOTAL e §_3.059.24

\)

This is an initial estimate based on 4 visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will
be prepared after the vehicle is surveved by a motor Survevor appointed by the insurnnce company




Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: lenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>

Sent: Friday, 20 September 2019 6:49 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKT4234E (O] : QBE - TBA) AND SHCE7958
(TP : LKK REF - CC3/QBE19013370/K1eb3) on 27.07.2019

Attachments: SKTA234E pdi

Our ref; VC012829
Dear Shu Pei

Please find attached as per requested

_regards
Janny Tah
Senior Assistan!
Claime / Asia
1 Ratfles Quay, #28-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+B5 B224 BB33 | +85 BATT 1225
il

QBE

Linkéain Tailzaes

From: Shu Pei (LKKAUto) <shupel@/kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 18 September 2019 9:16 AM

To: lenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com:=

Cc: lanice Goh Siew Geok <janice.poh@gbe.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlermont - Accident Invelving SKT4234E (O : QBE - TBA) AND SHCB7958 (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/QBE19013370/K1eb3) on 27.07.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter,

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our
necessary action.

Thank youw

Best Regards,
Shu Pel| Admin
LEK Auto Censultants Pte Lid



Fhone: 63660055 | email: shupaii@ikkauto com | fax 6741-4108
Bik 53, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Shu Pel [LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 29 August 2019 9:20 AM

To: lenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>

Cc: Janice Goh Siew Geok <[anice.goh@qbe.com»

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving SKT4234E (01 ; QBE - TBA) AND SHCB7958 (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/0BE19013370/K1eb3) on 27.07.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter,

Kindly advice whether insured hns reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Thank vouw

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ghupel@kkauto com | fax: 6741-4108

Bl 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 August 2019 9.5 A%

To: lenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.con =

Cc: Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice.pohi@gbe.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKT4234E (01 : QBE - TBA) AND SHC87958 (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/QBE19013370/K1eb3) on 27.07.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advice whether insured o roported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our
necessary action.

Thank vouw.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LEK Auto Consultanis Pue Lid

Phone: 6366-D055 | ermall shupet @ hbars comy | fac 6741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industiial Park. Ubl Avenue 1. #032.25 | S[408933)



From: Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice.poh@gbe.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 July 2019 11:10 AM

To: Shu Pel [LKKAuto) <shupei@Ikkauto.com>; Janny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving SKT4234E (0O : QBE - TBA) AND SHC8795B (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/QBE19013370/K1eb3) on 27.07.2019

Hi Shu Pei

Our insured has not reparted the accident to us,
We will forward to you upon receiving.

This case is handled by my colleapuc. 245 lenny Toh and our claim no VC012829,

Hi Jenmy
Please send letter to insured for reparting

Thank you

Janice Goh
Executive, Claims
Claims | Asla

1 Raffies Quay, #20-10 Scuth Towor, Singnpore 048583

+65 B4TT 1243
Webtsite Linkedin Twill

A QBE

From: Shu Pel [LKKAuto] <shupei@!tb=uto coms>
Sent: Tuesday, 30 July 2019 7:20 P!

To: Jenny Toh <jonny.toh@gbe oo o: frmice Goh Siew Geok <janice.goh@gbe.com>
Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.coms; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKT4234E (O : QBE - TBA) AND SHCB7958 (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/QBE19013370/K1eb3) on 27.07.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above martter.

We have Inspected 1P vehicle 5111 170958 at M /s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP
repairer proposed for o direct it

Enclosed for your perusail ls;
TH's GIA report



- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6366-0055 | email: ghupsl@lkkautn com | fax: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ubd industnal Park, Uy Avenue 1, 002-15 | 5(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The infarmation in this emall is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended reciplent, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this emall is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have receved this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply email
or telephone. You should also delete this emall and destroy any hard copies produced.

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The infarmation in this emall Is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are
nat the intended recipiont, any ute o di=comination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prakibis! o have recelved this emall in error, please promptly inform us by reply emall
or telephone. You should also delete this emall and destroy any hard coples produced,



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industnial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No: 190607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

AHlliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

QBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

1 RAFFLES QUAY #28-10 SOUTH

Refl CC3/OBE19013370/K 1eb3g2

Date: 2511-2019

[N

TOWERSINGAPORE 048583
Code: QBE
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKT 4234E Veh. Inspected SHC 87956
Policy No. B-VX020516-MVA Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. VC012829 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 29/07/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140 c.c 16885
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. KMHLB41UMGUOB2940 Colour BLUE
Ddometer 383011 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R18 WEST LAKE T mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. ' General Information
Accident Date  27/07/2018 Inspection Date 28/07/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508869
5a. Remarks
AYTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. | Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

v 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapere 408833
TEL: 6256 1561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo 199607198R GST Reg Mo, 19-9607198-R Pags No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO, SHC 8795B
' : S 5ar Conditic ‘Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition : e
= | ; Workshop ($)___ (5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|RADIATOR GRILLE CRACKED 1,110.10 1,110.10
1|RADIATOR GRILLE H EMBLEM CuT 39.50 38.50
1|FRONT BUMPER COVER TO REPAIR SEE 1.052.20
LABOUR
1|FRONT BUMPER SPONGE SERVICEABLE Bo.20 -
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT SERVICEABLE 402.10
2|FRONT BUMPER GRILLE (LH/RH )@%41.60 SERVICEABLE B3.20
2|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET TOP (LH/RH) @$22 40 SERVICEABLE 44.80
2|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET (LH/RH ) @324.60 SERVICEABLE 4520
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -578.08
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -287 40
2,304 24 86220
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE (SN} CRACKED 25.00 25.00
1|FRONT NO PLATE TRIM COVER (SN) SERVICEABLE 30.00
55.00 25.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT 400.00 200,00
BUMPER COVER .
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE. 300.00 200.00
700.00 400.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,059.24 1,287.20
'RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS R 1,000.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) i
Report Ref No. CC3/QBE19013370/K1eb3q2
I j
KALVIN ANG WEI KUN HO LEONG CHUAN
Automolive Assessor | Investigator Automotive Assessor

[HSCLAIMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Reparl s made selely for the dse §nd beneflt of ine Clieni named on tha froni page of this Repart.




