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51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UB1 INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (063) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D19004826MFSH Date: 15 August 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI19013368/Uyf3

The Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam.

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ SLV2257E

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 05/08/2019 at the premises of M/s SME MOTOR. and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :8§  3.575.60
Revised Estimate Amount :S§  2833.20
*Check” Items Amount :S%

Market Value s -
LTA Reimbursement Value : S8 -
Nett Value : 8% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages

A ——— -,
at the rear portion. rear @ frors

offside

Yours faithfully

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser



Ms§FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited co®eg fe 1950001060 GET Heg Mo H2-0OGLG26-9
B Raffies Quay 421 -00 Singapore D4BSE0
Tel: (65} 6222 2311 Fax: (B5)B2EE 3547

[laims & Mober Undenariting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 05BE7T
Tel (B5) 6507 3848 Fax (B5) 6307 3849
wian misfirstcapital.comusg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

24-07-2019 Our Ref No. D19004826MFSH
23-07-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHAB313U Third Party Vehicle. SLV2257E

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 BLK D #02-15/16/17/18AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
JACOB ANG

67476106/ 0 Fax No. 67442368

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS FTE LTD

MA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cec : Workshop
Cec : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

SME MOTOR PTE LTD Attention. MNIL
Ma TP Solicitor Fax No. MNA

SITHARA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Yuuhne Wnng (LKK Auto)

From: ¥Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, August 15, 2019 4:57 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; SUR

Cc ‘Sithara’

Subject: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004826MFSH/1 - SLV 2257E
Attachments: SLV2257E DOA 230719 REVERT.doc

Dear Sir/Madam

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLV2257E
Date of survey: 05/08/2019
Number of days : 3 days

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, July 30, 2019 3:53 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004826MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Eest Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | {ax: b2g6-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
1



Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8({408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims Tr‘nai|tD:CWSmDtorcIairns{ﬁlmsfirstcapital.cum.sgl

Sent: Tuesday, 30 July, 2019 3:56 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@ LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims -:gwsmomrciaims{&lmsﬂrstcagita!.mm.5g>; Sithara <5ithara@ msfirstcapital.com.sg=
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004826MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS5 within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Used vezel Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

sGCARMART.COM Login  Sign uj
Mew Cars Used Cars Soll My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources
Receive a higher selling price by selling your car yourself.
Advertise it for =ale at just $58, list till sold.
N ears C newal Honda Stre: L]
Post an Advertisement w5 Years BeRensent Bonde et 184 'mlnn -
Sedl it yourself! Advertise it at just Aa Puipirariin. K Cor. Buyet =
$58 until it's SOLD! .
d at GREAT PRICES a
-
Browse by Category ] wBackf123) Sort by Date Posted ] 20 resultsipage  v|
53 vehicles vezel hvanced Search. M, Submit |
Model Prica Depreciation Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type
Search Selection werel 7 Ava I
Honda Verel 1.5A X Honda $75,800 48,720 jyr 10-Juk- 2017 1,496 cx 25 704 km SLV Available
‘{r-ru‘..r.l;.
Graded A by STH
One Owner. Perfect Condition, Yery Well Maintained And Beautiful Unit. No Repairs Meeded. Having Our Own Werkshop. 100% Accident.
Honda Vezel Hybrid 1.5A X 576,800 59,500 fyr I1-May-2017 1,496 cc 37,088 km S Available
Fuel Type: Petrol-Electric
13 Years Obd Bidded 2 Digits Car Plate Gaing Alang, FOL! Low Mileage Dane 37088km. Tip Top Condition, Must See. 1 Owner, Sale Dus T
Lake WView Credit Pre Lud
Honda Vezel 1,54 X 572,800 £6.780 fyr 28-Feb-2017 1,496 cC 36,126 km S Available
Well Maintasmad With 1 Owner Only! Sporty Red And Black Interior And Seats! Flexible In-House Loan Scheme Avallable! Don't Miss Cat
Honda Vezel 1.58 X 74,800 58,800 (yr 30-May- 2017 1,496 o 18,000 km SLIV Available
We Provide Door Steps Viewing, 1 Careful Lady Qwner, Very Low Mileage Done, Well Maintained, 100%% Accident, Free, Clean And Neat |
Buying a pre-owned car, but
Unswure of its Condition?
Honda Vezal 1.5A X £71 80O 58,660 fyr D&-Apr-A017 1,496 cc s Available
Elegant White SUV, One Cwner Onby, Low Maintenance Cost, Very Well Maintained, Easy Financing, Flexible In-house Loan Packages Av..
Prirre Motor B Leasing
Honda Vezel 1.54 X £75,000 58,580 fyr 13-Jut-2017 1,496 oc 56,000 km sV Available
After Markat Exhaust With Cert. 1 Owner. Spacous Family SUV. Economic Fueel. Acodent-Free. Beautiful Whate Color, Meat Interor. High. "~ Femani 5 |
Honda Vezel Hybrid 1.54 X 575,822 50,580 fyr A0-Mar- 2017 1,496 cc 52,229 km S Available
Honda Sensing
Compare Fuel Type: Petrol-Electric
o ‘ e M= . =1 o v H= !
https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?RGD=2017&MOD=vezel& RPG=20& VEH=0&AVL... 05-Aug-19



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page | of 1

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Singapore NRIC

Owner ID: 407 A

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SLV2257E

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 05 Aug 2019
Vehicle Make: HONDA

Vehicle Model: VEZEL HYBRID 1.5X AUTO
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2017

Engine No.: LEB5954492
Chassis No.: RU31254477
Maximum Power Qutput: 112.0 kW (150 bhp)
Open Market Value: $25,956.00
Original Registration Date: 26 Dec 2017

First Registration Date: 26 Dec 2017
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $5,000.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 25 Dec 2027

PARF Rebate Amount: $3,750.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 25 Dec 2027

COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $47,002.00

COE Rebate Amount: $39421.00

Total Rebate Amount: $43,171.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 05 Aug 2019

OK

https://vrl Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput 7FUNCTION_ID=F030... 05-Aug-19



rerffed
SME Motor Pte Ltd
I Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-15 Aotobay i KakiBukit Singapore 4 [ T8E3 ZL}/AM M‘/"7.
i ;

TEL: 67476106 (6 lines) FAX: 67442368 Emuil servicedSmEemoor. com. sg

GST:201119451E RCB RNO:201 11943 1E

M/S: MSFIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED /D/f" j’l&i'ld
36 ROBINSON ROAD #16-01 Estimate No:  EST0004963
CITY HOUSE Date: 24 Jul 2019
Singapore 068877 Policy No: P10114608R00

TEL: 65073848 FAX: 65073849 Veh Reg No: SLV2257E

ATTN: Motor Claim Department Make/Model:  HONDA VEZEL

Your Ref No: 19 FC/TP-146 (07) Chasis No: RU31234477

Claim Type: Third Party Engine No: LEB5954492

Accident Date:  23/07/2019 Reg. Date: 26/12/2017

TP Veh Reg No:  SHAB3 13U
Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :SLV225TE

Description Quantity List Price Amount
S8 S8
List Price
| REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING c | PC 140.00 —
2 REAR GATE Ao g::, 1 PC 975 .00
i REAR GATE EMBLEM 'VEZEL' e 1 PC 46.00 —
4 REAR GATE BMBLEM 'HYBRID'  #L€A I PC 5800 —
5 REAR GATE RUBBER A 4 1PC 105.00
6 REAR GATE LOCK s~ 1PC 9500 2X
7 REAR BUMPER Ty | PC TROO0 —
8 REARBUMPER cLIP  72&T 10 PC 2500 —
9 REARGATELOGO -1 | PC w00 X
Vﬂi’\l‘ 2,282.00
}% y Less 20% 156,40 1.825.60
Special Net
10 REAR REVERSE SENSOR (etf ppee E'A'M[ 25000 Qo0
11 REAR WINDSCREEN GUM tpc AL w000 Lo
310.00 310.00
Labour
12 WIRE CHECKING 1 LN 20000 p—
13 REMOVE & REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN 1 UNIT 12000 L—
14 TRANSFER REAR GATE COMPONENT FROM OLD TO NEW 1UNIT 100,00 &2
15 LABOUR CHARGE 1UNII 600.00 SO0
16 SPRAY PAINTING 1UNII 600.00 (£ €V
TR ence notify 1,440.00 1,440.00
"- & Repairef _' ':"I Total S8 3.575.60
g resurvey Add GST @ 7% 250.29
7} e i.--.' i Total Amount Pavable 55 3,825.89
TOTAL: SINGAJ mi:I-."_'["'J'('li.].JXR;.l'l:[E.I'iE LHOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED TWENTY FIVE AND CENTS EIGHTY NINE
ONLY : atapy e mus! be resurveyed and
subifect o final approval liom Insurance Company
' . For SME Motor Pte Ltd
Acknowiadged by Repa ar
3L

AUTHORISED SIGNATURE



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL

B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 190607198R G5T Reg. No. 18-89607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCN9013368/Uyl3n2
3?;:;8{':??*? H{?L?SAEDSINGAPDRE 068877 Date:  02-03-2019 ” “m"”"umwul
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA B313U Veh. Inspected 5LV 2257E
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. D19004826MFSH Excess () 0.00
Assign From SITHARA Assign Date 30/07/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDAVEZEL HYERID (A) c.c 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. RU31254477 Colour WHITE
Odometer 23457 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R18 DUNLOP 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/80R16 DUNLOP 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTIOMN.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/07/2019 [Inspection Date 05/08/2019
Survey held at SME MOTOR PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE &
#02-15 (AUTOBAY @KAK] BUKIT)
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES COMNSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




i, F W |

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya LIbi Industrial Park, Singapore 408233
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 19960T198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607 198-R Fage Mo 1 of 1

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. 5LV 225TE

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Q Description of Parts Condition
2 2 Workshop (§)| __(5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING NECESSARY 140.00 140.00
1|REAR GATE BADLY DENTED 875.00 875.00
1|REAR GATE EMBLEM "VEZEL" MECESSARY 46,00 46.00
1|REAR GATE EMBELEM *HYBRID" NECESSARY 58.00 58.00
1|REAR GATE RUBBER NOT NECESSARY 105.00 -
1|REAR GATE LOCK SERVICEABLE 95.00
1|REAR BUMPER DENTED 780.00 780.00
10|REAR BUMPER CLIP NECESSARY 55.00 55.00
1|REAR GATE LOGO NOT NECESSARY 28.00 .
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -456.40 -410.80
1.825.60 1.643.20
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SHORTED 250.00 200.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN GUM (SN) NECESSARY 60.00 40.00
310.00 240.00
LABOUR
WIRE CHECKING. 20.00 20.00
REMOWVE & REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN. 120.00 120.00
TRANSFER REAR GATE COMPONENT FROM OLD TO 100.00 60.00
NEW.
LABOUR CHARGE. 600.00 300.00
SPRAY PAINTING. 600.00 450,00
1,440.00 850.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,575.60 2,833.20
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS I 2.833.20]

Reporl Ref No. CS/FCI192013368/Uyl3an2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made salely for the use and benefil of the Clent named on the front page of this Report.

Mo liabilit of respansiilit wh in
B i wit : " hi :




