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Khanchna (LKK Auto) —

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 30 September 20719 5:34 PM

To: CAROLYNTEOSK@HOTMAIL.COM

Ce: Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMC52BB) & SLE2590G ON 2B/07/2019 ALONG LOYANG
AVEMUE 8 & TAMPINES AVE 7

Tracking: Recipient Delivery
CAROLYNTEOSKEHOTMAILCOM
Admin A
olwalaui@lkkauto.com Delivered 30/9/2019 5:34 PM
MaikwanBlkkauto com Delivered 30/9/2019 534 PM
shupeli®lkkauto.com Delivered 30/9/2019 534 PM

Our Ref: CC6/AIG19013302/Aka3

SEET THIAN BENG BENJAMIN
[POLICY HOLDER]

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMC5288) [AIG) & SLE2590G ON 28/07/2019 ALONG LOYANG AVENUE 8 & TAMPINES AVE 7

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SLE2590G against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour. We will therefore
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount [NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles)
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us If you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@Ikkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)




1252019 Ad|justar Immediate Advice

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregno sossorioss;
51 Ubil Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Uibl Indusirial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-1561 Fax 6844-BE0S Email: sur@ikkautlo.com:assignments@lkkauto.com

To : AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.

Artn : Syed-Yusoff, Saliha

Your Rel . 672500288556

Our Ref - CCE/AIG18013302/AKAS

Date : 05 Dec 2019 “WITHOUT PREJUDICE"

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMC5288J & SLE2590G ON 28/07/2019
Refer 1o the above accident.

The accident occurred when il is @ head 1o rear end collision (BOLA 27- liability down against Insured). We have clarified
with the Ol an the nature of the acoident and heishe s aware that histher NCD would be affected.

On behalf of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Ltd., we have successfully / nol successfully carried out TF Express
Settlement batween your insured (vehicla no. SMCS5288.) and third party claimant [vehide no. SLE2590G).

Summary of offer made to workshop Modam Automotive Ple Lid is as follows :

Claimed Revised
Cost of Repairs (W/GST) § 11,749.54 6.259.50
“L‘?“m“' Rental ($120x4 ¢ ,an00 § 400,00 (5100 x 4 days)
LTA Search $ 200 § 2.00

Total $ 1223154 6.661.50
Amount of claim at Liability 100% 5 6.661.50

Enclose herewith the relevant supporting documents for your perusal.
=* 7 days recommendation for repair

For your approval pleasa.

Regards,

Khanchna Pothuraj
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

hitps 'singapare. merimen comiclaimsindex, cfmHusabox=SVCdoc&fuseachon=dsp_viewarsmart&nomgviewsar=1&ftypa=2&docid=4884 2548800 mn



' Kha;tchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent; Monday, 23 December 2019 11:32 AM
To: Chin

Cc Admin A

Subject: QOFFER - TP Settlement SLE2590G {AIG)

Without Prejudice
[save as lo costs)

Dear Sirs/Mcm.
We refer 1o the above matier.

For amicable settlement on a withoul prejudice basis. we propose seftlement as follows:

|. Cost of Repalr |w/G5T) % 6.259.50
2. Loss of Rental (4 days x $100) $ 400.00
3. LTA Search fee b 2.00

TOTAL | $6.661.50

Flease confirm acceplance.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on o without prejuilice hasis with the sole intention of resolving the
mutter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of lability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotintion of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party thar will materially affect/influence on the issues of
linbility/damnges, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negoiintion termy/settlement,”

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards.

Khanchnal Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360] email: Khanchna @ Ikkauto.com/Fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1., #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chin <chini@ modernautomotive.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 8 November 2019 11:42 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna/@ lkkauto.com>

Ce: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: TP Settlement SLE2590G (A1G)

Dear Khanchna

We refer to the above matter,



" Khanchna (LKK Auto)

————————————————————————— e ——————

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sant: Monday, 6 January 2020 3:58 PM

To: ‘Chin'

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: OFFER - TP Settlement SLE2590G (AlG)
Attachments: AlG DV, pdf

Withoul Prejudice

(save os fo cosis)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We reler to the above matter.

Thank you for the acceplance

We attach herewith a copy of the DV for your further action,

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter s purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resalving the

matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party s not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settiement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna a lkkauto com Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1. #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Chin <chin@modemautomotive.com.sg=>

Sent: Monday, 23 December 2019 1:36 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna/@lkkauto.com>
Ce: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto,com>

Subject: RE: OFFER - TP Seulement SLE2390G (AlG)

Dear Khanchna
We accept your offer of amount $6661.50 in settlement of this claim and forward us your DV

Thank you



- Khanchna !LKI{ Auto)

From: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha Syed-Yusoff@aig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 19 December 2019 3:23 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: Mandate Request from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid - SLE2590G

Dear Khanchna,
For cases that we have received LOD from repairer, can your side upload w/p report instead of the IA?
For this matter, | have given mandate approval via Merimen to expedite settlement.

Kind Regards,
Saliha

Saliha Syed Yusoff

AlG

Somiar Compl e Wms Exgmme
latims | AIG Asia Pacific Insuranca Pro. Lid
G Building & shenton Way fUB- 1k Singapors
i o[ {F o4l 1

WWW.E'E.SE

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The infarmation in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the infarmation. If you have received this emaill in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply”
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof, Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Do-Not-Reply [mailto:do-not-reply@merimen.com)|

Sent: Thursday, December 5, 2019 3:20 PM

To: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha.Syed-Yusoff @aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Mandate Request from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd - SLE2590G

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments,
Dear PIC,

There is a mandate request from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Claimmo.: 67250928855G

- Vehicle no.: 5LE2530G
Date of Accident: 28/07/2019
Repairer: Modern Automaotive Pte Ltd



12232018 Mearimen a-Claims
Print Received Message

This mail |s associated with

*SLE2590G (67250928855G)
[SMC5288J]
TP

MOHAMAD SA'D BIN OTHMAN
Jul 28 2019 6:00PM
[SEET THIAN BENG BENJAMIN]
Modem Automative Pte Ltd

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), senl on 19/12/2019 15:20 PM
To LKK_HQ
Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$56661.50) - SLE2590G - Claim Handler: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha

|Approved:6661.50:mandate approval is subject to final repair bill & ATA

hitpe-/fsingapore meriman. com/daimsindes. cim?Musebox=SVCmall&fuseacton=tsp_Print&CFID=6451T08TACFTOKEN=6eac260d357 208 18-E1

m



Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastlanm

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case tictitied Est Submitted Ad) Assigned Af| Apt Ad| Subrmitted Ins Auth'sd Status
me 30 Jul 2018 g{"g o 5%5,850.00 585,850.00 m"“" for Sareuy
_tot e | A v 32 | Cameni Casa |

Main

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS ] [Created by adjuster]
Insuredq: SEET THIAM BENG BENJAMIN, [D: 517667268

Main "
Claimant: MOHAMAD SA'ID BIN OTHMAMN, [D: 514302366

Vehicle Rag. | 28/07/2019 18:00 - 159
No.: SLE2590G Oate of Loss: | [36 Months and 14 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]
. Policy/Cover |1B00079793 (Comprehensive)
Claim Type: | TP / 67250928855G Note No.:  |Coverage: 06/D7/2018 - 0S/07/2030
Vahicie Reg.
hor SMC5288) :'gf_‘-‘."m":! ,o  |5102220954-01
(Insured) T
! Excess:
feparer:  |Modem Automotive Pis Ltd (HQ) Bik 3023A Ubi Road 1, #01-61 & #01-56, 408717 Libi - Tel: 6748 4422 / 6747 4472

Handling AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, [Express) - Tei: 65-6419-3000 .. [Handied by Syed-Yusoff, Saliha] Salina Syed-
Insurer: Yusoffdiag.com

mm NTUC Income Insurance Co-aperative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tei: 6256-3561 ... [Handied by ADRIAN LING] ... [Final Rpt due 07/08/2015]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view All |  Compose Case Mail |

« AIG_SG_EXPRESS [19/12/20159); Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$6661.50) - SLEIS90G - Clalm Handler: Syed-Yusaff...

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= Vigwe All ] Search Tasks ] Create New Task 1 Compiete |

Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Aszigned By Completed On Created On Done?
Mo results.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 14/1/2020




Menimen e-Claims

Lipegad Documanis I Lgioad Fnoms I cmﬂnmt l..l':ﬂr.d‘ﬂlﬁl I-Hlllﬂluh!

Claim Documents

*SLE2590G (67250928855G)
[SMC5288]]
™
MOHAMAD SA'ID BIN OTHMAN
Jul 28 2019 6:00PM
[SEET THIAN BENG BENJAMIN]
Modern Automotive Pte Ltd

Page 1 of 3

Letters/ Correspondences 1 pev page FF i)
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4 |27/08/19 09:15 | Ganeral View @ | ioad G
5 |27/08/19 09:15 General View D | cadirc | A
6 |27/08/1909:15 | General View 0| sedirc | A
7 |27/08/19 09115 | General View O | imawc | B
& |27/08/19 09115 Genaral View )| wceaws | BA
9 |27/08/1906:15 | General View O e | A
10 |27/08/19 09:15 | General View Q| toediec | A
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14 |2/08/19 09:1% Ganeral View 0| adic | A
15 |27/08/19 09:1% Ganeral View 0| eaws | A
16 |Z7/08/19 09:15 General View ﬁ imdirc |
17 |2708/19 09015 | General View 0| eaws | A
18 |27/08/19 09:15 | Genersl View @ | weews | A
19 |27/08/1909:15 | Genersl View Q| wawc | B
20 |27/08/19 09:15 Genersl View 0 | Leds | A
Iy |27/08/19 09:15 | General View i Lad G | M
12 |17/08/19 09115 | Genersl View © | wows | B
21 |27/08/19 09:15 | Genersl View )| tooaws | A
24 |27/081909:15 | Ganersl View 0O | atvs | B
25 |27/08/1909:15 | General View Q| woivs | B
I8 |I7/08/19 09115 |General View Q| i | B
I7 |I7j0E[19 0915 | Genersl View O | waws | &
20 |77/08/19 0915 | Genersl View @ | caars |
29 | 27/08/15 09:15 General View ) | Loadirc | H
30 |27/08/19 09:15 | Genersl View | lcedc | &
1IN0 00:15 | General View i ioad G | B2
32 |27/08/1909:15 | Genersl View A waaws | B
I3 |Z7/08/1909:15 | General View 0| s | ¥
34 |27/08/1309:15 | General View i toad 3rG | BA
15 |27/08/1909:15 | General View Q| eaws | B
36 |27/08/1909:15 | General View Q| cews | B
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 14/1/2020
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53 |I7/08/190%:15 | General View Q| et | &
54 |27/08/19 0915 | General View O | wuws | B
55 |27/08/18 09:15 | Genersl View O | wars | &
56 |27/08/19 09:15 General View 0| badwc | A
57 |I7/08/159 09:15 General View | icedwc |
58 |I7/08/19 0915 | General View @ | eds | B
59 | T7/08/1% 09:15 General View 0 | e | B
60 |27/08/19 09:16 Reinspection Photo 0| oades | B
61 |27/08/18 09:16 | Reinspection Photo @ | Lodrws | B
B2 |I7/08/1309:16 | Relnspection Photo @ | aawc | B
B3 |I7/08/19 09:16 Reinspection Photo ﬁ Lad 06 | BA
B4 |27/08/19 0%:16 | Reinspection Photo 0| wuaws | A
65 |27/08/19 05:16 | Relnspection Photo Q| i | A
B6 |27/08/19 09:16 | Reinspection Photo 0| adws | &
&7 |Z7/08/19 09:18 Relnspection Photo i Load 2G| B
68 |17/08/1909:16 | Reinspection Photo Q| wacwrs | FA
69 |27/08/19 0916 Reinspection Photo 0| oaws | &
70 |27/08/19 08:16 | Relnspection Photo 0| cadvc |
71 |27/08/1509.16 | Reinspection Photo Q| eivs | B
72 |I7/08/1309:16 | Reinspection Phots @ | wedrs | &
73 |37/0R/18 09:16 | Relnspection Photo @ | seaws | B
74 |27/08/1% 09:16 | Reinspection Fhoto Q| owws | &
75 |27/08/18 09:16 | Reinspection Photo 0| sdws | B
76 |27/08/1909:16 | Reinspection Photo 0 | cadvs | &
77 | Zz7rom/19.09:16 Relnspection Photo i losd PG | B2
78 | 17/08/19 09:16 Reinspection Photo 0| twaws | @
79 | I7/08/19 09:16 Reinspection Photo 'l_l wed G | B
B0 |27/08/1909:16 | Reinspection Photo O | s | A
Bl |I7/08/1909:18 Reinapection Photo 0| cadrws | A
B2 |27/08/1909:16 | Reinspection Photo O earc | 2
BY | Z7/08/19 09:16 Reinspection Photo )| oaavc | A
B4 | 37/08/19 09:16 Reinapection Photo @ | eewc | B
B5 |27/08/1909:16 | Reinspection Photo 0| tadwc | &
Bf |I7/08/19 09:16 | Reinspection Phote O adws | A
BT |27/08/1909:16 | Reinspection Photo O waaws | A
B8 |27/08/1909:16 | Reinspection Photo @ | osars | &
B9 |27/08/1% 09:16 | Reinspection Photo g toad WG | WA
90 |27/08/1509:16 | Reinspection Photo 0| cews | A
8] |27/08/1509:16 | Reinspection Photo ﬁ load G | A
52 |27/08/1909:16 Reinspection Phote ﬁ e 76 | B
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Letters/ Correspondences 1 w]| &
Mo | Finafized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HG} Thumbnall | Print
51 |27/08/13 05:16 |Relnapection Photo O s | B
27/08/1909:16 | Reinspaction Photo Q| caawc | &
95 |77/08/19 08:16 | Reinspection Photo ! Load 06 | BA
96 |27/0B/19 09:18 Reinspection Photo 0| toadws | A
97 |27/08/19 09:16 | Reinspection Photo O | aws | &
o8 |zrjoasia 09:16 | Reinspection Photo Q| losare | B
9% |27/08/19 09:16 Relnspection Phota g Load e | B
100 | 27/08/19 09:16 | Reinspection Photo Q| leedws | ¥
10 | 27/08/1% 09:16 Relnspection Photo 0| tadirs | &
102 |27/08/19 09:16 | Relnspection Photo 0| waws |
103 [27/08/19 09:16 | Relnspection Photo B | waws | M
104 |27/08/1902:16 | Reinspection Phote g Load 376 | BA
105 |27/06/19 09116 | Asinspection Photo 0| wedws | B
106 | 27/08/19 0916 Reinspection Photo 0| acws | B
107 |27/08/19 0916 | Reinspection Photo | coaws | BF
Documentation 1 per page m il
Mo | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
i 29/07/19 18:33 TP GIA REPORT Load POF
2 |30/07/19 2146 TP GIA REPORT Load POFE
1 |30/09/19 1736 EMAIL TO O Load PDF
4 |30/09i19 17:37 LETTER TO 01 Load PDF
5 |o5/1319 1501 TP ESTIMATE MARKED {FTMAL) Load FOF
& |05/13/19 15:11 LOD, final Repair Invaice, LTA Search, ATA, Rental Supporting docs Load POF
7 [14/00020 10:05 WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF
B |14/01/20 10:08 AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load PDF
8 |14/01/20 10:05 RENTAL RECEIPT Load POF
10 | 14/01/20 10:05 Release Voucher Load POF
11 | 14401720 10:05 LOD Load POF
12 |14/00/20 10:05 GLA SEARCH Load PDF
No | Finalized On AlG Asis Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. [SG) Thumbmnail | Print
1 |30/07/19 14:06 | O GIA REPORT 0 | oo vor
Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST feset | Save | Pt
There are no document checklists configured.
Dur Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
fa)
W
Show Remarks To: [ Hangling Insurer
Nuie Rarmarks are privaie sniees pou o @ G oiher partes
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SMC5288J (Insd veh) Model: HONDA VEZEL 1.5 X CVT
SLE2590G (TP veh) A)
| Date of Accident: |28/07/2019

Global Sum Settiement| .| [ ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate $ 11,740.54]
Final Repair Cost 5 8,250.50
Loss of Use - days al 50.00 per day
Rental (if any) s 40000| 4 days
LTA | GIA Search Fee ] 2.00
Others $ 0.00
-
Final Settlement Sum 5 6,661.50

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES | X] NO {Kindly Indicate
below)
A} For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ Mo BOLA Scenario No:
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: =

BOLA Liability: { %) Assassed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liabillly to be fled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nol apply,
Remarks

Paymaent Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) [Modem Automotive Pte Lid .5 6,661.50
2) i
3) ;5
14 Jan
JOAMNNE LEE KHANG MIN 2020
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Date

Please attach all the supportling documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Involce; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;

Medical Report! Bill (if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd comeg o 1sseor1ssr)

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6B44-8805 Email sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CCB/AIG18013302/AKA302

Date: 14/01/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Policy No: 1800079793
Claimant .
Vehicie No SLE2590G Insured Vehicle No : SMC5288)
Date of Loss: 281072019 Nature of Claim; TP Clalm No: 87250928855G
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SLE2590G
Make & Model: HONDA VEZEL, 1.5 X CVT (&) Engine No L15B4035962
Reg. Datle: 14/07/2016 (Man, Year: 2018) Chassis No: RU11115966
Colour: While Odometer: 72980 km
Engine Capacity. 1456 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (SS): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition Steenng (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake {Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 215/60 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 215/0 R16
Front Left Side: Toyo 6 mm Rear Left Side: Toyo 6 mm
Front Right Side: Toyo 6 mm Rear Right Side: Toyo & mm
Tha above vaives mpresani the remainng e irooads depih
\COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 7.550.88 5.171.92 237896 31.51
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,430.00 2.170.00 1,260.00 36.73
Paintwork Labour D.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 10,980.88 7,341.92 3,638.96 33.14
Approved Total (Overridden) (58) 5,850,00
(5%) 10,980.88 5,850.00 5,130.88 46,73
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S3) 788.66 400.50 350.16 48.73
MNett Amount (S5) 11,749.54 6,259.50 5,490.04 46.73
+ Car Rental (4.0 x 55100.00/day) (S%) 400.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) 200
Nett Liability (S§) 6,661.50
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 28/072018
Date Inspected: 29/07/2019 inspected At Modern Automotive Pte Lid (HO)
Blk 30234 Ubi Road 1, #01-51 & #01-
58
Singapore 408717
Estimated Period of Repair: 7.0 days
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Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: Khanchna Pothuraj

NOTE: This report represants our findings ot fhe ime and place of inspection staled hergin, Such inspection has bean carmod out to (he best of our
knowiedge and abilfy but any olfver labiity under any ofher circumstances is hereby srpressly srciuded
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Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty Pari No. Particulars Condition Repalrer's Amount
1 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformed BBO.0OFL *BEO.OOFL
2 1 *SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS Necessary 30.00FL  *30.00FL
a2 *REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER -LH & RH Necessary 7040FL  *TO40FL
4 2 *REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR -LH & RH Nol Necessary 280.00 FL ~FL
5 1 *REAR BUMPER UNDERCOVER Deformed 245B0FL  "245B0FL
g8 1 *SET REAR BUMPER UNDERCOVER CLIPS Necessary 3000FL  *3000FL
7 2 *“REAR SIDE BUMPER -LH & RH Deformed 30000FL  *390.00FL
8 1 *REAR END PANEL Dented 50580FL  *50580FL
g 1 *REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH Deformed 12590FL  *12590FL
10 1 *REAR END PANEL BUZZER Damaged 8550FL  *BS50FL
1 1 *REAR END PANEL LOCK SENSOR Nol Necessary 80.40FL “FL
12 1 *TAIL LAMP -LH & RH N/S Cut 96120FL  "48060FL
13 1 *TAILGATE Distorted 1,100.00FL *1,100.00 FL
14 1 *TAILGATE LOCK Damaged 186.30FL  *1B6.30FL
15 1 *TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP Cut 185.00FL  *185.00FL
18 2 “TAILGATE LAMP -LH & RH Cut 580 20FL  *580.20FL
17 1 *TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD Deformed 321.70FL  *321.70FL
18 1 *SET TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS Necessary 30.00FL  *30.00FL
19 1 *TAILGATE GLASS MOULDING Necessary 158.B0FL *158.60FL
20 1 *VEZEL EMBLEM MNecessary 58.20FL *58 20 FL
21 1 *SPARE TYRE PANEL TOP BOARD Deformed 306 80FL *30860FL
2 1 *TOOLS TRAY SPONGE Cracked 226 70FL  *226 7OFL
23 2 *REAR FENDER INNER TRIM -LH &RH Mol Necessary B850.60FL “FL
24 1 *SET REAR FENDER INNER TRIM CLIPS Not Necessary 80 00FL “FL
25 1 *‘REAR EXHAUST PIPE Not Necessary 688 10FL “FL
26 1 *REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING Not Necessary 35.00FL “FL
27 1 *REAR END PANEL SEALANT Necessary B80.00FS  *BD.OOFS
28 1 *“TAILGATE GLASS SEALANT Necessary 80.00FS  *BD.OOFS
29 1 *REAR CAMERA Not Necessary 480.00FS “FS
0 1 *REVERSE SENSOR Damaged 28000FS *200.00FS
F=Franchise pant S=Spchett L=ListiemDac
Sub Total (S§) 9,218.60 6,384.90
- List Item Discount on L Items 20.00/20,00% (S$) 1,667.72 1,212.98
Total Parts (S§) 7,550.88 5171.92
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul.
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Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellansous ems selected,

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour items
1 TO KNOCKING & PULL OUT REAR PORTION & RENEW New 1,200.00 900.00
ABOVE PARTS
2 TO PUTTY & SPRAY UP PAINT WORKS MNew 1,200.00 800.00
3 TO CHECK WIRING New 50.00 30.00
4 TO UNDERSEAL New 150.00 60.00
5 TO REMOVE REVERSE SENSOR New 100.00 50.00
-] TO REMOVE REAR CAMERA Mew 100.00 50.00
7 TO REMOVE UPHOLSTERY New 150.00 BOD.OD
8 TO REMOVE FITTING GLASS New 180.00 120,00
9 TO TRANSFER TAILGATE FITTINGS New 150.00 BO.0D
10 TO REMOVE EXHAUST PIPE New 150.00 0.00
Gross Labour Cost (S55) 3,430.00 2.170.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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