Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: Finalisation of repair cost FX386P

From: FTA Performance <ftaperformance @gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, March 11, 2020 1:59 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Finalisation of repair cost FX386P

Hi Khanchna,
We would like to claim:

Lump Sum Repair: $4500 + $315 (GST) = $4815

Lost of use: 4 days x $50 = $200

Thank you

BR
Kit

FTA Performance
Premier@Kaki Bukit

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #07-26
Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6384 0123



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT
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owner of ___fX3%F (vehicle no.) hereby authorize
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("The workshop”) to act for me with respect te my claim for

repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim"] for my

Vehicle No. f-‘\’ Zfdf that was damaged pursuant to the

accident which occurred on \5 g T (qace; along Eik (30

?5% B%"Pf M L {:}0{‘”‘ (ﬂf""a\) {location)
involving Vehicle No/s SKE 85‘{-]

{("The acoident®}.

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentiocned
claim in a manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further
authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim
with payment chegue/s being made in favour of the workshop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach
on my behalf is on a without prejudice and without admiseion of
liability bagis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the
‘other vehicle/s is cancerned.

Dated ghis w{ﬁﬁ__ day of ’%‘1

Signed by “the third party claimantc”




RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, FTA PERFORMANCE PTE LTD(“the workshop™”) hereby confirm that we/l have
reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
$$4.700.00(Global Sum) for vehicle no. FX386P that was damaged pursuant to the accident which
occurred on 15/07/2019 (date) along _POTONG PASIR AVENUE 1 involving vehicle no/s
SLE854J.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 30/07/2019 (date) at “the workshop”.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner LEE YAN CHU(the third party claimant™)
of vehicle no. FX386P make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/I have full
authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/lI deem fit. We/lI enclose herein
the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to FX386P (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this /2 (day) of /fl?/tw% (month) 20 _2_‘:/_} (year)
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Signed by appointed surveyor | Signed by “the workshop” (with chop)




SALES TAX INVOICE ﬁa
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Invoice : " 1000505516
Premium Performance Parts & Gears
Date ; 12/08/2020
Page:
. ) ; o Bill To
ok ARSI AIG ASIA Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way, AIG Building, #09-16
079120 Singapore
Ref: Phone: 64193000
Code Description Qty Unit Price Disc Amount ($)
Lump Sum Repair Accident Lump Sum Repair for FX386P 1 4392.52 4392.52
FX386P
3 working days repair for Working days repair for FX386P 3 50.00 100.0% 0.00 -
FX386P
Total : $ 4,542.52
S | Discount:  $ 150.00
GST7.0% : $ 307.48
Amount Due : $ 4,700.00
Balance Due : $ 4,700.00
Payment may be made by cheque payable to FTA PERFORMANCE PTE LTD Thank you for your purchase. Please come again.
FTA PERFORMANCE PTE LTD
FULLTHROTTLE ASIA
8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 Premier @ Kaki Bukit #07-26
Tel: 63840123 ; \ Yo
e Autho/\sgd %nitory Company Stamp & Signature
Date : Date :

GST Reg. No. : 201600708N : j



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 2 September 2019 11:55 AM

To: SUDHAMC@GMAIL.COM

Cc: Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING FX 386P & SLE 854) ON 15/07/2019 ALONG/AT POTONG
PASIR AVENUE 1

Tracking: Recipient Delivery
SUDHAMC@GMAIL.COM
Admin A
Meikwan@lkkauto.com Delivered: 2/9/2019 11:56 AM
olivialau@lkkauto.com Delivered: 2/9/2019 11:56 AM
shupei@lkkauto.com Delivered: 2/9/2019 11:56 AM

Our Ref: CC4/A1G19013278/Uka3
Your Ref: SLE 854 [Driver: KIRAN VARKEY CHERIAN]

SUDHA MARY GEORGE
[POLICY HOLDER]

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING FX 386P & SLE 854J) [AIG] ON 15/07/2019 ALONG/AT POTONG PASIR AVENUE 1

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from FX 386P against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour. We will therefore
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles)
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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