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Think One Autocare Pte Ltd
No.18 Defu Avenue 2

Singapore 539522
PC8116S TOYOTA HIACE GDH223-2001437 DATE  2477/2019
No Oty PARTICULAR AMOUNT S$§
I | FRONT BONNET 7T 98800 X
2 | CORNER PANEL LH > 35230 <
3 1 CORNER PANEL INNER SUPPORT LH 4-—12 252.00 &
4 | FRONT BUMPER i 693.00
5 1 FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH 11 12010 %
7 1 HEADLAMP BRACKET LH Aa 421.00 &
§ 1 DOORPILLAR LH A 142200 X
9 | DOORRH 2/ Sed 175200 _—
§  6,00040
LESS 25% $ 1,500.10
§ 442530
§ 450030
No Qty PARTICULAR NETT ITEM AMOUNT S§
I 1 HEADLAMP ASSYLH  1¢¢0 AN 253050
2 | FENDER MIRROR LH AA” 985008/
$ 3,524.50
LESS % L 5 35045
§ 317205
b1
LABOUR & MISCELLANEOUS: ,—3‘-3%;
1 To remove damaged body parts with all necessary components/attach- @g O 1.000.00 39

ra

ments apply hot-works where necessary repair,reshape body dented
panels in accordance with factory specifications replace new parts refit
and align into position refit all necessary components/attachments

To spray paint replaced/repaired body parts inclusive of preparatory

works and painting materials

To transfer fromt door components with all necesssary attachments

* Pans prices ame subiect 15 confemnation

* Supplameiysy TN ) i b
™ nubpect o Iralwmmcu

Dt

Page 1

* Tharet rraarty Suriwy 15 o & "Withoud Prejydics” Sy l 4
* No llsga FrEhicAnion(a) & sllowsd

— a?/

I'o conduct headlamp alignment
LEK Aulo Consyliants hence no
Ihe Repaiter of tha follcwing: 5 N

* To msuremy befor/aher KrIy paiting
= To Gspiay darnaged Fartls) dunng resusey 'L’

& Lo 100000

€ o 100.00
20 3000
S 2,130.00
(1Y)
£



PARE/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |ID Type: Company
Owner ID: 609M
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: PC8116S
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 29 Jul 2019
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: HIACE COMMUTER 28 GLAUTO
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2019
Engine No.: 1GD8385389
Chassis No.: GDH2232001437
Maximum Power Output: -
Open Market Value: $44,133.00
Original Registration Date: 08 Apr 2019
First Registration Date: 08 Apr 2019
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $2,207.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 07 Apr 2029
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $27,021.00
COE Rebate Amount: $26,187.00
Total Rebate Amount: $26,187.00

Page 1 of |

The information contained herein is correct as at 29 Jul 2019

OK

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDereglnput ?FUNCTION _ID=F0304... 29-Jul-19



PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST — PCE1168 va SOMS0P || on DOA 18/0TZOTN

Foom S, Yinl

To g b ala =any. A A |adrme-adikanugn oo

€ * Forg AndySY Chn LeeYieg i assm, homr Wase o fcbe  usiie | Vrme G ey @y Milhoongt Asafvesersats s Satremaram [evwashni Tang, Wihair
Sant:  TRWHE 3N PM

Hi,

Pliexae refer 1 the enclosed request (um Think One Awtoiare Pre 10 3'4:1P"~@ aﬁ,q hﬁ

Clakm ne : B2AS06907450003 VHL

Cane Owner  Wan Nar Salihe Hinte Syed Yosaff Dp@ MM H

17 you have nny quenes concems, pleoss let us know. i '
Kinally ansing v aspipn Marcws Chug wr Single foion Egpest w g ol H I: m gq,a h

Thanks & Regards,

Hom Yir Rud (Viviana)

Kb

PR, it |

Eerrgapers FNO)Y. | Claers Comesuas - - 20

vyl e R it | e g 81

From: michaeing@thinkone com. &g | malto-michzeing@thiskone oo ]

Sant: Fridoy, July 26, 2019 3:12 PM

Tot Hor, Yinrul

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OU | NSURED vEHICLE SDMS[ AND PCBL1GS ON 18/07/2019

Dear Hor Yinrul,

‘We prefer Mr Mareus Chaa freen LEK consultancy 1o tuke the b
Thank you

Michael Ng

From: Hoe, Yinrul

Sent: Fri, 26 Jul 2019 02 36:00 =000

To: michaelng@Eithinkone. com sy

Ce: Fong, Andy-8Y, Chin, Lee-Ying, Abu Kassin, Noor Mare o Azlan, Syaznnding, Chun, Yoke Shi, Lim, Sheng Yang, Mithoosngh, Aashwesnjectkaur,
Subramantam, Divysabl, Tong, Wahxin

Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION « ACTIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VINICLE SDMS0F AND PCHI 165 ON 1RO72019

Without Preyudics

Youur Reference (POl 1aS

O Reference - B2 50450 T4 S
Dhear Sir'Madam,

We refer to your Notice of Accidetsl ol even daie.

We intend to conduct 8 prepepair gercey of the domage 1 vour shiess o vour cusliinee's vehighe sty itk Wil ﬂwm -uﬁ,[hm We propose 10 use ong of ithe motor
wzveyor ramed in the smched list 10 conduct the Jou pre-repar 5or o 880 sl e exper

Name ol Sarveyur Cumnpany Naino
AlG In House Surveyor ATG Asia Pacific Tmusunce Pie |

| Lawremce Ng Chan Kee Promity Services
Tefey Ong Leng Kiat Tromity Soree o

"EC Looi A Ul nmokike nspection Sctvices 1. Lid
Pany Kiah Keen (Frankie) [ inrsenm Adhesiers e 1A |
big You Han Formenm Adjusers Pz Ll |
Seowm Hanin (Gary) Foymesm Adjmsters Fie 1id
Chew Ho Xiong | ceutuurs Adjustera Dl b —

[ Chis Son Teek [iun_lumm Furostenm Adjusters Pl Tul o
Kalvin Aig L KK Ao Commltanta e 13d |
ing Giuo Qiang L hR Awlo Consianis (e 130 =
Marcus Chus LRK Awo Toomylumma e 1
Mohamad Taniikh LRE Ao Crapabinms 1w L0d 4'
Adrian Ling LEE: Apla Cenmifiarm Pe L
Moharemed Rasol LER Auio Consdliaies P L |




[ Kenneth Kong | LKK Auto Consulisine e Lid |l

Please let us know within twi (2) wesbig dups whther vou sgiee 100w spposis ot of sy of | J e AarvEyers & 8 singhe juint expert. You muy select ong or more of the
liuted motor-mmrveyars. W will beur e cost of i pre=ropu i suerves carried out o the single jor cxpen

Thanks & Angards,

hand Vit Wl [Vl )

A

FHOL S §

Srpaporw FHOL | Clasms Gpwaiem -

TnraL s G | e e

From: michaeing@thinkane.comusg | malitatmichauing §thnione.conr 1g]
Sent: Friday, July 26, 2019 10:05 AM

To: ClamsDocManagement

Sulbrject: [EXTEANAL] HE-PCHLLES & S0MBHP DO 18 7 2016
Importence: High

This mesasuge i from an cxbernal sendors b cowtous wlth s gl 0 anents,

Dear Sir.

Arcwdent aleng Rangoon Resd on ' 5 7.2018
We would like fo arrange 1o sy il
Thank You

Michael Ng

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this emeil (and any attachmenish s confidenl By o e not the micided rocipient, you must not use or disseminute the information. I you
have received this email in eror, please umediately nonfy e b *Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thervof.
Although this email and any attachments are believed 1o be free of sy virss or other deflot hat right uffect mny computer system nto which it is recetved and

opencd, [t is the responsibility of the reciplent 1 casare tiat 1 b » s free and no fespon ity is accepted by American International Group. Inc. or its subsidiaries
or affiliates erther Jointly or severally, for pay less aor dannagee arfelong In aey sy o is e

IMPORTANT NOTICE

T iredgermaticn im this smnil (ane ary slmchmants) o canfidental | g an il st sl yo. et P L of dissasinate the inlormailion.  you Mies recsred Sis smal i e, penss
mmuchiuindy nobily me by "Reply” commesd end sorumanty Uty e = ey csoes o priniguts Somel, AShough iis amail and amy stiachma s o belieed ba ke Tres of any vius or
Gither dwlect hat might sffeet amy compuie syaiom ol which § & roomend S0 sgansd 4 Irn meaponsite - of tha resgient 1o eraes that @ in wiruw frw and 5o responglbilty i scoapted by Amsrean
imlisrnalinngl Groug, ine. of 8 subsidurny o s latts adhar famtly re prveE), fof By 00s AT AAMBGE B g i Sy Wy Ireem i .
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From: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha Syed-Yusofi@aig.com=>

Sent: Friday, 23 August 2019 11:58 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Ce Admin A

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: TP / B2650690745G - Seeking approval to reject TP claim

Dear Khanchna,

Please proceed with rejection based on the VF,

Kind Regards,
Saliha

Saliha Syed Yusoff

AlG

senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AIG Bullding, 78 Shenton Way #08-16, Singapore 079120
Tel +16%9) 6419 1917 |

www.aig.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential, If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply”
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this emall and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it s
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it Is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising In any way from its use.

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, August 22, 2019 5:23 PM

To: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha.Syed-Yusoff@aig.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] YOUR REF: TP / B2650690745G - Seeking approval to reject TP claim

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments,

OUR REF: CC4/AIG19013220/Uka3
YOUR REF: TP / B2650690745G



Dear Ms. 5aliha,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 81165 & SDM 50P [OI-AIG] ON 18/07/2019
The above matter refers,

The Third party said that Insured driver had encroached into his lane
and collision ensued. The third party’s statement is below for your easy reference:

s 5 M B TR

Whereas our Insured driver said that Third party had encroached into his lane and collided into his vehicle. The Insured

driver’s
statement is below for your easy reference:
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Based on the Insured’s video footage on Merimen, we opine the liability is down against Third party as the video shows
Insured vehicle is still on his lane and Third party had collided into Insured vehicle.

As such, we suggest to reject the Third party claim.
Appreciate your approvalfinstructions please.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID; 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@|kkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential, If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply”
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system Into which it s
recelved and opened, it Is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility Is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: michaelng@thinkone.com.sg

Sent: Monday, 9 December 2019 2:42 PM

Ta: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Reject claim - Accident involving PC 81165 (TP) & SDM S0P (O-

AIG:CC4/AIG19013220/Uka3) on 18/07/2019

Importance: High

Hi Khanchna,

Ok thank you

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 9 December, 2019 1:20 PM

To: michaelng@thinkone.com.sg

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Reject claim - Accident involving PC 81165 (TP) & SOM 50P (0I-AIG:CC4/AIG19013220/Uka3) on 18/07/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

The above matter and your e-mail below refers.

Please refer to the accident video(as attached). we maintain our opinion that the liability is down against Third party as

the video shows
Insured vehicle is still on his lane and Third party had collided into Insured vehicle.

As such, we have our principal’s instruction to reject the claim and we are unable to look into your client’s claim,
We will now close the matter in our end,

Thank you.

Nofe: This video footage is solely for investigation and shall not be reproduced. You underfake fo preserve ifs
confidentiality and will not disclose, provide or make available the video foolage in whole or in part, to any
third party.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settiement.”

Best Regards,



Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

'DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna®Ikkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Fram: michaelng@thinkane.com:sg <michaelng@thinkone.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 October 2019 11:06 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Reject claim - Accident involving PC 81165 (TP) & SDM S0P (OI-AIG:CC4/AIG19013220/Uka3) on 18/07/2019

Importance: High

Dear Khanchna,

Your total rejected the claim is un exceptionable your insure enter the merge lane and my client going straight is on the
correct lane.

If you put on 50 / 50 bases may be look into matter.
Looking forward to hear from you soon.
Thank you

Michael Ng

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchina@|kkauto com>
Sent: Thursday, 17 October, 2019 4:30 PM

To: michaelng@thinkone.com.sg

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.coms

Subject: Reject claim - Accident involving PC 81165 (TP) & 5DM S0P (OI-AIG:CC4/AIG19013220/Uka3) on 18/07/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,
The above matter and your e-mail below refers.,
Please be informed that our principal has reviewed the claim.

Based on all documents at hand and video footage, we opine the liability is down against Third party as the video shows
Insured vehicle is still on his lane and Third party had collided into Insured vehicle.

We append below screenshots of the Insured's accident video:



ideo - Accident

As such, we have our principal’s instruction to reject the claim and we are unable to look into your client’s claim.
We will now close the matter in our end

Thank you.



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
+ negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settiement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360 | email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)




Mernimen e-Claims

Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Revoked | No settlement

CLATHM W_I‘FI_:ILDIR TRACKING
Case|Notifiea Est Submitted | Ad| Assgred | Ad) Rt Ad) Submitted | Ins Auth'ed Status
(24912019 2 A o $84,100.00 | $$4,100.00 m for Survwy
. Ecit Bag Edit Ady Ret I Echit Extimatea mml c C-'IIIJ

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjuster]
Insured: CHERM SU MIN BERNARD, 1D: 51613355E
Main :
e THINK ONE LEASING PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 201115609M
Wehichs Beg. . | 18072019 00100 - ;59
No.: PCB116S Date of Loss: | |3 manths and 10 Days Fram LTA Reg Date {Man Yr)]
Ciaim Type: TP / 826506907455 H“"‘“;"“_’C“__“' 2100396417 (Comprenensive)
Vehick Reg
Na. SDMS0P ml 5107782431
(Insured): '
Excess.
Regalrer: Think One Autocsre Pte Lid (HQ) No. 18 Defu Avenue 2, 539527 Ubi - Tel: 68443300
Hundling AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. [Express) - Tel; 65-6419-3000 ... [Handled by Syed-Yusoff, Saliha] Sulina.Syed-
Insurer: YusoffQeig. com
m" NTUC Incoma Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel; 6256-3561 . [Handied by MARCUS CHUA] ... [Final Rpt due 06/068/2019]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose Case Mail |
» AIG_SG (19/07/2019); Request To Uplaad TP GIA Report

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS—
Priority

View All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Compiere |
Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?

Due Date
Mo results.

Type  Task Group Subject  Handler

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 19/12/2019



Page 1 of 2

Menmen e-Claims
Claim Documents
*pCE1165 (B2650690745G)
[SOMS0P]
TP
THINK ONE LEASING PTE LTD
Jul 18 2019 12:00AM
[CHERN 5U MIN BERNARD]
Think One Autocare Pte Ltd
Upiosd Bocumants |  Uslosd Photos |  Composs New Lester | uposa vices | vpiosa musio | ‘l'lim
videa [Coecpupe V1] @
Na | Finalized On AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pre. Lid, (SG) Thumbnall | Print
1 |3wmrne 1343 jm w.:ﬁp Chmmant: CHERN S4 MIN BERNARD [ nc s
Photos/ Images il e
No |Relsbel/Recrder | LKK Auto Consultants Pta Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall Print
1 |z90719 18:42 | Ddometer Reading Q| oers | B
2 |29/07/19 18:42 Chassis Number 0| waaws | A
3 |29/07/19 18:43 Chassis Mumbar Q| weaws | B |
4 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number 0| wdws | H |
5 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassls Number O | tasws |
|6 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassls Number 0| mdwvc | A
7 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number B | aws | A
8 |2907/19 18:41 | Chassls Number 0| wocws | A
9 |29/07/1918:43 | Chassis Mumbar O oarvs | B
10 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number 0| waws | @A
11 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Numbar 0| s | A
12 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number O | aws | B
13 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Mumbar 0| aaws | A
14 | 29/07/19 18:41 Chassis Numbar D | lcadirc | A
15 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number 0| laaws | A
16 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number B | aaws | A
17 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number 0| awrs | A
18 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Mumber 0| tsars | B
19 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Mumbar 0| oodirs | A
20 |29/07/19 18:43 Chassis Number 0! taws | A
21 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number @ | tacws | B
27 | 29/07/1% 18:43 Chassis Number 0| oaws | &
23 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number O tcadws | A
24 |29/07/19 18:43 Chassis Mumber | loadirc | A
25 |29/07/19 18143 | Chassis Number 0| edwrs | A
26 |2907/19 18:43 | Chassis Number O | sars | A
27 | 29/07/19 18:43 Chassis Number )| wooows | A
28 |29/07/10 18:43 Chassis Number i loed PG | M
29 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassls Number 0| i | A
30 |29/07/19 16143 Chassis Number O | losdws | B
31| 2W07/19 18:43 Chassis Number D | tosaws | B
32 |29/07/19 18:43 Chassis Mumber )| o | M
313 |29/07/19 18:43 Chassis Number 0| toedirc | A
33 |20/07/19 18:43 | Chassls Number g Load pc | BA
35 |20/07/19 18:43 Chassis Number 0 | lcediec | A
36 |20/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number O | taows | B
37 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number 0| v | A
38 |26/07/19 18:41 Chasals Number ) | toodrs | A
0 il

]
W3

29/07/19 18:43 Chassis Number

Load PG
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video (emse L) @
Ko _| Finalized On AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pie, Ltd. (56) [ [Thumbnail| Print
40 [29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number O edws | A
la1 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number 0| caws | &

|42 |29%/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number Q| edrc | 4
|43 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number QO wure o
&4 | 29/07/19 18:43 Chassis Number 0| waars | &
45 |29/07/10 18:43 | Chassis Number 0| wadwe | &
46 |29/07/19 18:41 | Chassls Number @ | adrc | A
&7 |29/07/19 16:43 | Chassis Number 0! wwrs | B |
48 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number Q| wews | A |
&9 |29/07/19 18:43 Chassls Number @ | e s %]
50 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Mumber 0| wadirc | &
51 |29/07/19 18:41 Chassls Number 0| teadwc | A
52 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Mumbar 0 | aaws | &
53 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number @ | wears | A
54 |29/07/19 16:41 | Chassis Number 0| waaws | B
55 |29/07/19 16:43 | Chassis Number 0| wadrs | &
L6 |29/07/1% 18:43 Chassls Mumber 0 | tadies | B
57 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number Q| tades | B
S§ |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number Q| wars | &
59 |29/07/19 18:41 | Chassis Mumber Q| woars | &
60 |29/07/18 18:41 | Chassis Number 0| wadvc | &
B1 |29/07/19 18:43  |Chassls Number @ | wadrws | B
63 |29/07/19 18:43 Chassis Humber 0| edwec | A
61 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number O | wadws | 4
64 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number 0| waaws | 4
65 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number 0| wadwc | B
66 |29/07/19 18:43 | Chassis Number @ | teadrwc | (A
67 |OA/OG/19 08:45 | Photo After Spray ! Load G | BA
68 |0E/08/19 0B:45 | Photo After Spray 0| wewc | A
&9 |0B/DB/19 DB:45 | Photo After Spray Q| wews | &
Documentation 1perpage | v]| M
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auta Consultants Ple Lid (HG) Thumbnail | Print
1 |26/07/19 1741 | ACKNDWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO AlG DD 26.07.2019 E Load POF

2 |26/07/19 1741 EMAIL FROM AIG DD 26.07.2019 Load PDF

3 |30/07/1931:56 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load POF

4 |30/07/19 11:59 TP GIA REPORT Load PDF

5 10/132/19 13114 EMAIL FROM ALIG APPROVAL TO REJECT. Load PDF

& (10/12/1% 11:14 | EMAIL TO TP WKSHOP REJECT CLATM B | Load POF

Ne |Finalized On ALG Asia Paclfic Insurance Pte. Lid. (SG) Thumbnall | Print
1 |29/09/18 10:12 | O1 GIA REPORT Loag POF

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST neset | save | e |

There sre no document checklists configored.

Show Remarks To: [ Handiing Trurer

FosE . Besidvkd @98 DHvALE oS iE9 vie Bhiew 8 9 sliher partey
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coregne 1sssoriser)
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408033

Tel 5256-35681 Fax: 6844-8805 Email; sur@lkkauto.com,assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

OurFlle No: CC4/AIG19013220/UKA302
Date: 18122019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Policy No: 2100396417
Clalmant ’
Vehicle No : PC81165 Insured Vehicle No : SDMS50P
Date of Loss: 18/07/2019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 826506807456
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No PC8116S
Make & Model: TOYOTA HIACE, 3.0 COMMUTER GL (A) Engine No: 1GDAa3a5388
Req. Date: 08/04/2018 (Man. Year: 2019) Chassis No: GDH2232001437
Calour: White Odomeler: 23900 km
Engine Capacily. 2754 cc
Market Valua/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S§): Market Value/New Car Price
THE TI F \'i
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable); Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195/80 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 195/80 R15
Front Left Side: Bridgestone & mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone 6 mm
Front Right Side: Bridgastone & mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 6 mm
Thae above valuss repressnt he memarnng fyre reads deopih
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %)
Paris 767235 363547 373688 48.71
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2,130.00 1.240.00 890.00 41.78
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 9,802.35 5,175.47 4,626.88 47.20
Approved Total (Overridden) (5%5) 4,100.00
(5%5) 9,802.35 4,100.00 5,702.35 5817
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 686.16 287.00 30918 58.17
Neit Amount [5$) 10,488.51 4,387.00 6,101.51 58.17
Global Sum Settlement (S5) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 28/07/2019
Date Inspected: 28/07/2018 Inspected At Think One Aulocare Pte Lid (HQ)
No. 18 Defu Avenue 2
Singapore 538522
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0days
Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: Khanchna Pothura
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 19/12/2019
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NOTE: This repovt represents our findings al the time and place of inspection sinted harein. Such inspection hars besn carned ol 10 e best of our
knowledge and ability but any other Kability under any ather circumstances is hemwby arprassly ercluded
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairar's Amount
1 1 *FRONT BONNET Repair B88.00FL "~ FL
2 1 *CORMNER PANEL LH Dented 352.30FL *352 30FL
3 1 *CORNER PANEL INNER SUPPORT LH Nol Necessary 252.00FL *FL
4 1 *FRONT BUMPER Crazed 693.00FL *803.00 FL
5 1 *FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH Mol Necessary 120.10FL *-FL
6 1 *HEADLAMP BRACKET LH Mot Necessary 421.00FL = FL
7 1 *DOOR PILLAR LH Repair 1,422 00FL “.FL
B 1 *DOOR RH Dented / Bant 1,752.00FL *1,752.00FL
g 1 *HEADLAMP ASSY LH Cracked 2.53950FN “245000FN
10 1 *FENDER MIRROR LH Not Necessary 9B85.00FN “~FN
F=Franchise parl LeListliemDisc. N=NatiltamDisc
Sub Total (S%) 9,524.90 5.,247.30
« List ltem Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (5%) 1.500.10 690.33
- Nett Item Discount on N Itams 10.00/25.00% (S$) 35245 812,50
Total Parts (S5) 7.672.35 3,935.47

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous items selected,
Recommended Labour
Neo Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour items
1 TO REMOVE DAMAGED BODY PARTS WITH ALL Mew 1,000.00 480.00
NECESSARY COMPONENTS /ATTACHMENTS APPLY
HOT-WORKS WHERE NECESSARY REPAIR ,RESHAPE
BODY DENTED PANELS IN ACCORDANCE WITH
FACTORY SPECIFICATIONS REPLACE NEW PARTS
REFIT AND ALIGN INTO POSITION REFIT ALL
NECESSARY COMPONENTS /ATTACHMENTS
2 TO SPRAY PAINT REPLACED /REPAIRED BODY PARTS MNew 1,000.00 680.00
INCLUSIVE OF PREPARATORY WORKS AND PAINTING
MATERIALS
3 TO TRANSFER FRONT DOOR COMPONENTS WITH ALL MNew 100.00 60.00
NECESSARY ATTACHMENTS
4 TO CONDUCT HEADLAMP ALIGNMENT New 30.00 20.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 2,130.00 1,240.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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