Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Friday, 26 July, 2019 11:47 AM

'Crystabelle Tan Gek Peng (ECICS, Claims)'; assignments

'ECICS Claims'; Admin A

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLL5142K & SLJ754M ON 09.07.2019
INS/IC/ZHR/0370/2019 DIRECT SETTLEMENT - Ref : DMPC1900179H/02/CT

Follow up
Completed

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Crystabelle Tan Gek Peng (ECICS, Claims) [mailto:Crystabelle_Tan@ecics.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 26 July 2019 10:51 AM

To: Muhammad Zuhri <zuhri@tanchong.com>; 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: ECICS Claims <claims@ecics.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLL5142K & SLJ754M ON 09.07.2019 INS/IC/ZHR/0370/2019 DIRECT
SETTLEMENT - Ref : DMPC1900179H/02/CT

Dear Zuhri

We are agreeable to have direct settlement.

Rental $100/day Or Loss of use $S60/day.

Aside to LKK — Please arrange survey.

Best regards
Crystabelle Tan

Senior Associate | Claims
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DID (65) 6303 0190 Tel (65) 6337 4779

Email crystabelle tan@ecics.com.sg Web www.ecics.com.sg
Address 10 Eunos Road 8, Singapore Post Centre, #09-04A, Singapore 408600.

From: Muhammad Zuhri [mailto:zuhri@tanchong.com]

Sent: Thursday, 25 July, 2019 3:13 PM

To: ECICS Claims

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLL5142K & SLJ754M ON 09.07.2019 INS/IC/ZHR/0370/2019 DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Dear Office In Charge,

Our customer, KOl WEI TER (CAlI WEIDE) the owner of SLL5142K is insured with AIG Insurance at the material time
of the accident. The 3rd party SLJ754M is insured with you at the material time of the accident.

Our customer holds your insured driver liable for the accident and would like to claim against your insured driver.
On behalf of our customer, we hereby enquire whether you would like to have a Direct Settlement with our
customer.

Our customer's claiming for Cost Of Repair and Loss Of Rental $110.00 / Use $70.00..GIA Report / Estimate attached
for your action.

Best Regards,

ZUHRI

Tan Chong Motor Sales Pte Ltd

913 Bukit Timah Road

Singapore 589622

Tel: +65-64694091 :: DID: +65-67038916 :: Fax: +65-64697472
Email: zuhri@tanchong.com

Website: www.tanchong.com :: www.nissan.com.sg

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee or undertaking
expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinions contained in this message. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee indicated in his message (or responsible for delivery of
the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply
email. Opinions contained herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited.
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