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NivithE (LKK Auto)

From: Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice.goh@qbe.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 3:17 PM
To: Veeramani Karuppiah; assignments@Ilkkauto.com
Subject: RE: Accident involving XD9317Y & SGCB1TL
; o413l

Without Prejudice 3.50pm @ ,

yexon® Man
Hi Mani sty ""'lf In

)

Thank you for your email. uJLEP % (boDS

We will appoint LKK for the survey.

Hi LKK
Please assist to arrange for TP PRI.

Thank you,

Janice Goh
Executive, Claims
Claims | Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #28-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 6477 1243

Website Linkedin  Twilter

S QBE

From: Veeramani Karuppiah <veeramanid029@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 2:45 PM

To: Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice.goh@gbe.com>

Subject: Re: Accident involving XD9317Y & SGCRITL

Hi Janice,

We are ok with LKK auto consultant.

Please do inform the surveyor to contact me to arrange for the PRS.

Rgds

Mani

Director

Our Bro's Workshop (S) Pte Ltd
www.owsproshop-obw.com

10 Kaki Bukit Rd 2 #03-37/38




First East Centre
Singapore 417868
HP: 90217013
OFF: 66361338

FAX: 66361339
On Monday, 22 July 2018, 04:35:04 pm GMT+8, Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice goh@abe.com> wrote:
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our ref | VCO127T1JG
Dear Mani
We refer to the above captioned matter

We intent to conduct a full survey of the damage to your client's vehicle. We propose to use one of the motor
surveyors named in the attached list:

Appraisal Associates Pte Ltd
Automobile Inspection Services

KM Auto Assessors Pte Litd

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Infinitl Appraisal Service

Priority Services

Quantum Risk Management (5) Pte Ltd

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
SUrveyors

Thank you

Janice Goh

Executive, Claims

Claims | Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 6477 1243

Website Linkadin Twitter



@ QBE

From: Veeramani Karuppiah <veeramani4029@vyahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 22 July 2019 3:38 PM

To: Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice goh@agbe com>

Subject: Accident involving XD9317Y & SGCB1TL

Attention: Motor Claims Department

To the Person-In-Charge,

We are writing in on behalf of our client- SGC817L

Our client authorized us to act on behalf with regards to his Third Party Motor Claims against your
insured- XD9317Y

Details:

QBE insurance: XD9317Y

Third Party Claimant: SGC817L
Date of Accident: 12 JULY 2019 14:35

Location of Accident ALONG WHITLEY ROAD BEFORE WAYANG SATU FLYOVER

Please do contact us to make arrangements for the Pre-Repair Survey at our workshop.

Address:
Our Bro's Workshop
10 Kaki Bukit Road 2 #03-38

First East Centre



Singapore 417868

"

You can contact us at 66361338 (Mani) or e-mail us, veeramani4029@yahoo.com.sq for further
clarifications.

Thank you.

Mani

Director

Our Bro's Workshop (S) Pte Ltd
www.owsproshop-obw.com

10 Kaki Bukit Rd 2 #03-37/38
First East Centre

Singapore 417868

HP: 80217013

OFF: 66361338

FAX: 66361339

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply email
or telephone. You should also delete this emall and destroy any hard copies produced.

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you
are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of
this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly

inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies
produced.



. Shu Pei !LKK&utn]

From: Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice.goh@gbe.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 31 July 2019 9:42 AM

To: Shu Pei (LEKAULD)

Cc Admin A Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Accident invalving XD9317Y & 5GC817L
Attachments: XD9317Y pdf

Hi Shu Pei

We refer to your emall dated 30.07.2019.
As requested, please see the attachment of our insured’s GIA report.
Our claim no. VCO12771/1G and | am the case handler,

Thank you,

Janice Gaoh
Exscutive, Claims
Claims | Asia

1 Rattles Cuay, #28-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 B47TT 1243

® QBE

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 30 July 2019 7:10 PM

To: Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice.goh@gbe.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jia Le [LKK Auto) <liale @lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Accident involving XD9317Y & SGCB17L

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SGC B17L at M/s Our Bro's Workshop (5] Pte Ltd ona WP basis and TP repairer
proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal |s:
- TP's GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice |5 not ready yet

i



- Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is [ia Le and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 5792,
Thank you

Bast Aegards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupe | @lkhsuto.com | fax: 6741-3108
Bik 51, Paya Ub industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408333)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 3:52 FM

To: ‘lanice Goh Siew Geok' <janice goh@gbe com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: Accident involving XD9317Y & 5GCB17L

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Hest Regands

G.NIVITHA

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone 8841-1972 | email: pudgnmentad tkgyiocom | b2g6-g315
Hik 51, Poya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1. #02-25 | ${408033)

From: Janice Goh Slew Geok [mallto:ianice goh@abe com|
Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 3:17 PM

To: Veeramani Karuppiah <veeramanid029@yahoo.com.sg>; assignments@|kkauto.com
Subject: RE: Accident involving XD9317Y & SGCB17L

Without Prejudice

Hi Mani

Thank you for your email.
We will appoint LKK for the survey.



. Hi LKK
Please assist to arrange for TP PRI

Thank you.

Janice Gah

Execulive, Claims

Claims | Asia

1| Ralfles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 B4ATT 1243

> QBE

From: Veeraman| Karuppiah <veeramani4029@vahoo.com sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 2:45 PM

To: Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice.goh@gbe.com>

Subject: Re: Accident involving XD9317Y & SGCB1T7L

Hi Janice,
We are ok with LKK auto consultant.
Please do inform the surveyor to contact me o arrange for the PRS.

Rgds

Mam

Director

Qur Bro's Workshop (S) Pte Lid
www.owsproshop-obw.com

10 Kaki Bukit Rd 2 #03-37/38
First East Centre

Singapore 417868

HP: 90217013

OFF: 66361338

FAX: 66361339

On Monday, 22 July 2018, 04:35:04 pm GMT+B, Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice goh@gbe.coms= wrali:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Cur rel = VCO12771UG
Dear Mani
We refer to the above caplionad matler,

We intent 1o conduct a full survey of the damage to your client's vehicle. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors
named in the attached |ist

Appraisal Associates Pte Ltd
Autamobile Inspection Services

KM Auto Assessors Ple Lid

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Infiniti Appraisal Service

Priority Services

Quantum Risk Management (S} Pte Ltd

Please let us know within two (2) working days whather you agree to the appointment of any of Ihese molor surveyors.

Thank you.

Janice Goh

Executive, Claims

Claims | Asla

1 Raffies Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore O4B583
+65 6477 1243

‘Website Linkedin Twitter

& QBE

From: Veeraman| Karuppiah <yesra a >
Sent: Monday, 22 July 2019 3:38 PM

To: Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice goh@abe . com>

Subject: Acciden! involving XD8317Y & SGCA17L



Attention: Motor Claims Department

To the Person-In-Charge,

We are writing in on behalf of our client- SGCB17L

Our client authorized us to act on behalf with regards to his Third Parly Motor Claims against your
insured- XD9317Y

Details:
QBE Insurance: XD9317Y
Third Party Claimant: SGC817L

Date of Accident: 12 JULY 2019 14:35

Location of Accident: ALONG WHITLEY ROAD BEFORE WAYANG SATU FLYOVER

Please do contact us 1o make arrangements for the Pre-Repair Survey al our workshop.

Address:

Our Bro's Workshop

10 Kaki Bukit Road 2 #03-38
First East Centre

Singapore 417868

You can conlact us al 66361338 (Mani) or e-mall us, veeramani4029@yahoo.com.sq lor further
clarifications.



Thank you.

Mani

Director

Our Bro's Workshop (S) Pte Lid
hop-obw.com

10 Kakl Bukit Rd 2 #03-37/38

First East Centre

Singapore 417868

HP: 80217013

OFF: 66361338

FAX: 66361339

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The Information In this amall is confidential and may also be privileged. Il you are nat the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this emall |s unauthorised
and strictly prohiblted. If you have recelved this email in error, please promptly Inform us by reply emall or telephane. You
should also delete this emall and destroy any hard coples produced.

not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this
emuil is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us
by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.

E] This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software
WINW. Ve com

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply email
or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard coples produced.



Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice.goh@qgbe.com>
Sent: Monday, 30 September 2019 10:31 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto]

Ce: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident involving XD3317Y & SGCB17L

Hi Jia Le

There is no evidence to proof that it was our insured’s vehicle hit rear of his client’s vehicle.

Please reject the TP claim if they are unable to provide evidence that our Insured's vehicle hit rear of his client’s
vehicle.

Thank you.

Janice Goh
Exscutive, Claims
Claims | Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583

+B5 68477 1243
Mebaite Linkedin  Twither

* QBE

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <liaLe@I|kkauto.com=>

Sent: Friday, 27 September 2019 2:37 PM

To: Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice.goh@gbe.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving XD9317Y & 5GC817L

Dear Janice,
We have spoke to insured driver, he said he had stop in time and did not collide onto Third Party's vehicle.

We also checked with Third Party and they do not have the video footage. Attached herewith the scene photo
provided by Third Party,

Based on the photo, it's seem like rear portion of Third Party’s vehicle have dent.
Kindly let us have your comments/instruction.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)
1



From: Janice Goh Siew Geok |mailto:janice . goh@gbe.com]
Sent: Friday, 27 September 2019 11:27 AM

To: Shu Pel (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; lia Le [LEK Auto)

Subject: RE: Accident involving XD9317Y & 5GCB17L
Hi Shu Pei

Please let us have an update asap.

Thank you.

Janice Gah
Executive, Claims
Claims | Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #28-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 6477 1243

Website Linkedin Tulties

> QBE

From: Janice Goh Siew Geok
Sent: Wednesday, 31 July 2019 9:42 AM
To: 'Shu Pei (LKKAuto)' <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.coms; Jia Le (LKK Auto) <Jiale@lkkautn.com>
Subject: RE: Accident involving XD9317Y & SGCB17L

Hi Shu Pei

We refer 1o your emall dated 30.07.2019.

As requested, please see the attachment of our insured's GIA report.

QOur claim no. VCD12771/)G and | am the case handler.

Thank you.

Janice Goh
Executive, Claims
Claims | Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #28-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+B5 B4TT 1243

Website Linkedin  Twattor

®QBE



From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 30 July 2013 7:10 PM

To: Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice.goh@gbe.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jia Le (LKK Auto) <liale@lkkauto.com:
Subject: RE: Accident involving XD9317Y & 5GCR17L

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter,

We have inspected TP vehicle SGC 8171 at M/s Our Bro's Workshop (§) Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer
proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP's GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured'’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Jia Le and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 5792,

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupe|@ kkauto com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ukl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 3:52 PM

To: 'lanice Goh Siew Geok’' <janice.goh@gbe.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving XD9317Y & SGCB17L
Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regurds

GNIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto com | fax: hash4m15
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, woz-25 | S{408931)



From: Janice Goh Siew Geok |[mailto:janice. goh@gbe.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 3:17 PM

To: Veeramani Karuppiah <veeramanid029@yahoo.com.sg>; assignments@|kkauto.com
Subject: RE: Accident invalving XD3317Y & SGCB17L

Without Prejudice

Hi Mani

Thank you for your email.

We will appoint LKK for the survey.

Hi LKK

Please assist to arrange for TP PRI

Thank you.

Janice Goh
Executive, Claims
Claims | Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 B4TT 1243

S QBE

From: Veeramani Karuppiah amani4029@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 2:45 PM

To: Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice.goh .Lom

Subject: Re: Accident involving XD2317Y & 5GC817L

Hi Janice,
We are ok with LKK auto consultant.
Please do inform the surveyor to contact me to arrange for the PRS.

Rgds

Mani

Director

Qur Bro's Workshop (S) Pte Ltd
www.owsproshop-obw.com

10 Kaki Bukit Rd 2 #03-37/38
First East Centre

Singapore 417868




HP: 80217013
OFF: 66361338
FAX: 66361338

On Monday. 22 July 2019, 04:35:04 pm GMT+8. Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice goh@gbe.com> wrote

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Qur ref  VCO127T7T1MG
Dear Mani
We refer 1o the above caplioned matter.

We intent to conduct a full survey of the damage to your client's vehicle. We propose to use one of the motor
surveyors named in the attached list

Appralsal Associates Pte Ltd
Automobile Inspection Services

KM Auto Assessors Pte Ltd

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Infinitl Appraisal Service

Priority Services

Quantum Risk Management (5) Pte Ltd

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these molor
Surnveyors.

Thank you

Janice Goh

Executive, Claims

Claims | Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore DAB583
+65 BATT 1243

Website Linkedin Twitter

> QBE



From: Vesramani Karuppiah <veeramani4(028{@yahoo com sg-
Sent: Monday, 22 July 2019 3:38 PM

To: Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice goh@gbe com>
Subject: Accident involving XD8317Y & SGCB17L

Attention: Motor Claims Department

To the Person-In-Charge,

We are writing in on behalf of our client- SGC817L

Our client authorized us to act on behalf with regards to his Third Party Motor Claims against your
insured- XD9317Y

Details:

QBE insurance: XD9317Y

Third Party Claimant: SGC817L

Date of Accident: 12 JULY 2019 14:35

Location of Accident: ALONG WHITLEY ROAD BEFORE WAYANG SATU FLYOVER

Please do contact us to make arrangements for the Pre-Repair Survey at our workshop.

Address:

Our Bro's Workshop

10 Kaki Bukit Road 2 #03-38
First East Centre

Singapore 417868



You can contact us at 66361338 (Mani) or e-mail us, veeramani4029@yahoo.com.sq for further
clarifications.

Thank you.

Mani

Director

Our Bro's Workshop (S) Pte Ltd
www.owsproshop-obw.com

10 Kaki Bukit Rd 2 #03-37/38
First East Centre

Singapore 417868

HP: 90217013

OFF: 66361338

FAX: 66361339

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
ntended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email Is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply email
or telephane. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you
are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of
this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly
inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies
produced.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.ave com

e IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be
privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any
disclosure or copying of this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in
error, please promptly inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy
any hard copies produced.

i IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be
privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any
disclosure or copying of this email is unauthonsed and strictly prolibited. If vou have received this email in



error, please promptly inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy
any hard copies produced.



Jia Le sLI{K Auta!

From: Jia Le [LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 30 September 2019 10:48 AM

To: Veeramani Karuppiah

Subject: RE: Your ref: SGCB17L [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES XD9317Y AND 5GC817L

ON 12/07/2019]

without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Madom,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD 9317Y & SGC 817L ON 12/07/2017

We refer 1o the above matter.

There is no evidence o prool that it was our insured's vehicle hit rear of your client’s vehicle.

In view of the above, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable 1o look into your client’s
claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Chan Jin Le | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6740 5702 | email: Jile@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Bik 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Veeramanl Karuppiah |mailto:veeramanid028@yahoo.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 6 August 2019 1:05 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Your ref: SGC817L [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES XD9317Y AND SGC817L ON 12/07/2019]

The only scene photo 1s attached.

Mam

Director

Our Bro's Waorkshop (S) Pte Lid
www.owsproshop-obw.com

10 Kak: Bukit Rd 2 #03-37/38
First East Centre

Singapore 4] 7868

HP: 90217013

OFF: 66361338

FAX: 66361339

On Tuesday, 6 August 2019, 10:03:51 dam GMT+8, Jin Le (LKK Auto ) <Jial e@iKkauto.com=> wroe:
1



Without Prejudice
Dear Mani,

Kindly let us have a copy of video footage/scene photo as our insured reported that there was no collision between
your ¢lient's vehicle and our insured’s vehicle.

Thunk you.

Hest Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jinlet kkaute com | fax: 67414108

Bl 51, Paya Lbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(405933)

From: Veeramam Karuppiah [mailto;veeramani4029@ yahoo.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 6 August 2019 9:53 AM
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Your ref: SGC817L |[ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES XD9317Y AND SGCR17L ON
12/07/2019]

Hi Mr Chan,

Just spoke to my client again this moming. He mentioned that right after the hit, my client came down and the other party
automatically also came down,

My client had asked the driver how he want to settle this. The driver had replied that this was lus company vehicle and will get his
boss to call my client. So they left, and after which my client's msgs and calls went unanswered.

Therefore. my client immediately went to make a police report.

Pls do let us know the outcome and we will do the necessary.



Thank you

Rads
Mam

Diirector
Our Bro's Workshop (3) Pre Lid

www.owsproghop-obw_com
10 Kaki Bukit Rd 2 £03-37/38
First East Centre

Singapore 41 TR6E

HP: 90217013

OFF: 66361338

FAX: 66361334

On Tuesday, & August 2019, 08:50:54 am GMT+E, Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkautio.com=> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs™dm,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability 15 unclear for this matier. Enclosed herewith in this email is 4 copy of our insured's accident
repon for your perusal,

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our O1 we will revert with
our opinion on the cause of the accident, Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you heard further from us.

Meanwhile, we would like to request a copy of video footage/witness statement/scene photos(if any) in order for us to look into
the matter,

We shall revert upon hearing from you.



Thank You.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole Intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of lability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
Inferred from this negotiation of terma/settlement.,

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence an the
issues of liability/damages, elther party is not bound, therealter, by the negotiation erms/settlement.”

Hest Regurds,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Aute Consultants FPte Ltd

Phane: 6749 $792 | emuil; Jiale@ Ikkauto com | fax: 67414108

Bik 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue |, 802-25 | S{408937)



’ VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

adm B - 51 bl Ave 1 #01.25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
- TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo. 199807108R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

‘Affillated to Federation Internationale Das Exparts En Automaobile

QBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD Rel CC4/QBE108013135/Adb3q2
T S s owe: ez [
Code: QBE
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. XD o7y Veh. Inspected SGC B17L
Policy No. 8-V0010603-MVA-RO04 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. VC012771 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  JANICE Assign Date 24/07/2018
2. ‘Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI LANCER c.c 1584
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 20086
Chassis No. JMYSTCS3ABUDD3558 Colour WHITE
Odometer 22750 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3 | Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/50 R18 HAIDA B mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/50 R18 HAIDA 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/50 R16 HAIDA 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/50 R16 HAIDA 6 mm
4. 'Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date 12072018 Inspection Date 29/07/2019
Survey held at OUR BRO'S WORKSHOP
10 KAKIT BUKIT ROAD 2 #03-38 FIRST EAST CENTRE SINGAPORE 417868
5a, Remarks
AYTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: & Working Days




y LL” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

oy a 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 199607198R GST Reg Mo 19-9607198-R Page No 1ol 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SGC B17L
; : it Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition [ Estmate BY | O )
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|RR RH TAIL LAMP NOT NECESSARY 480,00
1|RR LH TAIL LAMP CRACKED 480.00 344.00
1|RR BOOT DENTED 620.00 620.00
1|RR BUMPER DEFORMED 740.00 T40.00
1|REVERSE SENSOR DAMAGED 160.00 160.00
1|RR LH BUMPER BRACKET NECESSARY 78.00 44.00
1|RR RH BUMPER BRACKET MECESSARY 78.00 44.00
1|RR BOOT LOCK DAMAGED 68.00 88.00
1|RR BOOT STRICKER NOT NECESSARY 48.00
1|RR BOOT WEATHERSTRIP cur 210.00 210.00
1|RR END PANEL DENTED 580.00 580.00
10|RR BUMPER CLIP @54.00 NECESSARY 40.00 40.00
1|RR BUMPER SKIRT TO REPAIR SEE 420,00
LABOUR
1|RR BOOT NO.PLATE GARNISH CRACKED 220.00 220.00
1|RR NO: PLATE WITH HOUSING NOT NECESSARY 60.00 -
1|RR LH WHEEL INNER SHIELD TORN BO.0OO BO.OD
1|EMBLEM 'GLX' NECESSARY 42.00 42,00
1|EMBLEM 'LOGOD' NECESSARY 88.00 68.00
1|EMBLEM 'LANCER' NECESSARY 75.00 75.00
1|RR REINFORCEMENT BENT 260.00 260.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -362.50
4 ,837.00 3.262.50
LABOUR
PANEL BEAT AND LABOUR CHARGE TO TRANSFER AND 1,200.00 B00.00
DO WIRING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF RR BUMPER
SKIRT .
SPRAY WORKS 1,200.00 800.00
2.400.00 1.600.00
GRAND TOTAL 7.237.00 4,862.50

Report Ref No. CC4/QBE19013135/Adb3g2




1 8 74 74

i BMA A
Page Mo..2 of 2

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,900.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC4/QBE19013135/Adb3q2

% /%
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng.AMSOE . AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repor s mads soiely 1of the uss snd Benefi of ihe Cliem named on ihe front page of ihis Report.




