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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice.goh@qbe.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 July 2019 9:42 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Accident involving XD9317Y & SGC817L

Attachments: XD9317Y.pdf

Hi Shu Pei 

 

We refer to your email dated 30.07.2019. 

 

As requested, please see the attachment of our insured’s GIA report. 

 

Our claim no. VC012771/JG and I am the case handler. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Janice Goh 

Executive, Claims 

Claims | Asia 

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583 

+65 6477 1243  
Website   LinkedIn   Twitter 
     

 

 

 

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 30 July 2019 7:10 PM 

To: Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice.goh@qbe.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident involving XD9317Y & SGC817L 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

We have inspected TP vehicle SGC 817L at M/s Our Bro's Workshop (S) Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer 

proposed for a direct settlement. 

 

Enclosed for your perusal is:  

-          TP’s GIA report 

 

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet. 
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Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action. 

 

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Jia Le and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 5792. 

 

Thank you 
 

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 3:52 PM 

To: 'Janice Goh Siew Geok' <janice.goh@qbe.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident involving XD9317Y & SGC817L 

 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange. 

 
 

Best Regards  

 

G.NIVITHA 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
 

 

 

 

From: Janice Goh Siew Geok [mailto:janice.goh@qbe.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 3:17 PM 

To: Veeramani Karuppiah <veeramani4029@yahoo.com.sg>; assignments@lkkauto.com 

Subject: RE: Accident involving XD9317Y & SGC817L 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Hi Mani 

 

Thank you for your email. 

We will appoint LKK for the survey. 
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Hi LKK 

 

Please assist to arrange for TP PRI. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Janice Goh 

Executive, Claims 

Claims | Asia 

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583 

+65 6477 1243  
Website   LinkedIn   Twitter 
     

 

 

 

From: Veeramani Karuppiah <veeramani4029@yahoo.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 2:45 PM 

To: Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice.goh@qbe.com> 

Subject: Re: Accident involving XD9317Y & SGC817L 

 

Hi Janice, 
 
We are ok with LKK auto consultant. 
 
Please do inform the surveyor to contact me to arrange for the PRS. 
 
Rgds 
 

Mani 

Director 
Our Bro's Workshop (S) Pte Ltd 
www.owsproshop-obw.com 
10 Kaki Bukit Rd 2 #03-37/38 
First East Centre 
Singapore 417868 
HP: 90217013 
OFF: 66361338 
FAX: 66361339 

 
 
On Monday, 22 July 2019, 04:35:04 pm GMT+8, Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice.goh@qbe.com> wrote:  
 
 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
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Our ref : VC012771/JG 

Dear Mani         

We refer to the above captioned matter. 

 We intent to conduct a full survey of the damage to your client’s vehicle.  We propose to use one of the motor surveyors 
named in the attached list: 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

                        

  

 Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor surveyors. 

Thank you. 

  

Janice Goh 
Executive, Claims 
Claims | Asia 
1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583 
+65 6477 1243  

Website   LinkedIn   Twitter 
       

 

  

  

From: Veeramani Karuppiah <veeramani4029@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 22 July 2019 3:38 PM 

To: Janice Goh Siew Geok <janice.goh@qbe.com> 
Subject: Accident involving XD9317Y & SGC817L 

 COMPANY 

Appraisal Associates Pte Ltd  

Automobile Inspection Services 

KM Auto Assessors Pte Ltd                           

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Infiniti Appraisal Service 

Priority Services 

Quantum Risk Management (S) Pte Ltd 
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Attention: Motor Claims Department 

  

To the Person-In-Charge, 

  

We are writing in on behalf of our client- SGC817L 

Our client authorized us to act on behalf with regards to his Third Party Motor Claims against your 
insured- XD9317Y 

  

Details: 

QBE insurance: XD9317Y 

Third Party Claimant:  SGC817L 

Date of Accident: 12 JULY 2019  14:35 

Location of Accident: ALONG WHITLEY ROAD BEFORE WAYANG SATU FLYOVER 

  

Please do contact us to make arrangements for the Pre-Repair Survey at our workshop. 

  

  

Address: 

Our Bro's Workshop 

10 Kaki Bukit Road 2 #03-38 

First East Centre 

Singapore 417868 

  

You can contact us at 66361338 (Mani) or e-mail us,  veeramani4029@yahoo.com.sg for further 
clarifications. 
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Thank you. 

  

  

Mani 

Director 
Our Bro's Workshop (S) Pte Ltd 
www.owsproshop-obw.com 
10 Kaki Bukit Rd 2 #03-37/38 
First East Centre 
Singapore 417868 
HP: 90217013 
OFF: 66361338 
FAX: 66361339 
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