Jia Le (LKK Auto)

# = s = — —
From: Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 February 2020 4:24 FM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D203474C01/CHONGBS - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident

Invalving GW37R (Ol : CTI - TBA) and SJSB617A (TP : LKK REF -
CCH/CTI19013134/Adb3) on 22.07.2019

Hi lia Le
We refer to above matter.

Our investigation have concluded that there is no evidence to suggest any breach to the terms and conditions of the
policy.

Please proceed to negotiate on direct settlement with third party claimant.

Thank you,

Best Regards

Ben Tang
Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896175 | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www.sq cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: Ak Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are nol the infended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mall and any copies of it thereafier.

From: Chong Boon 5en

Sent: Wednesday, February 12, 2020 10:54 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <liaLe@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D203474C01/CHONGBS - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GW37R (Ol : CTI -
TBA) and SJS8617A (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI19013134/Adb3) on 22.07.2019

Hi Ben,
Elaine case you handle right? Need to look into matter.
Thank you. Want complain liao.

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.



3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (B5) 63896171 | M: (65) XHXX XXXX | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: #F#i# Taiping SG 3 Anson

Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (B5) 63896171 | M: (65) KXXK XHXX | F:(65)6222 1033

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:liale@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, February 12, 2020 8:46 AM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boaonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D203474C01/CHONGBS - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GW37R (01 : CT1 -
TBA) and 5JS8617A (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT119013134/Adb3) on 22.07.2019

Dear Boon 5en,
We refer further to the below email.
Please advise update of the investigation as TP is chasing once again for settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | (408933)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 6 January 2020 1:52 PM

To: Chong Boon Sen

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl; Alfred Toh

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM190203474C01/CHONGES - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving GW37R (Ol : CTI -
TBA) and 5J5S8617A (TP : LKK REF - CCH/CTI19013134/Adb3) on 22.07.2019

Dear Boon Sen,
We refer further to the below email.
Please advise update of the investigation as TP is chasing for settlement.

Thank you.

“Wishing vou a Happiness and Prosperity New Year”

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 18 December 2019 12:10 PM



To: Chong Boon 5en
Cc: Claims Dept of CTI; Alfred Toh
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D203474C01/CHONGBS - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GW37R (Ol : CTI -

TBA) and 5J58617A (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT119013134/Adb3) on 22 07.2019

Dear Boon 5en,

We refer further to the below email.
Please advise update of the investigation as TP is chasing for settlement.

Thank you.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Repards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6740 5792 | email: Jiale@]kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

sent: Thursday, 12 December 2019 2:00 PM

To: Chong Boon 5en

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D203474C01/CHONGBS - FW: Direct settlement - Accident Involving GW37R (01 : CTI -

TBA) and 5JS8617A (TP : LKK REF - CCH/CTI19013134/Adb3) on 22.07.2019
Dear Boon Sen,

We refer further to the below email.

Please advise update of the investigation as TP is chasing for settlement.

Thank you.

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 020"

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email; Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Chong Boon Sen [ma'lltn:bc:::-nsen.chnng@sg.cntaiging.ccm|

Sent: Thursday, 7 November 2019 9:45 AM
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI
Subject: RE: OUR REF: 5N M19D203482/CHONGBS - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GW37R (O1 : CTI -

TBA) and 5JS8617A (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI19013134/Adb3) on 22.07.2018

Dear liale,



Below is our reference: SNM19D203474C01 as we changed in system.

we are following up with investigator.

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63898171 | M: (65) XXXX XXXX | F:(65)6222 1033

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: & f3iif Taiping SG 3 Anson

Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896171 | M: (65) XXXX XXXX | F:(65)6222 1033

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, November 7, 2019 5:00 AM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D203482/CHONGBS - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GW37R (Ol : CTI -
TBA) and 5)58617A (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT119013134/Adb3) on 22.07.2019

Dear Boon Sen,
We refer further to the below email.
Please advise update of the investigation as TP is chasing for settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chong Boon Sen [mailto:boonsen.chon
Sent: Friday, 26 July 2019 3:33 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto); Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D203482/CHONGBS - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GW37R (Ol : CTI -
TBA) and 5J58617A (TP : LKK REF - CCH/CTI19013134/Adb3) on 22.07.2018

Dear 5ir,

Pls find Insured report.

Meanwhile, pls do not settle first as we are investigating matter (fleet policy 4 accidents involved).
Thank you.

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.



3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896171 | M: (65) XXXX XXXX | F: (65)6222 1033

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www._facebook.comichinataipingsa/ | WeChat: T3 Taiping SG 3 Anson

Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896171 | M: (65) XXXX XXXX | F. (65)6222 1033

From: Claims Dept of CTI

Sent: Friday, 26 July, 2019 10:29 AM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee 50
Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe @lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
<shupei@lkkauto.com>

Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D203482/CHONGBS - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GW37R (01 : CTI - TBA)
and SJS8617A (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI19013134/Adb3) on 22.07.2019

Dear Boon Sen,
Please revert Lkk.
Mote : officer in charge — Boon 5en 63896171,

Thanks,
shumin

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 25 July, 2019 5:35 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com=; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jia Le (LKK Auto)

<JiaLe@|kkauto.com>
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GW37R (Ol : CTI - TBA) and SISB617A (TP : LKK REF -

CC6/CTI19013134/Adb3) on 22.07.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.,

We have inspected TP vehicle S]S 8617A at M/s Green Forest Automobile Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP
repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
TP’s GIA report

Please be informed that preliminary advice is not ready yet.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Jia Le and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 5792.
Thank you

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Fmail Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www. symanteccloud. com




Jia Le (LKK Auto) — e ———————————————————————————

From: chan pick yuen Emai1to:chris_chanbebe@hutmail.mm]
Sent; Monday, 19 August 2019 10:25 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; C5 A Team

Subject: 5J58617A & GW37R DOA 22.07.2019

Dear Sir / Mdm ,

Enclosed is our client's invoice , LOA & Ita invoice .
As request following :

1. RC $ 2461 ( $2300 = 7% G5T )
7. Loss of use $600 ( $100 x 6 days - 1800 cc )-4 days recommend + 1 day waiting PRS + 1 day
weekend
3. Ita 57.45
@ 100%

Total 5 3068.45
Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen
GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD

HP: 92712214




Jia Le (LKK Auto) _

— — e e — = e —————
From: Jlia Le (LKK Auta)
Sent Friday, 2 August 2019 5:08 PM
To: MCITYRENTALS@GMAILCOM
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW 37R AND 5J5 861 7A ON 22/07/2019

Our Ref: CC6/CT119013134/Adb3

02 AUGUST 2019

M CITY RENTAL

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW 37R AND 515 8617A ON 22/07/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them,

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days fraom the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jile@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)



AUTHORISATION TO ACT
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authorize Green Forest Automobile Pte Ltd, (“The Workshop™) to act for me/us with m-.peu__gn;} _rqm four

; : ; i =) fe=l4
claim for the repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use for my/our vehicle =) 67
that  was damﬂv-r:.d pursuant . o _the accident oceurred  on ,'r ) ;" |4 at
Buan Al |-- 1/riNg  Tuwel L Buarg Ko 1 ” ’mwlwng we!‘ucle number
L

ot [-.:‘ WA _":r.-f-p

I'We further authorize the Workshop to settle my/our above mentioned ¢laim in a manner that they deem
fitand The Workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my/our claim with
pavment cheque being made in favor of Green Forest Automobile Pte Ltd.

The settlement The Workshop may reach on my/our behalf is on without prejudice and without
admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

Pursuant to Personal Data Protection Act 2012, I'We hereby agree that The Workshop may disclose or
share my personal data to any authorized service providers whom The Workshop would necessarily need
to cooperate, interact or work in one way or another in serving me or meeting my requests.

If I/'we are not able to recover full amount for the repair cost from the third Party’s Insurance Company
in 6 (six) months™ time from invoice date, Green Forest Automobile Pte Ltd shall bill to youw'vour
Company for the balance/full amount of the repair cost. The Workshop will close this case without prior
notice if we are unable to recover within 2 years.

I'We Grace Puto Lessin understand the above explanation by Green Forest
Automobile Pte Ltd.

Datedthis - ' dayof [ (month) o) (vear)

f;'E___ O
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Claimant’s Signature \Jj
{Company’s stamp for company vehicle) Green rest Automobile Pre Ltd

1
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Polizy Mo DMCYSN1815291300 Slaim Mo @ SNHM1AD203474C01
Claimant + GRACE AUTD LEASING
Amount 3.000.00

33
Sirgapore Dollars Thrae Thousand Only

I/We agres Tto accept the above mentignad amount <o Be paid to me/us io full &
final =zetrlement of all claims, sosts & disburzements for injuries / damagss
sUstained by me/us chrough an azcidsnt invalving

Claimant Vehicle No. 4J5 Bal7A

Insored Vehicle Mo, 1 GW 37R

Dare of Loss 3 22000 119

Plage of Accidsnt . BUANGKOE DRIVE TWRDS BUANGEOK GREEH

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to me/fus of tha aforementioned sum by
~HINA TAIPING IMNSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. 1TD., I[/We agree absaliutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING ITNSURANCE (SIMGAPORE) PTE:. LTD. and/or

Insured MNama » M CITY REWTAL
Driver WName 1 MARONG HNGIAM

fram all claims, present or future in respect of all loge, injury or damage
sustalned by mefus -arising out of the said accident,

I azoknowledge that this paymsnt is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE [SINGAPORE) PTE: LTD.

[17 Glebal Sum 35 3,000:00
TOTEL e = 36 58 /e & M % % % % & = 7. 040.00
ST oTEEEETT ST
Claimant ‘Hame : MEIC No

Signature H : Darte




GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD

g Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-25 Premier @ Kaki Bukit Singapor¢ 415875

INVOICE

GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD Date: 19-Aug-19
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 ) GST Reg.No: 201723238H

#05-25 Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 41 5875

Accident date: 22™ JULY 2019
Final Bill For Vehicle No: 5JS8617A TOYOTA WISH 1.8A

“Descriptions AMOUNT
Eump Sum repair cost as recommended by $2,300.00
KK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD
Surveyor : Nr. Adrian

GST 7 $161.00
Total]  $2,461.00

S/DLRS: TWO THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED SIXTY ONE ONLY



Land Transport S/ Authority

Land Transport Authaority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. © M4-0006528-2

Print Date/Time
Receipt Date/Time

Tax Involea/Receipt
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-190723-002171
Previous Recaipt No.

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference
No.
Result of Insurance Enquiry - GW3TR
As at 22 Jul 2019/00:20:00
Insurance Co- CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
1 Insurance Enquiry - GW37TR
Enquiry Fee
20190723154 7306563250

- Sub-Total

Wﬁsumnm Enguiry - EP8540G

As at ul 2019/47:30:00

Insurance Co. TOKIO MARINE INSURANCE SINGAPORE LTD
2 Insurance uiry - EPE640G

Enguiry Fee
20190723154 730606260

Sub-Total

Total Before Rounding
Rounding Difference
Total Amount Payable

Faid By

ooonooooonod 105
Tatal
Cash Change

Tendered Amount
Excess Refundable Amount

THANK ¥OU AND HAVE A NICE DAY

23 Jul 2019 /154841
23 Jul 2019/ 15:48:40

Amount GST Amount
Before Amount

GST (5%)

7.00

7.00

7.00

7.00

14.00

Credit Card: Visa
MasterCard

(s%)

0.49

0.49

0.49

0.49
0.98

After GST
(s%)

749

749

7.48

7.49
14.58
0.03
14,85

14.85
14.95
0.00
14,95
0.00

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



