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S1UBIAVE 1, #02-23 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORLE AUE9A3 TEL 1 (0651 62563561 FAX : (0465} 6256433

Your Ref: D190048 19MESH Date: 26 July 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCII9013111/T1st3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SJV T183A .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 25/07/2019 at the premises of M/s Gold Autoworks Pte Ltd and have the following to

report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 1S5 8.412.75
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 3.,465.75
*“Check” Items Amount 0 1.609.50
Total - 5%
Market Value 153
LTA Reimbursement Value i
Nett Value 8%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages

at the front o/s portion. The undercarriage
affected due to collision.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 5 days

Yours faithfully,
Mohamad Taufikh
Automotive Assessor



MS@FirstCapital

MS First Capital Insurance Limited (cReg ho. 1950001060 G57 Reg e, M2-0001678-9
6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D4BS80

Tel (65) 6222 2311 Fax: (B5) 6222 3547

Caims & Moter Undenriting Dept: 36 Robinson foad WLE-01 City House Singapore DEEETT

Tel [B5) 6507 3848 Fax: (B5) 6507 3349
www. msfirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
24-07-2019 Our Ref No. D19004819MFSH
18-07-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC0814H Third Party Vehicle. SJV7183A

48 TOH GUAN RD EAST ENTERPRISE HUB01-119, GOLD AUTO WORKS
SIMON TAN

819591449/ 81959149 Fax No. O
WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

GOLD AUTO WORKS Aitari NI
PTE LTD antion. NIL
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
SITHARA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




_Shirlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

To: claims@goldautoworks.com.sg; Taufikh

Cc survey

Subject: RE: Requesting for finalise amount : SIV7183A
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25
| 5{408933)

————— Original Message-----

From: claims@goldautoworks.com.sg [mailto:claims@goldautoworks.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 6 August 2019 3:51 PM

To: Taufikh <taufikh@lkkauto.com=>

Cc: survey <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: Requesting for finalise amount : SIV7183A

Hi Taufikh, without prejudice

Please kindly advice us your finalise amount for our client veh no :
SIVT183A

THANKS & REGARDS,
SIMON TAN

GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE LTD
8199-9149



Shir[ez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 26 July 2019 2:43 PM

To: 'Cithara'; '"CWS Motar Claims'

Cec: assignments; SUR

Subject: RE; SURVEY ASSESSMEMT - D19004819MFSH/1
Attachments: SIV 7183A - Preli Advise -.pdf

Dear Sithara,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SIV 7183A.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d @Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 25 July 2019 10:45 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004819MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email; assignments@ikkauto.com | fax: b256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Erom: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 25 July 2019 9:47 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg=>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004819MFSH/1



Dear 5ir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards.

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

WwWwW. avg. Com

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owmer 1D Type:

Owner 10
Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo

Chassis Mo.:

Maxirmum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Orlginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 26 Jul 2019

PARFICOE Rebate Enguiry

Business
B832]

SIVT183A

Mo

26 Jul 201%

TOYOTA
COROLLAALTIS 1.6 AUTO
White

2009

3ZZ4964223
MROSIZEE104165178
80.0 kW (107 bhp)
$17,853.00

08 Feb 2010

08 Feb 2010

1

$17,853.00

Yes
07 Feb 2020
$8,926,00

07 Feb 2020

A - Car {1600cc & below)
10

$19,989.00

$1,066.00
59, 992.00

OK
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GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE LTD

48 Toh Guan Road East Enterprise Hub #01-119 Singapore 608586

Email : claims@goldautoworks.com.sg
CAR MODEL : TOYOTA ALTIS
CHASSIS NO : MRO53ZEE1D6165178

Company Reg no. 201716329M
VEH NO: SIV71B34A
HP:8199-9149

Estimate Bill

List item Oty Unit Price Amount
1 |front bumper T IS 463.00 | $ 463.00 | AL~
7 [front bumper retainer AH 1 |5 122.00 | $ 122.00 A~
3 |front bumper weatherstrip 1 5 14500 | 5 ~ 145,00 | Eatde”
4 front bonnet 1 & 9B0.00 | & SRO.00 A >
5 |front wahser tank 1 5 2B5.00 | & 285.00 |22
& |front foglamp RH 1 5 22000 |6~ 220,00 Xy
7 |foglamp garnisnes RH i B 175005 - 17500 pF7 e~
B |front fender RH 1 5 F2Z00 | S 72200 |gA
2  |front headiamp RH b1 5 54400 | 5 544.00 |fira =
10 |front support panel 1 [ s 736.00 | 2 736.00 [£y
11 _[front wheel garnishes RH 1 5 23000 ) 5 230.00 fﬁ! il
12 [front lower arm RH TN 375.00|5 ~ 37500 K vin-
13 [front suspension RH A f 664.00 | 5 664.00 | ¥4
14 |front wheel knuckle RH 1 5 48000 |5+ 4000 |TLIT
15 |[front wheel bearing 1 |5 286.00 | 8 286.00 | 7wt
16 [front stabilizer link RH 1 . Ju5 13000 | & 130.00 | i
List Total 5 6,557.00 Li‘ 52
List 25% Discount 5 1,639.25 21-_}—&«:-[
After Discount 5 4,917.75
Special Nett Item
17 |vWTl emkblem 1 5 a0.00 | 5 000 |asy =~
18 |front TOYOTA logo 1 S 20.00 | % Q.00 |api—"
18 |support panel sealant 1 |3 100.00 | & 100.00 X wa
20 |wheel alignment 1 |8 100.00 | 5 100.00 J&= L
21 [front tyre 195/65/r15 RH i 28000 [ S 129 15000 |end v Eo%’
22 [bumper clip 10 [% anols A0.00 | Te ket =
23 |wheel garnishes clip 15 5 3005 A5.00 | Foas
Kot
Labour
A |to check wiring system & repair wire harness facus headlamp 3 10000 | 5 10000 | &
8  |toremove.check & replace front RH undercarriage parts 4 0000 ] 5 300.00 | raw? f b v /
C  |to apply antl-rust coating on new & affected panel 5 15000 | & 150,00 |50
D |tostraighten,repair, realign on damaged arez 5 100000 | 5 1,000.00 | Eed.
E |tospray paintingblending on damaged area - 5 120000 | 5 1,20000 |fo
1410
Total Labour & 5/N 5 3,455.00 q o
After Lump-sum 20% 5 6,730.20 4 1S 1
Gi12.3¢

Lf&q[‘g'aasﬁ
ﬂhqjgm 434453ty 5
[ \U'J'f'

P S — e Wy e

LKK Aulo Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:
» To resurvey batore/afiar Spray pantng

: 0{-‘;\?

» To dispiay damaged part{s) during resurvey ‘ri 13 ’ ¥ 1 [ ¢ (150
» Parts prices are subject b0 confirmation
« Third party survey ison a “Without CY” bena Lig vt 28 o

« No lilegal modificat

& Supplemaniary 3 J
s subdact bo | fina! approvel from Insuranca LOMmpaly

.@M**} N *7’”""‘

Qu @ lwﬁk-é>f-"“t

Jau il @ [l o =

Acknowledged by Repaire

Signature:
Digte:
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

M3 FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCH2013111/T1sf3n2
seororncuoomenerroreosserr oo sz | [HIVININ
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 814H Veh. Inspected SJV T183A
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. 0190048 19MFSH Excess ($§) 0.00
Assign From SITHARA Assign Date 25/07/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAALTIS c.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. MROS3ZEE106165178 Colour WHITE
Odometer 229347 Steering IN OCRDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 RASSURER 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 RASSURER 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |193/65 R15 RASSURER & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |[195/65 R15 RASSURER & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT /S PORTION AND UNDERCARRIAGE.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/07/2018 ]Inspuctiﬂn Date 25/07/2019
Survey held at GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE LTD
48 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST
#01-119 ENTERFRISE HUB
SINGAFPORE 608586
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED OM A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE MOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No; 190607108R GST Reg. No. 19-9507198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJV 7183A

Page No.: 1 of 2

. ; Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |, Chop t;}i {5-1
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 463.00 463.00
1|FRONT BUMPER RETAINER RH MECESSARY 122.00 122.00
1|FRONT BUMPER WEATHERSTRIP CuTt 145.00 145.00
1|FRONT BONNET TO REPAIR SEE 980.00 L
LABDUIR
1|FRONT WASHER TANK DEFORMED 285.00 285,00
1|FRONT FOGLAMP RH NOT NECESSARY 220.00 -
1|FOGLAMP GARNISHES RH DEFORMED 175.00 175.00
1|ERONT FENDER RH BENT 722.00 722.00
1|FRONT HEADLAMP RH CRACKED 544,00 544.00
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 736.00 3
LABOUR
1|FRONT WHEEL GARNISHES RH DEFORMED 230.00 230.00
1|FRONT LOWER ARM RH NOT NECESSARY 375.00 -
1|FRONT SUSPENSION RH NOT NECESSARY 664.00 -
1|FRONT WHEEL KNUCKLE RH BENT 480.00 480.00
1|FRONT WHEEL BEARING BENT 286.00 286.00
1|FRONT STABILIZER LINK RH NOT NECESSARY 130.00 :
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,639.25 -863.00
4,917.75 2,569.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|WWTI EMBLER (SR HECESSARY 90.00 |80.00
1|FRONT TOYOTA LOGO (SN} MNECESSARY 90.00 90.00
1|SUPPORT PANEL SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 100.00 x
1|FRONT TYRE 195/65/R15 RH ($150.00)(80%)(SN) cut 280,00 120.00
10|BUMPER CLIP @$4.00 (SN) NECESSARY 40.00 30.00
15|WHEEL GARNISHES CLIP @$3.00 (SN) NECESSARY 45.00 10.00
645.00 340.00
LABOUR
WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 100.00 §0.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19013111/T1sf3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: G256 4315
Req. Mo: 199607T198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607 1968-R

Page No.:2 of 2

: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
escription of Parts Condition
“"" e Workshop (8)] ___(5)
TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM & REPAIR WHERE 100.00 30.00
HARMESS FOCUS HEADLAMP.
TO REMOVE, CHECK & REPLACE FRONT RH 300.00 120,00
UNDERCARRIAGE PARTS,
TO APPLY ANTI-RUST COATING OM NEW & AFFECTED 150.00 30.00
PAMEL.
TO STRAIGHTEN,REPAIR, REALIGN OM DAMAGED 1,000.00 600.00
AREA INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT BONNET
AND FRONT SUPPORT PANEL,
TO SPRAY PAINTING,BLENDING ON DAMAGED AREA, 1,200.00 600.00
2 ,850.00 1,470.00

GRAND TOTAL B,412.75 4,399.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,500.00
{TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19013111/T1sf23n2

MARKET VALUE: $16,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $9,992.00=NETT VALUE: $8,008.00

M'

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

3

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE,AMIRTE.AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Ropart is mads salely for the use and banafit of the Client named on the front page of this Report,

Bepart. in whels or in par. doos so at his or her een sk

e ihis




