B/29/2019 Mail - Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) - Outlock

Fwd: Requesting for finalise amount : SJV7183A

Taufikh (LKKAuto)
Wad 28/8,/2019 11:10 AM
To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Get Qutlock for Android

From: claims@goldautoworks.com.sg <claims@goldautoworks.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, August 28, 2019 10:45:47 AM
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Requesting for finalise amount : 5JV7183A
Hi Taufikh, without prejudice

As conversation on the phone we would like to confirm your finalise
amount @ $3,500.00 (5days)

REGARDS,

SIMON TAN
GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE LTD

COn 2019-08-15 13:51, Taufikh (LKKAuto) wrote:
Hi Simon,

Will let you know soonest.

Regards,

Taufikh

From: claims@goldautoworks.com.sg

Sent: Thursday 15 August, 09:34
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> Subject: Re: Requesting for finalise amount : SIV7183A
>

> To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)
>

> Cc: Admin A, Admin-D (LKKAuto), SUR
=

> Hi Taufikh,

=

> Please kindly revert.
>

> REGARDS,

-

> SIMON TAN

>

https:/outicok affice. com/mail/deeplink?version=2018081802.10&popoutv2=1



_Shirlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

To: claims@goldautoworks.com.sg; Taufikh

Cc: survey

Subject: RE: Reguesting for finalise amount : SIV7183A
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25
| 5{408933)

----- Original Message-----

From: claims@goldautowarks.com.sg [mailto:claims@goldautoworks.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 6 August 2019 3:51 PM

To: Taufikh <taufikh@lkkauto.com=>

Cc: survey <sur@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: Requesting for finalise amount : SJV7183A

Hi Taufikh, without prejudice

Please kindly advice us your finalise amount for our client veh no :
SIVT183A

THANKS & REGARDS,
SIMON TAN

GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE LTD
8195-9149



Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 26 July 2019 2:43 PM

To: 'Sithara’; "CWS Maotor Claims'

Cc: assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004819MFSH/1
Attachments: SJV 7T1B83A - Preli Advise -.pdf

Dear Sithara,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SIV 7183A.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408333)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 25 July 2019 10:45 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004819MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6236-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Mator Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 25 July 2019 9:47 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motar Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004819MFSH/1



Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail, Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
Www . avE.com




